Tay Jian Ye

From: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 January, 2019 3:49 PM

To: Tay Jian Ye

Cc: assignments; Admin A

Subject: CTP REF NO. SNM19D200414 - TP CHINA TAIPING CLAIM SLM2369M AGAINEST
YOUR INSURE GBH1876S

Attachments: [Untitled].pdf; SLM2369M FRT VIDEQ.mp4

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Liability is down on our insured, hence, we are prepared to do a direct settlement.
We will appoint LKK to conduct PRS.

Aside to LKK;

Please assist to liaise with Cycle & Carriage.

Thank you.

Regards,

Irene Tay
Executive
Claims Department (Motor Division)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 Direct (65) 6389 6192

Fax (65)62247478/62247175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
https://apac01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=www.sg.cntaiping.com&amp;data=01%7C01%7C%7Cdb27483
291b94e82796208d681077453%7C8b768fcc12cadf4c9fde19e8afb863c6%7C0&amp;sdata=OFBrNh2t9vb3hGsL78t%
2BSO00NYXxJIFfzZ8bRKrQRUOSY%3D&amp;reserved=0

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore)
Pte. Ltd. except where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore)
Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not
the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

----- Original Message-----
From: Tay Jian Ye [mailto:jianye.tay@cyclecarriage.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2019 9:45 AM



To: Claims Dept of CT| <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Catherine Thia
<catherine.thia@sg.cntaiping.com>; Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Lucas Lee
<lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Don Bong Kiong Hua
<kionghua.bong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Edwin Abcede Caina <edwin.caina@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting
<coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: TP CHINA TAIPING CLAIM SLM2369M AGAINEST YOUR INSURE GBH1876S

Importance: High

To Officer In charge,

My client who is driving SLM2369M want to claims against GBH1876S which was insured by you.
Attach is the SAS report and repair quotation for your reference.

Please let me know the liability

Best Regards,

Tay Jian Ye
Advisor- Customer Service

Cycle & Carriage Singapore * 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
T: +65 6568 4501 * F: +65 6565 1240 * H: +65 81680997 * www.cyclecarriage.com.sg

From: PGMFPO6@cyclecarriage.com.sg [mailto:PGMFPO6@cyclecarriage.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2019 8:12 AM

To: Tay lian Ye

Subject:

DISCLAIMER:-

This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity named
above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that any
dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message.

Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries
Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you
have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any
views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd
and/or any of its related corporations.
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