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n-oCLAIH SUBFOL DE R---[HEW AESI“ I'll'l'lﬂl'lt]

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER 1 mcms N ]

RofhiTie T Sunmiraa Adl] g ‘-'~ ‘ 4] Siitvrtithed ll et | T -
23 Jan 2015 T
nlan 2019 | New Assignment
Main 16:16 |
e ncel Cass
[ | | Assign | | _Cancel Case |

Reference

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by insurer]
L]
Main

Claimant:

|um.:um |1wnmuun 100 - :59

\CD2 | Policy/Cover a
+ |TP/SNM19D200414C02 | ote No. uncvsmmmuau

Policy No.

(Claimant): |
| Excess: |ss0.00
(Repairer; | Cycle & Carrlage Automotive Pte Ltd (Pandan Gardens) 208 Pandan Gardens. 608338 West Coast - Tel. 65684501/65684518
pandiing | enina Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6389 6111 .. [Handiad by Irane Tay Hul Ping - £38986152]
. [Final Rpt due 01/02/2019]

FLE-I-EE SURVEY mu REVERT

Pm-r-nnmfnrmume.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= -

] :I'In- Aﬂﬁr;n__]:mh New Task | nm__j

Due ate Friarnty Type Task Group Subject Handiar Ansigned Dy Camplsied On

Created On Done?
Mo results.




Veron Chen !LI{KAutu!

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 12 April 2019 11:20 AM

To: Songcuan JR Lauro Araos; Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR

Ce Andre Chow En De; Loi Ai Ting; Cheng Jo Jo; Tay Jian Ye
Subject: RE: SLM2369M (KIA) - FINALIZE TP CLAIM

Dear Larry,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirm finalized amount of § 5,214.00 before Gst @ 5 working days.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to CHINA TAIPING

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Songcuan JR Lauro Araos <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 12 April 2019 5:57 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Lol Al Ting <aiting loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>, Cheng Jo Jo
<jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Tay Jian Ye <jianye.tay@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: SLM2369M (KIA) - FINALIZE TP CLAIM

Dear Sir/Madam,
Pls. refer to attached files and photos.
Kindly confirm finalized amount of 5 5,214.00 before Gst for SLM2369M.

Thank you so much.

Best regards,

Larry Songcuan
Customer Service



@@ Exceptional Journeys

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Cycle & Carriage Singapore « 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 608339
T +65 6568 4658 + F: +65 6565 1240 - www cyclecarriage com.sq

& A member of the jardine Cycle & Carriage Group

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity
named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that
any dissemination, distribution or copying of this emall or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are

those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its
related corporations.



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 January 2019 3:49 PM

To: Tay lian Ye

Ce: assignments; Admin A

Subject: CTP REF NO. SNM19D200414 - TP CHINA TAIPING CLAIM SLM2369M AGAINEST
YOUR INSURE GBH18765

Attachments: [Untitled].pdf; SLM2369M FRT VIDEQ.mp4

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Liability is down on our insured, hence, we are prepared to do a direct settlement.
We will appoint LEK to conduct PRS.

Aside to LKK;

Please assist to liaise with Cycle & Carriage.

Thank you.

Regards,

Irene Tay
Executive
Claims Department (Motor Division)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 Direct (65) 6389 6192
Fax (B5)62247478/62247175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :

This message Is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore)
Pte. Ltd. except where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore)
Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not
the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

~---0riginal Message——-

From: Tay Jian Ye [mailto:jianye.tay@cyclecarriage com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2019 9:45 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Catherine Thia
<catherine.thia@sg.cntaiping.com>; Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong @sg.cntaiping.com>; Lucas Lee
<lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>



Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Don Bong Kiong Hua

- <kionghua.bong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Edwin Abcede Caina <edwin.caina@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting
<coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: TP CHINA TAIPING CLAIM SLM2369M AGAINEST YOUR INSURE GBH18765

Importance: High

To Officer In charge,
My client who is driving SLM2369M want to claims against GBH18765 which was insured by you.
Attach Is the SAS report and repair quotation for your reference.

Please let me know the liability

Best Regards,

Tay Jian Ye
Advisor- Customer Service

Cycle & Carriage Singapore * 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
T:+65 6568 4501 * F: +65 6565 1240 * H: +65 81680997 * www.cyclecarriage.com.sg

-—--Original Message--—

From: PGMFPOE@cyclecarriage.com.sg [mailto:PGMFPO6@cyclecarriage.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2019 8:12 AM

To: Tay Jian Ye

Subject:

DISCLAIMER:-

This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity named
above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that any
dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment Is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message.

Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries
Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you
have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any
views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd
and/or any of its related corporations.

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com




CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

CYCLE & CARRIAGE COMMERCIAL AUTO PROTECTOR COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

Mamo of Policyholder  : XDriva Vehicla No. : BLMZ38aM
Period of Insurance ;24 Mar 2018 To 23 Mar 2018 Policy No. ¢ 2100560506856-01
Engina No., : D4FDGH1ITES3 Endorsemont Ne. @
Chassls No. : RNAHUB1SVHTITI3T tssued Date : 22 Mar 2018
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SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

. Pleass repoi] COITed III'E {he delails of the acciden! to speed up |he clama process

I Thim Form must e completed by the Palloyhalders andior the Authorsed Drver.

L, Infermation provided musl be as truthhul ard sccurale as possible. Ary wiblul misrepeesentation or witholding of maisnal lecls may allow mAUARCE COMDanad 10
repudiate policy Nabikty

4 The mse and accegtance of this Form by instrance companies & nal an admession of poabey labillty oh the par, = | (RAUrANCE DOMpEMeES

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

& This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GLA Rscords Management Cantre sstablksned by the General Insurance Assocation of Singapors {GIA) tor
archiving and that coplas of this report will, for a lee. ba made avallable upon application by interested parties

T, By the loogement of this report io the insurern, you hereby coneen (o the archiving of this repon at the centre and 10 copses of tha reper bang mads sYailsbls
wlitunand

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 21/01/2019 17:08

Date O Accidant 18/01/2018 20:50

Exact Location Of Accident BESIDE BLE SUPPER BOON KENG RODHDB CARPARK
Country/State of Loss SINGAPDRE

Vehicle Registration Number SLM2365M
Insured/Palicyholder

Mame Of Registered Owner XDRIVE

Co Reg No 53350985L

Email Address NOEMAIL

Mabile Phone No

Allernative Phons No OFFICE-NOPHONE
Vehicle Particulars

Manufacturer KIA

Modal CARENS-1.7 (A)

Exac

Exac Purpcne o ko vl ves bag Veed ot peonu

'-"-.rc- you claming unaer your own insurance palicy NO

ar repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please siate aclion 1o ba taken THIRD PARTY

Vahicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Insurance Campany

Mame of Insurance Company AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE

Fleat Policy MO

Paolicy Numbar 2100505065

Cover Nole Numbser

Driver

Mame of Driver MOHAMMAD HAFIZ BIN ZAINAL ABIDIN
NRIC No 579014624

Date Of Birth 16/01/1978

Ceoupation INDOOR

Date Of Driving Pass 18/11/1888

Driving Experience 18 YEARS AND 2 MONTHS
Geandear MALE

Mabile Number (LOCAL) +85-97101945
Fax Number

Contact Number HOME-64434143

EMall Address NOEMAIL

Page 1 of 71



Address 52 WOO MON CHEW ROAD
Posicode 455128

Was driver an amployee of the Insured's Company NO

If Ne. Relationship of tha Drivar with the Insured OWNER

Vehicle Registration Number of Drver's Crwn -
Vehicle B

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident HIT AND RUN | VANDALISM | DAMAGED WHILST PARKED
Weather Condilions CLEAR

Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)
irvalved in the accident

Was any body Injured in the Accident? NO
YWas any injured conveyed to hospital by

2

ambulance? NQ
Was any olher malarial or propery damaged? YES
| have pean approached by unknown persanis) NO
solicitinglalfaring accident claims assistance
Mumber ol Passengers |Including Driver) ]
Details of Police Action
Wae the accideni reparied o the police? YES
If Yes.Pleasa state which Police Station
Police Station Name BEDOK SOUTH NEIGHBOURHOOD POLICE CENTRE
Police Stafion Address gmng&Hm CHEE DRIVE , POSTCODE: 465045 . COUNTRY
Paolice Station Conlact TEL NO: 1800-2448886 - FAX NO: 62446558
¥Was notice of inlendad Prosscution given? NO
If Yes against whom?
Circumstances of Accident
REFER TO ATTACHMENT
Attachment(s)
Are accident photos avallable for attachment? YES
¥Was thera any video caplured by Car Cameara? YES
Was there any audio recorded? NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
Vehicla Registration Number GBH18TES
Vehicla Make/Madel/Colour TOYOTA DOYNA 3.0MSILVER
Datals Of Properties
Vehicle Categary COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

Name of Driver
NRIC/Passpor Mumber
Conlact Numbar
Address

Postcode
Insurance Company Name
Malure Of Damage

Page 2 of 27



Mo, Of Passanger (Including Driver)

Page 3ol 21




MPORTANT NOTICE

. This Form must be

Please report comrectly the detalls of the accident to speed up the claims process

he Policyhold

tompleted b inayor th inorised

. Infermation provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible, Any wilful misrepresentation or withholding of material
facts may allow Insurance companies to repudiate policy liability.

. The issue and acceptance of this Form by Insurance companies is not an admission of policy liabllity an the part of the insurance
companies.

The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance
Association of Singapore (GIA) for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by
interested partles.

By the lodgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this repart at the centre and to copies of
the report being made avallable aforesald

. Consent under the Personal Data Pratection Act (PDPA)
| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent tha

{a) My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore ["GIA") may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/persanal information set out in this [form] and any other personal information
provided by me or possessed by my insurer (collectively the "Personal Information®) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information to all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident (all insurer{s) who have insured
vehicle(s) invalved in this accident shall be coliectively referred to as the "Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the

Manetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant governmaent agency/authority (such as the police), for the purpose(s]
af :

li} processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims Including the settiement of the claims and any necessary
investigations relating 1o the claims;

{il) investigating the accident and/or my claims;
(iil] carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquliries by me;

(] administering my claims (Including the malling of correspondence, statements, invoices, reparts or notices 1o me,
which could involve disclosure of certaln personal dats about mé to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover af envelopes/mail packages): and/or

V] complying with opphicable law in agmenistering, processing, handiing and/or dealing with my claims, (caliectvely the
“Purposas”|

b  all ;nsurer(s) wha have insured venicle(s) mvalved in this accident and the Insurers’ [awyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal Information for ene or maore of the above Purposes; and

{c) my Personal Information may,/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GlA to their third party service providers or
agents{including their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the above Purposes.

(d} my Persanal Information will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
imvestigation and management In present and all future claims.

le} the information so collected under {d] above may be shared /[ disclosed:

{if toallinsurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

s
»- -
- 2 PP /
vl
Puanm Oriver's Signature Reparting Centre Persornel's Signature
Da Tme: {IF driver Is not the policyhalder) Name:
Date & Time: MRIC/FIN No.:




DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

vihy % Poler Rt -

TION
lare the foregoing particulars are true In every respect.

|
Palleyhol natura/,) Priver's Signature Reporting Centre Persofnel’s Signature
4 i ~ (If driver is not 1he policyhalder] Name:

Date & Time: MNRIC/FIN No.:




SINGAPORE
POLICE FORCE

Palice Station Of Origin:
Bedok South N.P.C

LT

20 Chai Chee Drive SINGAPORE 469045

Tel No: 1800-2448999

REPORT OF A TRAFFIC ACCIDENT

80120/2113

10f3
Report No. T/20180120/2113

Date/Time Report Made:
20/01/2018 19:46

Vide Report No.;

Name af Infurmant
MOHAMMAD HAFIIZ BIN ZAINAL

Address.

Station Diary No.:

32 WOO MON CHEW ROAD SINGAPORE 455128

_ABIDIN
ID Type /1D No.: Contact No.:

NRIC NO / S7801482A Home/Office: Mobile: 97101845
Nationality: Email:

SINGAPORE CITIZEN

Sex: Age: Date of Birth: | Type of Informant:

Male 40 16/01/1979 Vehicle Owner

Race: Language: Institution / School Name:
Malay English

Occupation: Driving Licenee Information:

SELF-EMPLOYED Class: 2B.2A 2,3 Date of Expiry:

General on of . _ :
Type of Non-Injury | Drink | Date/Time of Type of Location:
Aorident Hit and Run Drive: | Accident: Car Park

' No 18/01/2019 20:50
Location:
Along Road 1
UPPER BOON KENG ROAD
ESI LK S UP RPARK.
Weather: Road Surface: Road Speed Limit:
Clear Dry

Traffic Flow: Traffic Control: Traffic Volume:
One Way Not Controlled No Traffic
Type of Collision: Anyone conveyed by
Moving Vehicle Against - Parked Vehicle ambulance:

No
vdm '.Jﬁi'lla- 4 [ -=__-.- ..'_E__ M—-__I'_ == Co -' i I
GBH1B76S | Lorry TOYOTA DYNA 3.0
MANUAL
SLM2368M | Car KIA CARENS 1.7 Red Slightly |0
DCT DIESEL Damaged
S5DR FWD




PoLICE FoRCE A

/20180120/2113

BP:gne Station Of Origin: 20f3
ok South N.P.C R No. T/20180120/2113

20 Chai Chee Drive SINGAPORE 469045 = i

Tel No: 1800-2448999

CONTINUATION OF REPORT

Brief Details.

On 18/01/2019 at about 2020hrs, | parked my vehicle SLM2369M at the said parking lot. After which |
brought my family to nearby food centre to eat dinner.

On the same day at about 2050hrs, | came back to my vehicle and notice a scratch from the left headlight
lo the somewhere In the middle area of my front left car tyre. | then noticed there was a parking coupon
written with words on my wind shield and the contents informed me that someone actually witnessed a
lorry (GBH1876S) that reversed and scratched my car. The witness also left their names and contact

numbers if | require any verification of what happened. Their names are Salleh (97928946) and Shrmani
(91761885).

| called up to Salleh and Shrmani and they informed me the lorry driver came down of his vehicle and
@ppeared to have waited for me however the driver left after waiting for awhile.

However, there was no note left nor any explanation from the lorry driver.
As of now | estimate the cost of repair for my vehicle damages to be about SGD$2000/-.

| Have CCTV built in my vehicle and | have viewed the footage of what happened to my vehicle and

confirmed that said lorry (GBH1876S) has damaged my vehicle. | have said footages stored in my
computer.

| am lodging this police report for insurance claims purposes and will assist traffic police in any further
investigations.



SINGAPORE
POLICE FORCE

Police Station Of Origin

Bedok South N.P.C

20 Chai Chee Drive SINGAPORE 463045
Tel No: 1800-2448988

Sketch Plan
informant is not able to provide sketch plan

AR

120180120/211

30f3
Report No. T/20180120/21 13

CONTINUATION OF REPORT

IMPORTANT: Please attach a copy of your vehicle's Insurance Certificate to this report. If you don't have
ihe certificate with you now, please fax a copy 1o 55474885 stating the report numbymﬁr&nce.

Signature Of Officer Recording The Report: |

G/ /

Sgt 3 EDWARD TAN CHUN SENG

S

Signature Of Interpreter:

Not applicable 20/01/2019 19:46
Officer In Charge Of Case: Clgssification Of Case:
TP /HRT/ ! £
Sr Staff Sgt ESTHER CHONG e o

: . rLyd
Contact No.: 65476368 ) 1 ;:, |

Authentication Stamp
NP183



% ® CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIA PTE LTD
PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE

CYCLE & CARRIAGE 209 Pandan Gardens Singapore 609339 Tel 65684567 Fax: 65651240
Co Reg Ho : 199805410K ESTIMATE GST Reg No : MR-8500111-X
Invoice Name & Address Owner Name & Vehicle Info
Mr Xdrlve Cust No/Name {Mr Xdriye
Reg No/Reg Date 5LMZ369M / 2403 201
52 Woo Mon Chew Road Date In/Mileage / 0
:‘.9"“‘ "”:55125 Chassis No KNAHUB15VHT 171371
LR Engine No D4FDGH]176H93
Contact No Mobile: 97101045 Make/Model KIA/CARENS 1.7 A D SX FL DY6
Colour/Trim AJR INFERNO RED  / WK SATURN BLACK
AccountNo Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIF No
CSMOD081 Cash  05/03/2019/ 10:28 465 / Tay Jian Ye 43267
Duutptlnnnlaunduairﬂm Qty  Unit Price Disc% Amount
E PNTRBOOD ’ - f;w 1650. 00
TO RENEW FRT BUMPER, FRT LM FEHL‘-ER REPAIR FRT HDDEJ )
E PNTOBOOD v |40 1680.00
PAINT WORK SPRAY FRT BUHPEH FR LH FENDER, HDDD B
A 54900099 1 + 30.00
CHECK WIRING AND CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM
A 10028901 . " 200.00
TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK USING HI-SCAN BRO TEST
USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST A o
M SUNDRY 80.00
0 APPLY ANTT COROSSION >
M SUNDRY AN = s0.00
TO—SHPPEY FRT NUMBER PLATE
M SUNDRY A1 Mh_ 20.00
SUNDRIES AsA 5
M BRACKET-FR BUMPER SIDE,LH 1.00 12.00 00,00 Xiz.00 X
M COVER-FR BUMPER 1.00 695.00 00.00| <4 —"g95.00 |
M EMBLEM-KIA 1.00 76.00 00.00| ¥~ 76.00 |-
M COVER-FR BUMPER FOG LAMP.LH 1.00 130.00 00.00| 130,00 |+
M LAMP ASSY-FRONT FOG,LH 1.00 206.00 00.00| wvfR 206,00 [¥
M BRACKET-FR BUMPER SIDE,LM .-3.\ 1.00 12.00 00.00| " 12.00 |
M LAMP ASSY-HEAD,LH "'\ 1.00 1558.00 00.00 | cuk 558,00
M PANEL-FENDER,LH 1.00 425.00 00.00| A1 —"425.00
W G

— ."‘ |I
SURVEYOR NAME | m;UU"“ | f 1] L
SURVEYOR SIGNATURE o

DAIE: S ?_l ‘3 L 4w f?‘-'

REMARKS « __ @3_"&1;“4(: ’1[_ z
':-L*J{_‘ H\,{u»,,lmh ‘“\ ﬁﬁ"h.-

5\

Confirm & accepted by 2
o Nett 6,824.00

tha Rapairer of the following: . PRER

= T rewarvey belore'afe ey g 7% G5T on 6824.00 477 .68

» To daphey Carmaged part 1) durng renureey

= Parn press e aubsect o conlematon Total Payable 7.301.68
B .

Autherized signatory and company stamp | “hid purty "U:;:' =

» Ho ibeg mocdeabon(y| 8 siowed

Validity of this astimate is 14 days from dabe SfSeueRRrtiy Vs e jiear Gonei el docusent, no signature is roquired.

Estimated costs quoted are excluding G5T, Wel wou I ubywet S B NGRTENS=abuwd Srbies fe ¥#¥Bhsoq on our initial inspection and does not include
any additional parts or labour which may be uired after repalr work has commenced. Dccafionally worn or damaged parts are discoversd
after work has started and needed for repai q]wmh should this occur. de would advise you. Please be informed that a
deposit of 501 of the above estimate is payaple commencement of the work. Payment fqr this may be made in cash, credit card or
chegue. You muit also agree to pay full t 1 of the windscreen in the avent §f inadvertent breskage In the course of renewing
the rubber seal or other repair requiring thf rdwal of the windicreen.

Page 1 of 1



L

Tounfi ¥y

VEHICLENO :__ SLMZ236aM
MODEL : |tiA /CA eSS | F A D SX
WP ; U324+

Meterial ¥ | Zﬂél-['.ﬂﬂ'
. Labour ¥ | 2,250.00
| SubToml :3  5214.00
’! Lesa 2% Disc :§ —
r Loss Excess ' § =
Totai '8 5 214,00
ST 7% ¥ | 264.9% |
Grang - ©,9%
L FMMMH:__\,@L%_ 0 |z{oﬂjrq i

IE/ REVERT BACK WITHIN 7 DAYS,
OTHERWISE WILL PROCEED WITH INVOICING

] SURVEYOR'S REPORT REQUIRED

REPAIRTOOK___ > woRkiGDAYS + 2 days (k)

§ TP vehiele no ' GBHIDIFC S (tvnua 'T‘""IFIPJG)

¥ Glﬂ:m G\A ﬁfavcl 'K,u 5*,2.99
¥ dawm |ose of Neitad,



CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIAPTE LTD
PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE

CYCLE & CARRIAGE 209 Pandan Gardens Singapore 609339 Tel: 65684567 Fax: 65651240

PRO-FORMA INVOICE

Co Reg No : 199305410

THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE

Mr Adrive Cust No/Name [Mr_Xdrive
Reg No/Reg Date SLMZIESH / 26/03/2017
52 Woo Mon Chew Road Date In/Mileage (06/03/2019/ 87798
otk A Chassis/Package KNAHUBLSVH7171371 /KC17S3
o Engine Mo DAFDGHI17693 |
Contact No Mobile: 97101945 HILIH_HBI [ il{!ﬂ{:ﬂﬂi 1.7 A D SX FL DYB
25/03/ Colour/Trim {AJR INFERND RED J/ WK SATURN BLACK

RENEW FRONT BUMPER, FRONT LM FENDER,
E PNT98000 840,00
PAINT WMORK SPRAY FRONT BUMPER, FRONT LH FENDER,
A 54900099 30.00
CHECK WIRING AND CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM
A 10028901 200.00
TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST
USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST
M SUNDRY 60.00
APPLY ANTI CORDSSION
sl =P FOrm
SUNDRIES .
X COVER-FR BUMPER -~ 1.00 695,00 00.00 £95.00 4"
X EMBLEM-KIA .~ 1.00 76.00 00.00 76.004"
X COVER-FR BUMPER FOG LAMP,LH 1.00 130.00 00.00 130.004"
X BRACKET-FR BUMPER SIDE,LH 1.00 12.00 00.00 12.001
X LAMP ASSY-HEAD,LH ~~ 1.00 1558.00 00.00 1558,00 77
K PANEL-FENDER,LH » 1.00 425,00 00.00 425.00 ¢
X HOLDER-PARKING ASSIST SYSTEM N 1.00 17.00 00.00 17.00 |x
X HOLDER-PARKING ASSIST SYSTEM N 1.00 17.00 00.00 17.00 |x
X HOLDER-PARKING ASSIST SYSTEM N Sfp 1.00 17.00 00.00 17.00 ¢
X HOLDER-PARKING ASSIST SYSTEM N 1.00 17.00 00.00 17.00 |2
7 TEXT
TP CHINA TAIPING
DOA: 19.01.2019
SURVEYOR: TAUFILM LKK 05/03/2019
5 DAYS
Cycle & Corrioge celebrates 120 yeors.
Visit www.cyclecorrioge.com/120 for more info!
Parts 2,964.00 Nett §,214.00
Labour 2,170.00 7% GST on 5214.00 364,98
Standard Menu 0.00
specialist Job ; ’
e oo o :.ﬂ Total Payable 5,578.98
Sundry/Others B0.00
Total (w/o 8ST) 5.214.00

This is not an official tax invoice.
This is & computer generated document, no signature is required.

Page 1 of 1




CYCLE & CARRIAGE

INSURANCE CO.:  CHINA TAIPING
Supplementary For Registration No.- SLM 2369 M

Materials Cost ($)

1 Holder- Parking Assist System N (KS 86581 A4 B00) 17.00

2 Holder- Parking Assist System N (KS 88582 A4 800) 17.00 |y wat o

3 Holder- Parking Assist System N (KS 86583 A4 800) 17.00

4 Holder- Parking Assist System N (KS 86584 A4 800) 17.00
7% GST 476
Total 72.76

Thank You.

Yours faithfully

CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIA PTE LTD

LARRY SONGCUAN

CUSTOMER SERVICE

TEL: 8588 4858

FAX : 6567




Adjuster Report Page 1 of 3

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreg no1sssorissr

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignmenis@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CS/CTI18001551/T1VD3N2

Date: 18/04/2018
Handling China Taiping Insurance .
s (Sirgapora) Ple. Lid Palicy No: DMCV301584 18000
Claimant Insured Vehicle
Viehitte No : SLM2365M N6 4 GBH18765
Date of Loss:  19/01/2019 Rt ot ™ Claim  snm18D200414C02
DESCRIPTION & ID ICA OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SLMZ365M
Make & Model: KIA CARENS, 1.7 DCT (A) Engine No: D4FDGH117683
Req. Date: 24/03/2017 (Man. Year; 2016) Chassis No: KNAHUB15WVHT171371
Colour: Red Odometer: 87798 km
Engine Capacity: 1685 cc
Price:
Sum Insured (5$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake [Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 216/50R17 Rear Tyre Size: 215/50R17
Front Left Side: Habllead 8 mm Rear Left Side: Habilead 6 mm
Front Right Side: Habllead & mm Rear Right Side: Habilead & mm
The shove valies represant the remaming hyre treads death
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Paris 325200 2,984.00 268,00 824
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labaur 3,640.00 2,230.00 1,410.00 3874
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (55) 6,892.00 5,214.00 1,678.00 24,35
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (SS) 482 44 36498 117.45 2435
Nett Amount (S$) 7.374.44 5578.98 1,795.46 24.35
INSPECTI
Date of Assignment: 23/01/2018
Date Inspectad: 05/03/2018 Inspected AL: Cycle & Carriage Automotive Pte Ltd
(Pandan Gardens)
209 Pandan Gardens
Singapore 808339
Estimated Period of Repair: 50 days
Adjuster: MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID Manager: VERON CHEN

NOTE This raporf represants our findings at the fime and place of inspection stated herein Such inspechion has been carmed out fo the besf of our
khowisdge and ability but any attier kabilily under any other circumatances is hersby supressly avcluded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 1 8/4/2019




Adjuster Report Page 2 of 3

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 18 Apr 2019)

Parts: 143 KIA CARENS 1.7 DCT (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
|Labouir: Repairars [Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLM2359M)
\Validity:  These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
- numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

!Fm_mn_hﬂuiuanmrualuannmmmmmnuummmﬁmmnﬂmt

Recommended Parts
Ne. Qty 2" particulars Condition  Repairer's  Amount
11 *BRACKET-FR BUMPER SIDE,LH Not 12.00FS *-FS
MNecessary
2 1 *COVER,FR BUMPER Deformed §95.00FS *B95.00FS
3 1 *EMBLEM-KIA Necessary 76.00FS *T6.00FS
4 1 *COVER-FR BUMPER FOG LAMP,LH Cut 130.00FS *130.00FS
5 1 *LAMP ASSY-FRONT FOG,LH Not 206.00FS *FS
Necessary
8 1 *BRACKET-FR BUMPER SIDE,LH Necessary 1200FS  *12.00FS
7 1 “LAMP ASSY-HEAD,LH Cut 1,558.00 FS *1,558.00FS
8 1 *PANEL-FENDER,LH Bent 425,00FS *425.00FS
a 1 -nm.u}an-mnmns ASSIST SYSTEM N (KS 86581  Necessary 17.00FS *17.00FS
0 1 *HOLDER-PARKING ASSIST SYSTEM N (KS 86582  Necessary 17.00FS *17.00FS
A4800) .
11 1 *HOLDER-PARKING ASSIST SYSTEM N (KS 86583  Necessary 17.00FS  *17.00FS
A4800)
12 1 -mu:;-mnmm ASSIST SYSTEM N (KS 86584  Necessary 17.00FS  *17.00FS
A4800
13 1 *SUNDRIES Mecessary 2000F5 *20.00FS
14 1 *FRT NUMBER PLATE Not 50.00FS FS
Necessary
F=Franchisa part. S=SpcNetl

Total Parts (S§) 3,252.00  2,984.00

[ Report was unsubmitied during this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 18/4/2019




Adjuster Repon Page 3 of 3

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous items selected,

Recommended Labour

No  Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 ;ﬂ DgEHEW FRT BUMPER,FRT LH FENDER,REPAIR FRT New 1,650.00 1.100.00

2 PAINT WORK SPRAY FRT BUMPER,FRT LH MNew 1,680.00 B40.00
FENDER,HOOQD

a3 CHECK WIRING AND CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM Hew 30.00 30.00

4 TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK USING HI-SCAN Mew 200.00 200.00
PRO TEST USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST B -

5 TO APPLY ANTI COROSSION New B0.00 60.00

Gross Labour Cost (5%) 3,640.00 2,230.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 18/4/2019




