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Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

B 1000 Yisham lisdusimul Pk A 201374 3K Suvgupore TRETH]

TEL: 6TS36 142 (YIS FAX a75537TI%(YIN  Pmal chinotorasangnoe com &g
GAT 200 1 58E ROH MO 20000 | 58E

M/S:  AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD

TEL:

78 SHENTON WAY

#07-16 AIG BUILDING

SINGAPORE 079120

64 193000 FAX: 64153727

ATTN:  Motor Claim Departinent s Vor A, JM-&/
WS Ref TPAIGAMK £ /g B ?’o’ﬁg’

Claim Type: Third Party

A A’ ﬂ Engine No:
Accident Date: 17012019 "‘”‘"7 ’ ’;ﬁ- t‘nf_/ Reg. Date:

0 :SBZ9559K _; "(‘m

i

T

b
']

Estimate No:
Drate:

Policy No:
Veh Reg No:
MakeModel:

Chassis No:

ESIM2THAMK

I8 Mar 2019
DMPCSN1728981801
SBZ9559K

HONDA S2000 2.2 TYPE-
SM

AP21100922

F22C 1010924

18042009

imate Costto V
Description U/Price  Quantity List Price Amaunt
5% 53
List Price
FRONT LH FENIMIR ELER ] 1PC & LI -
FRONT LH FENDER EMBLEM "S20007 RO 10 1P M, B
FRONT LH FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIPF 430 6IC LT
FRONT LH RIM L 105 60 IPC L TS 6 e
1,972 a0l
Lesx 20% 364 52 157808
Labur
REMOVE & REFIX FRT BUMPER HEADUAMP FRT LH 440 00 LA awnin Feoes
FENDER & REALIGN THE SAME
PUTTY & RESPRAY FRT LH FENDER & ALL AFFECTED 3500 00 1LA LR ,?5#
AREAS
REMOVE & REFIX FRT LH RIM TYRE BALANCE & REALIGN .00 LA 3000 2‘(‘
THE SAME
TOCONDUCT COMPUTERIZED WHEEL ALIGNMENT LU I Wil ="
RUSTPROOEING 3 ik LA MW
K941 ) K941 ()
> o C Tewl  SS246R 08
AdA GST o ™ 17277
Total Amoum Pasahie 48 2 640 85

* SURVEY VEHICLE AT ANG MO K10 WORKSHOP

For Cheng Hoe Muotor Pre Lid

DORLYN LI

AUTHORISED SIGNATURE



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring
[

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner |D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Madel:

Primary Colour:
Manutacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibllity:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount;

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years);
QP Pald:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount;

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 18 lan 2019

hups://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDereglnput?’FUNCTIO...

Singapore MRIC
2641)

SBZ9559K

Mo

18 Jan 2019
HONDA,

SZ2000 TYPE-52.2M
Grey

2008
F22C1010924
AP21100922

178.0 kW (238 bhp)
$41,297.00

18 Apr 2009

18 Apr 2009

2

$37,882.00

Yes
17 Apr 2019
$19.941.00

17 Apr 2019

B - Car (1601cc & above)
10

$6,383.00

$186.00

$20,127.00

Page | of

I8-Jan-1'



Fre repalr ieppection request - SEZSASEK VS SLPI0ABC (O DOA. 170412019
From e Wewa
Ta Admm A RO aERRRAD CEI ARET TR i G

Se  IDAO0YE B8R0 AW

Hi,

Pleate refer 1o the enciosed requsat fram Chang Hue Motor Ple Lid (AMK) 10-2taevr@ 25 h “'\
Kinally carry out Pulicy coverage verificusion first beflre conducting the pre-repait inspection wtbis 48 houry.

1y have any guenisy'concems, please Dot us know. 3 Iﬂﬂrmﬁ@ D”ﬁhjn
Krrally munrt b aneiger Kemmaik Knmg ax Savgly Jums Expurs s reqaemest VNI

Thanks & Regards,

¥ Bk Mae (Viviane)

AlG

S Lggwer | Semepors FRUL Deen Coeenorm - duls
Grared Sereoes - SEmagn | Ciooe Sosdw il Berooed

IomirwiSgnon eewissd

From: i

Sant; Wisdrsday, loruary 13, 2019 Srdd AM

Tot Hor, Yineul

€ Fong, Andy-SY, Chin, Lee-Ying; Kaur, Baljt; Al K, Noor Maresa; Asian, Syassrding; Chan, Yoke Shi; Lim, Sheng Yang; Md Tahek, Mohd frrem; Mithomsngh,

Subject: AE PRE-REPAIR INSFECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLYING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SLPSOMBC AND SEI9S59K ON 17/00/3019

Hiall,
Clur Sebection as follow ;

« Kenneth Kang (LKK Auto Consubhants Pre Lad)

Datlyn Li
Cheng Hoe Motor Pre Lid (AMK)

Tel : 64812001

From: Hor, Yinrul

Beni: Tue, 22 Jan 2005 01:45:15 0000

To: chmumbk(Esingnet com sg

Ce: Fong, Andy-5Y, Chin, Lee-¥ing Keur, Baljil, &bu Kassim, Noor Manesa, Axian, Synzmrding, Chan, Yoke Shi, Lim, Sheng ¥ang, Md Ishok Mohd fmrn,
Mithoosi Asshweenjectkaur

Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SLPSOASC AND SHXGSS9K ON 17012019



o Sir Maddam,
W refer o yonr Notice of Accident of even date

W ustend to conduct 8 pre-sepair sisrvey of the damags v your elsent’ syour cusemer’s welughe jossly with your cliem/your mosor workshop. We proposs s use one oif te mamy
surveyors named in the attached list i conduct the joint pre—repair nervey as & single jint expes

Name of Survevor Company Name
AlG In House Survevor AlG Asia Pacific Insurmnce Pre Lid
Tefiey Ong Leng Kis___| Prioty Serviees

Jimmy Lee Priority Services
EC Lot Automobile Inspection Services Pir Lid
Fang hoiah Reen (Frankie) | Formieam Adjusters Pie Lid
o You Han Formboam Adjstors Pie Ltd
Soan HanXm (Gary) Formtoam M_iuwul_‘nl.ni_
Chow Bo Xang Formtzam Adjusters Pre Lid

Chua Soo Teck (Benjumin) | Formteam Adjusters Pie Lid

Falvin LEE Auwto Consultants Pre Lid
ﬁl_;ﬁm &E LEE Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Marcus Chua LEE Auto Conuiltants Pre Lid
Mohamad Taultkh KK Auto Consuliants Pe Lid
Adran Ling LEE Awa Consulmnts Pre Lid
Mahammed Rasul LEE Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Kenneth Kong LEE Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Plense lot 1o know wiihin pwo (2) working duys wheshes wou agree 1o the appolniment of my of thess motor surveyors s & sogle joind expert. You muy select obe o more
of the Nmed moor surveyon. We will bear the cont of the pre-repair survey carned out by the single joim expert

Thamis & Angards,

iy Wl Har Pfor i)
A

L Eegaces FNCL Carres Camewmmrs - asin
Sarurwel e owa o WFBLRRsE | TliDa B i maa Deaiied

Tyl eiPen oo | e i a8

Frosmi Cherg Hoo Motor Pre Lid (AMK) [maiito: chenamib @reingnet.com.sg]

Sant: Monday, January 211, 2019 5:11 PM

Tai Chan, Yoke 5hi; Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Lid

ICc: Md Ishak, Mohd lmvan; Abu Kassam, Noor Manesa; Lm, Sheng Yang, MohdFitn. MassimSaig.oom, Mithatsmgh, Asthwesn et
Subject: Repair Survey (Singie Joint Expart) -SEZHS59% doa 17/01/1% (¥r insured SLPSC4EC)

Dear Sir,

OUR CLENT = SBIZ9S53K
Doa, + IT/OLI015 B 2155HRS
FOUR INSURED : SLPSO48C [POON WEILING)

Kindly prowvide us of your surveyor listing for the selection on the survey,
Thank you

Regards

Doriyn LI

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd
Tel 154812001

Foux : BAR21J9E

IMPORTANT NOTICE

The mfarmation w this emall (and any attachmants) s confidential, I you are not the intended recipient, you must not use of digsemmate the informaton, If you
have recedived this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any coples of printouts thereal’
Although this ermail and any attachmants ane believed 1o be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system indo which i s recedved and
opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virds free snd no responsibility is accepled by Ametican International Group, Inc. or its
subsidinrics or affilimes either jointly or severully, for any loss o damage srising 0 any way from it use

IMPOHTANT WOTICE

Tra inAnrTraEian i1 IS ST | BN BTy EITECFTETE] (B CONBOMTUE 1] poa 5PN NOT T iR Gac M, Yo MDA L o SRS T T |1y P SeCkeend Tl @l 0 S0
[l TBdainy nOTYy by “REQET COMMBNd @nd parranaty dsisie e mﬂmmnmwmmm"-pmnu“-nm-w
winds & @er dalect el mighs affect ey compuier aysiem imo which @ @ received and ooened, i 8 ihe reponsisdity of e eopeei o s T § 8o fres eed no eeponsibiléy i1 socepied by
Emancar mismationsl Goup, e o i binckatien o #Sle sithel ooty o Ievereiy i any sl OF ORMEgE BTEING N ey iy TOm 21 use



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin [LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 11 March 2019 11:01 AM

To: '‘Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (AMK)'

Cc: Admin A; assignments

Subject: RE: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY FOR SBZ9559K ON 17/01/2019 (AIG INSURED :
SLP9048C)

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19001532/fb3

Your Ref: SBZ 9559K

Dear Dorlyn,
We refer to above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear /
under BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above
mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of
repair to your client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the
accident.

And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

In the meantime, kindly arrange TP survey ASAP.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of lability,
whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settiement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2142 | email: pohkin@|kkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)
| R "d "

SLERER KT Shwe the Larthe Print only when necessary:



.mchmmw#

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 23 October 2019 3:24 PM
To: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (Yishun-June)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: OFFER - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBZ 9559K & SLP 9048C [AIG] ON 17/07/2019
Tracking: Recipient Delivery
Cheng Hoe Mator Pie Ltd (Yishurn-June)
Admin A
shupei@ilkauto com Delivered: 23/10/72019 3:24 PM
olivialau@kkauta com Delvered: 2310/201% 3:24 PM
MeikowaniBkkauto com Delvered: 23/710/2019 3.24 PM
Without Prejudice

(sove os o cosis)
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matler,

we confirm setllement as per your LOD for $2.174.00(all in).

Vst Nt o

Pt parry v elmuie T A e

g W i s L VL phl 8

i PhM EMY ectveng wtaches se  AASYIUML & SLPwdc

-— TAMPTSIS CESTRAL 0

BHEAKDOWS (F PAYMENTS
1l e - M e Fupmess = (dapmg Hon Mo P Ll
o [ .-t ] Fapaibia o (haeg Few Yetm P Lid
LY s
U e il 'l A s Fawabee w i Satg Flew Viess P Lal
o LTA St M L Pupuisia v 4 oy, Dlew hotan M Lad
Tukad 1T
iy A ki

[y i



We will proceed to do the necessary.
Thank you.

Kindly note that this negetiation between parties on this matter ks purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amieably withoul parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of lability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred fram this
negatintion of terma/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by elther party that will materfally affect/influence on the issues of
liability /damages, elther party is not bound, thereafler, by the negotiation terma/setilement.™

Best Regards,

Khanchnal Case Handler

LLKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchnaialkkauto.com Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




Your Ref

Third party Vehicle No.
Claimant Vehicle No.

Accident on 17/01/2019

COYIAIG (200 1 532 [ Kl b3

’i_- _;-,M_'ll..._f;
PAYMENT ADVICE
SLP9D48C
SBZ9559K
involving vehicle/sno. SBZ9559K &  SLP904RC

along/at TAMPINES CENTRAL |

1) Repair cost
2) Loss of Use

3) Hire of Vehicle

4) LTA Search

Total

Service Adviser
Contact No.

BREAKDOWN OF PAYMENT/S

LKK

S§S  1926.00

S8 240.00

(3 days)
S$ 0.00

S§ B.00

S$ 2174.00

Payable to Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd
Payable to Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Payable to Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Payable to Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

62563561




[’[’ Aufo
) ! sw =ww C:wﬁunmh
e BE B Pha Lid

51 U AVE 1, #11-25 PAYA UL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62563560 FAX @ (D63) 67414108

Our Ref: CCYHAIGI901532/Kb3

217 February 2019

POON WEILING BY POST

48 Jalan Lapang,
Singapore 418998,

Attn: Mr Tong Wee Hiong
Dear Sir/Madam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SLP 9048C AND SBZ
9559K ON 17.01.2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid to
resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken
up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party,

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter,

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30%
(20% for commercial velcles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your
policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will
be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

]

)
Y

Poh Kin, Chong
Case Handler

DID: 6841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: pohkinf@lkkauto.com

cc.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
fMotor Claims Dept)



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

AIG Asia Pacific - EXPRESS THIRD PARTY CLAIM

3 Simei Ri #02-65
I, LINCONEN SInE) (the third party claimant) of 2 i =9
SBZO550K
5328795 (address), owner of ’ (vehicle no.)

hereby authorize CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD {(“the workshop”) to act for me

with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle

no, SBZ9339K gt was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 17/01/19

Tampines Central 1

(date) along (location) involving vehicle no/s

SLPA0D48BC (“the accident™).

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

paymeni cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/fowner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned,

18

Dated this (day) of J30U3TY  (onth) 2017 (year)

Signed by “the third party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop™
(with chop if applicable) (with chop)




G RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - EXPRESS THIRD PARTY CLAIM)

“Well, NG E LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have

reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyvor) with respect to the amount claimed for
551926 (Repair Cost), $5240.00 (Loss of Use), S58.00 (Disbursement), for vehicle no

SBZ9559K that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred 17/1/2019 (date) along
Tampines Central 1 (location) involving vehicle no/s SLP9048C. This is pursuant to the inspection
conducted on 18/3/2019 (date) at “the workshop™

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner Lim Chia Siang (“the third party
claimunt™) of vehicle no SBZ9559K make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have
full authority to setile the matter on his'her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l

enclose heremn the letter of authonity given by “the third party claimant™.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnifv AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage

SBZ9SSOK (vehicle no.) as a result of the aceident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final sertlement of any ¢laim of
“the third party claimani™ pursuant 1o the accident and that further this settlement is reached on &

without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subjeci to the applicanion of Singapore law and the Singapore Couns have

exclusive junsdiction over any dispute ansing out of the same

Dated this 28 (day)of OCTO LE 0 (month) __2019 _ (year)

~, )

F
o

() e

I LII“ : L ‘r‘f FT_‘: . - -'-"I-_ .
Signed by W surveyor Signetd by “the workshop" (with chop)




Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 1019, ¥ inkuie Inchstria] Parkc A #01-374/350, Simgapone ToET6]
TEL: STS34142 (VIS FAX: 6755TT190YIS) Email: chmoloriisingruel oom.sg
GST:2010 158E  ROB NO2010011SRE

M/S:  AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE FTE LTD
78 SHENTON WAY
#07-16 AlIG BUILDING
SINGAPORE 079120
TEL:  A4193000 FAX: 64153727
ATTN: Motor Claim Department
WS Ref: TP/AIGAMEK
Claim Type: Third Party
Accidemt Date:  17/01/2019

Description

To Supply all replaced parts, all necessary and agreed labour &

miscellaneous charges.
(As recommended by your appointed surveyor)

E. &% O E

TAX INVOICE

NO: CL8190912
Date: 27 Aug 2019

Palicy No: DMPCSNITIROR1R0I

Veh Reg No: SBZ9559K

Make/Model:  HONDA 8200022 TYPE-S M

Joh No: JCIAD038T

| Quantity | List Price

S5
I PC 5% 1,800.00

Total
Add GST @ 7%
Total Amount payable

For Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Lid
s

AUTHORISED SIGNATURE

PAGE:|
Amount

55
§$ 1,800.00

58 1.800.00
126.00
58 1,926.00



A.C. SYED & PARTNERS

ADVOCATES & SOLICITORB
COMMISSIONER FOR DATHS

101A UPPER CROBS STREET, #13-23 PEOPLE'S PARK CENTRE, SINGAPORE 05835

TEL : 6638 7411 & FAX : 8534 1011

: CHENG HOE MOTOR FPTE LTD

lBiLL NO: BO1OY 2018

'YOUR REF:

|OUR REF : ACE.CHLTAZ2018 (JAN 2018)

|oaTE : 132.19

10 OUR PROFEBBIONAL CHARGES for soling for you In the sbove matier including whers necsssary perumals,
e nhce prepereion exsminafion of documants relsdng thamio, comeepondence, stendance, parusels, isisphone
E:.-i--illﬂm-h not spacifically mentionad harein to anabie Us 1o cary oul the work

o un inchusive of all sdvica.

§ 200,00

§ 104.00

26 21/1/2019  SLP9048C SBZO539K 1712019
27 2112019 SMD727T7Y  SKWS259L 197172019
28 22/17/2019 GBH61T4B  S0Q2409U  20/1/2019
29 2/172019 SJV662E SFU2122L 14/8/2018
30 231172019  YPS434T SKV5899U 21172019
31 24/1/2019  YN7910H GBJ684A 2012019
32 24/1/2019 SLR3764Y  8JQ4530C 24/222018
33 24/172019 BSLR1654U GBF2192K 23/172019
34 26/1/2019 GBD1262) SIP7946Y 25/172019
a5 30/1/2018  SLT3768B SLLSSTBL 30/1/2019
36 31712019 SKK2510T SLAG30OY 30/1/2019
37 3112019 SKJ1471)  @GBD7522U 19/6/2018
38 31/12019 SLL8914E SGV7558M  249/2018
38 searchos @$8.00 per search

[SINGAPORE DOLLARS: THREE HUNDRED & FOUR ONLY.]

(Mfs. AC
ADVOCA
SINGAPORE
We reserved the right to forward & subsequeat bill for aay
disbursements omitted haredn.
E&OLE

& PARTNERS
& SOLICITORS

$ 304.00

Page 2



Menmen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiane
[ CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING {
Caze |Motifies  [EstSubmitted  [Ad) Awnigned Ad) Hpt Ad) Subrmitted | Ins Auth'ed |Status |
» 23 Jan 2019 | .,ﬁ’u'; e $§1,800.00 £$1,800.00 Panding for Survey
A ks
_Eane | | | ean gy npe | St | — _ cancel Casa | |

Hain Aeference Claim Dwtalls

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

‘i]-'-"-'—'-'-!“—:— POON WEILING, 1D 513501342 I
Mais !
| Ciaimant: LIM CHIA SIANG, 1D 579726411
. ’ | 87M01/2019 00:00 - :59
ny e k9 |sBzOSSOK Date of LSS |14 g Manths and 30 Days From LTA Reg Date {Man ¥r))
h Policy/Cover | 1700018466 [Comprohensive)
GeonTyoe: [P/ 319001260156 Not No.. | Coverage: 22/06/2018 - 21/06/2018
Vehicie Reg. Pedicy No.
L SLPSD4BC . | DMPCSN1FIEGB1801 I
[Insured): (Clairmant)!
_Exeesy. _.I
Regalrer: Cheng Hoe Mator Pte Ltd (Yishun) Blk 1019 #01-374/383, Vishun Industrial Park A, 768761 Yishun - Tel: 6755 6142
.l‘hnsﬂlnu ALG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: §5-6419-3000 . [Handied by Syed-Yusaff, Saltha] Saliha Syed-
Insurer: Yusaffghaig.com
'f:'“'“r:'j“ China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ} - Tel: £3589 6111
Adjuster: | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .. [Handied by KENNETH KONG] ... [Final Rpt due 01/02/2019]
| ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al |  Compose Case Mail |

| = AIG_5G [24/01/7019); Request to upload TP GIA Report

[ ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view Al | Search Tasks | Croate Wew Task | complete |

I Dus Date  Priority  Type  Task Group Subject  Handier Asslgned Ry Completed On Created On  Done?
No resulls.
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Claim Documents

*SEZ9559K (11998126815G)
[SLPOD4BC])
TP
LIM CHIA SIANG
Jan 17 2019 12:00AM
[POON WEILING]
Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Upfn-nnmmmf ummm] COmpots Mew Lemas I Upsnad vioea I uph-dl-nh_l View | Veew i Browser| &
Mg | Finsleed On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail Print
1 |(Drart) Third Party Express Settiement - Payment Breakdown | @ | Edn
Photos/Tmages Geepme  [~] &
Ne | Ralabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 [24n1001817:38 | General View 0| wedirc | &
[.‘r 2471019 17:39 General View | @) | lead e | A
'3 |24/10/1917:39 | General View B 0| weavs | M
(4 |24/10/1817:33 | General View | @ | weawc |
|5 |24/10/19 17:39 General View | | e | HA l
6 |24/10/1917:39 | General View '@ | Losdrs | B4 |
7 |24710/18 17:3% | General View 0| wedrc | B |
B |24/10/1917:39 | Genersl View Lead 76 | b
G | M4/10/19 17:39 | General View 0 wars B
10 |24/10/1817:39 | Genaral View 0D wears |
Documentation lperpage  [~] M
|No | Relabel/Rearder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbmmall | Print
1 |23/01/19 16:13 EMAIL FROM AIG DD 23012019 Load POF
2 |3/mi19 10:42 [ TP GIA REPORT Load FOF
3 |20/03/19 18:53 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Losd POF
4 |12/11/1909:02 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Lued FOF
5 |12/11/1909:07  AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM ) | LosdvoF
& |12/11/1609:07 | Rolease Voicher € | Lo poF
7 |12/11/1909:02 | LTA SEARCH ) | ioad POF
8 |12/11/190%:02 LoD i | tood PoF
lg  [12/11/1909:02  |LETTER YOOI 8 | itowdPpF
|8in_ | Finalized On AlG Asia Pacific Insurnnce Fte. Ltd. {§G) | Thumbnall | Print
t [24/01/1909:45 |01 GIA REPORT @) | Load poe |
Documents Checklist
There are no document checklists configured. i
Qur Checkiist = Ltd )]
F.
b
Show Remarks To! a Handling 1nuurers
ks SEMAFEL AFE Pr DS LB IBSY Yo oW i by slSe peited
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT EREAKDOWN)
1 Vahicle No: SLP9048C (Insd veh) Model: IHONDA 52000 2.2 TYPE-S
SBZ9559K (TP veh) 2.2 M (A)

| Date of Accident: |17/01/2019

Global Sum Settlement| - | [ ] Yes | 1] No

Repair Estimate 5 2,640.85

Final Repair Cost s 1,928.00

Loss of Use 5 240.00 3.00 days at 580,00 per day

Rental (if any) s 0.00 days

LTA ! GIA Search Fee - 8.00

Others - 0.00

: §

Final Settlemeant Sum 5 2.174.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [X ] YES | ] NO  (Kindly indicate
balow)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability (%)

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ He BOLA Scenario No:

1

Assessed Liability (") _(%)
* Assessad Liabilily lo be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nof apply,

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payea's Breakdown

1) |Cheng Hoe Molor Pte Lid ' 3 217400
2) ‘%
k)] o
12 Nov
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LKK ALto Consullants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
{(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;

Medical Report! 8Ill (If any)

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_... 12/11/2019



Adjuster Report Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd {Co Reg No: 158607 188R)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Email sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Dur File No: CC4/AIG19001532/KKB3Q2

Date: 12/11/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid,  Palicy No: 1700018466
Claimant .
Vekicla e s SBZI559K Insured Vehicle No : SLPS048C
Date of Loss 17/01/2019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 119881268156
DESCRIFTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SBZ9559K
Make & Model: HONDA, 52000, 22 TYPE-S 22 M (A) Engine Na: F22C1010824
Reg. Date: 18/04/2009 (Man. Year: 2008) Chassis No: AP21100822
Colour Metallic Grey Odomeler; 152674 km
Engine Capacity. 2156 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (SS); Market Value/New Car Price
E I R
Genaral Condition Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable). Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable); Yes Engine Modificalion: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
From Tyre Size: 215/45 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 215/45 R17
From Lefl Side: Goodyear 4 mm Rear Left Side: Goodyear 7 mm
Front Right Side: Goodyear 4 mm Rear Right Side: Goodyear 7 mm
The above Vlues represent the remamng fre ireeds depth
(COST OF CLAIMS o Repaire’s  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %
Paris 1.578.08 1,578.08 0.00 0.00
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 890.00 680.00 230.00 2584
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 2,468.08 2,238.08 230.00 9.32
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 1,800.00
(S$) 2.468.08 1,800.00 668,08 2707
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (55) 17277 126.00 4877 2707
Nett Amount (S5) 2,640.85 1,926.00 T14.85 21.07
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x S580.00/day) (SS) 240.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) 8.00
Mett Liability (S§) 2,174.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 23mz20me
Date Inspecled; 18/03/2018 Inspected Al Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Lid (Yishun)
Blk 1019 #01-374/382, Yishun
Industrial Park A
Singapore TBBTE1
Estimaled Period of Repair. 3.0 days

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 12/11/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster; KENNETH KONG Manager: Khanchna Pothuraj

NOTE: This report reprasenis our fingings at the Nme and place af inspection staled hersin, Such inspaction hag boen carmed oul 1o Ihe Dear of our
knawlindge and ability but any offer Labiity under any olher circumetances it heredy sxprassly esciuded
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Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Gty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT LH FENDER Bent 752 10FL *T52.10FL
2 1 *FRONT LH FENDER EMBLEM 52000 Mecessary 89.10FL *BB10FL
3 6 *FRONT LH FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIP Necessary 25B0FL *25 BOFL
4 1 *FRONT LH RIM Dentad 1,105B0FL *1,105.60FL
FuFranchise part L=LisfitamDisc
Sub Total (55) 1,872.60 1,972.60
- List ltem Discount on L lems 20.00/20.00% (S§) 394 52 394 52
Total Parts (S§) 1,578.08 1,578.08

Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul.
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Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 REMOVE & REFIX FRT BUMPER ,HEADLAMP FRT LH New 400.00 300.00
FENDER & REALIGN THE SAME

2 PUTTY & RESPRAY FRT LH FENDER & ALL AFFECTED MNew 350.00 250.00
AREAS

3 REMOVE & REFIX FRT LH RIM ,TYRE ,BALANCE & New 50.00 20.00
REALIGN THE SAME

4 TO CONDUCT COMPUTERIZED WHEEL ALIGNMENT Mew 60.00 60.00

5 RUSTPROOFING New 30.00 30.00

Gross Labour Cost (55) 890.00 660.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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