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51 URIAVE 1, #)1.25 PAYA UEI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: SGH3433P/SL/sa

Our Ref: CS/EGI19001527/Uqd3

The Motor Claims Department
ERGO Insurance

Attn: Steve

Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO,

Date: 24th January 2019

FBD 1202H

We thank you for the instruction on _23/01/2019.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 23/01/2019 at the premises of M/s

the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount

“Check” Items Amount

Lump Sum Repair Estimate Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value

Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages consistent.

Days of repair: 2 days.

We have NOT authorize repair.

Yours faithfully

CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appraiser

HUA HONG TRADING and have
: S8 741.00

: 58 577.70

: 5% -

: 5% 450.00

: S% -

: 8% -

- 5% -




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Steve Lim <stevelim@ergo.com.sg=>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 January 2019 9:56 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) (admin-d@lkkauto.com); SUR (sur@lkkauto.com)
Cc: Siti Rahman

Subject: FW: Accident between SGH3433P & FBD1202H | ERGO REF: 5GH3433P
Attachments: Ol report.pdf

Hi LKE,

Attached Ol report. Please assist on below PRS

Steve Lim
hManager - Claims

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-05 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 033085

D, +65 8828 9187

Fax. +55 G828 9247

steve. lim@ergo.com.sq

Wi B100.COM.50 ERGO

ERGO iz one of the major insurance greups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in more than 30 countries and concentrates
on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk carners

Misclasmer This message and its shiachments are confidential, infended only for the named adaresses, and may be priviteged. If you are not the mlended recipient, you

shaukd not disciose, distribute, copy or use this communication, If you are not the intanded recipient, ploass nolify the sender by return email and delele this message
[y apening 2ny stachment o s message, vou agree 1o accept (he risk that it may contain @ virus of damaging code, and you agree that ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd will
not be liable bor any logs or damage thereby caused

From: huaho trading [mailto:huahotrading@yahoo.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 23 January, 2019 9:40 AM

To: Siti Rahman

Cc: Steve Lim

Subject: Fw: Accident between SGH3433P & FBD1202H | ERGO REF: SGH3433P

Dear 5iti,
We have chosen LKK Auto Consultant. Kindly arrange the surveyor to come down
Thank you!

Best Regards
Hua Ho Trading

----- Forwarded message ——

From: huaho trading <huahotrading@yahoo.com.sg=

To: Siti Rahman <Siti. Rahman@ergo.com.sg=>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 January 2019, 10:12:42 AM SGT

Subject: Re: Accident between SGH3433P & FBD1202H | ERGO REF: SGH3433P
Dear Siti,

We have chosen LKK Auto Consultant. Kindly arrange the surveyor to come down

1



Thank you!

Best Regards
Hua Hao Trading

On Tuesday, 22 January 2019, 9:42:11 AM SGT, Siti Rahman <Siti. Rahman@ergo.com.sg> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir,

We acknowledged receipt of your email below for the PRS request as below

In compliance with “*State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from the
list below.

1 AlS Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
2 FTA FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd

3 IAS Infiniti Appraisal Service

4 JPK JP Knights Pte Ltd

5 LBS L.B.S Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

6 LKK LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

7 PS Priority Services

8 VAC Vicom Lid

»  Your request for inspection does not have your client's cost of repair estimate, kindly forward a copy

» Your request for inspection does not have your client's GIA report, kindly forward a copy

Kindly let us have your reply on the selection of the surveyor.

Thank you

Sit A'thikah

Claims Depariment

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.



5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-05 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore D3B985
DID.: +E5 6828.9170

Sitl. Rahman@ergo.

WYL 200, COM. 50 ERGO

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO s represented in more than 30 countries and concentrates
on Eurape and Asia. ERGOD is part of Munich Re {Group), one of the world's leading risk carrigrs

EMAIL DISCLAIMER

iThe information contaired in this email communication is confidential. You should only read, disclose, re-transmit, copy, distribute, act in reliance on or
|commercialize the infermation If you are authorized 10 do so. If you are nof the intended recipient of this email communication, please notify the sender by
replying fo the email and destroy any elactronic or paper copy of this message.

Any views expressed in this email communication are those of the individual sender. ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. does not represent, warrant or guarantee
|thal the inlegrity of this communication has been maintzined or that the communication is free of errors, virus or interference.

|ERGO Insurance Pte, Lid. assers copyright in respect to this email including any attachment. Mo part may be reproduced by any process or for any
!purpuse without prior writien permission.

Deaclaimar This message and Its atachmenls are confidential, intended anly for the named addrassee, and may be privileged. If you ane nol the imended recpient, you
shauld riot disclose, distibute, copy or use this communication. i you are not the intended recipient, prease nobify the sender by returm email and dedele this message
By opening any attachment o this message, you agrea 10 accept the risk that it may contain a virus or damaging code. and you agree that ERGO Insurance Pre Lid. will
vat b liable for any 1065 of damage thereby caused

From: huaho trading [mailto:huahotrading@yahoo.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2019 9:26 AM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)

Ce: elaine.ngu@ergo.com.sg, Siti Rahman; Steve Lim
Subject: Fw: Accident between SGH3433P & FBD1202H



Dear Sir/Mdm,

This is a resend, kindly send over a surveyor to the b/m address.

Hua Ho Trading
Blk 8 Defu Lane 10

#01-540 SE 5459187

----- Forwarded meassage --—-

From: huaho trading <huahotrading@yahoo.com.sg>

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 18 January 2019, 11:17:22 AM SGT

Subject: Accident between SGH3433P & FBD1202H

Dear SirlMdm,

Attached is the accident report between SGH3433P & FBD1202H, Kindly send over a surveyor to the b/m address.

Hua Ho Trading

Elk & Defu Lane 10

#01-540 SE 539187

Tel No: 62844487 Fax: 6289 8180

Thank you!

Eest Regards

Hua Ho Trading



Shiau Chan {LI(KAutn}_

#

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 24 January 2019 3:03 PM

To: 'Siti Rahman'; assignments

Cc: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.}'; SUR

Subject: RE: PRS RO FBD1202H | Ol : SGH3433P | DOA: 17/01/19 | ERGO REF:
SGH34323P/SL/sa

Attachments: CSEGI19001527Uqd3.pdf

Dear Siti,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of FBD 1202H.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 23 January 2019 12:41 PM

To: 'Siti Rahman' <Siti.Rahman@ergo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: "Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=
Subject: RE: PRS IRO FBD1202H | Ol : SGH3433P | DOA: 17/01/19 | ERGO REF: SGH3433P/SL/sa

Dear Siti,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: bash-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Siti Rahman [mailto:Siti.Rahman@ergo.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 23 January 2019 10:33 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Cc: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>

Subject: PRS IRO FBD1202H | Ol : SGH3433P | DOA: 17/01/19 | ERGO REF: SGH3433P/SL/sa

Hi,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment MNo.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company to be the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request on without prejudice basis and to try finalise with the repairer on the repairs,
(Note: No repair estimate was provided to us)



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page 1 of 2

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:
Owner 1D

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power QOutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Singapore NRIC
7490H

FBD1202H
Yes

21 Jan 2019
YAMAHA
T135

Black

2008
5YP300602
5YP300602
$1,740.00
24 Oct 2008
24 Oct 2008
5

$261.00

Mo

$0.00

23 Oct 2023

D - Motorcycle
5

$2,643.00
$2,513.00
$2,513.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle
must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if

applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 21 Jan 2019

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateBy PublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTION_ID=F030... 21/1.2019

OK
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HUA HO TRADING

MM ERTE¥RCER T8 KM6IR] M #01-540
Blk 6, Defu Lane 10, #01-540 Defu Industrial Estate Park C,
Singapore 539187, Tel: 62844487 Fax: 62898180

Dear Sir,

Estimate cost repair for the accident motorcycle Vehicle No: FBD1202H

ltems Price

Exhaust Pipe Protector 1 Set $60 Sed e

Rear Number Plate 538 Che S LECA

Foot Rest Bar 565 il e

Foot Rest Rubber il $30 s

Rear Mugguard Y |80 Dy

Left Side Tool Box Panel — | $130 o oom

Mirror Right Side | $38 AL —
/ebays | taber€harge $300 200

Total 5741
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industral Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No. 199607T198R G3T Reg. No. 19-9607T188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ERGC INSURANCE PTELTD Ref : CS/EGN8001527/Ugd3n2

| AR

5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD

#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 25-02-2019
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SGH 3433P Veh. Inspected FBD 1202H
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SGH3433P/SL/sa Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From STEVE LIM Assign Date 23012019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model YAMAHA T135 c.c 135
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. 5YP300602 Colour PIMK [ BLACK
Odometer 90740 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification SPORTS RIM
General GoOD
3, Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |70/80-17 MAXKIS & mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre |B0/90-17 MAXXIS & mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  16/01/2019 tlnspaction Date 23020189
Survey held at HUA HO TRADING
BLK 8 DEFU LANE 10
#01-540
SINGAPORE 539537
5a, Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOCD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




' Vdl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Al BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
"’-_. TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. FBD 1202H
: Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | & mmp?gn {;];
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|SET EXHAUST PIPE PROTECTOR SCRATCHED 60.00 50.00
1|FOOT REST BAR BENT 65.00 65.00
1|FOOT REST RUBBER TORN 30.00 30.00
1|REAR MUGGUARD CRACKED 80.00 80.00
1|LEFT SIDE TOOL BOX PANEL CRACKED 130.00 130.00
1|MIRROR RIGHT SIDE CRACKED 38.00 38.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT : -40.30
403.00 36270
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE (SN) CRACKED 38.00 15,00
38.00 15.00
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGE 300.00 200.00
300.00 200.00
GRAND TOTAL T741.00 STT.70
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 450.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No, CS/EGI19001527/Uqd3n2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

SCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Ropor s mada sclaly for the uss and banefit of the Clisnt named on the front page of this Report,




