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51 UBI AVE 1, #01-15 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL ; (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: GBF8562L/SL/wm Date: 21* February 2019

Our Ref: CS/EG119001464/Ugd3

The Motor Claims Department
ERGO Insurance

Attn: Wai Meng

Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO___SJG 4724M

We thank you for the instruction on _22/01/2019.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 22/01/2019 at the premises of M/s FASTECH AUTO and have the
following to report.-

Workshop Estimate Amount 5% 8.670.00 .
Revised Estimate Amount :S§  2.800.00 (Lump Sum)
“Check” Items Amount : 5% - i

Lump Sum Repair Estimate Amount : S8 -

Market Value : 8% -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -

Nett Value :S$ -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
o/s front portion.

Comments/ Present Status:

Damages consistent.
Days of repair: 3 days.

We have NOT authorize repair.
Yours faithfully
CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

e e e e e S e e

From: Loh Wai Meng <waimeng.loh@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 January 2019 3:54 PM

To: admin-d@Ikkauto.com

Cc sur@lkkauto.com; Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)

Subject: FRS IRO 5JG 4724M | Ol : GBF 8562L | DOA: 22/01/19 | ERGO REF:
GBFBSeZL/SLAwWm

Hi,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre

Repair Survey, both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company to be the
“Single Joint Expert”,

Please conduct this survey request on without prejudice basis and to try finalise with the repairer on the
repairs.
(Note: No repair estimate was provided to us and our driver has not lodge the accident report to us)

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

NOTE: Please assist to quote our ref as the subject matter, when forwarding the Preliminary Reports /
Survey Reports.

For Claims Department

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

EMAIL DISCLAIMER

|The infarmation contained in this @mail communication is confidential. You should only read, disclose, re-transmit, copy, distribute, act in reliance on or
commarcialize the information if you are authorized to do so. If you are not the intended recipient of this email communication, please notify the sender by
replying to the email and destroy any electronic or paper copy of this message.

Any views expressed in this email communication are those of the Individual sender, ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. does nol represent, warrant or guaraniee
that the intagrity of this communication has been maintained or that the communication is free of errors, virus or interfarence.

ERGO Insurance Ple. Lid. asseris copyright in respect to this email including any attachment. Mo part may be reproduced by any process or for any
purpose without prior written permizssion.

From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)
Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2019 3:41 PM

To: 'Mancy Lam'

Cc: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)
Subject: RE: Request for PRS : 5]G 4724M
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir,

Your email below has reference.

We shall appoint the selected surveyor to conduct the survey accordingly.



For Claims Departiment

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd,

From: Nancy Lam [mailto:nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2019 3:31 PM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)
Subject: RE: Request for PRS : 51G 4724M

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir,
Please arrange LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to survey the car.

Regards.

Nancy Lam

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd
[el: 67406 5405

Fax: 6745 8520

From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) [mailto:claims@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, January 22, 2019 3:22 PM

To: Nancy Lam <nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg>

Cc: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. [Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Request for PRS : SJG 4724M

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir,
We acknowledged receipt of your email below for the PRS request as below.

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from the list
below.

1 AlS Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
2 FTA FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd

3 |AS Infiniti Appraisal Service

4 JPK JP Knights Pte Ltd

5 LBS L.B.S Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

6 LKK LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

7 PS Priority Services

B VAC Vicom Ltd

* Your request for inspection does not have your client’s cost of repair estimate, kindly forward a copy
e Your request for inspection does not have your client’s GIA report, kindly forward a copy
i



e Our Insured’s driver has not reported the accident to us todate.

Kindly let us have your reply on the selection of the survey

For Claims Depanment

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

From: Nancy Lam [mailto:nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2019 11:08 AM

To: ERGC Insurance Pte. Ltd, (Claims Department)
Subject: Request for PRS : S1G 4724M

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Sir/Madam,

My client claiming your insured GBF 8562L.

Please kindly arrange PRS for 51G 4724M.

Date of accident 22.01.2018.

In accordance to APPENDIX C Pre-action Protocol for Non-Injury Motor Accident Cases of PRACTICE DIRECTIONS

AMENDMENT NO. 1 OF 2016 paragraph 2.3, you are require to provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors within
2 days of the notice.

Regards,

NANCY LAM
Fastech Auto Pte Lid
Tel: 6746 5405

Fax: 6745 8520



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 21 February 2019 2:53 PM

To: ‘Loh Wai Meng'; assignments

Ce: SUR; 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)'

Subject: RE: PRS IRO SJG 4724M | Ol : GBF 8562L | DOA: 22/01/19 | ERGO REF:
GBF8562L/5L/wm

Attachments: CSEGI19001464Uqd3.pdf

Dear Wai Meng,
Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SJG 4724M.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

sent: Wednesday, 23 January 2019 2:09 PM

To: 'Loh Wai Meng' <waimeng.loh@ergo.com.sg>; assignments =assignments@|kkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Subject: RE: PRS IRO SJG 4724M | Ol : GBF 8562L | DOA: 22/01/19 | ERGO REF: GBF8562L/5L/wm

Dear Wai Meng,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SIG 4724M on 22/01/2019.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 22 January 2019 4:00 PM

To: 'Loh Wai Meng' <waimeng. loh@ergo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=; 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Subject: RE: PRS IRO SIG 4724M | Ol : GBF 8562L | DOA: 22/01/19 | ERGO REF: GBFB562L/5L/wm

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
1



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 23 January 2019 2:09 PM

To: ‘Loh Wai Meng'; assignments

Cc: SUR: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)'

Subject: RE: PRS IRO SJG 4724M | Ol : GBF B562L | DOA: 22/01/19 | ERGO REF:
GBFB562L/5L/wm

Dear Wai Meng,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle 5JG 4724M on 22/01/2019.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-1561 | email; siewse@ kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 22 January 2019 4:00 PM

To: 'Loh Wai Meng' <waimeng.loh@ergo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=; 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Subject: RE: PRS IRO SJG 4724M | Ol : GBF 8562L | DOA: 22/01/19 | ERGO REF: GBF8562L/SL/wm

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.,

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Loh Wai Meng [mailto:waimeng.loh@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 22 January 2019 3:54 PM

To; admin-d@|kkauto.com
Cc: sur@|kkauto.com; Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Subject: PRS IRO 5JG 4724M | Ol : GBF 8562L | DOA: 22/01/19 | ERGO REF: GBF8562L/SL/wm

Hi,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre

Repair Survey, both TP repairer and Ergo Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company to be the
“Single Joint Expert”.



1232019

Used Ainvave Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapare - sgCarMart

Full Loan Mthly $600 Plus We Are Sgcarmart Premium Dealer! Buy With No Worries! No Hidden Cast! Car In Original Condition! Low Mile
Freel In House Loan Or Bank Loan Available! No Nesd Gua...

B8 Motar Trading

Postad: 17-Jan-2019 EEE:HE,EE': Heonda Airwave, 2009 honga airwave,; Honda Alrwave, honda airwave, Honda, Airwave, airwave,

Honda Airwave 1,5A M (COE 528,800 £5,890 fyr 15-Dec-2008 1,496 cc 135,000 km 5
till 12/2023)

New & Month Road Tax,Well Maintained, Low Mileage, Family Car, Spacicus And Comfortable, Reliable And Easy To Maintain, Bank Or It
Loan Avallable 522K, Trade In Welcome, Call Us Now To Make ...

Posted; 17-Jan-2019 L:!;;:Hzni*gg Honda Alrwave, 2008 honda aireave, Honda Airwave, honda alrwave, Honda, Alrwave, airwave,

Honda Airwave 1,5A M (COE $27,800 $5,610 jyr 08-Jan-2009 1,49 cc 151,023km ¢
till 01/2024)

Well Maintained And Most Affordable Station Wagaon Vehicle In Town! Tip Top Condition! Choice OF Paint Wark Calour, Easy To Drive Ar
Maintained! Very Smoath Transmission! Wear And Tear All Fixed!...

Posted: 16-1an-3019 Lﬂﬁhﬂi Haonda Airwave, 2009 honda alrwave, Honda Airwave, honda ainvave, Honda, firwave, airwave,

Honda Airwave 1.5A (COE till £20,998 £6,090 fyr 05-Jul-2007 1,496 cc - 5
07/2022)

Be Our Mext Happy Client To Own This Quality Pre-Crwned Vehicle At Most Reasonable And Affordable Price! Safe Buy! Selling At Paper®
Body Well Taken Care Of Interior! Striking Red Exterio...

Posted: 14-Jan-2019 :E;Higudi Henda Airwave, 2007 handa airwave, Honds Airwave, honda airwave, Honda, Anwave, airwave,

Honda Airwave 1.54 M (New $26,500 $5,200 fyr 23-Jan-2009 1,496 cc - 5
5-yr COE)

Car In Goed Coendition, Very Well Maintained, In House Loan And Trade In Welcome. Call Us Now To View The Car At Your Convenience

Posted: 13-Jan-2019 Im;HiEgg Honda Airwave, 2009 honda airwave, Henda Aimwave, honda airwave, Honda, Airwave, alrwave,

Honda Airwave 1.5A M (New $35,888 £7,170 jyr 15-Jan-2009 1,496 cc - 5
5-yr COE)

Yet Another Beautiful And Well Maintained Wagon! High Loan Or Trade In Availl Try Out Our V.T.A.C In House Loan Senvices! 3.28% Pr
Only! Approval Almost Immediately So Hurry Down For A No ...

Prsted: 10-Jan-2019 Iags:Hi{:’gﬂa Honda Arwave, 2009 honda ainwave, Honda Ainwave, honda airwave, Handa, Ainvave, airmave,

Save up to 20.88% at Esso with the best petrol discount credit cards. Updated with the latest offers and promotions,

Find out more!

Honda Airwave 1.5A (COE till %$16,888 £6,040 fyr 09-Nov-2006 1,496 cc 450,000 km g
11/2021)

Great Family Car. Fast Deal. Callf SMS To View. Trade In/ High Loans Avallable,

Posted: 08-Jan-20149 T;:;Hi:]\?jg Honda Airwave, 2006 honda airwave, Honda Alrwave, honda airwave, Honda, Airwave, airwave,

Honda Airwave 1.5A (COE till $22,000 5,470 /yr 14-Feb-2008 1,496 cc 137,000 km  §
01/2023)

Superb LED Interior Lighting Kits, Car Well Mzintzined Exterior And Interior, Deluxe Car Floor Mat, View To Believe, Flexible Loan And Tr
Available.Viewing Strictly By Appointment Only.

360 VR Cars
Pusted: 07-Jan-2019 | 29% 2008 Honda Airwave, 2008 honda airwave, Honda Alrwave, honda airwave, Honda, Airwave, airwave,
Used Honda
ia Airwave 1.5A M (New %31, 800 $6,360 fyr 23-Jan-2009 1,496 cc 85,000 km €
COE)

hitps=iwww.sgcarmart. com/used_carsflisting php?RGD=104MOD =Alrwave&RPG=208VEH=D&AVL=2 213
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> Back to OneMotoring

PARFICOF Rehate Frning

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Business
Owner 1D: 1207K
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SJG4724M
Vehicle to be Exported: MNo
Intended Deregistration Date: 23 Jan 2019
Vehicle Make: HONDA

Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:

Manufacturing Year: 2008

Engine No.: L15A5160630
Chassis No.: GJ11208939
Maximum Power Output: 81.0kW (108 bhp)
Open Market Value: $14,168.00
Criginal Registration Date: 01 Jul 2008
First Registration Date; 01 Jul 2008
Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: $14,168.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Forfeited
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 30 Jun 2023
COE Category: A - Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period(Years): 5

PQP Paid: $19,107.00
COE Rebate Amount: $16,952.00
Total Rebate Amount: $16,952.00
Message

AIRWAVE 1.5M A
Silver

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-
registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever
is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 23 Jan 2019

OK
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FASTECH AUTO PTELTD
BLK1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883

VEHICLE NO:SJG 4724M

aTy

1PCS
1PCS
1PCS
1 SET
1PCS
1 PCS
1PCS
1PCS
1PC3
1PCS
1PCS

PARTICULAR
FRONT BUMPER

FRONT BUMPER REIN FORCEMENT
FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER O/S

FRONT BUMPER CLIPS

FRONT FENDER O/S
HEADLAMP O/S

78:

FRONT SUPPORT F‘P«NEL#

FRONT GRILLE
FRONT GRILLE LOGO

WIPER WASHER TANK /¢ 17

e (0

FRONT SPORT RIM O/5

LABOUR CHARGES:
TO CHECK WIRING

TO REFILL AIR CON GAS

TO CONDUCT WHEEL ALIGNMENT

TO SPRAY RUSF PROOFING

LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING PARTS
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING

Tl q
>
2 o
P -
!
= ; f._.'g:l-l:- §1r:ﬂ:?u_m|___.-' -
L $4BB.20
lta $66.80 —
oA $5000 —

vl §745.20 <

seafear $1,550.00

A §788.20
{ Na ;5_5’0_53{]#
Jze  $4500
e $28130
A $85000
$6.920.00

$50.00 “1
4 A $50.005¢
f $120.00 X
AL $50,00 X
$680.00 S0 0
$800.00 £ 5
TO $8,670.00



' 7d 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

;_‘ ; ; ; ; 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6255 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-96071968-R
Affiliated to Federation Internatlonale Des Experts En Automobile
ERGO INSURAMCE PTE LTD Ref : CS/EGI19001464/Ugqd3n2

5 TEMASEK BEOULEVARD

[T

#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 25-02-2019
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
ab Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBF BS62L Veh. Inspected S5JG 4724M
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. GBFBSG2ZL/SLAWm Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From LOH WAI MENG Assign Date 221012019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA AIRWAVE (A) c.C 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. GJ11208939 Colour GREY
Odomater 241412 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/65 R14 TOYO B mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/65 R14 TOYO & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/65R14 TOYO & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/65 R14 TOYO & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S FRONT PORTION.,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5 General Information
Accident Date 22/01/201% Inspection Date 22/01/2019
Survey held at FASTECH AUTO PTELTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417283
5a, Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
£1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Libi Indusirial Park, Singapaore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9807193-R Page Mo.1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJG 4724M
te By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition Estima
iy P Workshop () )
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER DENTED / 1,450.00 1,450.00
DEFORMED
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT TO REPAIR SEE 488.20 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER O/S NECESSARY £6.80 66.80
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|FRONT FENDER O/S TO REPAIR SEE 745,20
LABOUR
1|HEADLAMP QS SCRATCHED / 1,550.00 985,00
CRACKED
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 788.20 .
LABOUR
1|FRONT GRILLE CRACKED B05.30 485 50
1|FRONT GRILLE LOGO MNECESSARY 45.00 45.00
1|WIPER WASHER TANK DEFORMED 281.30 18540
1|FRONT SPORT RIM ©/S NOT NECESSARY B50.00 .
LESS 20% DISCOUNT - -653.54
£,820.00 2614.16
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING, 50.00 20.00
TO REFILL AIR CON GAS, NOT NECESSARY 50.00 2
TO CONDUCT WHEEL ALIGNMENT. NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
TO SPRAY RUSF PROOFING. NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING 680.00 300.00
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT BUMPER
REINFORCEMENT FRONT FENDER O/S AND FRONT
SUPPORT PANEL.
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. BO0.00 600.00
1,750.00 820.00
GRAND TOTAL B,670.00 3,534.16
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,800.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/EGI19001464/Uqd3n2




CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:. This Repor is made solaly for the use and bensfit of the Cliant named on the front page of this Report.
i cepled o any third party who may reply ¢n ihe Bepor whally o

Report Ref No. CS/EGI19001464/Uqd3n2
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