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S1 UBLAVE 1, #02.25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) (2563561 FAX : (065 62564515

Your ref; D19000644MFSH
Our ref: CS/FCII9001275/Uvd3 DATE: 05/3/2019
The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear SirMadam

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NOSJY 1898U

We thank for your instruction on 24/1/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

vehicle on 24/1/2019  at the premises of M/s FASTECH AUTO FTE LTD
Workshop Estimate Amount : §833,803.90

Revised Estimate Amount : 850,600.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check" Items Amount 8%

Market Value ;8%

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 8%

Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



MS@FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coreg bo 155000106¢ GST Reg, hia. M2-0001675-9
b Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore O4B580
Tel: (65 6222 2311 Fax: (65) 6222 3547

Chalms & Mator Undenwriting Dept: 30 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 063877
Tel (B5) 6507 3848 Fax: [R5} E507 1044
www.msfirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

23-01-2019 Our Ref No. D19000644MFSH
23-01-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHB3296M Third Party Vehicle. SJY1898U

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #01-46/48/50AUTOBAY
NANCY LAM

B7465405/ 67465405 Fax No. 67458520

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA Fax No. 68416315
MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc: Workshop
Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD Attention. NIL
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generatad letter, no signature reguired.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 5 March 2019 3:58 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: ‘Karen Tan'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000644MFSH/, SIY 1898U
Attachments; 5JY 1898U PREL| ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SJY 1898U
Date of survey: 24/1/2019
Number of days : 7 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 28 January 2019 9:41 AM

Ta: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000644MFSH/1, 51Y 1898U

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SIY 1898U on 24/1/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 24 January 2019 4:49 PM
To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

1



Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000644MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1072 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS$ Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 24 January 2019 4:00 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000644MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
: www.avg.com

e



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 28 January 2019 9:41 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc: ‘Karen Tan'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000644MFSH/1, SJY 1898U

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJY 1898U on 24/1/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phene: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 24 January 2019 4:49 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000644MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CW5 Motor Claims 1'maiIm:cwsmmDrclaims@m5ﬂrstcapital.cum.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 24 January 2019 4:00 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Maotor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000644MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited

Tel : 6507 3848
Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AUG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software,
: WWW.aVE.COm



Used Toyota Estima Car for Sale in Singapore, Zenith Automobile - sgCarMart Page | of 2
IGE&HMAR-‘--CW Login:  Sign ug

New Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Farum Resources

I AVIVA

...you can go to any workshop you preferred!

Estima Price Range | | Depreciation ™| | 2010 » | Vehicle Type v| M Submiti
Resources TU‘,.-'Dt—:_‘! Estima 2.4A Aeras G
ar Buying Crvervlew Financial Insurance Accessories Similar Ressarch Photos Map

Car Selling

T
Car Ownership cal?ﬁ?_‘_l__b
Pric $47,800
Car Aftermarket *“
Depreciation £26, 150 fyr ﬂ
On The Move L
Reg Date L 2-Mar-2010
Lifestyle {1yr Imth LEdays COE left)
Manufactured 2009 [ 7}
Car Leasing
Mileage 123,000 km (13.9k fyr}

ml PaSing

YOUR PREFERRED CAR LEASING
OPTIOM IN SINGAPORE

Transmission Auto

Engine Cap 2,362 o
Road Tax 51,638 fyr L 7]
Power 125.0 KW [167 bhp)

View specs of the T

Curb Weight 1,770 kg 7]

Features Rasponsive DOHC 241 WT-1 Engine, 7 Speed LT
Transmassod, Moonnpof, Push Start, Keyless Entry,
Dual Zone Climatic Aircon, Cruise Control.

]
L LTS
Accessories Sports Rims, Touch Screen Awdio System, Premium Location Map
Leathar Seats, Reverse Camera, Retractable Side
Mirrors, Power Tailgate, Dual Power Sliding Doors, Sellar Information
Description Marnithly Instaliment $1350, Guaranty Buy Back At Company Zenith Automobile
530,000 After 14 Manth » deal i
» 4
COE 7] ! 123
amy $36.41 ﬂ Address 1 Bakit Batok Crescent #02-54
ARF §36,481 L 7]
Location
Dereg Value 420,065 25 of today (chanae) o
Office Mo GoR4BRHY
No. of Owners . L 7]
Contact Person(s)  Simon 98197237
Typa of Veh Gearge BROBBEZS
Category
Useful Services
Availability Available
Afraid of lamons? Request to have
srﬁ this car pvaluated professionally
wha Ll i Tl Vehicke Evaluation
Find out the market valee for your car
& ! Get a free Car Valuation,
N
L Free Valuation
Upfront Payment
Transfer Fee 525 [ 7]
Compare Down Payment £14,340 { } Maximurm F0% [ 7]

hitps://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/info.php?ID=789256&DL=1238 24-Jan-19



Used Estima Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart Page 1 of 2

sGLARMART.COM Lagin

Hew Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources

dealers 4 Sell ur Car for Mare Cash
competed to s Highest Price or Get $100 Free SELL YOUR CAR S
buy my car! Get Paid Now, Handover Later QUOTZ

. B/2016 Outback 2.5i L5 Star Euro MCAP Rating L]
Post an Advertisement ( HIN LUNG AUTO -
i 1 Pyrt i 3 AUTO H
‘_-ueg_ s hel;:.iﬂ:e?ﬁe Itajual I o = HoBee % a
un L I 1 . Rk - P 3 =
$58 iHit's S One Stop Car Hub
Finance, Insurance, Workshop L]
New and Used Cars =
Browse by Category e Sort by Date Posted w | 20 results/page V|
6 vehicles Estima ! ; W Submiti
Ml Price Depreciation [ Eng Cap Mileage vel Type
Search Salection
§47.500 £14,470 fyr 21-Dec-2010 2,362 cc 150,000 kmi MPY hvailable
Rare 1 Owner Car! Luxury Specs! Mew Road Tax! Mew Tyres! Tip Top Condition! Hot Favorite Estima! Smoath Drive With Responshve Engine! Best
Choice To Renaw COE For Great New 10 Years! Hurry And Call No...
Es PAA X (New %69 800 56,970 fyr 12-Apr-2010 2,362 cc MY Available
J=vr LOE)
Complimentary & Months Pre-Owned Warranty. 100% Genune Mileage, Reguiarty Sarviced And Maintained. 100% Accdent Free, STANVICOM
Evaluation Weknome! Flexible And High Loan Packages Available, Trade-1.
B Agtamobibeg
Toyota Estima 2.44 Aeras G 44 800 £15,220 fyr 25-0et-2010 2,362 135,000 km MPY Available
Just Arrved! Cheapest Tn The Market! CHY Fast Sales! Super Low Mileage Done By Non Smoker Fravious Crenizr! 100% Loan Avallable! 100%
Accident Free! High Trade In Avaitable! Call Now For A& Non Obligato..
Toyoka Estima 2.4A Aeras G 47,800 S26,190 fyr 12-Mar-2010 2,364 cC 123,000 km MPY Availabie
Manthhy Installment $1350, Guaranty Buy Back At 30,000 After 14 Month.
Is your COE expiring? Let us help you renew it
GET YOUR : . :
COE Getting your COF renewed Is easy, fast and affordable. We'll help you renew your COE and get a loan for it Get the cheapest loan in towm and an
RENEWAL approval in 2 days without effort! Enquire today
LOAN
A Aeras G £75 800 47,570 fyr 059-Jun-2010 2,362 cc 103,000 km MPY Avallable
Criginal Facelft Model, Dan't Meed To Woery About Inspection And Insurance Claim. Major Maintenance And Make Over Done With Fresh New Paint
Dane Up And Top Engine Overhaul, Mice 3 Digit Bidded Car Pl L LD
Toyota Estima 2.4A X (New $73. 800 7,370 fyr 0B-lan-2010 2,362 cx MPY Avallable

10-yr COE

Rekable And Well Loved 8 Seater MPV Commanly Seen On The Roads! Most Durable And Efficient MPY! & Combination Of Space, Comifort And
Elegance For Your Love Ones While On The Road! Different Bank/In Ho

Lompare

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?RGD=2010&MOD=Estima&RPG=20& VEH=0&AV... 24-Jan-19



2471120149

> Back to OneMotoring

PARFICOFE Rehate Froing

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner |D;

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Criginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
60078

SJY1898U

No

24 Jan 2019
TOYOTA
ESTIMA 2.4X A
Gold

2010
2AZF397432
ACR500114645
125.0 kW (167 bhp)
$31,205.00

12 May 2010

12 May 2010

3

$31,205.00 /¢ bu

Yes
11 May 2020
$17,162.00

11 May 2020

B-Car(1601cc & above)

10
$23,889.00
$3,096.00

$20,258.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 24 Jan 2019

OK
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FASTECH AUTO PTELTD
BLK1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
YEHICLE NO:SJY 18980
aTyY PARTICULAR
1 PCS REAR WINDSCREEN
1PC3 REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING
1PCS TAILGATE lEFC 1O
1PCS TAILGATE REAR LOGO
1PCS TAILGATE 'ESTIMA' EMBLEM
1PCS TAILGATE "X’ EMBLEM
2PCS TAILGATE REFLECTORS @$485.10
1PCS TAILGATE CENTRE REFLECTOR
1PCS TAILGATE INNER LOCK
1PCS TAILGATE LOCK STRIKER
1 PCS TAILGATE LOCK REMOTE
1 PCS TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP
1PCS TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD
1SET TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS
2PCS TAILGATE INNER SIDE TRIM GARNISH @$115.20
1PCS TAILGATE OUTER CHROME HANDLE
1PCS REAR BUMPER
2 PCS REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS @$66.50
2PCS REAR BUMPER INNER SPONGES @$125.00
2PCS REAR BUMPER TOW COVERS @$33.50
2PCS REAR BUMPER REFLECTORS @$96.60
2PCS REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDERS @3$89.10
1PCS REAR END PAMEL
1PCS REAR END PANEL TOP GARMISH
1PCS REAR FLOOR PANEL
1PCS REAR FLOOR PANEL TOP BOARD
1PCS REAR FENDER O/S
2 PCS REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARDS @$798.10
1PCS REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS
1PCS REAR WHEEL HOUSING PANEL Q/3
1PCS REAR FENDER GLASS Q/S
2 PCS TAILLAMPS @5533.10
1PCS REAR AIR CON BLOWER O/5
1PCS REAR BACK ROLL SEAT ASSY
S.NETT
1 SET REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR
1PCS REAR END PANEL SEALANT
1PCS REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT
1PCS REAR FEMDER GLASS SEALANT OIS
1 SET REAR REVERSE CAMERA

L%/

AT $1880.10 X
2L $138.90 —
/4;.9@ 79 $1,866.10 —
224~ $68.50
el $79.20 —
A sees0 T
An  $970.20 X
A1 $366.50 X
M ffea $509.10—"
5 éf 4 %E':Ejl
5344,
1A s200.107
e fena §745.10~
A 550,00
A1 $230.60,%
A4 $29530 X
1 $1.450.00
‘3‘&‘?‘ ﬂﬂ.ﬂﬂ -
A4 $25000 X
A1 $67.00 ¢
A1 §193.2
et s ?3.2%
Lol D s899.10~
Ky T-~ $266.50—"
e d4 12 /Bt §1,120.10—
D/ pipd  sp45.30_~
s, $1,105.10 X
R /Bén $159%6.20,~
AL~ ss50.00—"
A $1.350.10 X
A~1  $1,005.30 .‘PL

CAn  $1376.204
// A 52&5210J4

AN $3.800.000%

.‘lrf [ 3’7 $26,523.90
!11@?7 clih $280.,00 900

444  $50.00
ALL  $50.00 0
A1 $50.00 )L

stAd s38000



1PCS
1PCS

REAR FENDER GLASS SOLAR FILM
TAILGATE TOP SPOILER

LABOUR CHARGES:

TO CHECK WIRING

TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING REVERSE SENSOR

TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING REAR WINDSCREEN &FENBER GLASS-
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX SEAT ,CUSHION UPHOLSTREY
TO MOUNT VEHICLE ON CAR O-LINER

TO SPRAY RUSF PROOFING

TO TRANSFER TAILGATE MECHANISM

TO DISMANTLE & REFIX FUEL TANK

TO REFILL REAR AIR CON GAS

TO CONDUCT WHEEL ALIGNMENT

LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING,CUT WELD,STRAIGHTENED
& REPLACING PARTS

TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING

L
A7

AL

w1

$350.00 X
$680.00

$80.00 S0
$80.00 fU
$300.00 / 29
$180.00 /0O
$380.00 X
$150.00 /@ O
$150.00 4 2
$100.00 *
$120.00 /¥ 0
$100.00

$2,000.00 /300

$1,800.00 [ 400

TO 533,803.90

(LI66.7)
963



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607153-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI12001275/Uvd3n2
$16.01 GITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068677 sl ”"m'“wmmuﬂ
Code: FCI2
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHB 3296M Veh. Inspected SJY 1888U
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19000644MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From KARENT Assign Date 24/01/2019
Z Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAESTIMA (A) c.c 2362
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. ACR500114645 Colour BEIGE
Odometer 158176 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOCD
3, Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/50 R18 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/50 R18 YOKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/50 R16 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/50 R18 YOKOHAMA & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/01/2018 Inspection Date 24/01/2018
Survey held at FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
CYIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUGTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 7 Working Days




Reg Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJY 1898U

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: G256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Page No.1of 3

- f Pai .| Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts itk Gmdiﬁnn Worksh 6.[:-8{:“ l:sj}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR WINDSCREEN NOT NECESSARY 1,880.10 i
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING NECESSARY 138.80 138.90
1| TAILGATE BADLY DENTED 1,866.10 1,685.10
1|TAILGATE REAR LOGO NECESSARY 68.50 £8.50
1| TAILGATE "ESTIMA" EMELEM NECESSARY 79.20 79.20
1| TAILGATE "X" EMELEM MECESSARY 66.50 B6.50
2|TAILGATE REFLECTORS [@$§485.10 NOT NECESSARY S70.20 -
1|TAILGATE CENTRE REFLECTOR NOT NECESSARY 366.50
1| TAILGATE INNER LOCK DENTED / JAMMED 509.10 509.10
1| TAILGATE LOCK STRIKER NOT NECESSARY 66 80 -
1| TAILGATE LOCK REMOTE DAMAGED 344 .50 344 50
1| TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP TWISTED 299.10 299.10
1| TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD DEFORMED ¢ T45.10 74510
CRACKED
1|SET TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS NECESSARY 50,00 50.00
2| TAILGATE INMER SIDE TRIM GARNISH @$115.30 NOT NECESSARY 23060 -
1| TAILGATE OUTER CHROME HANDLE NOT NECESSARY 295,30 .
1|REAR BUMPER DISTORTED 1,450.00 66510
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS @$66.50 BENT 133.00 133.00
2|REAR BUMPER INMNER SPONGES @%125.00 MOT NECESSARY 250.00 -
2|REAR BUMPER TOW COVERS @$33.50 NOT NECESSARY 67.00 .
2|REAR BUMPER REFLECTORS @$96.60 NOT NECESSARY 193.20 "
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDERS @%$89.10 BENT 178.20 178.20
1|REAR END PANEL BADLY DENTED 89910 899.10
1|REAR END PANEL TOF GARNISH DEFORMED / TORN 266.50 266.50
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL BADLY DENTED / 1,120.10 1,120.10
BUCKLED
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TOP BOARD DENTED / WARPED 84530 845.30
1|REAR FENDER O/S TO REPAIR SEE 1,105.10 -
LABOUR
2|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARDS @$798.10 DEFORMED / TORM 1,606.20 1,596.20
1|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
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1|REAR WHEEL HOUSING PANEL OIS TO REPAIR SEE 1,350.10 =
LABOUR
1|REAR FEMDER GLASS O/S NOT NECESSARY 1,005.30 -
2| TAILLAMPS @3688.10 CRACKED 1,376.20 1,376.20
1|REAR AIR CON BLOWER O/S NOT NECESSARY 2,862.10 -
1|REAR BACK ROLL SEAT ASSY NOT NECESSARY 3,800.00 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -2,778.93
26,523.90 B336.77
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SHORTED 280.00 200.00
1|REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 40.00
1|REAR FEMDER GLASS SEALANT OJS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1|SET REAR REVERSE CAMERA (SN) SHORTED 380.00 380.00
1|REAR FENDER GLASS SOLAR FILM (SN) NOT NECESSARY 350.00 -
1| TAILGATE TOP SPOILER (SN} NOT NECESSARY 680.00 -
1,840.00 670.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING. 80.00 30.00
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING REVERSE SENSOR. 80.00 50.00
TO DISMAMNTLE & REPLACING REAR WINDSCREEN 300.00 120.00
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX SEAT,CUSHION UPHOLSTERY. 180.00 100.00
TCO MOUNT VEHICLE OMN CAR O-LINER. NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
TO SPRAY RUSF PROOFING. 150.00 100.00
TO TRANSFER TAILGATE MECHANISM. 150.00 60.00
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX FUEL TANK. NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
TO REFILL REAR AIR CON GAS. 120.00 100.00
TC CONDUCT WHEEL ALIGNMENT. NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
LABOUR FOR PANEL 2,000.00 1,300.00
BEATING,CUT WELD STRAIGHTENED & REPLACING
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR FENDER
/S AND REAR WHEEL HOUSING PANEL Q5
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TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. 1,800.00 1,200.00
5,440.00 3,080.00

GRAND TOTAL 33,803.90 12,066.77
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 9,600.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
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MARKET VALUE: $34,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $20,258.00=NETT VALUE: $13,742.00

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

CISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client namad on the front page of this Repodt.




