Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Attachments:

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Wednesday, 31 March 2021 9:49 AM

Tek Soon Motor

RE: Your Ref: SKR6768D// LKK Ref: CC4/FWD19001191/Apa3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SLH9964A(FWD) AND SKR6768D ON 14/01/2019]
DV_SKR6768D.pdf; ATA_SKR6768D.pdf

We confirm settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair

$2,700.00

2. Loss of Use (4days x $80.00)

$ 320.00

Total | $3,020.00

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Tek Soon Motor <teksoonmotor@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 29 March 2021 11:29 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SKR6768D// LKK Ref: CC4/FWD19001191/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH9964A(FWD) AND

SKR6768D ON 14/01/2019]

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Please see attached LOD and final bill.



Thank you.

On Wed, Mar 17, 2021 at 5:10 PM Tek Soon Motor <teksoonmotor@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Hsiao Tong,
Noted with thanks for the reminder.
Will be sending over soonest.

Thank you.

On Wed, 17 Mar 2021 at 5:08 PM, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

REMINDER

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

For COR, recommended amount at L/sum $2,700.00(before GST) with 04 repair days.

Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt) to
us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 9 March 2021 1:51 PM

To: Tek Soon Motor <teksoonmotor@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SKR6768D// LKK Ref: CC4/FWD19001191/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH9964A(FWD)
AND SKR6768D ON 14/01/2019]

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

For COR, recommended amount at L/sum $2,700.00(before GST) with 04 repair days.

Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt) to
us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: Tek Soon Motor <teksoonmotor@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 March 2021 3:21 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SKR6768D// LKK Ref: CC4/FWD19001191/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH9964A(FWD)
AND SKR6768D ON 14/01/2019]

Hi Hsiao Tong,

This case how already?

Best,

Dawn

9069 2658

On Thu, 18 Feb 2021 at 4:11 PM, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice



Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to our below email.

Kindly advise if your client is still pursuing third party claim against our insured / M/s FWD Singapore Pte Ltd. If
so, kindly forward the LOD and all supporting documents to us if available for our further action.

Please respond and let us know within 10 days from the date of this e-mail. Otherwise, we will proceed to close
file at our end.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)




From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 20 October 2020 12:21 PM

To: teksoonmotor@gmail.com

Subject: Your Ref: SKR6768D// LKK Ref: CC4/FWD19001191/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH9964A(FWD) AND
SKR6768D ON 14/01/2019]

Your Ref: SKR6768D Without Prejudice

LKK Ref: CC4/FWD19001191/Apa3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH9964A(FWD) AND SKR6768D ON 14/01/2019

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under
BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned
case.

Attached is a copy of your client report as requested.

Kindly advise if your client is still pursuing third party claim against our insured / M/s FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. If
so, kindly assist to finalise your repair cost and number of days with our surveyor as soon as possible.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

TEK SOON MOTOR REPAIR AND SPRAY PAINTING

This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the addressee named. If you are
not the named addressee (or authorised to receive for the addressee) you must not disseminate,
distribute or copy this email. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-
mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system.

TEK SOON MOTOR REPAIR AND SPRAY PAINTING

This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the addressee named. If you are
not the named addressee (or authorised to receive for the addressee) you must not disseminate,
distribute or copy this email. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-
mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system.

TEK SOON MOTOR REPAIR AND SPRAY PAINTING

This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the addressee named. If you are
not the named addressee (or authorised to receive for the addressee) you must not disseminate, distribute
or copy this email. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by
mistake and delete this e-mail from your system.



