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51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0651 62563561 FAX : (065) 61564315

Your Ref: D19000507MFSH Date: 13 August 2019

Qur Ref: CS/FCI119001189/Aqd3

The Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SKQ 4527B .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 18/01/2019 at the premises of M/s LEE SHENG AUTO. and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S8  6.305.18
Revised Estimate Amount :S§  2.300.00
“Check” Items Amount 5% -
Market Value : S$ -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 8% »
Nett Value s -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages

at the rear portion.

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, M. MATA!
Licensed Appraiser



MS‘ Fi rs tCa pital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited cofeg Mo 1950000060 GST Reg Mo, M2-0001675-9

& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (65)6222 2311 Fax |65 6222 3547
Clatews & Moter Underwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore O5EB77

Tel; (B5) 6507 3848 Fax (65) 6507 3849
www msfirsteapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number,

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

17-01-2018 Our Ref No. D19000507MFSH
16-01-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHA7T316T Third Party Vehicle. SKQ4527B

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #01-58/60 AUTOBAY @KB
LEE EK CHEN
67477387/ 0 Fax No. 67457138

DIRECT SETTLEMENT:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA Fax No. 58416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

LEE SHENG AUTO PTE

LTD Attention. NIL
MA TP Sclicitor Fax No. NA
KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days far re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 August 2019 2:56 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments

Cc: 'Karen Tan'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000507MFSH/1
Attachments: CSFCI19001189Aqd3.pdf

Dear Karen,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SKQ 45278B.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 21 January 2019 2:44 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000507MFSH/1

Dear Karen,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SKQ 45278 on 18/01/2019.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 18 January 2019 4:43 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000507MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed repairer agreed survey on 21/01/2018.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) —

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 21 January 2019 2:44 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments

Cc: '‘Karen Tan’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000507MFSH/1
Dear Karen,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SKQ 45278 on 18/01/20189.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 18 January 2019 4:43 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Karen Tan' <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000507MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed repairer agreed survey on 21/01/2019.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [Ln_anm:cw5motnrcIaim5@msﬁrstcapital,cum,sg1

Sent: Friday, 18 January 2019 3:55 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cec: CWS5S Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital. com.sg>
Subject: PRI SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000507MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

1
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> Back to OneMotoring
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Cwner 1D Type:

Crwner 1D:

Wehicle Mo
Wehicle to be Exported
Intended Deregistration Date
Vehicle Makes:

Yehicle Model

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year

Engine Mo.

Chassis Mo

Maximum Power Qutput
Open Market Value

Original Registration Date
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:

PARF Eligibility
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

COE Expiry Date
COE Category
COE Period|Years)
QP Paid:
COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount
The information contained hereinis correct asat 21 Jan 2019

PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Company
3497D

SKOQ45278

Yes

21 Jan 2019

SUBARU

SUBARU XV 1.6 AWD CVT
Black

2014

FB161479761
JFIGPIKCSEGL46627
B4.0 kW (112 bhp)
$14,152.00

28 Nov 2014

28 Moy 2014

]

$11,152.00

Yes
27 Now 2024
%8,354.00

27 Mov 2024
& - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$464,900.00

33796500

$£46,330.00



LEE SHENG AUTO PTE LTD

1,Kaki Bukit Ave 6,Autobay@KakiBukit
#01-60/58 , Singapore 417883
Tel No. : 67477333 Fax No. : 67457138

E-Mail : leesheng@singnet.com.sg

Tax Reg. No. : 201000701R Buss. Reg. No. : 201 000701R

Messrs. WATELIER PTELTD

Estimate : ES000628

Page1/2

5 GUL AVE
S 629682 Date : 17/01/2019
P | 2 viehicle Num. : SKQ 45278
: . ' I Make/Model : SUBARU XV-2014
Altention : Motor Claim Department Chassis/Eng# - JF1GP3KCSEG146629/FB161479701
; bren . Accident Date : 16/01/2019
Xieo Chin Claim No. '
Reference :
Policy No. :
SN Quantity Particular Unit Price Amount 55
LIST ITEMS :
B 1PC REAR TRUNKLID /=€ = e §10.80
2 1PC REAR TRUNKLID QUTER GARNISH - 162.80 +
3, 4 PCS REAR TRUNKLID OUTER GARNISH CLIPS | = 1.60 6.40 1
4. 1PC REAR TRUNKLID LOGC = A 8360 ¥
5, 2 PCS REAR TRUNKLID EMBLEM 68.50 137.00 ©
8. 2PCS REAR LAMPS 1 377.40 754.80 ¢
- 1PC REAR TRUNKLID INNER LOCK 200.30 ©
8. 1PC WIPER ARM 4620
g 1PC WIPER MOTOR 21640 ©
10. 1PC REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING | M1 & 44.20F
1. 1PC REAR TRUNKLID WEATHERSTRIP| 119.50
12.  2PCS REAR TRUNKLID DAMPER | 14.20 28.40 ©
13. 1PC REAR TRUNKLID TRIM BOARD 252.80"
14. 1PC REAR BUMPER Sk {0{ B94.20
15.  BPCS REAR BUMPER CLIPS /™ 6o 6 250 20.00
16. 2PCS REAR BUMPER RETAINER “™ 1, L, 36.20 72.40 <
17. 2PCS REAR BUMPER BRACKET t 5.0y 36.20 72.40 T;”
18. 1PC REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Bést . DK 187.20
19. 2PCS REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR ™ =~ 24.30 4860 T
200 1PC REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR CENTRE (4 102.80 «~
21. 1PC REAR END PANEL a8s.90 1~
22. 1PC REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH AL prea = 100.50 4~
E ¥ hewrt ?flo.f_. 3 68 ‘r - B o
e List TotalS$ : 4,850.20
1@.@% Discount S% : 485.02
30Y. 436518

CONTINUE / ...



LEE SHENG AUTO PTE LTD

1,Kaki Bukit Ave 6,Autobay@HKakiBukit

#01-60/58 , Singapore 417883

Tel No. : 67477333 Fax No. : 67457138

E-Mail | leesheng@singnet.com.sg

Tax Reg. No. : 201000701R Buss. Reg. No. : 201000701R

Page 2/2

Messrs. W.ATELIER PTE LTD Estimate : ES000828
5 GUL AVE
S 620682 Date : 17/01/2019
Vehicle Num. : SKQ 45278
W : Make/Model - SUBARU XV-2014
Attertion:: Motor: Claim:-Department Chassis/Eng#  JF1GP3KC5EG146620/FB161479701
Accident Date ; 16/01/2019
Claim No. :
Reference .
Policy Mo, .
SN Quantity Particular Unit Price Amount 5§
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS :
1. 1SET REAR MUMBER PLATE & BASE /T +— ) 50,00 "
2/ 1 SET REAR BUMPER SENSOR /o | 22 260:00° 20
s R
Special Nett Total 5% : 300.00
LABOUR :
KNOCKING, CUTTING,JACKING WELDING ETC 00> >
SPRAY PAINTING 70000 T SV
TO CHECK WIRING AND SYSTEM FUNCTION 710 126-007°
TO APPLY RUST-PR DFlfNG ON AFFECTED AREA 120.00 +
s reove 2% Diee_ [0 g0 2
Labour Total S5 L P s 1,640.00
Adne, L2

L'I;'r I 'Eif’ml,‘fr:&

toted 287§ 44
.}/g 223k

LEE SHENG AUTO PTE LTD

Total 85 ! 30518



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX; 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607128-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Ref ; CS/FCH9001185%/Aqd3n2

#16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068677 Date: 14-08-2018 ” ””Imulmmmm
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 7T316T Veh. Inspected SKQ 45278
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. D19000507MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  KARENT Assign Date 18/01/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model SUBARU XV c.c 1600
Engine No, HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. JF1GP3IKCHEG146629 Colour BLACK
Odometer 53347 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General elalely
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/56 R17 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Front T},rru 225/55 R17 YORKOHAMA 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/55 R17 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/'H Rear Tyre 225/55 R17 YOKOHAMA & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
3. General Information
Accident Date  16/01/2018 Inspection Date 18/01/2019
Survey held at LEE SHENG AUTO PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE &
#01-60
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REFPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




avsimsm

174 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607198-R Page MNo.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKQ 45278
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | =* mhnp?:}} "‘"{:1}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR TRUNKLID NOT NECESSARY 910.80 -
1|REAR TRUNKLID QUTER GARNISH NOT NECESSARY 162.80 -
4|REAR TRUNKLID OUTER GARMISH CLIPS @$1.60 MOT NECESSARY 6.40 -
1|REAR TRUMNKLID LOGOD MOT NECESSARY 83.60
2|REAR TRUNKLID EMBLEM @ﬁﬂ-.ﬁﬂ NOT NECESSARY 137.00 -
2|REAR LAMPS @$377.40 WOT NECESSARY 754.80 -
1|REAR TRUNKLID INNER LOCK NOT NECESSARY 200.30 -
1|WIPER ARM NOT NECESSARY 46.20 -
1|WIPER MOTOR NOT NECESSARY 216.40 -
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 44 20 -
1|REAR TRUNKLID WEATHERSTRIP MOT NECESSARY 119.50 -
2| REAR TRUNKLID DAMPER @$14.20 MOT NECESSARY 28.40 -
1|REAR TRUNKLID TRIM BOARD WOT NECESSARY 252.80 -
1|REAR BEUMPER DEFORMED 894 20 894 20
B|REAR BUMPER CLIPS @$2.50 NECESSARY 20.00 20.00
2| REAR BUMPER RETAINER @$36.20 MECESSARY T72.40 72.40
?| REAR BUMPER BRACKET {@3$36.20 NOT NECESSARY 72.40 -
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 187.20 187.20
2| REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR @3$24.30 NOT NECESSARY 48.60 -
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR CENTRE cuT 102.80 102.80
1|REAR END PAMEL TO REPAIR SEE 388.90 -
LABOUR
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH HOT MNECESSARY 100.50 -
1|EXHAUST PIPE DENTED 684.00 684.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -553.42 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT - -392.12
4 980.78 1,568.48
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR NUMBER PLATE & BASE (SN) MOT NECESSARY 50,00 -

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18001189/Aqd3n2




’ VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

edm B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 198607198R GST Reg. No. 10-0607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
te By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition Estimate By
2 . Workshop ($)) ($)
1|SET REAR BUMPER SENSOR (SN) DAMAGED 250.00 200.00
300.00 200.00
LABOUR
KNOCKING, CUTTING, JACKING WELDING ETC.INCLUSIVE 700.00 500.00
OF THE REPAIR OF REAR END PANEL.
SPRAY PAINTING. 700.00 500.00
TO CHECK WIRING AND SYSTEM FUNCTION, 120.00 30.00
TO APPLY RUST-PROCFING ON AFFECTED AREA, NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
TO REMOVE EXHAUST PIFE. 150.00 B0.00
1,790.00 1,110.00
GRAND TOTAL 7,070.78 2,878.48
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,300.00
{TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19001189/Aqd3n2

‘g‘
ADRIAM LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

HMSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benafit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




