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!‘ l’!l‘! Auto

-~ Cansulants
e W Pte Lid Company Registration No. 19360T196R

1 URTAVE 1. #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 308933 TEL : (065) 62563301 FANX : (065) 62304315

Your ref: D19000443MESH

Owur ref: CS/FCI9001179/Gsd3 Date: 23/1/2019

The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SGH 9333E

We thank vou for your instruction on 18/1/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
21/1/2019  at the premises of M/s CYCLE & CARRIAGE FULCO MOTOR DEALER

PTELTD and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :5%15,790.00
Revised Estimate Amount :5%10,323.00
"Check" Items Amount 55 983.00
Market Value 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value 5

Nett Value 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear portion,

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

XING GUOQIANG (HP RIKR 0282)
MMATAL AMSAE-A
Automotive Assessor



MS @ FirstCapital

6 Faffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D4BSEQ
Tel (B5)6222 2311 Faw (B5) 6222 3547

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited ccReg wo 1050001060 CST Reg Ko M2 -DO01676-9

Claime & Hater Underariting Bept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 06ERTY

Tel: (B5) 6507 3848 Fax (6516507 3848
wwrwmsfirsteapital com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
15-01-2019 Our Ref No
12-01-2019 Claim Type
SHC8158M Third Party Vehicle

330 UBI ROAD 3
MARS LER
65949163/ 91792566

DIRECT SETTLEMENT: EST. COR - $15,790.00

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No
Ma,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Fax No.

. D18000443MFSH

. Third Party

. SGHI9333E

. 6B416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc: Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

CYCLE & CARRIAGE -

FULCO MOTOR DEALER Attention
PTELTD - (SERVICE)
NA TP Solicitor Fax No

SERENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

. NIL

. NA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Shirlex Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 5 April 2019 1:57 PM

To: ‘Mars Ler": 'Chris Bulaclac’; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: 'Renemer Bagang'

Subject: RE: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D19000443MFSH ; YOUR REF: SGHI333E
Dear Mars,

Confirmed final fig $11,458.00 @ 8 days of repairs.

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408333)

From: Chris Bulaclac [mailto:chris.bulaclac@ccfulco.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 March 2019 9:10 AM

To: 'guogiang@lkkauto.com' <guogiang@lkkauto.com>; Admin A (admin-a@lkkauto.com) <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com=
Cc: Mars Ler <mars.ler@ccfulco.com.sg>; Renemer Bagang <renemer.bagang@ccfulco.com.sg>

Subject: Re : SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D19000443MFSH ; YOUR REF: SGH9333E

Hi Guogiang,

Please see attach file for your reference & finalization.
Thank You,

Best regards

Mars Ler

B & P Service Advisor

Cycle & Carriage Fulco Motor Dealer Pte Ltd
330 Ubi Road 3 Singapore 408650

D/D 65949163 H/P 91792566

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)
Sent: Friday, 18 January, 2019 3:00 PM

To: Mars Ler

Cc: CWS Motor Claims; Serene Ler

Subject: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D19000443MFSH ; YOUR REF: SGH9333E

Dear Sir/Madam

PRI Request For SGHI333E Accident Involving SHC8159M On 12-01-2019 AT 20:15:00HRS.
1



Please find below details for your reference

« Claim number : D19000443MF5SH

« Insured vehicle number : SHC8159M

« Accident date : 12-01-2019

+ Third-party vehicle number : SGH9333E
« Assignment type : DIRECT SETTLEMENT

« Surveyor : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
» Officer-in-Charge : SERENE

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 23 January 2019 12:20 PM

To: "CWS Motor Claims'

Cc ‘Serene Ler’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000443MFSH/1, SGH 9333E
Attachments: SGH 9333E PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SGH 9333E
Date of survey: 21/1/2019
Number of days : 8 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler on behalf of Shirley

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 18 January 2019 3:45 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Serene Ler' <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000443MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed repairer agreed survey on 21/01/20185.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email; assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S$(308933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 18 January 2019 3:00 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmaotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Serene Ler <Sereneler@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000443MF5H/1

' D.ear SikMdm,.



We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited

Tel : 6507 3848
Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

- AVG. This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software,
: WWW.ave.com



019409 PARFIMAF Rahate Frmiing

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type:

Singapore NRIC

Owner ID: 1899C

Vehicle No.: SGH9333E

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 22 Jan 2019

Vehicle Make: MITSUBISHI

Vehicle Model: LANCER EX 1.6 AT LED TAIL LAMP
Primary Colour: Silver

Manufacturing Year: 2015

Engine No.: 4A92CGB0O72

Chassis No.: JMYSRCY1AGU004101
Maximum Power Output: 86.0kW (115 bhp)
Open Market Value: $14,037.00

Original Registration Date: 28 Jun 2016

First Registration Date: 28 Jun 2016

Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $14,037.00

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 27 Jun 2026

PARF Rebate Amount: $10,527.00

COE Expiry Date: 27 Jun 2026

COE Category: A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $53,694.00

COE Rebate Amount: $39,897.00

Total Rebate Amount: $50,424.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 22 Jan 2019

ntps:iivelita gm‘.ag-‘lw.'vrl.‘actlnn.u'er'lqulreHaﬂatEHyr‘uDlsl::lzlarurauereglnpul:?l—uNL;| HIN_|U=FRS0a009 ) |



“LONPAC INSURANCE BHD[&wcmsm

Antrrporaied in iieayiia)

Singapors Offica: 200, Beach Road #17-04/07, The Concowse. Singapers 185555
Tal: (65) 6250 738 Fau: (55) E208 3TET Wabsils: wasw lonpac oom g
GST Reg No.: FO-0005825-C

Class of Policy : MOTOR CAREPLUS Policy No. » Z18VPQS013899
Named Drivers 2 1. THE INSURED

Age: 63

2. NG KIM LUK

Age: 27

This Palicy is subject to the following endorsements. clauses, warranties, and/or Special Excdusion(s) as printad in this Policy or added thereon
ar attached thereto and forming part of this Policy.

AUTHORISED WORKSHOP WARRANTY / DISTRIBUTOR-OWNED MOTOR WORKSHOP

——prmmmEme——

IT 15 HEREBY WARRANTED THAT IT SHALL BE A CONDITION PRECEDENT TO LIABILITY THAT ALL REPAIRS
TO THE INSURED VEHCLE WOULD BE CARRIED OUT BY AN AUTHORISED WORKSHOP OF LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
OR DISTREBUTOR-OWNED MOTOR WORKSHOP OTHERWISE THERE WILL BE NO PAYMENT UNDER SECTION 1.

1) ACCESSORIES

2] AR-CONDITICMING UNT & CAR RADIO/CASSETTE/C.D FLAYER
3) CLAIMS OPTION

4) ENDORSEMENT NO. 30 - REPLACEMENT PARTS

5) ENDORSEMENT NO. 72 - LEGAL LIABILITY OF PASSENGERS FOR ACTS
MNEGLIGENCE

6) EXCESS CLAUSE (OWN DAMAGE CLAIMS)

7} ACCIDENTS TO PASSENGERS AND AUTHORISED DRIVER (OTHER THAN THE INSURED)
8) BREAKAGE OF GLASS IN WINDSCREEN OR WINDOWS

9) EXCESS CLAUSE - ELDERLY OR YOUNG &/OR INEXPERIENCED DRIVERS

10} INCENTIVE DISCOUNT SCHEME FOR OFFEMGE FREE DRIVERS
11) MO CLAIM DISCOUNT PROTECTION

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CHEF EXECUTIVE
(Singapore Branch)

Lsar D : SINGCHEW1
Date lssued  : 2018-06-07 17:13:15.813

PRIVACY POLICY

For information on our privacy policy, please visit our website www.lonpac. COm.sg

Paolicy Schedule - Page 2 of 2
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CYCLE & CARRIAGE-FULCO MOTOR DEALER PTE LTD ’
EUNOS LINK SERVICE CENTRE

F A Y

CYCLE & CARRIAGE 330 Ubi Road 3 Singapore 408650 Tel: 67461000 Fax: 64875857 e
ESTIMATE
invoice Name & Address Owner Name & Vehicle Info
M5 First Capital Insurance Limited Cust No/Name /Ms Tan Chor Kheng Jenny
36 Robinson Road #16-01 Reg No/Reg Date SGHI3I3IE*1F / 28/06/2016
City House Date In/Mileage 15/01/2019/ 0
Singapore 068877 Chassis No JMYSRCY1AGU004101
Engine No AA0ZCG8072
Contact Mo Make /Model MIT/16MY LANCER EX 1.6 4AT
Colour/Trim ADL / BK
AccountNo Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIF No
FOOO0034 Credit 16/01/2019/ 19:28 DS 218 / MarsLer 17184
Description of Goods | Services Qty  Unit Price Disc% Amount
S MIPNTBBDEE ~ 250.00
DIAGNOSTIC/SCANNING £{
S MIPNTBB088 * B80.00

L

LA

R E T EEZETEZEEE=EZE=E

TO CHECK LIGHTNIMG AND WIRING SYSTEM ON REAR ACCIDENT
AFFECTED AREAS

MIPNTEEDEE

TO REMOVE & RE-INSTALL CARPETING & TRIMMING TO GIVE WAY
ACCESS REPAIR ON REAR ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS
MIPNTSR088

TO APPLY SEALANT OM NEW PAMELS

MIPNTEE088

TO TRANSFER REAR BOOT COMPONENTS AND MECHANISM
MIPNTBEDEE

TO REPLACE REAR BOOT,REAR BUMPER,REINFORCEMENT,ETC.

-TO CUT AMD WELD REAR END PAMEL AND FLOOR PAMNEL

-TO REPAIR LHR QUTTER FENDER

STRAIGHTEM,REFORM,ALIGN ON REAR ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS
MIPNTBB0BS

TO APPLY SOUND PROOF SEALANT KIT

MIPNT9B0BE

SPRAY PAINTING ON REAR ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS

JJ64108832 FACE,RR BUMPER - T7V/
JJ6410C544 RH, BRKT,R/BMPR FACE 7 ggg.
JJ6410C543 LH,BRKT,R/BMPR FACE

JJ64108929 REINFORCEMENT,RR BUM o~ (,g,‘{
JJ64108028 REINFORCEMENT ,UPR,RR,
JJ5281A179 PANEL,RR END, .~ 6

JJ52514837 FLoor.RR X il
JJ5920A061 PAMEL, TRUNK LID .~ A }\/
JJ5925A042 GAS SPRING,TRUNK LID ¢, N
JJ5921A003 WEATHERSTRIP,TRUNK L _- |
JJ5927A012 LATCH,TRUNK LID _-
JJ5927A010

STRIKER,TRUNK LID LA % pVA/

2

r

%

1.00 852.00 0.00
1.00 17.00 0.00
1.00 17.00 0.00
1.00 231.00 0.00
1.00 90.00 0.00
1.00 556.00 0.00
1.00 572.00 0.00
1.00 760.00 0.00
2,00 66.00 0.00
1.00 182.00 0.00
1.00 74,00 0.00
1.00 24,00 0.00

MO £

556
572

132
182

Loo 600.

202 300.
Gos 600.

5400,

loo 4.
20 2940.

g52.
17.
17.
231.
90.

00

oo

0o

0o

oo

00
00
0o
oo
00

00
00
760.

0o

.00
00
74,
24,

0o
]

Confirm & accepted by

Authorized signatory and company stamp

Validity of this estimate is 14 days from date of guote. This is a computer generated document, no signature is required.

Estimated costs quoted are excluding GST. We would mention that the above estimate is based on our initial inspection and does not include

any additional parts or labour which may be required after repair work has commenced. Occasionally worn or damaged parts are discovered
after work has started and needed for repairs or replacement. However, should this eccur, we would advise you, Please be informed that a
deposit of 50% of the above estimate is payable before commencement of the work. Payment for this may be made in cash, credit card or

chegue. You must also agree to pay full amount for renewal of the windscreen in the event of inadvertent breakage in the course of remewing

the rubber seal or other repair requiring the removal of the windscreen.

Page 1 of 2
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CYCLE & CARRIAGE

CYCLE & CARRIAGE-FULCO MOTOR DEALER PTE LTD

EUNOS LINK SERVICE CENTRE
330 Ubi Road 3 Singapore 408650 Tel: 67461000 Fax: 64875857

ESTIMATE

4
/a

MITSUBISHI
MOTORS

Invoice Name & Address

Owner Name & Vehicle Info

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited
36 Robinson Road #16-01

Cust No/Name

/Ms Tan Cher Kheng Jenny

Reg No/Reg Date SGHI333E*1F / 28/06/2016

AButhorized signatory and company stamp

City House Date In/Mileage 15/01/201%/ 0
Singapore 068877 Chassis No JMYSRCY1AGUO04101
Engine No 4A920G80T2
Contact Ne Make/Model MIT/L6MY LANCER EX 1.6 4AT
Colour/Trim AD1 / BK
Account Mo Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIP No
FOOO0034 Credit lﬁ,"[}l;’Zﬂlgf 19:28 bs 218 / MarsLer 17184
Description of Goods | Services i Qty Unit Price Disc% Amount
M JJ7240A032 TRIM, TRUNK ROOM RR E ~ ¥& - 1.00 164,00 0.00 164.00
M WB330A001LED LED TAILLAMP KIT {‘-I'L 1.00 855.00 0.00 855.00
M JJB355A039 REFLECTOR,LH » 1.00 36.00 0.00 36.00
M JJB355A040 REFLECTOR, RH LV 1.00 36.00 0,00 36.00
M JJB410A436WA COVER,RR BUMPER ’%5 1.C0 22.00 0.00 £2.00
M JJB341A099 LAMP ASSY,LICENSE PL &% /UN 2.00 i5.00 0.00 70.00
M JJ7415AL111 MARK , THREE-DIA ~° L 1.00 51.00 0.00 51.00
M JJMRE74899 MARK,LANCER ~~ l‘t' 1.00 58.00 0.00 58.00
M JJIMRZ00300 CLIP, BUMPER -~ a;,l 10.00 2.00 0.00 20.00
M JJB430A0B3 BRACKET,LICENSE PLAT - v 2.00 13.00 0.00 26.00
M JJ5370AZE9 LH/SHIELD,RR WHEELHO '? 1.00 32.00 0.00 32.00
M JJBE3ITAL34 BUZZER,KEYLESS OPERA s f]gM 1.00 170.00 0.00 170.00
M JJBE3ITALIS ANT . KEYLESS OPERATIO 1.00 93.00 0.00 93.00
Z NOTES |
ACCIDENT ON 12/01/2019 ALONG UPPER BUKIT TIMAH ROAD
OWNER CLAIMING UNDER THIRD PARTY
REQUIRED REPLACEMENT CAR
TP #: SHCB159M TP INS: MS FIRST CAPITAL
5V - A
——— . - b
MM P%U} 9‘72«7{3'5 : ' .'
|'
, 015 i :'
GM@ &,O’\f - 3}39 |
| :
|
L / [ / IT ; :
|
|
F
Confirm & accepted by L “Parts 5,140.00
Labour 0.0
Standard Menu 0.00
Specialist Job 10,650.00
Others (Lub,etc) 0.00
Sundry _ 0.00
Total(w/o GST) /50F0  15,790.00

Validity of this estimate is 14 days from date of quote. This is a computer generated document, no signature is required.
Estimated costs guoted are excluding GST. We would mention that the above estimate is based on our initial inspection and does not include
any additional parts er labour which may be required after repair work has commenced. Occasionally worn or damaged parts are discoversd
after work has started and needed for repairs or replacement. However, should this occur, we would advise you. Please be informed that a
depesit of 50% of the above estimate is payable before commencement of the work. Payment for this may be made in cash, cradit card or

cheque. You must also agree to pay full amount for renewal of the windscreen in the event of inadvertent breakage in the course of renewing

the rubber seal or other repair requiring the removal of the windscreen.

Page 2 of 2




@ @ CYCLE & CARRIAGE-FULCO MOTOR DEALER PTE LTD g
EUNOS LINK SERVICE CENTRE

CYCLE & CARRIAGE 330 Ubi Road 3 Singapore 408650 Tel: 67461000 Fax: 64875857 e
ESTIMATE
T IhvoiCe Name & Addrass i i [ ide T T (Owiier Name & Vehlelellnfor i - R
MS First Capital Insurance Limited Cust No/Name | /Ms Tan Chor Kheng Jenny
36 Robinson Road #16-01 _Reg No/Reg Date SGH3333E*IF  / 28/06/2016
City House Date In/Mileage |15/01/2019/ 0
Sigeppee- it Chassfs No |JMYSRCYLAGUOO4101
Engine No  I4A92CGEO72
Contact No _Make/Model [MIT/L6MY LANCER EX 1.6 4AT
Colour/Trim A1 / BK

“Account Noi: Terms ., Date/Time Printed #™{GSE " /- {Op e B e PRI N o it el b v s

FOOOO0034 Credit 18/03/2019/ 11:24 0s 323 / ChrisBulaclac 17184

0 DescApton o Goons [ Services T IiT i T T @ty [UnitPrice  DIsc% - iAmount i

5 MIPNTEBDAS 250,00
DIAGNOSTIC/SCANNING

S MIPNTS8088 60,00

TO CHECK LIGHTMING AND WIRING SYSTEM ON REAR ACCIDENT
AFFECTED AREAS

5 MIPNTBB0EE 300.00
TO REMOVE & RE-INSTALL CARPETING & TRIMMING TO GIVE WAY
ACCESS REPAIR ON REAR ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS

S MIPNTBB0BB ; 200.00
TO APPLY SEALANT OM NEW PANELS
5 MIPNTBBOBS 200.00

0
TO TRANSFER REAR BOOT COMPORENIS-AN
S MIPNTBA20BE 3000.00
TO REPLACE REAR BOOT,REAR BUMPERTRE EMENTLET!

-TO CUT AND WELD REAR END PANEL AND FLOQR PANEL
-TO REPAIR LHR OUTTER FENDER
STRAIGHTEN,REFORM,ALIGN ON REAR ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS

S MIPNTREOSS 300.00
TO APPLY SOUND PROOF SEALANT KIT

S MIPNT98088 2520.00
SPRAY PAINTING ON REAR ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS

§ MIPNTRS0E8 280,00

REVERSE SENSOR SET .~ (/M
A M199000QC 0

ZND TECH:NA
COMPLAINT : NA

REP:YEE

REP DOME:YEE
% JJ64108832 FACE,RR BUMPER 1.00 852,00 0.00 852.00
% JJ6410C544 RH,BRKT,R/BMPR FACE ! 1.00 17.00 0.00 17.00
X JJ64100543 LH,BRKT,R/BMPR FACE 1.00 17.00 0.00 17.00
X JJe4lopezg REINFORCEMENT,RR BUM 1.00 231.00 0.00 231.00
X JJ6410B028 REINFORCEMENT,UPR,RR 1.00 90.00 0.00 90.00

Confirm L accepted by

Fﬂ;‘ﬂﬁép— .r;q G'#d @;'n.:? Lft"fe"
w70
Ruthorized signatory and company stamp

Validity of this estimate 4s 14 days from date of guote. This is a computer generated document, no signature is required.

Estimated costs gquoted are excluding G5T. We would mention that the above estimate is based on our initia) inspection and does not include
any additional parts or labour which may be required after repair work has commenced. Occasionally worn or damaged parts are discovered
after work has started and needed for repairs or replacement. However, should this occcur, we would advise you. Please be informed that a
deposit -of 50% of the above estimate s payable before commencement of the work. Payment for this may be made in cash, credit card or
cheque. You must also agree to pay full amount for renewal of the windscreen in the event of inadvertent breakage in the course of renewing
the rubber seal or other repair requiring the removal of the windscraen.
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%- @ CYCLE & CARRIAGE:-FULCO MOTOR DEALER PTE LTD &
EUNOS LINK SERVICE CENTRE

CYCLE & CARRIAGE 330 Ubi Road 3 Singapore 408650 Tel: 67461000 Fax: 84875857 ”Hﬂg"fs”l

T e NS AR e A e F R
HS F1 rst_ Capita'ﬁ Insurnn:e Lilﬂ'ltﬂd .Eljﬁsjnﬂg.fﬂ_%_m_,l.____EH_S.[M!-.CII..‘.O.T Eh_epg JE
36 Robinson Road #16-01 Reg No/Reg Date SGH9333E*1F / 28/06/2016
City House | Date In/Mileage i15/01/2019/ B oo
Singapore 068877 | Chassis No MYSRCY1AGUOO4101 B
_Engine No _ 14A92CGB072 B
Contact No  Make/Model (MIT/LEMY LANCER EX 1.6 &AT
Colour/Trim 01 / BK
JAccountNo
FOOQ0034
FEEm B ._.'-'
% JJ5ZBLALTI PANEL,RR END 0.0 556,00
X JJ5920A061 PANEL, TRUNK LID- 0.00 760,00
X JJ5921A003 WEATHERSTRIP, TRUNK L 0.00 1B2.00
X JJS927A01E LATCH, TRUNK LID 0.00 74.00
X JJT240A032 TRIM,TRUNK ROOM RR E 0.00 164.00
X WB330A00LLED LED TAILLAMP KIT 0.00]? 855.00
X JJB355A039 REFLECTOR,LH 0.00 36.00 -
X JJBA10A43GMWA COVER,RR BUMPER . i 0.00 22.00
X JJ7415A111 MARK , THREE-DIA 1.00 51.00 0.00 51.00
% JJIMRS574899 MARK , LANCER 1.00 58.00° 0.00 58.00 -
X JJMU4BBOOG CL} ROOM COV O 00 2.00 0.00 20.00
X JJ8637A134 BUZ YYES ! 170.00 0.00 170.00
X JJBB3ITALIG ANT, 5 ATIO0 . h 1. _ 93.00 0.00 93.00
Z NOTES = T
ACCIDENT ON 12/01/2019 ALONG UPPER BUKIT TIMAH ROAD . R
OWMER CLAIMING UNDER THIRD PARTY
REQUIRED REFLACEMENT CAR (R/A-22039)
TP #: SHCA159M TP INS: MS FIRST CAPITAL
Confirm & accepted by Parts 4,248.00
Labour 0.00
Standard Menu 0.00
Specialist Job 7,210.00
Others(Lub,etc) 0.00
Sundry 0.00
Kuthorized signatory and company stamp Total (w/o GST) 11,458.00

valldity of this estimate is 14 days from date of quote. This is a computer generated document, no signature 1s required.

Estimated costs guoted are excluding G5T. We would mention that the above estimate is based on our initial inspection and does not include
any additicnal parts or labour which may be required after repair work has commenced, Oceasicnally worn or damaged parts are discovered
after work has startad and meedsd for repairs or replacemsnt. However, should this eccur, we would advise you. Please be informed that a
deposit of 50% of the above estimate i3 payable bafors conmencement of the work. Payment for this may be made in cash, credit card or
cheque. You must alsc agree to pay full amount for ranewal of the windscreen in the event of inadvertent breakage in the course of renswing
the rubber seal or other repair requiring the removal of the windscreen.
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' Ve Vg LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Bsm mE . 51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: G256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI18001179/Gsd3n2

36 ROBINSOMN ROAD

Date ;. 11-04-2019

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAFORE 068877

Code ; FCI2
1 Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC B153M Veh., Inspected SGH 9333E
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19000443MFSH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From  SERENE LER Assign Date 18/01/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI LANCER c.C 1590
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. JMYSRCY1AGUO04101 Colour SILVER
Odometer 34616 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 YOKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R1& YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 YOKOHAMA & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  12/01/2019 ]Inspaction Date 21/01/2019
Survey held at CYCLE & CARRIAGE FULCO MOTOR DEALER PL
NO,330 UBI ROAD 3
SINGAPORE 408650
5a. Remarks
AVDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: B Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubd Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 4085933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6266 4315

Reg. Mo: 198B071%38R GST Reg. Mo. 19-89607198-R Page No.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SGH 9333E
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | ,-* mmp?;}} “l}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FACE RR BUMPER (SN} TORN 852 00 852.00
1|RH BRET, R/BMPR FACE (SN) DEFORMED 17.00 17.00
1|LH,BRET.R/BMPR FACE (SN) DEFORMED 17.00 17.00
1|REINFORCEMENT RR BUM (SN} BENT 231.00 231.00
1|REINFORCEMENT, UPR.RR (SN) BENT S0.00 90.00
1|PANEL.RR END (SN) BENT 556,00 556.00
1|FLOOR.RR (SN} TO REPAIR SEE 572,00 2
LABOUR
1|PANEL TRUNK LID (SN} BENT 760.00 760.00
2|GAS SPRING TRUNK LID (SN) NOT NECESSARY 132.00
1|WEATHERSTRIP. TRUNK L (SN) TWISTED 182.00 182.00
1|LATCH, TRUNK LID (SN) BENT 74.00 74.00
1|STRIKER TRUNK LID LA (SN) NOT NECESSARY 24,00
1|TRIM TRUNK ROOM RR E (SN) DEFORMED 164.00 164.00
1|LED TAILLAMP KIT (SN) DEFORMED 855.00 855.00
1|REFLECTOR LH (SN) CuT 36.00 36.00
1|REFLECTOR RH (SN} NOT NECESSARY 36.00 s
1|COVER RR BUMPER (SN) MISSING 22.00 22.00
2|LAMP ASSY LICENSE PL (SN) NOT NECESSARY 70.00 :
1|MARK THREE-DIA (SN} HNECESSARY 51.00 51.00
1IMARK . LANCER (SN} NECESSARY 58.00 58.00
10| CLIP BUMPER (SN} HECESSARY 20.00 20.00
2|BRACKET,LICENSE PLAT (SN} NOT NECESSARY 26.00 .
1|LH,SHIELD,RR WHEEL HO (SN) NOT NECESSARY 32.00 :
1|BUZZER KEYLESS OPERA (SN) DAMAGED 170.00 170.00
1|ANT KEYLESS OPERATIO (SN) DAMAGED 93.00 93.00
1|SET REVERSE SENSOR (ADDITIONAL)(SN) DAMAGED 280.00 280.00
5,420.00 4,528.00
LABQUR
DIAGNOSTIC/SCANNING. 250.00 250.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19001179/Gsd3n2




'Y ’d 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
)

Al BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 8256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. Mo 109607198R GST Reg. No. 18-0607188-R Page No.:Z of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted

Description of Parts Condition

o P Workshop ($)]  (5)
TO CHECK LIGHTNING AND WIRING SYSTEM ON REAR 80.00 B0.00
ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS,
TO REMOVE & RE-INSTALL CARPETING & TRIMMING TO £00.00 300.00
GAIVE WAY ACCESS REPAIR ON REAR ACCIDENT
AFFECTED AREAS.
TO APPLY SEALANT ON NEW PANELS, 300.00 200.00
TO TRAMSFER REAR BOOT COMPONENTS AND 600,00 300.00
MECHAMISM
TO REPLACE REAR BOOT,REAR 5.400.00 3,000.00

BUMPER, REINFORCEMENT ETC.TO CUT AND WELD
REAR END PANEL AND FLOOR PANEL-TO REPAIR LHR
OUTTER FENDER.STRAIGHTEN, REFORM, ALIGN ON
REAR ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS.INCLUSIVE OF THE
REPAIR OF FLOOR,RR.

TO APPLY SOUND PROOF SEALANT KIT. 480.00 300.00

SPRAY PAINTING ON REAR ACCIDENT AFFECTED 2,540.00 2.520.00
AREAS

10,650.00 6,930.00

GRAND TOTAL 16,070.00 11,458.00

I RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 11,458.00]

Report Ref No. CS/FCI119001179/Gsd3n2

KL

XING GUO QIANG ADRIAN LING WAI PING
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng, AMSOE.AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI
Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser

ISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report s made sobely for the use and benefit of the Clent named cn the front pags of this Report.
N Babiliny of ;




