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MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 17-01-2019 Our Ref No. D19000458MFSH
Accident Date 15-01-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHC7213X Third Party Vehicle. SDQRBS0L
Survey Location 303 ALEXANDRA RDAD SIME DARBY PERFORMANCE CENTRE
Contact Person. CARCLINE
Contact No. 63150174/ 0 Fax No. B4794801
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: LIABILITY UNCLEAR:
Appoisisd LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. MA,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental

OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

PERFORMANCE
Cc : Workshop MOTORS LIMITED Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge SITHARA
IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspegtion
This is & computer generated lefter, no signature reguirsd.
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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

e — e S e e |

From: Admin-D {LKEKAuto)

Sent: fFriday, 26 April 2013 3:.05 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims!; assignments

Cc *Sithara’; SUR

Subject: RE: REQUEST OF SURVEY REPORT-OUR REF:D19000498MFSHACCIDENT

INVOLVING SHC7213X AND SDQ88BOL ON 15-01-2019

Prear SirfMdm,

Thank you for the email.

Flease be informed that according to the repairer TP owner has already converted to OD claim.
Mo:survey was-done for SDQ 8880L.

We will close this case at our end without billing.

Frest Regaids,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lud

Fhone: 684116972 | email pesipmmments@lkkantocom | fax: besf-gas
ik 53, Paoym Ubi Industreial Park, bl Avenue, #oz-25 | S(4084533)

From: CWS5 Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotarclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Friday, 26 April 2019 1:48 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital. com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: REQUEST OF SURVEY REPORT-OUR REF:D19000498MFSH;ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC7213X AND SDQ8880L
ON 15-01-2019

Dear Sir,
We received LOD from workshop/solicitor.
Please let us have the Survey Report including Vehicle Inspection Photos & Survey Fees Invoice asap.

Kindly upload the survey report through CWS from document management screen by selecting option
Survey report.

Thanks & Regards,

Motor Claims Department

VIS First Capital Insurance Ltd
owsmotorclaim i ital.



