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MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Data 17-01-2019 QOur Ref No. D19000491MFSH
Accident Date 15-01-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHC1010D Third Party Vehicle, SJW8810L

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person
Contact Number.

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

BLK 1 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE SECTOR C #01-115
JACELYN LOH
B55580944/ 0 Fax No. 65153144

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS FTE LTD

NA Fax No. BB416315
NA,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT U el ML;.cka

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST
Ce : Workshop f_::;u‘m SERVICES PTE Atterition, NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Officer Incharge

MAY CHUA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey repart via CWS within 14 days far survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection;

This is a computer generated latter, no signature required,
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Celine Fong (LKKAutnz

From: Celine Fong (LKKAutg) .

Sent, Wadnesday, 11 September 2019 11:58 AM

To: ‘CWS Motar Claims’; assigniments

Ce: ‘May Chisa Hui Chin’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1900C49TIMFSH/1
Dear Sir/Mdm,

Plezse be informed that according to the repairer TP owner already withdraw claim.
No survey was done for this case,

We will close this file at our end without billing.

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKX Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phoie: 6256-3561 | email: pelinefongElkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | Sl408933)

Frem: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

sent: Thursday, 17 January 2019 5:49 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Clainis' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'May Chua Hui Chin' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR csur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000491MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignmeant.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

. Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Indystrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4n8033)

From: CWS Motor Claims |mgilgg;gsmoggrclaimg@mgﬁ'rgicag!'ml.gom.g]
Sent: Thursday, 17 January 2019 5:14 PM

Ta: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cei CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorglaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; May Chua Hul Chin

<mnaychua@msfirstcapital. com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000491MFSH/1



