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Eivifh,a (LKK Auto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 17 January 2019 1:30 PM

To: assignments

Subject: FW: TP / OUR CLIENT SKU7685L DOA: 09/01,/2019 POLICY NO.
PNPV2018-00014424 YOUR INSURED GV5205

Attachments: 7685.pdf

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=

Sent: Thursday, 17 January 2019 11:19 AM

To: zila <zila@ahlimmotor.com. sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP / OUR CLIENT SKU7685L DOA: 09/01/2019 POLICY NO. PNPV2018-00014424 YOUR INSURED GV520S

Dear Sirs
We refer to the above matter.

Liability is in favor of your client and we agree to go for Direct Settlement, subject to consistency of damages, based
on our appeinted surveyor’'s findings, with supporting documents,

Aside to M/s LKK, please upload your report and bill for services rendered in Merimen at your earliest convenience.

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower
Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 63896171

Fax: 62247175

Email: boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :
This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore)
Pte. Ltd. except where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore)



Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not
the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: zila [mallto:zila@ahlimmotor.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 17 January, 2019 11:18 AM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: TP / OUR CLIENT SKU7685L DOA: 09/01/2019 POLICY NO. PNPV2018-00014424 YOUR INSURED GV520S

Hi,

Pls refer to the attached file.

Best Regards,

Zila
Ah Lim Motor
Tel: 64831244 Fax: 64836170

On 17/01/2019 11:06 AM, Chong Boon Sen wrote:

> Without Prejudice

=

> Dear Zila,

-

> We are prepared to do direct settlement but pls provided repair estimate.

>

-

> Regards,

> Chong Boon Sen

> Claims Executive

> Claims

-

> China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

> 3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 Co. Reg. No.

> 200208384E

> DID: 63896171

> Fax: 62247175

>Email: boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com

> Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

>

=1

> Disclaimer :

> This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore)
Pte. Ltd. except where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore)
Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not

the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.
>

>

> ——0Original Message-----

> From: zila [mailto:zila@ahlimmotor.com.sg]

>5ent: Thursday, 17 January, 2019 10:36 AM

> To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

2



> Cr: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

= Subject: Re: TP / OUR CLIENT 5KU7685L DOA: 09/01/2019 POLICY NO.
> PNPV2018-00014424 YOUR INSURED GV5205

>

> Hi Chong Boon,

>

> Just to check if your insured has report the accident.

> Pls advise liability too.

>

> Thanks.

=

>

> Best Regards,

-

>

= Zila

> Ah Lim Motor

> Tel: 645831244 Fax: 64836170

>

> 0n 17/01/2019 10:33 AM, Chong Boon Sen wrote:

>> Without Prejudice

>3

=> Dear Zila,

=

=> We will appoint accordingly.

>

== Dear LKK,

>

== Pls PRI.

-

>> Regards,

»> Chong Boon Sen

== Claims Executive

== Claims

==

== China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

>> 3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 Co. Reg. No.
>> 200208384E

>>DID: 63896171

=> Fax: 62247175

=> Email: boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com

>> Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

-}

=01

>> Disclaimer ;

>> This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore)
Pte. Ltd. except where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore)
Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not

the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.
e

== From: zila [mailto:zila@ahlimmotor.com.sg]

>> Sent: Thursday, 17 January, 2019 10:28 AM

>> To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

>> Subject: Re: TP/ OUR CLIENT SKU7685L DOA: 09/01/2019 POLICY NO.

3



>> PNPV2018-00014424 YOUR INSURED GV520S

el

=> Hi,

>

>> We choose Kenneth Kong to be the surveyor.

== Thanks.

=

=

>> Best Regards,

e

>

>> Zila

>> Ah Lim Motor

>>Tel: 64831244 Fax: 64836170

>

>>0n 17/01/2019 9:58 AM, Chong Boon Sen wrote:
>>> *Without Prejudice*

0

=== Dear Sirs

e

>>>We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your
>>> client's vehicle jointly with your client/your motor workshop. We
>>> propose to use one of the following motor surveyors to conduct the
>>> joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.
EEES

>=> ADRIAN LING

]

=>2> Kelvin Ang

25>

>»> SEE CHEW SENG

22>

>>> MOHD FADHILAH BIN OSMAN

e

=== XING QUO QIANG

a2

==> KENNETH KONG

e ]

>2> S5IMON HO

=

>>> CHUA WENIE
>33

>>> MARCUS CHUA
5>

>>> HENRY NG
SN

50N
>>> Please let us know within two(2) working days whether you agree to

>>>the appointment of any of these motor surveyors as a single joint expert.

22>

>>>You may select one of the listed motor surveyors and we will bear
>>> the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.
20>

>>> Regards,

e

>>>*/ _Chong Boon Sen_/**/ _/*

e



=>> Claims Executive

25>

»»> Claims

-]

>>> *China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.*

-

>>>3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

25>

=>>Singapore 079909

5>

>>> Co. Reg. No. 200208384F

2

>>>DID: 63896171

25>

>>> Fax: 62247175

e ]

>>> Email: boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com

e

>>> Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

]

>=> [Disclaimer: ///

>

>>> [This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a

>>> commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except
>>> where provided for in a written agreement between you and China
»>> Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure,
>>> use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If
>>>Yyou are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the
>>> sender immediately. /

S

-

>

>> _ This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud
== service.

>> For mare information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com
>3

>
=
-1

>

> This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
> For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com
>

>
=
>

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page 1 of |

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner 1D:
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
7537A

SKU7685L

No

10 Jan 2019

KIA

FORTE K3 1L.6AEX
Black

2015
GAFGFH780979
KNAFX411MF5461097
95.3 kW (127 bhp)
$14,236.00

17 Aug 2015

17 Aug 2015

1

$14,236.00

Yes
16 Aug 2025
$10.677.00

16 Aug 2[)25;‘

A - Carupto 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$56,209.00

$37,094.00

$47,771.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 Jan 2019

https://vrl lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTION _ID=F03040...  10/01/2019



WAL B204458-01 | AR Lim Matar Comgpany - AK
ENTRY DATE 5 TIME: 10001/2015 16:18
SUBMITTED BY: Zila

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Pleasa repart (ﬂrre{ﬂz the details of the accident 1o speed up the claims process

2. This Farm must be completed by the Policyholder andlor the Authorised Driver,

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as pessible, Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies o
repudiate policy liability - :

4, The issue and acceplance of this Form by insurance companies (s not an admissian of policy lability on the part of the insurance companies

5. Any false reporting may be referred te the Police for investigation. -

&, This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GlA Records Management Centra established by the General Insurance Associabon of Singapare (GIA} for
archiving and thal copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by inlerested paries. !

7. By the lodgement of this report 1o the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the cantre and o coples of the report being made available
aforesasd,

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

Vehicle Registration NMumber
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registered Owner
MRIC No

Email Address

Maobile Phong No

Alternative Phone Mo
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturar

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken

Wehicle Category
Insurance Company
Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage
Fleet Policy

Paolicy Number

Cover Mole Number
Driver

Marme of Driver

NRIC Mo

Date Of Birth
Oecupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Mobile Mumber

Fax Number

Contact Number
EMail Address

10/01/2019 16:18
09/01/2019 17:10

FIE (CHANGI AIRPORT)
SINGAFORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

SKUTEE5L

HANS BROWN
S765753TA

NOEMAIL

(LOCAL) +65-93837172
OTHERS-28557360

KA
FORTE K3-1.6 {(A)

PRIVATE USE

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

FWD SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

PNPY2018-00014424
29/0/2018 - 28/10/2019

GHIZLANE SAMIR BROWM
STELTHIES

03081876

INDOOR

18/10/2018

0 YEAR AND 2 MONTH
FEMALE

(LOCAL) +65-98557360

OTHERS-93837172

BROWNGIHZLANE@GMAIL.COM



630 UPPER THOMSON ROAD
Address #04-73 MEADOWS @ PIERCE

Postcode TA7T132
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured SPOUSE

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Wehicle *

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - CHANGE/CROSS LANE
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information
Was any foreign vehicle invalved in this accident? NO
Wumber of vehicles (including own vehicle)

invalved in the accident e

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

Was any injured conveyed lo hospital by ND

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? ¥YES

| have been approached by unknown person(s) NO

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance,

Mumber of Passengers (Including Driver) 3

Passenger 1 NAME: - SOPHIA

GENDER: FEMALE

Passenger 2 NAME: . ALEXANDRA
GEMDER: : MALE

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? MO
If ¥es,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of infended Prosecution given? NO
If ¥es against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO THE SKETCH PLAN BY DRIVER
Attachment(s)

Are accident pholos available for attachment? YES
Was there any video captured by Car Camera? YES

Remarks/ Reasons: TRY TO RETRIEVE
Was there any audio recorded? MO
Vehicle Registration Mumber GuUs205

Yehicle Make/Model/Colour

Details Of Properties

Vahicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Mame of Driver

MNRIC/Passport Number

Contact Number

Address
Page 2 of Z7



Posicode

Insurance Company Mame

Mature Of Damage

MNo. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 3 of 28



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORT OTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the aceident to speed up the claims process.
2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver,

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate sible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withholding of material

facts may allow insurance companies to repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the Insurance
companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. The repart will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance
Azsociation of Singapore (G1A] for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by
interested parties.

7. By the lodgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this repart at the centre and to copies of
the repart being made available aforesaid,

8. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA)
| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

{a) My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapare ("GIA"] may/are permitted to coliect, use,
disclose and/for process my personal datafpersonal infarmation set out in this (form] and any other persenal information
provided by me or possessed by my insurer {collectively the “Personal Information™) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information to all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident {all insurers) who have insured
vehiclels) invobved in this accident shzll be collectively referred to as the “Insurers”™), the Insurers' lawyers/law firms, the
Manetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant government agency/authority (such as the police), for the purpose(s}
of ;

{i] processing, bandling and/er dealing with my claims including the settlement af the claims and any necessary
investigations relating 1o the claims;

(i) investigating the accident and/or my claims;
tilifcarrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or respanding 1o any enquiries by me;

{iv} administering my claims {including the mailing of correspondence, statements, invaices, reports or notices to me,
which could involve dischosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well a5 on the
externzl cover of envelopes/mail packages); andfor

{v] complying with appliceble law in administering, processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims. [collectively the
"Purposes”)

(b} allinsurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) invaleed in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disciose and/or process my Personal information for one or mare of the above Purposes; and

[c] my Personal Informetion may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers andy/ar GIA to their third party service providers or
agentsiincluding thelr lawyersflaw firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for cne or mare of the above Purposes,

{d)  my Personal Information will also be collected and used to compile claims histary for the purpose of fraud detection,
Inwastigation and management in present and all future claims,

fe) theinformation so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclosed:

{i} to all insurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controfling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

(i) for complying with requiremenits under any regulatiens, laws or court orders,

flD> @&

Palicyholder's Signature Drriver's Signature Reportingyls el's Signature
Date & Time: [If driver is not the palicyhalder) Mamie:
pate&Time: a1 |1 MRIC/FIN Nov.:
Wby

Page 4 af 27



Sketch Plan Pg. 2

i Pno,

Date ufaccldem+ﬁjﬂﬂgﬁ_fme. A E ll_'liz Location: _«%’i" D”: ((}J(mm ﬁifﬁﬂ%)

My Vehicle &: S W [ T4 %5 ) VehiceB: (=\S 20 S Vehicle C:
SKETCH PLAN

“_.;'E;.-?ﬁ-'_*tf : fanes LLJEM[{’ rBJuU I'ﬁa
40 © suer chevions
Qﬂ{t AF (e m Elrh(‘ ffft’lﬁ

"

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

T bians &n Cane_on e €xNe 55130, towrnds *rlN_Eh:m'Hw_

| (athe d - 2 74

oy thie m;ﬂ&m’aﬁa do_avatd f‘wmﬂi‘ ingizle dhe inbra {one digiden
MWMM@MJ&M.
The wigh: F‘L; coodideons wee ctan and dhe other Anlver wan ab

M_Mcﬁaﬁ%_éﬂgpﬂi;&ﬂéamaaﬁhﬂ%_muui%

the oK m‘“ ay an

_E]‘/Clalm C'D AhLim Mator  []Claim ODfTP at otherworkshop [ Reporting Only

Remarks : Please forward a copy of my efile accident report to
My workshop

Email address :

B myself

Email address . MEUN ghzf%m Egmedl.com
Mote: Please take note that your insurer have 14 days timeframe for you te submit own damage ¢laim under

you own policy. Kindly check with your own insurer for more information.

DECLARATION
I/'We declare the foregoing particulars are true In every respect,

Policyholder’s Signature Drll,'Er‘sSlgnature a@uﬁingwmsmmm& -
[

Date & Time! [1§ driver s not the policyholder) Mame:
Dete & Time: | O Teany \Q SRIC/FIN Ne.:
AN LALK TAATOV COBSTANY
Lo s

Fage 5of 27



Sketch Plan Pg. 3

CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

Please call +65-6322-2072 for FWD Emergency Assistance
if Your Car breaks down or is involved in an accident.
Bl accidents must be reported within 24 hours of the incident regardless of whether it will lead to a claim,

POLICY NUMBER: PNPV2018-00014424 (Comprehensive - Classic Plan)

Car plate number: SKU7E85L

Yaur name (As the policyholder): Hans Brown

Coverage start date: 29/10/2018

Coverage end date: 28/10/2019

Covered geographical area: Singapore, West Malaysia and Southern Thailand

Who s insured to drive:
{a) You; and
{b) Anyone with a valid driving license who You give permission to drive Your Car.

Important things to know:

Your Policy comprises this Certificate of Insurance, the Contract, the Car Insurance Summary and any
Endorsements attached by Us. These documents should be read together as one. You must make sure that
any person You give permission to drive Your Car understands Your duties under this Policy and complies with
its conditions.

Yaur Policy is only valid if Your Car is being used for non-commercial activities in accardance with Your contract.

We confirm that this Pollicy complies with the Motor Vehicles {Third-Party Risks and Compensation} Act (Chapter 189).

Issued on: 27/10/2018

b B>

Abhishek Bhatia Please immediately inform us at +65-6820-5528
Chief Executive Officer or email us at contact.sp@fwd.com if any details
FWD Singapore Pte Ltd in this Certificate of Insurance need to be changed.

FWD Singapors Pre. Lid, 6 Temasek Bowlevard, § 18-01 Suntec Tower 4, Singapore 038556, T; (65) 8820 SEA8. Company Registration No. 200500 737H | weaw. faed.com sg
Copyright © 2018 FWO Sigapore Pte. Lid. All Rights Resereed.

Page & of ZT



AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY

No. [0 Ang Mo Kio Ind. Park 24 =01-09% AMK Autopoint Singapore 368047
Email: ahlimmei@'singnet.com.sg

TEL: 6483 1244 { 4 lines ) FAX: 6483 6170

GSTM9-0009639-E RCB NO:O64TOI00E

M/S HANS BROWN
630 UPPER. THOMSON RD Estimate No: MC1900031
#04-7T3 MEADOWS (@ PIERCE Date: 11 Jan 2019
SINGAPORE 787132 Policy No: PNPV2018-00014424
TEL.: 08557360 Veh Reg No: SKU7685L
ATTN: ] le Make/Model: KIA FORTE K3 1.6A EX
'r’mlu' Ref No: SKIU?‘&SbL 1 D /’l/ﬁ"?' 4/(/'7 4 S
Claim Type: Third Party /ﬁ
i::;c‘::.lmt E:'late.. ::1"9,{]1#‘._(:19 M-::, a2 )74?‘.;;
eh Reg No:  GV5208
Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :SKU7685L 7 2,
Description Quantity List Price Amount
5% 5%
SPARE PARTS
1 REAR BOOT 1PC 77 1LO73.00 ¥
2  REAR BOOT INSULATOR CLIPS I0PC VA 2500 ¥
3 REAR BOOT LAMP LED LH 1 PC for TI000 =—
4 REAR BOOT EMBLEM e M 300 —
5 REAR BOOT LOGO (FORTE) LH | PC Ay 300~
6 REAR BOOT LOGO (K3) LH - GHECK-PRICE I PC Ae. 000 — &,
7 REAR BOOT LOGO (CYCLE CARRIAGE) RH - EHECKPRHEE | PC An 000 — 2
% TAILAMP LED LH 1 PC TREO0 —
9  TAILAMP LED CLIPS N e pe M 1500 m-fo"
10 TAILAMP PANEL LH 1 PC A 2300 ¥
11 REAR BUMPER 1 PC s TB8.00 —
12 REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS LONG LH 1PC &7 3300 —
13 REAR BUMPER CTR RETAINERS SHORT LH - GHESHPRICE 1PC Dor o0 —E3.
14 REAR BUMPER CLIPS 12rc P 000 —
15 REAR BUMPER LOWER REFLECTOR LH - GHESHK-PRIEE | PC GT 000 — s
I6 REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT | PC 2 36000 ~ 4
17 REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BRACKET LH | PC L1500 K
I8 REAR BUMPER LOWER LIP BLACK ipc P4 2100 —
19 REAR BUMPER LOWER SIDE COVER LH | PC Pl 2200 ¥
20 REAR BUMPER LOWER SIDE COVER CLIPS 10 PC o 00 £
p— 4.351.00
% 20 Less 10% 435.10 1.915.90
Special Nett = |E
21 REVERSE SENSOR \oas—cY ISET % 20000 X
—— 200000 200,00
LABOUR
22 TO DISCONNECT AND CHECK ELECTRICAL WIRING, WIRE SOCKETS | PC 40,00 ‘?"('
AND ETC. TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL DAMAGED ELECTRICAL
UNITS, TEST AND RECTIFY FOR PROPER FUNCTIONING.
23 TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL CUSHIONS, SEATS, BACKREST, INNER IPC e gsoo0 X
TRIM. GARNISH, ROOF LINING OR UPHOLSTERY TO FACILITATE
REPAIRS.
24 TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL/REPLACE FUEL TANK, FIXTURE AND 1 PC Aa goo0 X
ATTACHMENTS.
35 TO REAR BOOT REVERSE CAMERA 1 PC A o000 X
26 TORESET TAILAMP LED,TAILAMP LH,REAR BOOT LOCK SENSOR 1PC A 180,00
27 TOREMOVE AND REINSTALL/REPLACE FR&T/REAR BUMPER 1PC 80.00 5,

SENSORS.



AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY

No. 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind. Park 2A #01-09 AMK Autopoint Singapore 568047

TEL: 6483 1244 4 lines ) FAX; 6483 6170 Email: ahlimme /@ singnet com.s5g

GET-MU-D00953%.E RCB NO:064 703008

M/S: HANS BROWN
630 UPPER. THOMSON RD Estimate No:
#04-73 MEADOWS @ PIERCE Date;
SINGAPORE 787132 Policy No:
TEL: 98357360 Veh Reg No:
ATTN: Make/Model:
Your Ref No: SKU7685L

Claim Type: Third Party
Accident Date: 09/01/2019
TP Veh Reg No:  GV5205

28
29

30

Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :SKU7685L

Description Quantity
TO SPRY ANTI-RUST COATING ON AFFECTED AREAS. 1 PC
TO DISMANTLE ALL DAMAGED PARTS. TO CUT & WELD TAILAMP 1 PC

PANEL LH.TO KNOCK & REPAIR END PANEL,REAR FENDER LH INNER

PANELS AND AFFECTED AREAS. TO REFIT LISTED PARTS BACK

SAME.

TO SPRAY TAILAMP PANEL LH REAR BOOT,REAR BUMPER.END | PC
PANEL.REAR FENDER LH.

MC1900031

11 Jan 2019
PNPV2018-00014424
SKUT685L

KIA FORTE K3 1.6A EX

List Price Amount

S$ S8
v goon X

50000 Fe > /

W0 fo - %

242000 2.420.00
Total 58 653590
Add GST 0 ™% 457.51
Total Amount Payable 5% 699341
TOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR SIX THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED NINETY THREE AND CENTS FORTY ONE ONLY
Please arrange this vehicle to be surveyed soonest possible. é/: ) ::Tr 5

Thank You
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno:190s07198r)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CS/CTI12001104/KSD3N2
Date: 16/08/2019

REFERENCE

Handling China Taiping Insurance .

Hshil (Singapore) Ple, Ltd. Policy No: DMCVSN17466618011

Claimant Insured

Vehicle No : SKU7685L Vehicle No : GV5208

Date of Loss:  09/01/2019 bl of TP ﬁ:":"" SNM19D200220C02

DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE

Reg No: SKUTE85L

Make & Model: KIA FORTE K3, 1.6 (A) Engine No: G4FGFHTB0979

Reg. Date: 17/08/2015 (Man. Year: 2015) Chassis No: KMNAFX411MF5461097

Colour: Metallic Black Odometer: 34686 km

Engine Capacity: 1591 cc

Market Value/New Car N/A

Price:

Sum Insured (S3): Market Value/New Car Price

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY

General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
COMNDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/55R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/55R16
Front Left Side: Bridgestone 8 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone 8 mm
Front Right Side: Bridgestone 8 mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 8 mm
The abave values represent the remaining lyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Paris 4,232.90 2,486.70 1,746.20 41.25
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2,420.00 §70.00 1,450.00 59.92
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (5%) 6,652.90 3,456.70 3,196.20 48.04
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 485.70 241.97 223.73 48.04
Nett Amount (S5) 7,118.60 3,698.67 3,419.93 48.04
INSPECTION

Date of Assignment: 16/08/2019

Date Inspected:

Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days

18/01/2019 Inspected At:

Ah Lim Motor Company (AMK)

10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 24, #01-
09 AMEK Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG

Manager: Hiew May Fung

NOTE: This reporf represents our findings at the time and place of inspection staled herein. Such inspection has been caried out o the best of owr
knowledge and ability but any other liability under any oiher circumstances (s herely expressly exciuded.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 16/ 8/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 3

REPAIR DETAILS _
'Reference

?Part Source: MEM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 16 Aug 2019) |
Parts: 143 KIA FORTE K2 1.6 [A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapare 1.0) |
Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List) [
Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SKU7685L)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last eslimate page
|Further Info: Items/values not in reference catalogue are _preﬁxgd_w_'r!l'_q__.'_al aslerisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *REAR BOOT Repair 1,073.00FL “-FL
2 10 *REAR BOOT INSULATOR CLIPS Mot Necessary 25.00FL *-FL
3 1 *REAR BOOT LAMP LED LH Cut 710.00FL *710.00FL
4 1 *REAR BOOT EMBLEM MNecessary 37.00FL *37.00FL
5 1 *REAR BOOT LOGO (FORTE) LH Mecessary 31.00FL  “31.00FL
6 1 *REAR BOOT LOGO (K3) LH Necessary 21.00FL *21.00FL
T 1 *REAR BOOT LOGO (CYCLE CARRIAGE) RH Necessary 28.00FL "2B.00FL
8 1 *TAILAMP LED LH Broken 78B.00FL *7B8.00FL
9 3 *TAILAMP LED CLIPS Mecessary 15.00FL *15.00FL
0 1 *TAILAMP PANEL LH Repair 123.00 FL *-FL
11 1 *REAR BUMPER Buckled 768.00FL *768.00FL
122 1 *REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS LONG LH Distorted 33.00FL T"33.00FL
13 1 *REAR BUMPER CTR RETAINERS SHORT LH Distorted 2300FL *23.00FL
14 12 *REAR BUMPER CLIPS Mecessary 30.00FL *30.00FL
15 1 *REAR BUMPER LOWER REFLECTOR LH Cut 58.00FL “58.00FL
16 1 *REAR BEUMPER REINFORCEMENT Repair 360.00 FL *-FL
s ol *REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BRACKET LH  Repair 75.00FL *-FL
18 1 *REAR BUMPER LOWER LIP BLACK Dented 221.00FL *221.00FL
19 1 *REAR BUMPER LOWER SIDE COVER LH Serviceable 42 00FL “-FL
20 10 *REAR BUMPER LOWER SIDE COVER CLIPS Not Necessary 20.00FL *-FL
21 1 *SET REVERSE SENSOR Serviceable 200.00FS *-F3

F=Franchise part. S=SpcNel L=ListhemDisc,

Sub Total (S3) 4,681.00 2,763.00
- List ltem Discount on L Items 10.00/10.00% (5%) 448.10 276.30

Total Parts (S§) 4,232.90  2,486.70

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. I

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 16/8/2019
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No

Particulars

Labour ltems

1

TO DISCONNECT AND CHECK ELECTRICAL
WIRING,WIRE SOCKETS AND ETC.TO REMOVE AND
REINSTALL DAMAGED ELECTRICAL UNITS, TEST AND
RECTIFY FOR PROPER FUNCTIONING

TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL
CUSHIONS,SEATS,BACKREST INNER
TRIM,GARNISH,ROOF LINING OR UPHOLSTERY TO
FACILITATE REPAIRS

TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL/REPLACE FUEL
TANK,FIXTURE AND ATTACHMENTS

TO REAR BOOT REVERSE CAMERA

TO RESET TAILAMP LED,TAILAMP LH.REAR BOOT
LOCK SENSOR

TO REMOVE AND REINSTALLU/REPLACE REAR BUMPER
SENSORS

TO SPRAY ANTI-RUST COATING ON AFFECTED AREAS

TO DISMANTLE ALL DAMAGED PARTS.TO CUT & WELD
TAILAMP PANEL LH.TO KNOCK & REPAIR END
PANEL,REAR FENDER LH INNER PANELS AND
AFFECTED AREAS.TO REFIT LISTED PARTS BACK
SAME

TO SPRAY TAILAMP PANEL LH,REAR BOOT,REAR
BUMPER,END PANEL,REAR FENDER LH

Gross Labour Cost (S$)

Lab.Type

MNew

MNew

Mew

New
Mew

New

Mew
Mew

Mew

Page 3 of 3

Repairer's Amount
40.00 20.00
180.00 0.00
B0.00 0.00
80.00 0.00
180.00 0.00
80.00 50.00
80.00 0.00
800.00 300.00
900.00 600.00
2,420.00 970.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES =

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 16/8/2019



