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Veron Chen (LKKAuto) 4

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 January 2019 12:29 PM

To: *KHONG Lynn'; LKK Valuation

Subject: RE: Urgent - Checking Market Value (MV) - S8M0173P / SMD7758B / DOA :
16-12-2018

Dear Lynn,

The market value of SMD 7758B is $78K (Estimated) as at Dec 2018.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: KHONG Lynn <lynn.khong@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 17 January 2019 10:57 AM

To: admin@autoprobe.com.sg; cynthia.ong <cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg>; motorsurvey
<motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>; LKK Valuation <valuation@Ilkkauto.com>; admin (admin@Ibs-auto.com) <admin@Ibs-
auto.com>

Subject: Urgent - Checking Market Value (MV) - S8M0173P / SMD7758B / DOA : 16-12-2018

Importance: High

Hi,
We are doing a quick check for market value, kindly assist to return 2pm today.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Lynn Khong
Specialist, Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811
Email: lynn.khong@axa.com.sg

Customer Care No. 1800 8804888
www.axa.com.sq
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Enquwe PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

ons {6 |

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Singapore NRIC

Owner |D Type:
~ Owner ID: 0729E ‘ " N Qﬁxﬂ)
Vehicle Details
© Vehicle No: SMD7758B
- Vehicletobe Exported i i i No
] A Intended Dereglstratlon Date: " 17Jan2019
~ Vehicle Make: HYUNDAI
 Vehicle Model: ELANTRAAD 1.6 GLS AT (AMS)
Prlmary Colour: Silver
Manufacturmg Year 2018
Engine No.: " G4FGJU247010
| ChassisNo: KMHD841CMJU737935
' Maxrmum Power Output 93.8kW (125»bhp)
Open Market Value: $12,563.00
Orlgmal Registration Date: 03 Sep 2018
" First Registration Date: 03Sep2018
'Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $12563.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: , ) Yes ,
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 02 Sep 2028 '
' PARF Rebate Amount: $9,422.00 ’
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 02 Sep 2028
COECategory: A-Car upto 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
COE Perlod(Years) - 10 - ' o
QP Paid: $31,997.00
COE Rebate Amount: $30,801.00
Total Rebate Amount: $40,223.00 ’

The |nformat|on contamed Herem is correct as at 17 Jan 2019

OK s



