Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 4 June, 2019 1:30 PM

To: sirina@successunited.com.sg

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: TP PRI : SLV 2756G / SHC 5212L / DoA 15.01.19 *** LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19001080/Aha3

Attachments: DS FORM.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sirina,
We refer to your below email.

On a without prejudice basis, purely for an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s
part, we confirmed settlement amount of $2,086.24 (all in) to settle your client’s claim.

Kindly chop and sign the attached DS FORM and forward back to us for our Principal to process to payment.

The above amount is to be made payable to SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD.

Thank you.

Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LIRS

w0 Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: sirina@successunited.com.sg [mailto:sirinassk@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 21 May, 2019 3:45 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: TP PRI : SLV 2756G / SHC 5212L / DoA 15.01.19 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM19001080/Aha3

Hi Vic



Attached herein our LoD for your necessary action.

Appreciate your prompt attention & response.

Thank You.
Best Regards,
Sirina Soon

Senior Claims Executive
Mobile: +65 9223 6288

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-33 / #02-29

Kaki Bukit AutoHub

Singapore 417921

Tel: 6746 1515  Fax: 6748 5015

On Thu, May 9, 2019 at 11:16 AM Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirina,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is clear
subject to the BOLA guideline settlement.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of
repair to your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is
subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/
LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our
principal.

Kindly forward the LOD and all supporting documents to us if available to proceed with the settlement.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 January, 2019 4:12 PM

To: sirina@successunited.com.sg

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: RE: TP PRI : SLV 2756G / SHC 5212L / DoA 15.01.19 *** LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19001080/Aha3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we are currently pending verification for direct settlement.

Fyi, Ol has reported. Please refer to the below OI's sketch plan and statement.
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

Circumstances of Accident

OM 15/01/2019 AT ABOUT Z020HRS, | WAS EXITING THE CAR PARK OF TELOK AYER CRESCENT. AFTER VEHICLE
B{SCV2T56G) WENT PAST MY VEHICLE'S PARKING LOT, | PROCEEDED TO TURN RIGHT. | DID NOT NOTICE THAT
VEHICLE B HAD STOPPED ON MY LEFT AND MY TAXI HIT ONTO VEHICLE B'S REAR LEFT PORTION WHILE | EXIT THE
PARKING LOT.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: sirina@successunited.com.sg <sirinassk @ gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January, 2019 7:00 PM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey @axa.com.sg>
Subject: TP PRI : SLV 2756G / SHC 5212L / DoA 15.01.19

Reference to the above accident, kindly arrange for TP PRI of our client's damaged Veh No. SLV 2756G
which is now lying in our workshop after the accident.

Attached the necessary documents for your action.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Sirina Soon

Senior Claims Executive

Mobile: +65 9223 6288

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-33 / #02-29

Kaki Bukit AutoHub

Singapore 417921

Tel: 6746 1515 Fax: 6748 5015



