Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 5 March, 2019 5:36 PM

To: sinsheng engineeringservices

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident Involving XD8417Z with XD2448Z on 09/06/2016 LKK REF
CC4/ASM19001078/T1hb3

Attachments: XD8417Z_LOC.PDF; XD8417Z_ATA.PDF

Without Prejudice

Dear Susan,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.
We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LIRS

w0 Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: sinsheng engineeringservices [mailto:sinsheng1981@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 5 March, 2019 4:31 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR; Admin A

Subject: Re: Accident Involving XD8417Z with XD2448Z on 09/06/2016

Hi Ms Vic,

Attached LOC document and ATA for your attention please.

Kindly assist to revert us with the liability issue/offer if direct settlement is in order.
Thank You

Regards

Susan



Sin Sheng Engineering Services
3 Tech Park Crescent

Tuas Tech Park

Singapore 638129

Tel: 6863 9595

Fax: 6863 6477

On Tue, 5 Mar 2019 at 14:33, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981 @ gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Mr Taufikh,

We are agreed.

Thank You
Regards

Susan

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
3 Tech Park Crescent

Tuas Tech Park

Singapore 638129

Tel: 6863 9595

Fax: 6863 6477

On Tue, 5 Mar 2019 at 13:02, Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh @lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Sysan,

COR L/S$4350, 3DAYS.
Regards

Taufikh

Lkk Auto

Get Outlook for Android

From: sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981 @gmail.com>
Sent: Saturday, March 2, 2019 12:13:26 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: Re: Accident Involving XD8417Z with XD2448Z on 09/06/2016

Hi Mr Taufikh,

Please have your finalized URGENTLY.

Thank You
Regards



Susan

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
3 Tech Park Crescent

Tuas Tech Park

Singapore 638129

Tel: 6863 9595

Fax: 6863 6477

On Thu, 21 Feb 2019 at 17:07, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Susan,

Case handler is vic, copied in the email.

CC4/ASM19001078/T1hb3

Dear Vic,

Please follow up

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay @lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981 @ gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 21 February 2019 5:02 PM
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh @lkkauto.com>
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Cec: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Accident Involving XD8417Z with XD2448Z on 09/06/2016

Hi Mr Taufikh,

Please assist to have your finalized.

Thank You
Regards

Susan

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
3 Tech Park Crescent

Tuas Tech Park

Singapore 638129

Tel: 6863 9595

Fax: 6863 6477

On Mon, 21 Jan 2019 at 14:26, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981 @gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Mr Taufikh,

Please find attached and have your finalized please.

Thank You
Regards

Susan

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
3 Tech Park Crescent

Tuas Tech Park

Singapore 638129

Tel: 6863 9595

Fax: 6863 6477



On Mon, 14 Jan 2019 at 16:55, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981 @gmail.com> wrote:

4TH REMINDER

Dear Sir/Madam

Please assist arrange for PRS @ ASAP.

Vehicle is in and waiting for PRS since 09/01/2019.

Thank You
Regards

Susan

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
3 Tech Park Crescent

Tuas Tech Park

Singapore 638129

Tel: 6863 9595

Fax: 6863 6477

On Fri, 11 Jan 2019 at 10:04, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981 @gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Officer Incharge,

REMINDER IN URGENT



We are repairer of motor vehicle XD8417Z . Enclosed Accident Statement and LTA search fee for your attention
please. Kindly assist to arrange for the Pre-Repair Inspection to be conducted within two (2) workings days upon
received this email.

Kindly let us have your list of 10 norminated surveyors to conduct the Single-Joint Inspection.

Kindly assist to revert the liability issue or offer if direct settlement is in order

Thank You
Regards

Susan

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
3 Tech Park Crescent

Tuas Tech Park

Singapore 638129

Tel: 6863 9595

Fax: 6863 6477

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981 @ gmail.com>

Date: Fri, 11 Jan 2019 at 09:45

Subject: Re: Accident Involving XD8417Z with XD2448Z on 09/06/2016
To: AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey @axa.com.sg>

Dear Officer Incharge,

REMINDER IN URGENT

We are repairer of motor vehicle XD8417Z . Enclosed Accident Statement and LTA search fee for your attention
please. Kindly assist to arrange for the Pre-Repair Inspection to be conducted within two (2) workings days upon
received this email.

Kindly let us have your list of 10 norminated surveyors to conduct the Single-Joint Inspection.

Kindly assist to revert the liability issue or offer if direct settlement is in order

Thank You
Regards

Susan



Sin Sheng Engineering Services
3 Tech Park Crescent

Tuas Tech Park

Singapore 638129

Tel: 6863 9595

Fax: 6863 6477

On Thu, 10 Jan 2019 at 10:36, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinshengl1981 @ gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Sir/Madam,

REMINDER for the PRS.

Thank You
Regards

Susan

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
3 Tech Park Crescent

Tuas Tech Park

Singapore 638129

Tel: 6863 9595

Fax: 6863 6477

On Wed, 9 Jan 2019 at 11:34, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@ gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Officer Incharge,

We are repairer of motor vehicle XD8417Z . Enclosed Accident Statement and LTA search fee for your attention
please. Kindly assist to arrange for the Pre-Repair Inspection to be conducted within two (2) workings days upon
received this email.



Kindly let us have your list of 10 norminated surveyors to conduct the Single-Joint Inspection.

Kindly assist to revert the liability issue or offer if direct settlement is in order

Thank You
Regards

Susan

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
3 Tech Park Crescent

Tuas Tech Park

Singapore 638129

Tel: 6863 9595

Fax: 6863 6477



