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Auro
! H .I{ Consultanis

A e Pt Lid Company Registration No. 199060T198R

S1 UL AVE |, #M12-28 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (D65) 62564315
Y our ref: TBA Date: 22.01.2019
Our ref: CC&/CTINOONI036/R 1fa3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD

Dear SirMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SLT 4750L

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 17.01.2019
at the premises of M/s Prime Auto Claims Services Pie Lid and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 53 2,753.52
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 870.00
"Check"” Items Amount : 55

Total (Including Check ltems) : 8% 870.00
Market Value : 5% - [est)
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 8% - (esL)
Nett Value : 5% - (esL)

Description of Damage: —
The vehicle sustained damages at the
N/S Front Portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 4.0 days

Y ours faithfully,

MOHD. RASUL
Licensed Appraiser



Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
GST Reg. No : 201606560M

6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927

Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

PRIME GROUP

Date: 16.01.2019

China Taiping Insurance (S) Pte Ltd
2 Anson Road #16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

RE: ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR TO VEHICLE SLT4750U MAZDA 2 (2017)

To Supply

1) 1pc  Leftfront fender reposV $ 323.10
2) 1pc  Leftfront door foplsy $  1,109.30
3) 1pc  Left side mirror cover ﬂfm""' S 122.00
Sub total Parts S 1,554.40
Less: 20% discount $ 310.88
S 1,243.52
L/charges
1) Totuff kote $ ;g.-cﬁ?a
2') Touansfer left front door trim board, glass, handle & mechanism parts 5 ﬁ?ﬁ] ‘l"u
3 ) Toremove left front fender, left frant door & left side mirror cover. S E‘QR‘UTJ -?ﬁ?
Replace the above parts. Align & adjust door & fender. To)
4') To putty, respray painting left front fender, left front door inlet & outer, S ;Dt){ﬂ Sov
left rear door outer, left rear fender & left side mirror cover. To polish
(F"SUL Sub total L/charges §___ 1,510.00
2,753.52

— ) — _ ﬁ'{’ Qeoleg | Estimated Grand Total _$
c by
Pl
;-,l.:l[ﬁ @

_1_. ___ %‘F‘D Ac“ﬂ"‘ ,—,_‘.,:..'.V




Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Alice Leong <aliceleong@primeautociaims.com>

Sent: Thursday, 14 March 2019 3:11 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Ce: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 16.01.2019 INVOLVING VEHICLES SLT4750U & GBF7057K
Importance: High

Categories: clear

Hi Poh Kin,

We accepted vour below offer. Please let us have your DV,
Thank you

Alice Leong
Manager, Motor Claims

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd

i Benol Place Singopore 629927
T(65): 6861 0908 | F(65)6515 2948
HP (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Group

Lisglmmer

This e-madl (including all attachment) contains confidentinl information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the dentified
recipient(s) o whom it is addressed. If you are nol an intend recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this messuge from your system
Yo may notl copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkin@lkkauto.com]

Sent: 14 March, 2019 2:41 PM

To: Alice Leong <aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 16.01.2019 INVOLVING VEHICLES SLT4750U & GBF7057K
Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CC6/CTI119001036/R1fa3
Your Ref: SLT 4750U

Dear Alice,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had review the matter, we are view that our offer at global sum of $ 985.00 is
already fair and reasonable.

We appreciate if you could kindly reconsider our offer and confirm acceptance on this matter.

1



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

e ———— it

From: Poh Kin [LEKAuUtD)

Sent: Thursday, 14 March 2019 2:41 PM

To: ‘Alice Leong'

Ce: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 16.01.2019 INVOLVING VEHICLES SLT4750U & GBF7057K
Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CCs&/CTI19001036/R1fa3
Your Ref: SLT 4750U

Dear Alice,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had review the matter, we are view that our offer at global sum of § 985.00 is
already fair and reasonable.

We appreciate if you could kindly reconsider our offer and confirm acceptance on this matter.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matier is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of lability,
whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred fram this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affectfinfluence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/sattlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(40809313)

Lt

o Sove Che Earthe Print only when necassary-

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violalion of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, plaasa do nol
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender thal you have deleled the e-mall, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you

From: Alice Leong [mailto:aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com|
Sent: Thursday, 14 March 2019 2:25 PM
To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@lkkauto.com>



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Alice Leong <aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com>

Sent: Thursday, 14 March 2019 2:25 PM

To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 16.01.2019 INVOLVING VEHICLES 5LT4750U & GBF7057K
Importance: High

Categories: clear

Hi Poh Kin,

Our client proposed at global sum of $1,000/- (all in). Please revert.
l'hank you

Alice Leong
Manager, Motor Clmims

Prime Auto Claims Service Pre Lid

& Benoi Place Singapore 629927
T(65). 6861 0908 | F (65) 6515 2948
HP (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer

This e=muil {including all atachment) contains confidemial mformation which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient{s) 1o whom it is addressed. If you are not an intend recipient, please reply o us immediately and delete this message from your system,
You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents 1o any person.

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto:pohkin/@lkkauto.com]

Sent: 14 March, 2019 2:21 PM

To: Alice Leong <aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 16.01.2019 INVOLVING VEHICLES SLT4750U & GBF7057K
Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CCB/CT 119001036/R1fa3
Your Ref; SLT 4750U

Dear Alice,
We refer to above matter.

Purely towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we offer
settlement at global sum of $985.00{all in} on this matter.

kindly confirm acceptance on this matter.



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuUta)

Sent: Thursday, 14 March 2019 2:21 PM

To: ‘Alice Leong'

Ce: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 16.01.2012 INVOLVING VEHICLES SLT4750U & GBF7057K
Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Our Ref: CCB/CTI19001036/R1fa3
Your Ref: SLT 4750U

Dear Alice,
We refer to above matter.

Purely towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we offer
settlement at global sum of $985.00{all in) on this matter.

kindly confirm acceptance on this matter.

Your prompt reply will be very much appreciated.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
Intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discoverad or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

MY, e
RER = Shwe the Larth Print only when nacessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, snd are for the sole use of the intended reciplent. Use or distribulion by an
unintended reciplent is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in eror, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mall and all attachments, including any coples thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thersof. Thank you

From: Alice Leong [mailto:aliceleong(@primeautoclaims.com|
Sent: Monday, 4 March 2019 3:22 PM



Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd

GST Reg. No : 201606560M
6 Benol Place Singapore 629927
Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

PRIME GROUP

Date: 23.01.2019

Our ref: SLT47500U
Your Reft Please advice

China Taiping Insurance (3) Pte Lid _ o

3 Anson Road #16-00 'I-'b_'uh-::-m prejudice
Springleal Tower Fax: 6224 7175
Singapore 079909

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Dear Sur / Madam.

ACCIDENT ON 16.01.2019 INVOLVING VEHICLES SLT4750U & GBFT057K

We are on behalf of Mr. Abdul Rahim Bin Hashim the owner of vehicle SKT4750U in their third
party claim against your insured / driver of GBF7057K

Appended below our client’s claim:-

1. Cost of repair § 95090
2. Loss of use @3$60.00 x 5 days $ 300.00
3, GIA senrch Fee $ 2.00

Total § 1.232.90

We enclosed herewith our invoice 3124, GIA search receipt, letter of authorization for your
retention. Please acknowledge receipt.

For amicable scttlement, pleasc let us have your offer
Regards

Yours faithTully,

Alice Leohg
E-mail; aliceleong@primeauoclaims.com

Enel.



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Monday, 4 March 2019 4:36 PM

To: 'LEONGSHEN@LIVE.COM'

Cc: Admin A

Subject: ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLS NOS. GBF 7057K AND SLT 47500
ALONG BENOI PLACE ON 16.01.2019

Attachments: inf1_6947_20190116_131302_| (online-video-cutter.com) mp4

Importance: High

Our Ref: CC6/CTI19001036/fa3
Your Veh: GBF 7057K

LEONG SHEN ENGINEERING & CONSTRUCTION PTE LTD
Policy Holder

Dear Ms Leong,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLS NOS. GBF 7057K AND SLT 4750U ALONG BENOI PLACE ON
16.01.2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to
resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with
them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other
information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your
insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have
them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 14/03/2019, after we shall proceed with negotiation with
Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims
whatsoever by you/your driver against the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

As spoken over the phone, attached herewith a copy of Third Party video footage for your kind attention,
We are view that this case could be 50/50 or less as per TP video footage.

Please call us if you have further queries.



X~JUNCTION (Uncontrolled)
6. |(b) Vehicle X— Tuming Right, from
J opposite direction 50% | 50%
- 0 - Vehicle Y — Tuming Left
B Reason: Both vehicles should
—_— — exercise caution when
1 tuming
Rest Regards,

Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4089:13)

IMK =

- Save the Earthe Print only when necessary-

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the inlended reciplent. Use or distribution by an
uninlended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you beliave that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
nzad this e-mall or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thareof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereol, Thank you,



LETTER OF AUTHORITY
To: PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE. LTD

Re: ACCIDENT ON 16.01.2019 INVOLVING SLT4750U & GBF7057K
ALONG BENOI PLACE

I/ We, M/S Abdul Rahim Bin Hashim hereby authorized you to carry oul repairs of the damage
caused to my / our vehicle no. SLT4750U in the above accident.

I/ We further also confirm and agree that all sums of money to be recovered by you on my/ our
behalf shall be paid to you. I/ We hereby also authorise the third party insurer to release to you

such sums of money recovered on my / our behalf.

@7

Rl e R T R R LR L R R L ]

Signature (Company 's stamp if applicable)
MName: MR. ABDUL RAHIM BIN HASHIM
NRIC: S0210614)



MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE YOUCHER

Policy Me : DOMCVENID1E&1916801 Claim Ne : SHNM19D003L6/C02
Claimant @ ABDUL HRAHIM BIN HASHIM
Amournt :  BEORE._ DO

DOLLARS HINE HUHDRED EIGHTY-FIVE OMLY

I/We agree to accept the above mentioned amcunt to be paid to mefus In full &
final settlement of all clalms, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by me/us through an accident involving

Claimant Vehicle Ne. : SLT 47500

Insured Yehicle Mo. : GBF T057H
Date of Losa : 16/01/72015
Place of Accident | HENOI PLACE

IN CONSIDERATION of cthe payment made to mefus of tche aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agree absolutely to
discharge CHIMNA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Hame 7 LEONG SHEN ENGINEERING & CONSTRUCTION PTE LTD
Driver Name i FARLUQE OMAR

from all claims, present or future in respect of all less, injury or damage
sustalned by meofus arising out of the said sccident,

1 acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liabiliecy on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

1] Glotal Sum 55 585.00

TOTAL & - ¢ o s s o« s a @a ' a o o = 8% S85.00

- ———

Claimant Name : I}Llu\ Qh\\.‘ﬂ. E]?l. "\ll\%‘l SRIC Wo 't '&b}lﬁﬂihl

SR | e300




TAX INVOICE NO.: 3124
Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd

B Benoi Place Singapors 620027
Tol: 8881 DO0A Fax: 6515 2048
GST Reg. No: 201806560M
PRMEGROUP  Rag No 20160B560M

MESSRS CHINA TAIPING INSUTRANCE (S) PTE LLTD DATE 2130112019
N e Bad WORKS ORDER NO 3117
#16-00 Springleal Tower VEHICLE NO SLT4750U
SINGAPORE 079909
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
Make/ Model MAZDA 2
Hepawr Date 12018
Tems of Payment cob
THIRD PARTY CLAIMS
0 G
| TO TUFF KOTE H 30.00
2 TO TRANSFER LEFT FRONT DOOR TRIM BOARD, 5 4000
GLASS HANDLE & MECHANISM PARTS
3 TO REMOVE LEFT FRONT FENDER.LEFT FRONT H 300 00
DOOR & LEFT SIDE MIRROR COVER.REPLACE
THE ABOVE PARTS ALIGN & ADJUST DOOR & ) 000
FENDER
i TO PUTTY RESPRAY PAINTING LEFT FRONT 5 800,00
FENDER.LEFT FRONT DOOR INLET & OUTER,
LEFT REAR DOOR OUTER.LEFT REAR FENDER & 5 004

LEFT SIDE MIRROR COVER TO POLISH

Compoind interests ut the rate of | % per month SUB TOTAL

5 27000
will be charged on late payment GST ™% < 0,90
ROUNDING ADJ § 0.00
TOTAL 5 930 90
B " PRIME AUTO S SERVICE

Munuger



1118308 0 ]

GST Registration No: M400017735

Onling Purchase

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Third Party Insurer Enquiry
Dur Al Mo GR-19-009089
Dats ol Reguast: 16/01/2018 Your Raf No:
Prume Auto Claims Service Ple Lid
G Benol Place
Singapore 629027

Dear Skk/Madam,

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Rafles Cuay #18-00, Singapore 048580
|NSURANCE Phane: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCLATION Operaling Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to 5pm

Enguiry Date 16/01/2018
Enquiry By Liu Pai Yea
* Vehicle Na GEFTOSTK
weodont Dale 16012019
Enquiry Result
TP Vahicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tal. No.
GBFTOSTE China Taiping Insurance {Singapors) Pte. Lid. 18/02/2018-15/02/2019 6383 6111
Thank You.

nu.m.mmmmmﬂmmmmmmmmwnmmhwwm@

Singwnmulﬂ'nuulpnnﬁbiluryrwhﬂlmmnrm-mlmmllmmﬂnmnﬂilnnﬁmlwmfhuwd-uanumﬂ

or In connectian with the repons of helr Images

This s a computer generalad document and requires no signature,

hitps fisngapore menmen com/clamsingex. ¢im Hussbor=MTRsasAiUseaction=asp  geninvipArelid=20312B84CFID=470043364CFTOREN=TT2

2



1NE2049 Irvoioe

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

G Raffles Quay ¥18-00, Singapore 046580
INSURANCE rrcne -e5 5226 0010 rax +85 6224 0030
ASS0CIATION Operaling Hours: Monday 1o Friday Bam to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE

Our Rel No: GR-18-0080595

Dale of Request; 16/012018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Prime Auta Claims Service Pie Lid
G Banol Place
Singapore 620927

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Date 16201/2019

Enquiry By Liu Pe: Yea

=7 Vahicle No. GBFTOSTK

~~Cident Date 160172019

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S§)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Duae (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You

This |s a compulter generaled documenl and requires no signalure

For GIARMC Officlal use
Date:
|%] GIRO | | Cash | | Cheque

nitps /isingapore. menimen comicialmsindes chmusebos=MTRsash luseaction=dsp_geninviphrefid=20312885CFID=4TOB4XIBACFTOKEN=TT¢c... 272



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 201-25 Paya Ubl industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 8256 3587 FAX 6256 4215

Reg. Mo 188807188R GST Reg Mo 10-880T168-R

Affilinted lo Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobila

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD

Ret CC8/CTI18001036/R 1fa3qg2

SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 078909 N S0-ane Il"II"II."I
Code CTI
15 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBF TO57K Veh. Inspected SLT 4750U
Policy No. DMCVSN3016181801 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D200316/C02 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 1710172018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MAZDA2Z15L c.C 1456
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. JMEDJZHAAD12001685 Colour BLACK
Odometer 44838 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/60 R16 TOYO & mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/60 R16 TOYO 5mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/60 R16 TOYO 5mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/60 R16 TOYO 5mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. Geaneral Information
Accident Date 16/01/2018 Inspection Date 17101/2019
Survey held at PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE LTD
& BENOI| PLACE
SINGAPORE 628927
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

4 Working Days




' VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

BdE B = 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusinial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 62566 4315
Reg No: 1886807T108R GST Reg No 18-860T198-R Page Mo 1ol 1

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLT 4750U

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|LEFT FRONT FENDER TO REPAIR SEE 32310
LABOUR
1|LEFT FRONT DOOR TO REPAIR SEE 1,109.30
LABOUR
1|LEFT SIDE MIRROR COVER TO REPAIR SEE 122 .00
LABOUR
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -310.88
1,243 52
LABOUR
TO TUFF KOTE 5000 30.00
TO TRANSFER LEFT FRONT DOOR TRIM 80.00 40 00
BOARD .GLASS HAMNDLE & MECHANISM PARTS
TO REMOVE LEFT FRONT FENDER .LEFT FRONT DOOR 500.00 300.00
& LEFT SIDE MIRROR COVER ,REPLACE THE ABOVE
PARTS ALIGW & ADJUST DOOR & FENDER.
TO PUTTY RESPRAY PAINTING LEFT FRONT 200.00 500.00
FENDER LEFT FRONT DOOR IMLET & OUTE.LEFT REAR
DOOR OUTER LEFT REAR FENDER & LEFT SIDE
MIRROR COVER TO POLISH. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR
OF LEFT FRONT FENDER,LEFT FRONT DOOR AND LEFT
SIDE MIRROR COVER.
1.510.00 870.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,753.52 870.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS [ I | s70.00]

Report Ref No. CCE/CTI19001036/R1fa3q2
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MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS HO LEONG CHUAN
Automolive Assessor Automotive Assessor

DEECLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: - This Repor is made scisly lor the uns snd benafll of (he Cliew nemed on tha irari pags of this Repart




