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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 10 October, 2019 11:41 AM

To: City Auto

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD for SKA2172M Your ref: GBG7432E Our ref: JO201901-0428 

D.O.A:15/01/2019 LKK REF CC4/QBE19001023/Gha3

Attachments: LOD.PDF; DV.PDF

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Vronica, 

 

We refer to the below email. 

 

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability, our principal 

had further reviewed the matter and would maintain our offer as below. We observed that the weekly statement 

for your client for the Grab earnings was for the month of June and July 2019. The accident happened on January 

2019. 

 

Cost of Repair (w/gst)  $    4,280.00   

Loss of Use ($60 x 7 days)  $        420.00   

  TOTAL $    4,700.00  
    

 

If agreeable, kindly let the owner sign the attached DV and forward back a copy to us (LKK)  to us for our principal to 

process the payment. 

 

Thank you. 
 

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and 

should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement 

should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present 

matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer 

in any other related matters.  

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessary.... 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
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From: City Auto [mailto:cityauto@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 23 August, 2019 10:44 AM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Admin A 

Subject: RE: LOD for SKA2172M Your ref: GBG7432E Our ref: JO201901-0428 D.O.A:15/01/2019 LKK REF 

CC4/QBE19001023/Gha3 

 

Dear Vic, 

 

Re-send the LOD for above-mentioned claims. 

 

Kindly check and revert to us. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Vronica LawVronica LawVronica LawVronica Law    

City Auto Pte Ltd 
Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate, 

#01-60/62 Sin Ming Road, 

Singapore 575643 

Tel  : 6453 1235 

Fax : 6453 7944 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Friday, 23 August, 2019 10:31 AM 

To: City Auto 
Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: LOD for SKA2172M Your ref: GBG7432E Our ref: JO201901-0428 D.O.A:15/01/2019 LKK REF 
CC4/QBE19001023/Gha3 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Vronica, 

 

We refer to your below email. 

 

Please be informed that no Loss of Income was indicated in the LOD and kindly inform your client that he can only 

claim either Loss of Use or Rental as the vehicle was registered under private individual. 

 

Otherwise, kindly submit any proof to support his loss of income. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessary.... 

 

 



3

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: City Auto [mailto:cityauto@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 23 August, 2019 10:18 AM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Admin A 

Subject: RE: LOD for SKA2172M Your ref: GBG7432E Our ref: JO201901-0428 D.O.A:15/01/2019 LKK REF 

CC4/QBE19001023/Gha3 

 

Dear Vic, 

 

Thank you for the email. 

 

Owner want to claim loss of income due to his car is under private hire. 

 

Kindly assist. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Vronica LawVronica LawVronica LawVronica Law    

City Auto Pte Ltd 
Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate, 

#01-60/62 Sin Ming Road, 

Singapore 575643 

Tel  : 6453 1235 

Fax : 6453 7944 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 22 August, 2019 5:02 PM 
To: City Auto 

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: LOD for SKA2172M Your ref: GBG7432E Our ref: JO201901-0428 D.O.A:15/01/2019 LKK REF 

CC4/QBE19001023/Gha3 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Vronica, 

 

We refer to the below email. 

 

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability, we have our 

principal’s mandate and we propose below amount to settle your client’s claim: 

 

Cost of Repair (w/gst)  $    4,280.00   

Loss of Use ($60 x 7 days)  $        420.00   

  TOTAL $    4,700.00  
    

 

If agreeable, kindly let the owner sign the attached DV and forward back a copy to us (LKK)  to us for our principal to 

process the payment. 
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Thank you. 
 

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and 

should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement 

should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present

matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer 

in any other related matters.  

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: City Auto [mailto:cityauto@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 5 July, 2019 8:59 AM 

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) 

Subject: LOD for SKA2172M Your ref: GBG7432E Our ref: JO201901-0428 D.O.A:15/01/2019  

 

Dear Cecilia, 

 

Please see attached Letter of Demand for above-mentioned claim. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Vronica LawVronica LawVronica LawVronica Law    

City Auto Pte Ltd 
Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate, 

#01-60/62 Sin Ming Road, 

Singapore 575643 

Tel  : 6453 1235 

Fax : 6453 7944 

 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 4 July, 2019 6:04 PM 

To: City Auto 
Subject: RE: SKA2172M Finalise 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Vronica, 

 

For Cost of repair, the recommended repair cost is L/S $4000.00 (before GST) with 6 repair days.  
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Kindly forward your LOD and other documents to us (LKK) for our necessary action.  

 

Thanks 

 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 

from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 13 May 2019 11:31 AM 

To: City Auto <cityauto@singnet.com.sg> 

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <JoyIrene@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SKA2172M Finalise 

 

Dear Vronica, 

 

Finalize COR $3800 before GST @ 6 working days. 

 

Regards,  

Guo Qiang 

 

 

From: City Auto [mailto:cityauto@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 3 May, 2019 1:02 PM 
To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) 

Subject: FW: SKA2172M Finalise 
Importance: High 

 

Dear Sir, 

 

Kindly finalise with us. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Vronica LawVronica LawVronica LawVronica Law    

City Auto Pte Ltd 
Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate, 

#01-60/62 Sin Ming Road, 

Singapore 575643 

Tel  : 6453 1235 

Fax : 6453 7944 
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From: City Auto [mailto:cityauto@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 24 January, 2019 12:27 PM 
To: Guo Qiang(LKK)  

Subject: SKA2172M Finalise 

 

Hi Guo Qiang, 

 

Please refer to attachment. 

 

Lump sum - $ 4,450.00 with 6 Days of repair. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Vronica LawVronica LawVronica LawVronica Law    

City Auto Pte Ltd 
Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate, 

#01-60/62 Sin Ming Road, 

Singapore 575643 

Tel  : 6453 1235 

Fax : 6453 7944 

 


