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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: City Auto <cityauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 5 July, 2019 8:59 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: LOD for SKA2172M Your ref: GBG7432E Our ref: JO201901-0428 D.O.A:15/01/2019 

Attachments: Letter of Demand.pdf

Dear Cecilia, 

 

Please see attached Letter of Demand for above-mentioned claim. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Vronica LawVronica LawVronica LawVronica Law    

City Auto Pte Ltd 
Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate, 

#01-60/62 Sin Ming Road, 

Singapore 575643 

Tel  : 6453 1235 

Fax : 6453 7944 

 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 4 July, 2019 6:04 PM 
To: City Auto 

Subject: RE: SKA2172M Finalise 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Vronica, 

 

For Cost of repair, the recommended repair cost is L/S $4000.00 (before GST) with 6 repair days.  

 

Kindly forward your LOD and other documents to us (LKK) for our necessary action.  

 

Thanks 

 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 

from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 
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From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 13 May 2019 11:31 AM 

To: City Auto <cityauto@singnet.com.sg> 

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <JoyIrene@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SKA2172M Finalise 

 

Dear Vronica, 

 

Finalize COR $3800 before GST @ 6 working days. 

 

Regards,  

Guo Qiang 

 

 

From: City Auto [mailto:cityauto@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 3 May, 2019 1:02 PM 
To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) 

Subject: FW: SKA2172M Finalise 

Importance: High 

 

Dear Sir, 

 

Kindly finalise with us. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Vronica LawVronica LawVronica LawVronica Law    

City Auto Pte Ltd 
Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate, 

#01-60/62 Sin Ming Road, 

Singapore 575643 

Tel  : 6453 1235 

Fax : 6453 7944 

 

From: City Auto [mailto:cityauto@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 24 January, 2019 12:27 PM 
To: Guo Qiang(LKK)  

Subject: SKA2172M Finalise 

 

Hi Guo Qiang, 

 

Please refer to attachment. 

 

Lump sum - $ 4,450.00 with 6 Days of repair. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Vronica LawVronica LawVronica LawVronica Law    

City Auto Pte Ltd 
Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate, 

#01-60/62 Sin Ming Road, 
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Singapore 575643 

Tel  : 6453 1235 

Fax : 6453 7944 

 


