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MS‘ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited cekeq Mo, 1950000060 CST ey Me M2-0001676-9
& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapare 048580

Tel: {65)6222 2311 Fax (65)6222 3547

Claims & Mater Underwriting Dept 36 Robinson Road BLE-01 ity House Singapore DGEE77

Tel, (65) 6507 3848 Fax (65) 6507 3849
wan mefirsteapital.comsg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Parson

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

15-01-2018 Our Ref No. D19000438MFSH
14-01-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC1070E Third Party Vehicle. SSB88E

255 ALEXANDRA ROAD BODY REPAIR & PAINT CENTRE

NG SIN HAI

64715418/ 90721768 Fax No. 0
WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS FTELTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315

MNA,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN.

BHD. Attention. NIL
A TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
MAY CHUA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

et of AR IS UHANCE (RO




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

; E—— ——
From: Veron Chen (LKKAutg)

Sent: Thursday, 28 February 2019 9:25 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: 'May Chua Hui Chin'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000438MFSH/1, SS 888E

Attachments: SS 888E PRELI ADVISED. pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SS 888E
Date of survey: 26/2/2019
Number of days : 5 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January 2019 3:29 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Ce: 'May Chua Hui Chin' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000438MFSH/1

Dear Sir/fMdm,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims @msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January 2019 2:01 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @ LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; May Chua Hui Chin
1




<maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000438MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. A“G. This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
; WWW.avVE.com



yEL

< = M= Consultants

i A = Pie Lid Company Registration Mo, 198607 194R
Bl UKL AVE L, #02-23 PAYA UKL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL @ (D651 62563561 FAX : (065) 62504315

Your ref: D19000438MFSH

Our ref’ CS/FCI19000999/T1vd3 Date: 28/2/2019

The Motor Claims Department

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF YEHICLE NO S5 888E

We thank you for your instruction on 16/1/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

26/2/2019 at the premises of M/s KAH MOTOR CO SDN BHD

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 1 558,421.60
Revised Estimate Amount : 553,680.64
"Check" Items Amount : 55913.04
Total : 8%

Market Value : 8%

LTA Reimbursement Value + 8%

Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
front n/s portion

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
MMATAIL AMSAE-A
Automohile Assessor



BAKM 19006488 ! Kah Maolor Co Sdr Blsd - Ui
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 14012019 21496
SUBMITTED BY: MG SIN HAl

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please repon I:EF'EC'.|'E the details of the accident 1o speed up e claims process.

2. This Farm must be completed by the Pnrln}'hnldcr andfor the Authorised Dr‘i-.-E..

3, Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any witful misrepresentation or witholding of materal facis may allow insurance companies 1o
repudiate policy liabifity.

4, The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of palicy llabity on the part of the insurance companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GLA Records Managemant Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapare {GIA) for
archiving and thal copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interesied paries.

?'_r By H’J.,:i!-:\'ﬂnemen‘. of this repod 1o the neurers, you heraby consant to the arch ViFNg of this repad at the centre and to copies of thi repor baing made availabls
AoreEdId.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report
Date OF Accident

Exact Location OFf Accident

Country/State of Loss

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Wehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
MName Of Registered Chwner
NRIC No

Email Address

Mabile Phone No

Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to vour vehicle?

[f Mo, Please state action to be taken

Vehicle Category
Insurance Company
Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage
Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number
Driver

Mame of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth
Occupation

Date Of Dniving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Mobile Mumber

Fax Mumber

Contact Number
EMail Address

14/01/2019 21:48
14/01/2078 09:40
CLEMENTI AVE 2
SINGAPORE

SSB88E

CHIEW PENG CHOO
S0320879F

NOEMAIL

(LOCAL) +65-98183733
OFFICE-98183733

HONDA,
CR-V-1.5 (A)

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

AVIVALTD
COMPREHENSIVE
ND

CHIEW PENG CHOO
50320879F

27061948

INDOOR

25/06/14979

39 YEARS AND 6§ MONTHS
FEMALE

(LOCAL) +65-98183733

QOFFICE-98183733
NOEMAIL
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) HONDA

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.

{A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)

Service and Body Repair

Tel: +65 6841 3638 Website: www.honda.com.sg
For 24-hours Roadside Assistance, Call 98203838

QUOTATION

GST Reqg Mo.: M200050223
Company Ref. No.: S60FC1380G

Customer : MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED Document No. : SQT19000280 Page 1
36 ROBINSON ROAD Date : 15. Jan 2019
#16-01 CITY HOUSE Customer No. : WZF002
SINGAPORE 068877 Svc Advisor :

Registration No : SS888E Engine No : L15BG1106908

Chassis No : MEHRW1860JP000010 Date | Time : 15. Jan 2019 8:41:59 PM

Model : CRV 1.5L TURBO YM2018 (5 SEATER) Surveyor Name

Cwner's Name : CHIEW PENG CHOO Survey Date

Ins Policy No. . Authorisation Date

Date of Accident  : 14/1/2018

0% GST Amount

item Description Qty  UnitPrice Disc%  Amount Amount incld GST

TP DIRECT SETTLEMENT (JING: )

CWHNER:

OWMNER INSURER;

ACC DATE:

SURVEYED BY:

DATE:;

REF MC:

TP INSURER:

TP VEH:

it 7 )
71101-TMC-UO0ZZ  FACGE, FR. BUMPER 1 548 30 25 41122 < 2879 440.01
T1100-TMC-U10ZZ  FACE ASSY, FR. BUMPER ? i WAk 1 548.30 25 411.22 2879 440.01
71130-TME-T12 BEAM COMP,FR BUMPER 7 x ®® 1 480.80 25 36060 2524 385 84
71102-TME-T00 FACE, FR. BUMPER LOWER ar" 1 530.40 25 397.80 « 27.85 42565
71190-TME-T04 BEAMFR.BUMPER LCORNER UPP 7 X 7 1 42,50 25 3187 223 34.10
T1193-TME-T01 SPACER, R. FR. BUMPER SIDE % R 1 11.90 25 B.92 062 054
71198-TME-T04 SPACER, L FR. BUMPER SIDE nés—" 1 11,90 25 sgez / 0862 554
91505-TME-003 CUPBUMPER  wet— 14 230 25 2415 .~ 1869 2584
71110-TME-T01 GARMISH, FR. BUMPER SKiID ¥ ™7 1 28,80 25 2242 157 23.99
33150-TLA-T14 HEADLIGHT ASSY.L. ¢ " 1 1836.50 25 137737 9642 147379
33950-SLE-J51 LIGHT ASSYLFRFOGLIGHT ¥ | 1 23970 25 179.77 12,58 192,35
71166-TME-T00 BRACKET, L. FR. FOG LIGHT ¥ pF«" 1 8.40 25 .30 0.44 6.74
71156-TMC-TOD GARNISH, L. FR. FOG LIGHT # 1 29.40 25 22,05 1,54 23.59
39680-TEX-Y41ZT  SENSOR ASSY.PARKING 7 ' n ' 1 145 80 25 109.35 7.65 117.00
74165-TME-T01 PROTECTOR. L FR. WHEEL ARGH ot~ 1 23.40 25 1755 «* 123 18.78
60261-TLA-ADOZZ  PANEL, L FR FENDER /% 1 631.10 25 473.32 3313 506.45
74150-TME-TOO FENDER ASSY, L FR. INNER % "1 1 145 50 25 109.12 7.64 116.75
T4207-TLA-ADD GARMISH, L. FR. FENDER X Wiy 1 26.20 25 19.65 1.38 21.03
Sum ltem 399160 27941  4.271.01

Printed on 26/2/2019 9:55:54 AM

This 5 @ compuler gensrated invoce Mo signaiure |5 requined

Pt prices ane subjeciad 1o charge withaut nolica

The above esbmated cost of rapair do nof include any unforeseen damapes

GET Amount 8 calculabed frem indiadual line(s)

A amount of $53.50 (incl GST) will be applicable for the reguest of the abawe quoiaiion for estimales abeve 52 000 00
Hiowever, # the repairs ane subseguanily done af Kah Molor Co. Sdn. BRd, it will be refunded



I HONDA

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.
(A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)
Service and Body Repair

Tel: +55 6841 3838

Website: www honda.com.sg

For 24-hours Roadside Azsistance, Call 98203838

QUOTATION

GS5T Reg No.: M200050223
Company Ref. No.: S60FC1380G

Customer : M5 FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED Document Mo. + SQT19000280 Page 2
36 ROBINSON ROAD Date : 15 Jan 2019
#16-01 CITY HOUSE Customer No. + WZF0o02
SINGAPORE DB8ATT Svc Advisor :
Registration No . SS888E Engine No : L15BG1106908
Chassis No : MEHRW1860JPOOC010 Date | Time < 15. Jan 2019 B:41:59 PM
Model : CRWV 1.5L TURBO YM2018 (5 SEATER) Surveyor Name
Owner's Name : CHIEW PENG CHOO Survey Date
Ins Palicy Mo. . Authorisation Date
Date of Accident 14172015
0% GST Amount
Item Description Qty Unit Price  Disc % Amount Amount  incld GST
BOSUN SUNDRIES roL 1 1000 >Y 10000  7.00 107,00
BMLO1I INSPECT FR LIGHTING MECHANISMS & FOCUS 1 180,00 o "'_ 180.00 12.60 182 60
BADIR REMOVE & INSTALL SIDE CORMER SENSORS-ZPESTN) 1 15000 150.00 10.50 160.50
BKEHO1S gIE#E.HTEN ALIGH BULKHEAD & REMNEW DAMAGE 1 200000 ! | 2i ¥ 2000.00 140.00 2140.00
BPOZR _:E;;.:;Y PAINT ON REFAIRED/REFPLACED AREAS (2PX 1 2000.00 | 351:) o 200000 140.00 214000
Sum Labor  4430.00 31010 4.740.10
Survey By T~ ‘1"}""1‘1%%."’\ O\
Date & Time 24| Th 4o oo %Q\ Total Amount 842160 58951  9.011.11
Excess N v Total (Inclusive of GST) 9.011.11
Status X wi SEILT)
Signature W ‘

1

Suv @ [ laaAds Gona -

onsrs bﬁﬂ

il GLW

(~

LKK Auto Consyltants hence nofify

the Repairer of the following:

o To resurvey beforelatier soray nainting

o To display damaged | sufing resurey

& Parls pnces a

& Therd party
Mo il

X o4 yed ang

gz e rance Lompany

jice” basis

Printed on 26/2/2019 9:55:54 AM

This is a computer genarated inwice. No signature is regquired
Par prices are subpecied fo change without notice

The abeve estimaled cost of repair do not include ary unfonseen damagas

GET Amount rs calculatad from ingeddual Bass)

An amaunt of 35350 (inel GST) will be appliicable fof the request of the abowe quotation for estimales abave 52 000 00

Howewer, if the repairs are subsequentyy done 51 Kaen Motor Go. Sdn Brd i will be rafunded



HONDA.

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.
{A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhac)

370 Ukl Road 3 Singapore 408651, Tel: +65 6841 3883 Fax: +65 6741 5022
255 Alexandra Road Singapore 159937, Tel: +65 6471 5458 Fax +65 6471 5460

SERVICE PRE-INVOICE

GST Reg Mo.: M200050223
Company Ref. No.: S60FC1380G

Customer: WZFQQE I MS FJ_R?I_GAF‘ITAL Documaent Mao: SVO19012583
Chassis No: MRHRW1860JP000010 Printed By: SHNG
License Mo: SSBBBE Order Date:; 26, February 2019
Mileage: 18524 Order Timea: 11:39:08 AM
Engine No: L15BG1106908 Service Advisor: NG SIN HAI
ITEM DESCRIPTION ary UNIT pisc%  AMOUNT ":i GST Amount i"da Ed:l'
TP DIRECT SETTLEMENT (N0 }
OWNER:CHIEW PENG CHOO
CWHMNER INSURER-AVIVA
ACC DATE:14/01/2019
SURVEYED BY: TAUFIKH
DATE: 26/022019
REF NO:
TP INSURER:MS FIRST CAP
TP VEH:SHC1070E
SUPPLEMENTARY PART
THM-TMC-UROZZ FACE, FR. BUMPER 1 548.30 25 411.22 2879 440,01
T1102-TME-TOD FACE, FR. BUMPER LOWER 1 530.40 25 397.80 2785 425 65
T1198-TME-T09 SPACER, L. FR, BEUMPER SIDE 1 11.890 25 B.92 082 9.54
81505-TMB-003 CUP BUMPER 14 230 25 24 15 169 25.84
T4165-TME-T01 PROTECTOR, L. FR. WHEEL ARCH 1 23,40 25 17.55 1.23 18.78
71121-TME-T0O BASE, FR. GRILLE A 1 154.00 25 115.50 809 123.50
TM23-TME-TOO MOLDING B, R. FR. GRILLE (&4} 1 52.90 25 3087 276 42 45
T1173-TME-T0D MOLDING B, L. FR. GRILLE (/) 1 52.90 25 3967 278 42 45
T5T00-SZW-000 EMBLEMH MARK 'l 29.60 25 212 1.55 2387
90301-5T0-003 MUTPUSH 3MM 2 210 25 315 0.22 .37
SUM PARTS: 1.079.75 75.60 1,155.35
BOSUN arot 1 30.00 30.00 210 32.10
SUNDRIES
BMLO1I oro1 1 180.00 180.00 1260 192.60
INSPECT FR LIGHTING MECHANISMS &
FOCUS
HEADL.IGHTS.{N}
BADIR 0669 1 150.00 150.00 10.50 160.50
REMOVE & INSTALL SIDE CORMNER
SENSORS-2 PCS (N)
BKBHO1S 0e59 1 1,120.00 1,120.00 T8.40 1,188.40
STRAGHTEN ALIGN BULKHEAD &
REMEW DAMAGE PARTS.
BPOZR 1610 1 1,350.00 1,350.00 84 .50 1,444 50
SPRAY PAINT ON REPAIREDVREPLACED
AREAS {2PX$450)
SUM LABOUR: 2,830.00 198,10 3,028.10
TOTAL SGD 3,909.75 273.70 4,183.45
Total Payable (SGD) 4,183.45

GET Amourt |s caloulated from individusd lina(s)



) HONDA

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.
(A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)
370 Ubl Road 3 Singaoore 408651, Tel: +B5 6841 3883 Fax; +65 6741 5022
255 Alexandra Road Singapere 159937 Tel. +85 6471 5458 Fax; +65 6471 5480

SERVICE PRE-INVOICE

GST Reg Ma.: M200050223
Company Ref, Ne.: SE0FC1380G

Customer: ***=*0879F / CHIEW PENG CHOO Document No: SVO18012583
Chassis No: MRHRW1B860JP000010 Printed By: SHNG
License No: SSB88E Order Date: 26. February 2018
Mileage: 18524 Order Time: 11:38:08 AM
Engine No: L15BG1106908 Service Advisor: NG SIN HAI
ITEM DESCRIPTION ary  UNIT DISC% AMOUNT ﬁﬁ; Aot Ineks
SUPPLEMENTARY PART
71121-TME-T00 BASE, FR. GRILLE T 154.00 25 115,50 8.09 123,59 ‘*»”/
71123-TME-T00 MOLDING B, R. FR. GRILLE 1 52580 25 39 67 278 4245017
T1173-TME-T0D MOLDING B, L. FR. GRILLE 1 52.90 25 39.67 278 424517
TET00-SZW-000 EMBLEMH MARK 1 29,50 25 2212 1.55 23,67 i -
80301-8T0-003 NUTPUSH 3MM 2 2.10 25 3.15 0.22 3.7k
SUM PARTS: 220.11 15.42 236.53
TOTAL SGD 220.m 15.42 23553
Total Payable (SGD) 235.53

GET Amount is calculabad from indhicual linafe]



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 March 2019 3:29 PM

To: 'Mg Sin Hai'

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Submission Pre-Invoice for vehicle SSBBBE
Hi Sin Hai,

COR 53909.75 , 5 days.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk AUTO

From: Ng Sin Hai [mailto:shng@kahmotor.onmicrosoft.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 5 March 2019 7:40 PM

To: Taufikh@lkkauto.com; SUR

Subject: RE: Submission Pre-Invoice for vehicle SSBBBE

Dear Mr Taufikh,
Kindly refer to the attached pdf for the pre-invoice final repair cost amount for abovementioned vehicle .

Cost of repair : 553,909.75 (before GST)
No of working days : 05 days. (LOU)

We will proceed for closing after 1 week of submission to you.
Kindly contact me if there is any discrepancy

Thank you and have a nice day,®

Warmest Regards,

Ng Sin Hai

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd

(A member of Oriental Holdings Berhad)
Body Repair & Paint Centre

255 Alexandra Road

Singapore 159937

DID: 6471 5419

HP: 9072 1769

E-mail: shng@honda.com.sg



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL:; 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 198607188R GST Reg. Mo. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref :  CS/FCI19000999/T 1vd3s2
e i |||
Code: FCi2
il Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 1070E Veh. Inspected SS 888E
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19000438MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  MAY CHUA Assign Date 16/01/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA CRV c.c 1498
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. MRHRW1860.JP000010 Colour WHITE
Odometer 027454 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOoOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |235/65R17 GOODYEAR 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre [235/65R17 GOODYEAR 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |235/65R17 GOODYEAR 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |235/65R17 GOODYEAR 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT N/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 14/01/2019 ilnspactiun Date 26/02/2019
Survey held at KAH MOTOR CO SDN BERHAD
NO. 255 ALEXANDRA ROAD
SINGAPORE 159937
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|E5TIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

5 Working Days




¥y

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bdl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. S5 888E
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition [ =stimats P?gn ﬁjl
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FACE, FR. BUMPER (SN) DEFORMED 411.22 411,22
1|FACE ASSY, FR. BUMPER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 411.22 -
1|BEAM COMP, FR. BUMPER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 360 60 -
1|FACE, FR. BUMPER LOWER (SN) cuT 397 80 397 80
1|BEAM. FR. BUMPER L CORNER UPP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 31.87 .
1|SPACER, R. FR. BUMPER SIDE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 892 -
1|SPACER, L. FR. BUMPER SIDE (SN) NECESSARY 892 892
14|CLIP, BUMPER (SN) NECESSARY 24.15 24.15
1|GARNISH, FR. BUMPER SKID (SN) NOT NECESSARY 22 42 ;
1|HEADLIGHT ASSY, L (SN) NOT NECESSARY 1,377.37 :
1|LIGHT ASSYL FR.FOGLIGHT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 179.77 -
1|BRACKET, L. FR. FOG LIGHT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 6.30 .
1|GARNISH, L. FR. FOG LIGHT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 22.05
1|SENSOR ASSY PARKING (SN) NOT NECESSARY 109.35 -
1|PROTECTOR, L. FR. WHEEL ARCH (SN) cuT 17.55 17.55
1|PANEL, L FR FENDER (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 473.32 -
LABOUR
1|FENDER ASSY, L. FR. INNER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 109.12 :
1|GARNISH, L. FR. FENDER (SN) NOT NECESSARY 19.65 -
1|SUNDRIES {SN) NECESSARY 100.00 30.00
1|BASE, FR. GRILLE (SN) (ADDITIONAL) CRACKED 11550 115.50
1|MOLDING B, R, FR. GRILLE (SN) (ADDITIONAL) cuT 39.67 3067
1|MOLDING B, L. FR. GRILLE (SN) (ADDITIONAL) cuT 39.67 39.67
1|EMBLEMH MARK (SN) (ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY 22.12 22 12
2|NUTPUSH 3MM (SN) (ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY 3.15 3.15
4311.1 1,108.75
LABOUR
INSPECT FR LIGHTING MECHANISMS & FOCUS. 180.00 180.00
REMOVE & INSTALL SIDE CORNER SENSORS 150.00 150.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19000999/T1vd3s2




' V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bdl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607108R GST Reg. Mo, 19-8607198-R Page Mo, 2 of 2
Qty Description of Parts Condition Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Workshop (§)) ($)
STRAIGHTEN ALIGN BIULKHEAD & RENEW DAMAGE 2,000.00 1,120.00
PARTS, IMCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF PAMEL, L. FR
FENDER.
SPRAY PAINT ON REPAIRED / REPLACED AREAS. 2,000.00 1,350.00
4,330.00 2,800.00
GRAND TOTAL 8,641.71 3,909.75
f RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 3,909.75/

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19000999/T1vd3s2

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH ADRIAN LING WAI PING
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng,AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A,M.MATAI
Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report Is made solely for the use and benefit of the Cllent named on the front page of this Report.
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