Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 5 March 2019 8:43 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: LOD YN5978B AGAINST YM8681S DOA 14/01/2019
Attachments: InvoiceSEARCH.pdf; LOD-YN5978B.pdf

CS/CTI19000998/Avd3n2

From: lvan Teo <ivanteo@abwin.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 1 March, 2019 11:00 AM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Linda Liao <lindaliao@abwin.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: LOD YN5978B AGAINST YM8681S DOA 14/01/2019

Dear Boon Sen,

Please find the attached LOD for your necessary action.
We will mail out the hard copy to your good office.

Thank you.

Best regards,

lvan Teo
Motor Claims Executive

DID +65 6713 9416 / 86680608

Abwin Service Pte Lid

B ABWIN

Service Centre

Engine Engine Bodywork Repair & Air-conditioning Tyre Replocement
Dlﬁ!?!ﬂﬂb:i Gwﬁ'hnul Spray-painting Repair & Servicing

No. 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #07-48 Premier@Kaki Bukit Gate 2 Singapore 415875
T +65 6713 9400 | F +65 6713 9415

From: Chong Boon Sen [mailto:boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com]
Sent: Thursday, 17 January, 2019 9:15 AM
To: lvan Teo <ivanteo@abwin.com.sg>

&

All Cther’
Mechanical Ser



Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR PRI SURVEY YN5978B AGAINST YM8681S DOA 14/01/2019

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs
We refer to the above matter.

Liability is in favor of your client and we agree to go for Direct Settlement, subject to consistency of damages, based on
our appointed surveyor’s findings, with supporting documents.

Aside to M/s LKK, please upload your report and bill for services rendered in Merimen at your earliest convenience.

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 63896171

Fax: 62247175

Email: boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided for
in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: lvan Teo [mailto:ivanteo@abwin.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 17 January, 2019 9:18 AM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR PRI SURVEY YN5978B AGAINST YM8681S DOA 14/01/2019

Dear Boon Sen,

Please find the attached marked estimate surveyed by LKK.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

ABWIN;

Abwin Service Pte Ltd



No. 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
#07-48 Premier@Kaki Bukit Gate 2
Singapore 415875

lvan Teo
Motor Claim Executive
DID +65 6713 9416 / 86680608

T +65 6713 9400 | F +65 6713 9415
Website | Facebook | LinkedIn

Looking to start a new business soon? Find out how we can provide you with a complete vehicle ownership solution and much more!

Click here to view our listing >>

Sales & Purchase of Pre-owned Commercial & Private Vehicles | Vehicle Service Centre | Vehicle Hire Purchase | Motor Insurance | Gene

From: Chong Boon Sen [mailto:boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Thursday, 17 January, 2019 9:07 AM

To: Ivan Teo <ivanteo@abwin.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR PRI SURVEY YN5978B AGAINST YM8681S DOA 14/01/2019

Without Prejudice
Save as to costs

Dear lvan,
We are prepared to do direct settlement but kindly provide repair estimate.

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 63896171

Fax: 62247175

Email: boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided for
in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: lvan Teo [mailto:ivanteo@abwin.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 17 January, 2019 9:02 AM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR PRI SURVEY YN5978B AGAINST YM8681S DOA 14/01/2019
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Good Morning Boon Sen,

Kindly advise on liability for this case.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

ABWIN

Abwin Service Pte Ltd

No. 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

#07-48 Premier@Kaki Bukit Gate 2
Singapore 415875

lvan Teo
Motor Claim Executive

DID +65 6713 9416 / 86680608

T +65 6713 9400 | F +65 6713 9415
Website | Facebook | LinkedIn

Looking to start a new business soon? Find out how we can provide you with a complete vehicle ownership solution and much more!

Click here to view our listing >>

Sales & Purchase of Pre-owned Commercial & Private Vehicles | Vehicle Service Centre | Vehicle Hire Purchase | Motor insurance | Gene

From: Chong Boon Sen [mailto:boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January, 2019 1:04 PM

To: lvan Teo <ivanteo@abwin.com.sg>

Cc: Linda Liao <lindaliao@abwin.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR PRI SURVEY YN5978B AGAINST YM8681S DOA 14/01/2019

Without Prejudice

Daer both,

Will appoint accordingly.
Dear LKK,

Kindly assist with PRI.

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Claims




China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 63896171

Fax: 62247175

Email: boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided for
in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Ivan Teo [mailto:ivanteo@abwin.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January, 2019 11:26 AM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Linda Liao <lindaliao@abwin.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR PRI SURVEY YN5978B AGAINST YM8681S DOA 14/01/2019

Dear Boon Sen,

Kindly appoint Marcus Chua.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

ABWIN/;

Abwin Service Pte Ltd

No. 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

#07-48 Premier@Kaki Bukit Gate 2
Singapore 415875

lvan Teo
Motor Claim Executive

DID +65 6713 9416 / 86680608

T +65 6713 9400 | F +65 6713 9415
Website | Facebook | LinkedIin

Looking to start a new business soon? Find out how we can provide you with a complete vehicle ownership solution and much more!

Click here to view our listing >>

Sales & Purchase of Pre-owned Commercial & Private Vehicles | Vehicle Service Centre | Vehicle Hire Purchase | Motor insurance | Gene



From: Chong Boon Sen [mailto:boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January, 2019 11:15 AM

To: lvan Teo <ivanteo@abwin.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ARRANGE FOR PRI SURVEY YN5978B AGAINST YM8681S DOA 14/01/2019

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's vehicle jointly with your client/your
motor workshop. We propose to use one of the following motor surveyors to conduct the joint pre-repair survey
as a single joint expert.

ADRIAN LING
Kelvin Ang

SEE CHEW SENG
MOHD FADHILAH BIN
OSMAN

XING QUO QIANG
KENNETH KONG
SIMON HO

CHUA WEIJIE
MARCUS CHUA
HENRY NG

Please let us know within two(2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert.

You may select one of the listed motor surveyors and we will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out
by the single joint expert.

Thank you.

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 63896171

Fax: 62247175

Email: boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided for
in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.



From: lvan Teo [mailto:ivanteo@abwin.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January, 2019 11:14 AM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: ARRANGE FOR PRI SURVEY YN5978B AGAINST YM8681S DOA 14/01/2019

Dear Boon Sen,
Kindly arrange for 3™ party survey

My client YN5978B
Your insured YM8681S
Date of accident : 14/01/2019

Vehicle in our workshop.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

ABWIN

Abwin Service Pte Ltd

No. 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

#07-48 Premier@Kaki Bukit Gate 2
Singapore 415875

lvan Teo
Motor Claim Executive

DID +65 6713 9416 / 86680608

T +65 6713 9400 | F +65 6713 9415
Website | Facebook | LinkedIn

Looking to start a new business soon? Find out how we can provide you with a complete vehicle ownership solution and much more!

Click here to view our listing >>

Sales & Purchase of Pre-owned Commercial & Private Vehicles | Vehicle Service Centre | Vehicle Hire Purchase | Motor insurance | Gene

From: lvan Teo

Sent: Tuesday, 15 January, 2019 3:43 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: ARRANGE FOR PRI SURVEY YN5978B AGAINST YM8681S DOA 14/01/2019

Dear Motor Claims,



Kindly arrange for 3™ party survey

My client YN5978B
Your insured YM8681S
Date of accident : 14/01/2019

Vehicle in our workshop.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

ABWIN

Abwin Service Pte Ltd

No. 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

#07-48 Premier@Kaki Bukit Gate 2
Singapore 415875

lvan Teo
Motor Claim Executive
DID +65 6713 9416 / 86680608

T +65 6713 9400 | F +65 6713 9415
Website | Facebook | LinkedIn

Looking to start a new business soon? Find out how we can provide you with a complete vehicle ownership solution and much more!

Click here to view our listing >>
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