Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Attachments:

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Monday, 7 June 2021 11:43 AM

Guan Motor Works

RE: Your Ref: GBG1695C *Our Ref: CC6/11119000976/Kpb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
GW 5853T(lll) / GBG 1695C/ OTHERS ON 14/01/2019]

DV_GBG1695C.pdf; LOD(GBG1695C).pdf; Repair Bill.PDF

Without Prejudice

Dear Ah Heng,

As per our tele-conversation earlier, we confirm settlement at a global sum of $20,000.00(all-in).

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return together with the following document to us (LKK) for our
necessary action: -

e Repair Tax Invoice bill to India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

e

GUAN MOTOR WORKS "

Aysness Fegn Mo: 08 1026005 i
176 Sin Ming Drive #0203 Sin Ming Autocare Singapore 3 13721
A ! T

BEAR 41 EXPRESS j_

B - 1 |

Tel: G453 G11] HP: G742 G003

Invoice No: 4972

(19-04-2019

TOYOTA HIACE - GRG TRYS

e Authorisation to Act signed by your client.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 22 March 2021 12:07 PM

To: Guan Motor Works <guanmotorworks@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: GBG1695C *Our Ref: CC6/11119000976/Kpb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW 5853T(lll) / GBG
1695C/ OTHERS ON 14/01/2019]

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We have seek further mandate/instruction from Ill. However we regret to inform you that we have our principal
instruction to maintain offer at g/s $20,000.00(all-in).

11l comments for the items below: -

e HEADLAMP - Damages not clear.
e REAR LH BODY INNER PANEL — Repairable.
e REAR FLOOR PANEL — Repairable.
e REAR EXHAUST SILENCER — Can be reused.

Kindly re-consider our offer. Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 23 September 2020 10:09 AM

To: Guan Motor Works <guanmotorworks@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: GBG1695C *Our Ref: CC6/11119000976/Kpb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW 5853T(lll) / GBG
1695C/ OTHERS ON 14/01/2019]

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We have seek further mandate/instruction from Ill. However we regret to inform you that we have our principal
instruction to maintain offer at g/s $20,000.00(all-in).

Kindly re-consider our offer.

Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 22 May 2020 9:51 AM




To: Guan Motor Works <guanmotorworks@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Your Ref: GBG1695C *Our Ref: CC6/11119000976/Kpb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW 5853T(lll) / GBG
1695C/ OTHERS ON 14/01/2019]

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to your below email.

We have seek further mandate from our principal on this matter and we have our principal instruction to improve
our offer at a global sum of $20,000.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Guan Motor Works <guanmotorworks@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 13 April 2020 4:16 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: GBG1695C *Our Ref: CC6/11119000976/Kpb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW 5853T(lll) / GBG
1695C/ OTHERS ON 14/01/2019]

Hi,
We reject S$ 18,500.

We propose SS 24,250.

Cost of repair S$21,850 SN
Loss of use (SS$80 per day x 30 days) SS$ 2,400
TOTAL $$24,250
Thank you.

Pang

Guan Motor Works



On 4/12/20, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

> Without Prejudice

>

>

>

> Dear Sirs/Mdm,

>

>

>

> We refer to our below email.

>

>

>

> Please confirm acceptance.

>

>

> “Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely
> on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter
> amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of

> liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of
> terms/settlement.

>

>

>

> In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by
> either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of

> liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
> terms/settlement.”

>

> Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be
> made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy.
> Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

>

> Best Regards,

> Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

> Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com<mailto:chewht@Ilkkauto.com>
> fax: 6741 4108

> Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

>

> <mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com>

>

>

> From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

> Sent: Wednesday, 25 March 2020 5:53 PM

> To: Guan Motor Works <guanmotorworks@gmail.com>

> Subject: RE: Your Ref: GBG1695C *Our Ref: CC6/11119000976/Kpb3 [ACCIDENT
> INVOLVING GW 5853T(Ill) / GBG 1695C/ OTHERS ON 14/01/2019]

>

> Without Prejudice

> (save as to costs)

>

> Dear Sirs/Mdm,

>

> We refer to the above matter.

>




> We have our principal instruction to improve our offer at a global sum of
> $18,500.00(all-in).

>

> Please confirm acceptance.

>

>

> “Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely
> on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter
> amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of

> liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of
> terms/settlement.

>

> In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by
> either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of

> liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
> terms/settlement.”

>

>

>

> Best Regards,

> Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

> Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

> Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

> From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

> Sent: Sunday, 8 March 2020 3:27 PM

> To: Guan Motor Works <guanmotorworks@gmail.com>

> Subject: RE: Your Ref: GBG1695C *Our Ref: CC6/11119000976/Kpb3 [ACCIDENT
> INVOLVING GW 5853T(Ill) / GBG 1695C/ OTHERS ON 14/01/2019]

>

> Without Prejudice

> (save as to costs)

>

> Dear Sirs/Mdm,

>

> We refer to the above matter.

>

> We have our principal instruction to improve our offer at a global sum of

> $18,000.00(all-in).

>

> Please confirm acceptance.

>

> “Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely
> on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter
> amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of

> liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of
> terms/settlement.

>

> In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by
> either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of

> liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation

6



> terms/settlement.”

>

>

>

> Best Regards,

> Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

> Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya
> Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

> From: Guan Motor Works <guanmotorworks@gmail.com>

> Sent: Tuesday, 17 December 2019 10:03 AM

> To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

> Subject: Re: Your Ref: GBG1695C *Our Ref: CC6/11119000976/Kpb3 [ACCIDENT
> INVOLVING GW 5853T(lll) / GBG 1695C/ OTHERS ON 14/01/2019]

>

> Hi Ms Hsiao Tong,

>

> We reject the above mentioned offer.

>

> Thank you.

> Pang

> Operations

> Guan Motor Works

>

>0n 12/12/19, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:
>> Your Ref: GBG1695C Without Prejudice

>> Qur Ref: CC6/11119000976/Kpb3

>>

>> Dear Sirs/Mdm,

>>

>> ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW 5853T(lll) / GBG 1695C/ OTHERS ON 14/01/2019
>>

>> We refer to the above matter.

>>

>> We have our principal instruction to offer as follows: -

>>

>> 1. Cost of Repair

>> $15,850.00

>> 2. Loss of Use (24days x $80.00)

>>$ 1,920.00

>> 3, LTA/ GIA search fee

>>S 7.45

>> Total

>>$17,777.45

>>

>> Please confirm acceptance.

>>

>> "Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is
>> purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

>> resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal

>> proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
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>> inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

>>

>> |n the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced
>> by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of

>> liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the

>> negotiation terms/settlement."

>>

>> "Best Wishes for Merry Christmas, and Happy New Year 2020"

>>

>> Best Regards,

>> Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

>> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

>> Phone: 6742-3197 | email:

>> chewht@Ikkauto.com<mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com> |

>> fax: 6741-4108

>> Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

>>

>>

>>

>>

>

>

> -

> Yours sincerely,

>

> Pang

> Operations

>

> Guan Motor Works

>

> 176 Sin Ming Drive

> #02-03 Sin Ming Autocare

> Singapore 575721

> 0:+65.64536.111

> F: +65.6453.8292

> WWw.gmw.com.sg<http://www.gmw.com.sg>

>
> This transmission is CONFIDENTIAL and the information is intended only for
> the use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed. If you are not
> the intended recipient, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering
> it to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use,

> dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is STRICTLY
> PROHIBITED. If you have received the transmission in error, please

> immediately notify us by e-mail and/or telephone, and delete the

> transmission and any attachments from your mailbox. Thank you.

>

Yours sincerely,

Pang
Operations

Guan Motor Works



176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-03 Sin Ming Autocare
Singapore 575721

0O: +65.64536.111

F: +65.6453.8292
WWW.EMW.COM.Sg

This transmission is CONFIDENTIAL and the information is intended only for
the

use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed. If you are not the
intended recipient, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering it
to

the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination,
distribution or copying of this communication is STRICTLY PROHIBITED. If
you

have received the transmission in error, please immediately notify us by
e-mail

and/or telephone, and delete the transmission and any attachments from your
mailbox. Thank you.



