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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: BHAS - Chan Yun Shi <yunshi.chan@bhauto.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 15 March 2019 7:30 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto); BHAS - Bernard Kee; BHAS - Moo Wen Zheng

Subject: LOD SJP8769K TP First Capital DOA 12.01.2019

Attachments: LOD.pdf

 
Dear Veron, 
 
Kindly refer to attached file is resend LOD for our vehicle. 
We had post out original copy document by today. 
 

Please kindly acknowledge in reply and advice further course of action soonest. 
Awaiting for your favorable reply in due course. 
 

Thank you and have a nice day. 
 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 
 

Yun ShiYun ShiYun ShiYun Shi    
    

 

Address: Blk 1,Sector C, Sin Ming Industrial Estate 

#01-111/113/115/117 Singaopre:575636 

(T) +65-6559 8944 /8942         (F) +65-6515 3144 / +65-6269 2404 

Email: yunshi.chan@bhauto.com.sg  
Website: http://www.bhauto.com.sg 

 

 

From: BHAS - Bernard Kee <Bernard.kee@bhauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, March 13, 2019 10:52 AM 
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; BHAS - Moo Wen Zheng 
<wenzheng.moo@bhauto.com.sg>; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: BHAS - Chan Yun Shi <yunshi.chan@bhauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: FINALISE SJP8769K TP First Capital DOA 12.01.2019 

 

Dear Veron 

 

COR confirmed $1900.00 

Thank you 
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Best Regards, 

Bernard KeeBernard KeeBernard KeeBernard Kee    
 

    
(W) +65-6559 8941         (F) +65-6269 2404         (M) +65 9747 8383 

Bernard.kee@bhauto.com.sg   http://www.bhauto.com.sg    
 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 13 March 2019 10:34 AM 
To: BHAS - Bernard Kee <Bernard.kee@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Moo Wen Zheng 
<wenzheng.moo@bhauto.com.sg>; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: BHAS - Chan Yun Shi <yunshi.chan@bhauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: FINALISE SJP8769K TP First Capital DOA 12.01.2019 

 

Dear Bernard, 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
As spoken. 
 
Confirmed Lump Sum $1900/- @ 3 working days. 
 
Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to First Capital Ins Ltd. 
 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: BHAS - Bernard Kee <Bernard.kee@bhauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 13 March 2019 10:30 AM 
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; BHAS - Moo Wen Zheng 
<wenzheng.moo@bhauto.com.sg>; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: BHAS - Chan Yun Shi <yunshi.chan@bhauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: FINALISE SJP8769K TP First Capital DOA 12.01.2019 

 

Dear Veron 

 

COR confirmed $1908.24  
Thank you 

 

Best Regards, 

Bernard KeeBernard KeeBernard KeeBernard Kee    
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(W) +65-6559 8941         (F) +65-6269 2404         (M) +65 9747 8383 

Bernard.kee@bhauto.com.sg   http://www.bhauto.com.sg    
 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 13 March 2019 9:27 AM 
To: BHAS - Moo Wen Zheng <wenzheng.moo@bhauto.com.sg>; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) 
<GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: BHAS - Bernard Kee <Bernard.kee@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Chan Yun Shi 
<yunshi.chan@bhauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: FINALISE SJP8769K TP First Capital DOA 12.01.2019 

 

Dear Wen Zheng, 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Offer Lump Sum $1900/- before GST @ 3 working days. 
 
Parts    $1917 (less 10%)=$1725.30 
S/N      $200 
Labour $460 
 
Total : $2385.30 (less 20%)=$1908.24 
 
Please check and confirm 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, 8 March 2019 11:52 AM 
To: 'BHAS - Moo Wen Zheng' <wenzheng.moo@bhauto.com.sg>; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) 
<GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: BHAS - Bernard Kee <Bernard.kee@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Jacelyn Loh 
<Jacelyn.loh@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Chan Yun Shi <yunshi.chan@bhauto.com.sg>; SUR 
<sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: FINALISE SJP8769K TP First Capital DOA 12.01.2019 

 

Dear Wen Zheng, 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Offer Lump Sum $1800/- before GST @ 3 working days. 
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Parts    $1807 (less 10%)=$1626.30 
S/N      $200 
Labour $460 
 
Total : $2286.30 (less 20%)=$1829.04 
 
Please check and confirm 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: BHAS - Moo Wen Zheng <wenzheng.moo@bhauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 19 February 2019 7:20 PM 
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: BHAS - Bernard Kee <Bernard.kee@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Jacelyn Loh 
<Jacelyn.loh@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Chan Yun Shi <yunshi.chan@bhauto.com.sg> 
Subject: FINALISE SJP8769K TP First Capital DOA 12.01.2019 

 

Dear veron, 
 

Kindly refer to attached file for finalise SJP8769K amount is $2550.00 B/GST Lump Sum. 
 

Appreciate if you can expedite on this and confirm the amount asap. 
 

Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 
Wen Zheng  

 

(W) +65-6559 8945              (F) +65-6269 2404        (HP) +65 9621 2084 

(E)wenzheng.moo@bhauto.com.sg    http://www.bhauto.com.sg  

         
 

 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 14 February 2019 3:23 PM 
To: BHAS - Jacelyn Loh <Jacelyn.loh@bhauto.com.sg>; BHAS - Moo Wen Zheng 
<wenzheng.moo@bhauto.com.sg> 
Subject: PENDING FINALISE 
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Dear Jacelyn/ Wen Zheng, 
 
Kindly advise vehicle status. 
 
If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.  
 

1) SCP 39U-DOA: 8/1/2019 
2) SJP 8769K-DOA: 12/1/2019 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


