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! l’/!‘ Auto

Conmalimnis
A mam Pre Lid Company Registration No. 1996071988

t

S§ UBLAVE 1, 80225 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL @ (3651 62563361 FAX : 05y 6236431 2
Your ref; PLEASE ADVISED

Our ref; CS/EGI 9000958/ Avd3 DATE: 26/2/2019

The Motor Claims Department Without Prejudice
M/s: ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD

Dear SirfMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SJV 428R
We thank you for your instruction on 16/1/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned
vehicle on 16/1/2010 at the premises of

M/s MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8%15,636.80

Revised Estimate Amount : §$%6,500.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check"” Items Amount 1 5%

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%

Nett Value 1 58

Description of Damage:
The vehicle susiained damages at the
rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AMMATAIL
Licensed Appraiser



Veron Chen !LKI(Auto) —

From: Veran Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 February 2019 9:21 AM

To: ‘Steve Lim'

Cc: ‘Siti Rahman'; SUR

Subject: RE: SJV428R-( PRE-INSPECTION) ; YOUR REF : GZ4702L-DOA ON 14/12/2018
Attachments: SJV 428R PRELI REVISED.pdf

Dear Steve,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SJV 428R
Date of survey: 16/1/2019
Number of days : 10 days

Kindly provides us the claim number

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Uki Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 January 2019 10:48 AM

To: 'Steve Lim' <steve lim@ergo.com.sg>

Cc: 'Siti Rahman' <Siti. Rahman@ergo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: S/V428R-( PRE-INSPECTION) ; YOUR REF : GZ4702L-DOA ON 14/12/2018

Dear Steve,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJV 428R on 16/1/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

“Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January 2019 11:09 AM

To: 'Steve Lim' <steve lim@ergo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Siti Rahman' <Siti.Rahman@ergo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SJV428R-( PRE-INSPECT ION) ; YOUR REF : GZ4702L-DOA ON 14/12/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: bag6-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Steve Lim [mailto:steve.lim@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 16 January 2019 10:56 AM

To: SUR (sur@lkkauto.com) <sur@lkkauto.com>
Ce: Admin-D (LKKAuto) (admin-d @Ikkauto.com) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>; Siti Rahman <Siti.Rahman@ergo.com.sg>
Subject: FW: SIV428R-( PRE-INSPECTION) ; YOUR REF : GZ4702L-DOA ON 14/12/2018

Dear LK,

Please assist on below PRS

Steve Lim
Manager - Claims

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Termasak Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore 038985

DID.: +656829 9197

Fax. +B65 GB29 9247

slﬂg.!'m@ergo.cnm.sg

ERGO

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Garmany and Eurcpe Woridwide, ERGO is represented in mare than 30 countries and concentrates on
Europe and Asia. ERGO Is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the warld's leading risk carriers

WWW. B0 COM &0

EMAIL DISCLAIMER |

|The information contained in this email communication is confidential. You should only read, disclose, re-transmit, copy, distribute, act in reliance on or
commerciatize the information if you are authorized to do so. If you are not the intended recipient of this email communication, please notify the sender by
¥ |replying to the email and destroy any elecironic or paper copy of this message.
Any views expressed in this email communication are those of the individual sender. ERGD Insurance Pte, Lid. doas nol represent, warrant or guarantee that
[the integrity of this communication has been maintained or that the communication is frea of emors, virus or interferance.
\ERGO Insurance Pte. Lid. asserts copyright in respect to this emall including any attachment. Mo part may be reproduced by any process of for any purpose
without prior written parmission.




Disclaimer This message and its attacnments are confidential intended cnly for the named agdresses, and may be privilagad If you are nat tha ntended recipler L. o
shauld rot dissiose, Sistnbyle, copy o use this communcation If you are net the Intended recipsent plaase notify the sandar by relurn emat anco dalete this message. By
apening any atachment ta this message, you agrea 1o sctepl e nzk thal it may contain @ virus or damaging code, and you agree that ERGO Insurance Pie Lid wil not be

liabse for ay |0ss or damage therely caused

From: MG Solution [mailto:mg3solution@gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January, 2019 10:52 AM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department); Steve Lim

Subject: SJV428R-( PRE-INSPECTION) ; YOUR REF : GZ4702L-DOA ON 14/12/2018

Dear Person In Charge,

Please refer to attach file and arrange for pre-inspection.

we prefer our single joint expert as below:

ADRIAN LING WAI

PING LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Ms hong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 (South Wing)
#02-03B Vicom Inspection Centre
Singapore 415933

Tel : 6744 4165

Fax : 6744 4604




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LEKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 January 2019 10:48 AM

Tao: '‘Steve Lim'

Cc 'Siti Rahman'; SUR

Subject: RE: S$JV428R-( PRE-INSPECTION) ; YOUR REF : GZ4702L-DOA ON 14/12/2018
Dear Steve,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SIV 428R on 16/1/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January 2019 11:03 AM

To: 'Steve Lim' <steve.lim@ergo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Siti Rahman' <Siti.Rahman@ergo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: S/V428R-( PRE-INSPECTION) ; YOUR REF : GZ4702L-DOA ON 14/12/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

(. Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Lim [mailto:steve.lim@ergo.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January 2019 10:56 AM

To: SUR (sur@lkkauto.com) <sur@l|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto) (admin-d@Ikkauto.com) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>; Siti Rahman <Siti.Rahman@ergo.com.sg>
Subject: FW: S/V428R-( PRE-INSPECTION) ; YOUR REF : GZ4702L-DOA ON 14/12/2018

Dear LEK,

Please assist on below PRS



Steve Lim
Manager - Claims

ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.

& Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Five
Singapore (38985

DiD.; +65 6825 9197

Fax.. +85 6829 9247

steve li T @grga.cnm.sg

ERGO

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in more than 30 countries and conceniraies
on Europe and Asia, ERGO is part of Munich Re {Group), ona of the world's leading risk carmers.

WIWW BI00 COM 59

[EMAIL DISCLAIMER

The infarmation contained in this email communication s confidential. You should only read, disclose, re-transmit, copy. digtribute. act in refiance on or
commercialize the infarmation if you are authorized to do so. If you are not the intended recipient of this email communication, please notify the sender by
|raplying to the email and destroy any electfonic of paper copy of this message.

|Any views expressed in this emall communication are those of the individual sender. ERGO Insurance Pie. Ltd, does nol represent, warrant or guarantee
that the integrity of this communication has been maintained or that the communicatien is free of errars, virus or interferance.

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. asserts copyright in respect to this email including any attachment. Na part may be reproduced by any process or for any
purpose without prior written permission.

Dizclaimer This message and its attachments are confidential, intended anly for e named addresses and may be privileged IF you are not I0e inlenced reciplent, yos
shauld not digclose, distribule, Copy oF use this commumcanen If you are ned the intended recipient, please notity the sender by refurn emas an i@ this message

By opening any attachment 1o this message, you agree to sccept the rsk that it may contain a virus or damaging code, and you sgres that ERGO Insurance Pla Lid w
nat ba lighle lor-any l2as or damage theaky caused

From: MG Solution [mailto:mg3solution@gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January, 2019 10:52 AM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department); Steve Lim

Subject: S)V428R-( PRE-INSPECTION) ; YOUR REF : GZ4702L-DOA ON 14/12/2018

Dear Person In Charge,
Please refer to attach file and arrange for pre-inspection.

we prefer our single joint expert as below:

ADRIAN LING WAI

e LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Ms hong



MG SUiUT]ﬂN P'PEJLTD

23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 (South Wing)
#02-03B Vicom Inspection Centre
Singapore 415933

Tel : 6744 4165

Fax : 6744 4604

. A\fﬁ This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
& WWW aVvg.com



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Steve Lim <steve lim@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January 2019 10:56 AM

To: SUR {sur@lkkauto.com)

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto) (admin-d@Ilkkauto.com); Siti Rahman

Subject: FW: SJV428R-( PRE-INSPECTION) ; YOUR REF : GZ4702L-DOA ON 14/12,2018
Attachments: SJV428R-( PRE-INSPECTION) ; YOUR REF GZ4702L.pdf

Dear LKK,

Please assist on bhelow PRS

Steve Lim
Manager - Claims

ERGO Insurance Pte, Lid,

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Eive

Singapore 038985

DIDx.. +55 G829 9197
Fax, +656B24 9247
teve. limEer B

WAL EMD0.CaM. 50

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Eurape Waorldwide, ERGO is represented in mare than 30 countr 25 and concantrates
on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk carners

'EMAIL DISCLAIMER

The information contained in this email communication is sonfidential, Yeu should only read, disclose, re-transmit. copy, distribute, act in rellance on or
|commercialize the information If you are authorized fo do so. If you are not the intended recipient of this email communication, please notify the sender by
|replying to the email and destroy any electronlc or paper copy of this message.

|Any views expressed in this email communication are those of the individual sender. ERGO Insurance Pta. Lid. does not represent, warrant or guarantee
{that the integrity of this communication has been maintained or that the communication is free of errors, virus or interference.

;ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. asserls copyright In respect to this email including any attachment. No part may be reproduced by any process or for any
|purpose without prior written permission.
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From: MG Solution [mailto:mg3solution@gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January, 2019 10:52 AM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd. (Claims Department); Steve Lim

Subject: S1V428R-( PRE-INSPECTION) ; YOUR REF : GZ4702L-DOA ON 14/12/2018

Dear Person In Charge,
Please refer to attach file and arrange for pre-inspection.

we prefer our single joint expert as below:



ADRIAN LING WAI

PING LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Ms hong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 (South Wing)
#02-03B Vicom Inspection Centre
Singapore 415933

Tel : 6744 4165

Fax : 6744 4604
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner |0 Type: Company
Qwner |Dx T312W
B 11 2 S e SRt A Rl e S o et et N |
Vehicle No.: SIMVA428R
Wehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date: 16 Jan 2019
Vehicle Make: HONDA
Vehicle Maodel; FIT13GA
Primary Colour: Red
Manufacturing Year; 2009
Engine No.: L13A4176514
Chassis No.: GE61161227
Maximum Power Output; 730 kW (97 bhp)
Open Market Value: $13,854.00
Original Registration Date: 08 Jan 2010
First Registration Date; 08 Jan 2010
Transfer Count: 2
Actual ARF Pald: $£13,856.00
e PR B e A T L S ey
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date; 07 Jan 2020
PARF Rebate Amount: $6,928.00
It O R o e e e Ty
COE Expiry Date: 07 Jan 2020
COE Category: A - Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $18,502.00
COE Rebate Amount: $1.805.00
Total Rebate Amount: $8,733.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 16 Jan 2019

OK



MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 (South Wing) #02-03 Singapore 415933
Tel: (+65) 6243 1373 | Fax: (+63) 6243 1370
Reg, No: 201427944N

Email: mg3solution{@gmail.com

TO

: ERGO INSURANCE

ATTENTION : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT

ESTIMATE REPORT

VEHICLE DETAILS

DATE

VEHICLE NO s SIVAZER

Ve on
MODEL - HONDA FIT 1.3G A
CHASSIS NO

ACCIDENT DETAILS DATE : 14-Dec-18

THIRD PARTY REQUESTOR / CONTACT

TIME : 13:40HRS

JACK LI

1711212018

JOBTYPE T/P CLAIM

CLAIM DETAIL : PARTS

SIN DESCRIPTION v | T | e
sl cate  rsforded ) 1 |s 78890|s 78890
2| TAILGATE CENTER GARNISH 20 1 |s 1s840|s 15840
3| TAIL GATE LOGO ol 1 |s 45908 45.90
4| TAIL GATE EMBLEM " FIT* AL~ 1 |5 4000]s 40.00
5|TAIL GATE sTOPPER M€ &~ 2 |s 25808 51.60
8|TAIL GATE HANDLE ™ 1 |s o98860|S 98.60
7| TAIL GATE INNER Lock ey &- 1 |s 19820]|s 198.20
8|TAIL GATE CATCH  Bentt 1 |s s570]8 55,70
of raiL GATE weaTHER STRIP (oK 1 |s 10200|5 102,00

10| TAIL GATE INNER TRIM € ceelid 1 |8 15350|8 15350
11| TAILGATE WINDSCREEN GLASS  Shalfeeld 1 |s 7a800|S 74800
12| TAIL GATE WINDSCREEN MOULDING /M~ 1 |s ori0ls 97.10
13| TAILGATE WIPER ARM [t 1 |§ 5540(% 55.40
14| TAILGATE WIPER ASSY  Ind 1 |s 16600/8% 166.90
15| TAILGATE WIPER MOTOR @Mi . 1 |s 32800]5 32500
16|TAIL GATE DAMPER Nt Has 2 |s 1se00|s 31800
17|REAR BUMPER 'ﬁ&u 1 |§ 555308 555.30
18|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER AW/ 2 |5 e4s0|s 1;9-.136

SaX L VAN Y NN AN RN



19|REAR BUMPER TOWING COVER et~ 1 |s s230ls 52.30 |~
20|REAR NUMBER PLATE LAMP N~ »+ 2 |8 6280(8% 125.60 | £'.
atltaiLLamp L1 Swwled , Rt cacd—4 2 |s 26650|8 53300
22|TAIL LAMP BRACKET A 4 2 |$ 48008 96.00 |
23|TAIL LAMP PANEL L1 eded 2 |s 155608 311,20 /58 ko
24|3RD BRAKE LIGHT Seded 1 |s 245008 2:5.4]4} ~
os|rRear FENDER M1 Prurelled- 2 |s ses20|s 137eanf=" £88 L0
26|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM (it 2 |s 290205 580.40 | «~
27|REAR END PANEL Vi stand-t d 1 |$ 355008 355.90 | <
28|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH I«ie{ri__cf 1 |s 0420]($ 94.20 |~
29|REAR FLOORPANEL Py or 1 |s 7o9s0|$ 79980 |1
30|REAR FLOOR PANEL TOP ED:;RD nt—< 1 |$ 26500|%  265.00 |
31|REAR EXHAUST PIPE ?, e, 1 |s 51120]8% 511.20 |*
32| REAR EXHAUST INSULATOR | 7~ 2 |s ssools 11600
33|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING J 2 |s 34508 69.00 | .
f 51 ) TOTAL PRICE $ 961850
< }_1’-. e LESS 20% $  1.923.70
SUB TOTAL PRICE §  7,694.80
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS iR
SIN DESCRIPTION arv| et | E"”EAIL:
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE = ALL = 1 |5 s5000|8 50.00 | *
2| TAILGATE CENTER GARNISH CLIP (SET) At 1 |s 2000(% 20.00 |~
3|TAIL GATE INNER TRIM CLIP (SET) s/ 1 |§ 3000]8% 30.00 |~
4|TAIL GATE WINDSCEEN SEALANT M 1 |s s8000|8% 8000 |$0
5|TAIL GATE WINDSCEEN INNER SEAL A 1 |s 6000[$% po.00 >
6| TAIL GATE WINDSCEEN GLASS SOLAR FILM _Abe 1 | s 35000($ 350.00 P<s
7|REAR BUMPER CLIP  #M~ 1 |5 2200(s 2200 | ~
8| TAIL LAMP CLIP (SET)  ple~ 1 |s 2000($ 20.00 |7
9|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM CLIPS (SET) 74 1 |s 2000]$% 20.00 |~
10|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS (SET) 1 |$ 2000|8 200077
11|REAR END PANEL INSULATION SEAL /™ 1 |8 12000]8 120001 60
12|REAR FLOOR PANEL INSULATION SEAL /¢~ 1 |s 2s000(s 250.00 | +
13|REAR FLOOR PANEL MAT N r 1 | s 55000(8 550.00 |7
14|REAR FLOOR PANEL MAT COVER M4+~ 1 |s 4s000|$  4soo00|
15|IROAD CAMERA  Pe—g - 1 |s ssoools rgﬁﬁ.ﬁﬁf# 45D
16|REVERSE CAMERA P—d v |'s 40000ls  agecn] F77
17|REVERSE SENSOR Dwx:é 1 |8 22000]8 29000 | A7
TOTAL $  3,212.00



CLAIM DETAILS: LABOUR AND SPRAY PAINTING (REAR)

PANEL BEATING, REMOVING AND A r00
1|REPLACING PARTS $ 2,000:00 ing
7
2|SPRAY PAINTING TO AFFECTED AREA | § 200060 | [Ho9
7
3| TRANSFER TAILGATE MECHANISM 5 80.00 | ¢
REMOVE AND REFIX TAILGATE P
4|WINDSCREEN 3 120.00 i
REMOVE AND REFIX REVERSE SENSOR - <o
S5|AND DISTANCE SETTING 5 150,00
REMOVE AND REFIX REVERSE CAMERA D S
6|AND DISTANCE SETTING 5 150,00 | 2
Fil
TIREMOVE AND REFIX PHY 5 S0.00 '//
REMOVE AND REFIX REAR EXHAUST .
8|PIPE $ 180.00 | .
gl
TOTAL $4,730.00 2150
ESTIMATE REPORT
TOTAL PARTS COST @ § 10,906.80 fdaz.. L/)
TOTAL LABOUR COST : § 4,730.00 L/ $ / é/ﬂf / (9.
TOTAL REPAIR COST : § 15,636.80 1o 97-:- :
APPROVED DETAILS
SURVEYOR A
£ ] A )
CONTACT NO EAX (5 -
AP ]
PART BY PART / LUMP SUM L[ C Y

NO OF DAYS

| ¢nett Um)

51 b rearveyed and
cwal from Insurance Company

Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:

Mat
Ligie




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 19980T198R GST Reqg. No. 19-9807198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experte En Automobile

ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD Ref ;. CS/EGI19000958/Avd3n2
oo SHTE ToneR M
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 27-02-2019
SINGAPORE 038985
Code : EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GZ 47021 Veh. Inspected SJV 428R
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. GZ4702L Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From STEVE LIM Assign Date 16/01/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDAFIT c.C 1339
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. GEB1161227 Colour RED
Odometer 154281 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |1B85/60 R14 HABILEAD & mm
L/H Front Tyre |[185/60 R14 HABILEAD B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/60R14 HABILEAD & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |[185/60 R14 HABILEAD & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  14/12/2018 Inspection Date 16/01/2012
Survey held at MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4
(SOUTH WING) #02-03B
VICOM INSPECTION CENTRE,
SINGAPORE 415833
5a, Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BiIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 10 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 100607188R GST Reg. No. 19-0607198-R Page Mo.:1 of 3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJV 428R
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop l:l‘.l (s)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1| TAIL GATE DISTORTED 786.90 788.90
1|TAIL GATE CENTER GARNISH DEFORMED 1568.40 158.40
1|TAIL GATE LOGO NECESSARY 4580 45.80
1|TAIL GATE EMBLEM "FIT" MECESSARY 40.00 40.00
2|TAIL GATE STOFPER @$25.BEI NOT NECESSARY 51.60
1|TAIL GATE HANDLE NOT NECESSARY 98.60 .
1|TAIL GATE INNER LOCK DAMAGED 198.20 198.20
1|TAIL GATE CATCH BENT 55.70 56.70
1|TAIL GATE WEATHER STRIP cuT 102.00 102.00
1| TAIL GATE INNER TRIM CRACKED 153.50 153.50
1|TAIL GATE WINDSCREEN GLASS SHATTERED 748.00 748.00
1|TAIL GATE WINDSCREEN MOULDING HNECESSARY a7.10 8710
1| TAILGATE WIPER ARM cuT 55.40 5540
1| TAILGATE WIPER ASSY cuT 166.90 166.90
1| TAILGATE WIPER MOTOR DAMAGED 325.00 325.00
2|TAIL GATE DAMPER @$159.00 NOT NECESSARY 318.00 .
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 555 30 555.30
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @$64.50 NECESSARY 129.00 64.00
1|REAR BUMPER TOWING COVER DEFORMED 52.30 52.30
2|REAR NUMBER PLATE LAMP @$62.80 NOT NECESSARY 12560 :
2| TAIL LAMP @$266.50 N/S SMASHED / O/S 533.00 533.00
CRACKED
2|TAIL LAMP BRACKET @$48.00 NOT NECESSARY 96.00 .
2|TAIL LAMP PANEL @$155.60 N/S DENTED 311.20 155 60
1|3RD BRAKE LIGHT CRACKED 245.00 245.00
2|REAR FENDER @$668.20 N/S BUCKLED 1,375.40 688.20
2|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM @$290.20 CRACKED 580.40 580.40
1|REAR END PANEL DISTORTED 355.90 355.90
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH DEFORMED 94.20 9420
1|REAR FLODOR PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 799.80
LABOUR

Report Ref No. CS/EGI19000958/Avd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6258 3581 FAX: B2RE 4315

Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Fage No.:Z2 of 3
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | =% mmp?}'ﬂ ﬁl}
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TOP BOARD DEFORMED 265.00 265.00
1|REAR EXHAUST PIPE NOT NECESSARY 511.20 -
2|REAR EXHAUST INSULATOR @$58.00 NOT NECESSARY 116.00 -
2|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING @3534.50 NOT NECESSARY 69,00 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,923.70 -1,304.78
7,694 80 5,219.12
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1|SET TAILGATE CENTER GARMNISH CLIP (SN} NECESSARY 20.00 20.00
1|SET TAIL GATE INNER TRIM CLIP (SN} NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|TAIL GATE WINDSCREEMN SEALANT (SN) MNECESSARY 80.00 30.00
1|TAIL GATE WINDSCREEN INNER SEAL (SN) NECESSARY &0.00 30.00
1| TAIL GATE WINDSCREEN GLASS SOLAR FILM (SN) NECESSARY 350.00 200.00
1|REAR BUMPER CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 22.00 22.00
1|SET TAIL LAMP CLIP {SN} HECESSARY 20.00 20.00
1|SET REAR FENDER INNER TRIM CLIPS (SN} MNECESSARY 20.00 20.00
1|SET REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 20.00 10.00
1|REAR END PANEL INSULATION SEAL (SN) NECESSARY 120.00 G0.00
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL INSULATION SEAL (SN) NOT NECESSARY 250.00 -
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL MAT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 550.00 -
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL MAT COVER (SN} NOT NECESSARY 450.00 -
1[IRCAD CAMERA (SN} DAMAGED 550.00 450.00
1|REVERSE CAMERA [SN) DAMAGED 400.00 350.00
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN} DAMAGED 220.00 200.00
3,212.00 1.442.00
LABOUR
PAMEL BEATING REMOWVING AND REPLACING 2,000.00 1,400.00
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR FLOOR
PAMNEL.
SPRAY PAINTIMNG TO AFFECTED AREA. 2,000.00 1.400.00
TRANSFER TAILGATE MECHANISM., 80.00 80.00
REMOVE AND REFIX TAILGATE WINDSCREEM. 120.00 120.00

Report Ref No. CS/EGI19000958/Avd3n2
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Qty Description of Parts Condition WE::T;;?;H UL n{gj,ustad
REMOWVE AND REFIX REVERSE SENSOR AND DISTANCE 150.00 50.00
SETTING.
REMOVE AND REFIX REVERSE CAMERA AND DISTANCE 150.00 50.00
SETTING
REMOVE AND REFIX PHV, 20.00 50.00
REMOVE AND REFIX REAR EXHAUST FIPE. NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -

4,730.00 3,150.00

GRAND TOTAL 15,636.80 9,611.12
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 6,500.00
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

ADRIAN LING WA| PING

B.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

Report Ref No. CS/EGI19000958/Avd3n2

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made scbsly for the use and banefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




