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a4/2019 Merimen e-Claims

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

cum SUBFOLDER TRACKING - i R _
a5t Notified Est Submitted | Adj Assigned ]a _|'.'~' __|Ad) Submitted __ | ins Auth'ed Status
14 Mar 2018 | |Panding for Survey
Main | {(Wot Notified) | 09:04 | | | Report

I 14 | | | Carct e |

Documents

Reference

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS e I[l:raatad by insurer] i
| ,Insun!d | == 3 - - |
Main |SONG YEW JIN, 1D: S1804323H

| =

Clalmant

: ::ehicle Reg. |5|_35543D Date of Loss: | 10/01/2019 15:00 - :59
| - - Policy/Cover | o
i ..Clalm T'rpe _TP - NoteMo,: | - |
Vehicle Reg. |
No. GY8735X ‘Eg:'f:nf::ﬁ_ 5101101129 |
| (nsured): | e o 24l 1IN [ =

| |Exeess: _|_$DDD -

.Rﬁl:lalrer ~Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd (HQ) Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1, #01-406, 408701 Ub - Tel: 67431913 - -

;":;L"‘_g’:ﬂ China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6389 6111 ... [Handled by' Cheng Boon 5-.-.]

Claimant's | uryc Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:

|
FANBAIEEIRS fmrint o s S o e e e R R e P ey

_ | Agjuster: iucx Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by ADRIAN LING] ... [Final Rpt due 25/03/2019]
'ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View All | Compose Case Mail |

i | There are na mail for this case,

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™= view All | Search Tasks | Create tew Task | Complete |
Due Date Priarity Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done

No results,
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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

# —————
From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 14 March 2019 9:06 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc SUR

Subject: RE: New Third Party Claim - SLZ5948D / GY8735X on 10/01/2019
Dear Veron,

Done.

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen

Claims Executive

Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079908

Co, Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 63898171

Fax: 62247175

Email. boonsen.chong@sg cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

CDisclaimer :

This message is confidentiol; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping insuronce {Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided for
in o written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singopore) Pte. Ltd, Any unguthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in
whole or partial, is prohibited. if you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 13 March, 2019 5:27 PM

To: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: New Third Party Claim - SLZ5948D / GY8735X on 10/01/2019

Dear Boon Sen,

Kindly create claim in merimen.
Workshop Details:

JOO HAK KEE AUTO PTE LTD
BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-406

KAMPONG UBI INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
SINGAPORE 408701

Best Regards,



Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 14 January 2015 2:31 PM

To: 'Elaine Cheong' <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>; assignments <assi nts@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: New Third Party Claim - SLZ5948D / GYB735X on 10/01/2019

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Elaine Cheong [mailto:elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Monday, 14 January 2019 1:09 PM

To: Grace Lim <grace@jhk.com.sg>; 'assignments’ <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: New Third Party Claim - SLZ5948D / GY8735X on 10/01/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Grace,

We refer to your email of 14.01.19,

We will be assigning M/s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to survey your client’s vehicle.
Aside to LKK,

Please refer to the attachment and proceed to survey the third party vehicle.

Thank you,

Regards,

Elaine Cheong
Executive (Motor Claims)
Claims Departrment



China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleal Tower

Singapaore 079909

Co. Reg. Mo, 200208384E

DID: 6389 6530

Fax: 6224 T478 / 6224 7175

Email: elaine.cheong(@sg.cntaiping.com

Website: www.saq.cntaiping.com

From: Grace Lim [mailto:grace@jhk.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 14 January, 20159 10:09 AM

To: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: Re: New Third Party Claim - SLZ5948D / GY8735X on 10/01/2019

Good Morming Elaine,

Hope your weekend was well!
Just a gentle reminder, kindly arrange for surveyor Adrian Ling.

Thanks!

Cheers,

Grace Lim

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd

3007 Ubi Road 1 #01-406 Singapore 408701

O 6743 1913 | F: 6743 5234 | E: grace(@jhk.com.sg

On Fri, Jan 11, 2019 at 10:42 PM Grace Lim <grace(@jhk.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Elaine,

Thanks for email.
Kindly arrange for surveyor Adrian Ling, thanks

Regards,
Grace

On 11 Jan 2019, at 6:21 PM, Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong(@sg.cntaiping.com=> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Grace,
We refer to your email of 11.01.19,

Our insured have yet to report the accident to us.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the following motor surveyors to conduct the
joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

ADRIAN LING

Kelvin Ang

SEE CHEW SENG

MOHD FADHILAH BIN OSMAN
XING QUO QIANG

KENMNETH KONG

SIMON HO

CHUA WEIIIE

MARCUS CHUA

HEMNRY NG

Please let us know within two(2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these
motor surveyors as a single joint expert,

You may select one of the listed motor surveyors and we will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey
carried out by the single joint expert.

Regards,

Elaine Cheong
Executive (Motar Claims)

Claims Departrment

China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6530

Fax: 6224 747876224 7175

Email. elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com



Website: www. sg.cntaiping.com

<image001.png>

From: Grace Lim [mailto:grace@jhk.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 11 January, 2019 5:23 PM

To: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: Fwd: New Third Party Claim - SLZ5948D / GY8735X on 10/01/2019

Dear Elaine,

Nice speaking with you.

Kindly please arrange pre-repair survey for the above and if possible would like to do direct
settlement. Vehicle will be in on Monday (14/01/2019)

Please provide us your list of surveyors for our selection.

Attached are the accident report for your reference and we're currently in the midst of preparing
the estimate.

Cheers,
Grace Lim

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pie Lid
3007 Ubi Road 1 #01-406 Singapore 408701

0: 6743 1913 | F: 6743 5234 | E: gracei@jhk com.sg

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Grace Lim <grace@jhk.com.sg>

Date: Fri, Jan 11, 2019 at 5:03 PM

Subject: Re: New Third Party Claim - SLZ5948D / GY8735X on 10/01/2019

To: <claimsdept(@sg.cntaiping.com>




Dear Sir/Mdm,

Sending a second reminder for the list of surveyor.

Vehicle will be in Monday morning, thanks

Cheers,
Grace Lim

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Lid

3007 Ubi Road 1 #01-406 Singapore 408701

0: 6743 1913 | F: 6743 5234 | E: grace(@jhk.com.sg

On Fri, Jan 11, 2019 at 10:23 AM Grace Lim <grace(@jhk.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Kindly please arrange pre-repair survey for the above and if possible would like to do direct
settlement. Vehicle will be in on Monday (14/01/2019)

Please provide us your list of surveyors for our selection.

Attached are the accident report for your reference and we're currently in the midst of
preparing the estimate.

Thank you.
Cheers,

Grace Lim



Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd

3007 Ubi Road 1 #01-406 Singapore 408701

0: 6743 1913 | F: 6743 5234 | E: grace@jhk.com.sg

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

] This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
www.avg.com




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Elaine Cheong <elaine cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 14 January 2019 109 PM

To: Grace Lim; ‘assignments’

Subject: RE: New Third Party Claim - SLZ5948D / GY8735X on 10/01/2019
Attachments: TP SAS REPORT - 5LZ5948D pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Grace,

We refer to your email of 14.01.19,

We will be assigning M/s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to survey your client’s vehicle,
Aside to LKK,

Please refer to the attachment and proceed to survey the third party vehicle.

Thank you.

Regards,

Elaine Cheong
Executive (Motar Claims)
Claims Departrment

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6388 8530

Fax: 6224 7478 /8224 7175

Email: elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

ANNIVERSARY
Iu Simpapore since 1938

From: Grace Lim [mailto:grace@jhk.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 14 January, 2019 10:09 AM

To: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com=

Subject: Re: New Third Party Claim - 5LZ5948D / GY8735X on 10/01/2019

Good Morning Elaine,



Hope yvour weekend was well! .
Just a gentle reminder, kindly arrange for surveyor Adrian Ling.

Thanks!

Cheers,

Grace Lim

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd

3007 Ubi Road 1 #01-406 Singapore 408701

O: 6743 1913 | F: 6743 5234 | E: gracef@@jhk.com.sy

On Fri, Jan 11, 2019 at 10:42 PM Grace Lim <grace(@jhk.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Elaine,

Thanks for email.
Kindly arrange for surveyor Adrian Ling, thanks

Regards,
(Grace

On 11 Jan 2019, at 6:21 PM, Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong(@sg.cntaiping.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Grace,
We refer to your email of 11.01.19,
Our insured have yet to report the accident to us.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the following motor surveyors to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert,

ADRIAN LING

Kelvin Ang

SEE CHEW SENG

MOHD FADHILAH BIN OSMAN
XING QUO QIANG

KENNETH KONG

SIMON HO

CHUA WEIJIE

MARCUS CHUA

HENRY NG

Please let us know within two(2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of
these motor surveyors as a single joint expert.

You may select one of the listed motor surveyors and we will bear the cost of the pre-repair
survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Regards,



Elaine Cheong

Executive (Motor Claims)

Claims Departrment

China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 8338 6530

Fax 6224 7478 /6224 7175

Email: elaine.cheongi@sag.cntaiping.com

Website: www.sq.cntaiping.com

<image001.png>
From: Grace Lim [mailto:grace@jhk.com.s

Sent: Friday, 11 January, 2019 5:23 PM

To: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: Fwd: New Third Party Claim - SLZ5948D / GY8735X on 10/01/2019

Dear Elaine,

Nice speaking with you.

Kindly please arrange pre-repair survey for the above and if possible would like to do direct
settlement. Vehicle will be in on Monday (14/01/2019)

Please provide us your list of surveyors for our selection.

Attached are the accident report for your reference and we're currently in the midst of
preparing the estimate.

Cheers,



Grace Lim
Joo Hak Kee Auto Pre Lid
3007 Ubi Road 1 #01-406 Singapore 408701

0: 6743 1913 | F: 6743 5234 | E: gracef@jhk com.sg

-------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Grace Lim <grace(ajhk.com.sg>
Date; Fri, Jan 11, 2019 at 5:03 PM

Subject: Re: New Third Party Claim - SLZ5948D / GY8735X on 10/01/2019
To: <claimsdept(@sg.cntaiping.com>

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Sending a second reminder for the list of surveyor.

Vehicle will be in Monday morning, thanks

Cheers,

Grace Lim

Joo Hak kee Auto Pte Lid

3007 Ubi Road 1 #01-406 Singapore 408701

O: 6743 1913 | F: 6743 5234 | E: grace@jhk.com.sg

On Fri, Jan 11, 2019 at 10:23 AM Grace Lim <grace(@jhk.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Kindly please arrange pre-repair survey for the above and if possible would like to do
direct settlement. Vehicle will be in on Monday (14/01/2019)

Please provide us your list of surveyors for our selection.



Attached are the accident report for your reference and we're currently in the midst of
preparing the estimate.

Thank you.

Cheers,

Grace Lim

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pre Ltd

3007 Ubi Road 1 #01-406 Singapore 408701

0; 6743 1913 | F: 6743 5234 | E: gracef@jhk.com.sg

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.syvmanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com
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Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles ‘Forum Resources

» Local Loh Kean Yew Stuns Lin Dan in Badminton Finais
s W212 owners, please check-in
s fth Gen Toyota Camiry (XV70)

Mercedes S63L AMG.

Post an Advertisemant i Autolinn
Sell it yourseil! Advertise L at just r . 5 5. Tip To An. Paipiradiss. Far far Bagert

$58 until it's SOLD! e - st Like oW ahlde dick here to view

our PRISTINE USED CARS

GET YOUR
COE
RENEWAL
LOAN

at GREAT PRICES

‘toyota altis Ariy Aoy 2010 Ay Ay Ay Availabbe
D Tayota Corolla Altis 1.64 $16,800 $9,900 fyr 14-Jan-2010 1,598 ¢ 130,000 km Sadan Available
Lowest Price In Market, 1 Owner, Good Condition To Renew COE After 10 Years, Nice Interior, 100% Accident Free, No Repair Needed, Wiaw Or Test

Drive To Belave, e
[[] Toyota Coralla Altis 1.64 $20,588 £10,330 fyr 02-Mar-2010 1,598 ¢ 73,000 kam Sedan Availabibe

Excebent Condition, Market Most Well Known Sedan, Relisble, Powerful Yet Fuel Economical, Low Maintenance. Servicing Records Available Fram
Auobacs, Flexiphe Loan Options Availablel Call Ls Now To Fu.

' . ¥ tm Corolln, 2070 bovols corcin, Toyetn Coralia; toyotn oo Toots, Conlia, corclia, Uiod
[[] Toyeta Corolla Altis 1.6A £12,988 $11,050 fyr 12-May-2010 1,598 oo 142,000 km Sedan Available
Well Maintained With Zaro Mishap, Great Fuel Corsumption, Easy Maintenance & Mast Importantty Reliable, Most Popular Family Secan. Call Dur Sales —
Persan Mow To Arrange For An Appointment For Viewing, .., Lo L
[:l Toyota Corolla Altis 1.6A $16,800 $10,360 fyr 26-0ct-2010 1,558 cc 92,000 km Sedan Avallabla

1 Qwnir! Very Low Mileage! Most Reliable and Economical Sedan! Great Condition! View To Believe! No Gimmicks! Trade In Welcome! Call Us Far An
Appaintmeant Mowl

Is your COE expiring? Let us help you renew it!

Getting your COE renewed is easy, fast and affordable, We'll help you renew your COE and get a loan for It. Get the cheapest loan in town and an
approval in 2 days without effoet! Enguire today,

D Toyota Corolla Altis 1.6A $43,800 $19,470 fyr 12-Mov-2010 1,598 cc 58,000 km Sedan Available

Don't Missed The Oppartunity, Fane Unit In Market, Dual WT- Engine, Act Fasti Supert Low Mileage 28k Km Only [Proof Of Pictures As Showed),
[nkisrior As Can Tell Rarely Drove, New Paint Werk Dane, No...

l'_—l Toyota Corolla Altis 1.6A $26,800 $10,000 fyr 23-Mov-2010 1,598 cc 125,371 km Sedan Availsble

{100% Quality Buy!) Drive With Confidence. Purchase Comes With & Manths Engine And Gearbowx Protection Plan With 24/7 Roadside Assistance,
STANICOM/AA Evaluation Friendly. Bank And In-House Loan Suppo...

Sincere Matoring Pre Lid

e

Savve this search critesia, to got cmail alerts whensver @ match ts found, [l s TR

DA TLISTED HEATERY

view Expired ads 20 ¥ | resunts/page



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

» Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

WVehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner D

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Wehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Cutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date;

COE Category:

COE Period(Years);

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 14 Jan 20179

https://vel.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDereglnput ZFUNCTION_ID=F030...

OK

Singapore MRIC
4323H

SLZ5948D

Mo

14 Jan 2019

TOYOTA
COROLLAALTIS 1.6 AUTO
Silver

2010

34998294
MROS3ZEE1D6175312
B0.OkW (107 bhpl
$16,716.00

12 May 2010

12 May 2010

1

$14,7146.00

Yes
11 May 2020
$9.193.00

11 May 2020

A - Car (1600cc & below)
10

£26,102.00

§£3,455.00

§12,648.00

Page 1 of |

14-Jan-19



JOO HAK KEE AUTO PTE LTD

VAL ERABR 2 )
SINCE 1986
TP b REPAIR ESTIMATE
X
’ Est. No. . E19010005
ATTN: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT Vecoa Date - 14/01/2019
OWNER: SONG YEW JIN Vehicle Num, :SLZ5948D
IE:DSUHER: NTU% 1II:C0ME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LTD Make/Model  : Tayota ,Corolla
REEE':RYEZEE_S%P C&}:ﬁzg Chassis/Eng# : MROS3ZEE106175312
DOA: 10/01/2019 ¥r. of Manu : 2010
No Description Qty u/P Amt
Section; LIST ITEMS
- ,5\ -
1 FRONT BUMPER - A5lavi—C 1.00 517.40 517.40~"
2 FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER A 2.00 56.60 113.20 =
3 FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT TB@J’ 25& & 1.00 329.10 326.10 &7
4 RH FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP COVER /¢ 1ot4:10 1.00 66.10 66.10 ¥
S  RHHEADLAMP  [urf” 1.00 399,10 399,10
6 RHFRONT FENDER wdme—=t. /At Ain 1.00 434.10 434,10 ¥
7 RH FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD /A€ s 1.00 124.10 124.10°°
Amt 5% 1,983.10
Discount (25.00%) 5% 495,77
520 Subtotal 55 1,487.33
Section: LABOUR
8 TO PANEL BEAT AND RENEWAL OF ALL DAMAGED PARTS 1.00 800.00 Eggﬂﬂ""' Su
9  TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING ON ACCIDENT DAMAGED PROTION 1.00 700.00 700007 £ 523
10 TO REALIGN HEADLAMP 1.00 50.00 50.00° 2.0
Amt 5% 1,550.00

50l 1559 to

“ -t Surveyed hy/Company,

+ parry GDMGL Number
= P dliegal myare i - -
= Sunplemantas T feaAr N

+ ckiansed Automirtivs Sy Sag <7 Ny

e :
Joo Hé@éa Auto Pte, Ltd,

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-408, SINGAPORE 408701

TEL: 6743 1913 FAX: 6743 5234

Discount (0.00%) S5 0.00
Subtotal 55 1,550.00

12590

o} Da/sa Adns. (-~

!
HS ”"/DI |]|‘*?.

03 ph},},

LIST ITEMS Subtotal 5% 1,487.33
LABOUR Subtotal 5% 1,550.00
Total 5% 3,037.33

CO/GST REG NO: 201300082W

BLK 3014 UBI ROAD 1 #01-324, SINGAPORE 408702 EMAIL: admin@jhk.com.sg WEBSITE: www.jhk.com.sg
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreano:1sss071ser)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833

Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@|kkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CS/CTI18000934/AVD3N2

Date: 165/03/2019
REFERENCE
Handling ; N i ;
i China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Ltd. Policy No:
Claimant "
Vehicle No : SLZ5948D Insured Vehicle No :  GYB735X
Date of Loss:  10/01/2019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: N/A
D PTI NTI
Reg No: SLZ5948D
Make & Model: TOYOTA COROLLA, 1.5 (A) Engine No: 3774998296
Reg. Date: 12/05/2010 (Man. Year: 2010} Chassis No: MRO53ZEE106175312
Colour: Silver Odometer: 214285 km
Engine Capacity: 1598 cc
Market Value/Mew Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
c M F
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195/65R15 Rear Tyre Size: 195/65R15
Front Left Side: Toyo & mm Rear Left Side: Toyo & mm
Front Right Side: Toyo 6 mm Rear Right Side: Toyo 6 mm
The above values represant the remaining tyre lreads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 1,487.32 1,019.10 468.22 31.48
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,550.00 580.00 970.00 62.58
Faintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S$) 3,037.32 1,599.10 1,438.22 47.35
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 1,250.00
(S5) 3,037.32 1,250.00 1,787.32 58.85
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 21281 87.50 125.11 58.84
Nett Amount (5$) 3,249.93 1,337.50 1,912.43 58.85
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 14/03/2019
Date Inspected: 14/01/2019 Inspected At: Joo Hak Kee Auto Ple Lid (HQ)
Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1, #01-406
Singapore 408701
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days

Adjuster: ADRIAN LING

Manager: VERON CHEN

NOTE: This report represents our findings af the time and place of inspection stated herein, Such ingpection has been carried ouf to the basf of our
krawiedge and abilly but any other lability under any other circumslances /s hereby expressly excluded.
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REPAIR DETAILS B | | i
Reference |
\Part Source: MRM-5G wersion: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 15 Mar 2019) _
|Parts: 143 TOYOTA COROLLA 1.5 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0) :
Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List} |

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLZ5948D)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page |
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page ‘

Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk ™.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Distorted 517.40FL *517.40FL
2 2 *FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER Mecessary 113.20FL *113.20FL
3 1 *FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Bent 329.10FL *329.10FL
4 1 *RH FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP COVER Mot Necessary 68.10FL *-FL
4] 1 *RH HEADLAMP Cut 390.10FL *385.10FL
5] 1 *RH FRONT FENDER Mot Necessary 434 10FL *FL
7 1 *RH FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD Mot Mecessary 124 10FL *FL
F=Franchisa parl L=ListlemDisc —_

Sub Total (S§)  1,983.10  1,358.80
- List Item Discount on L Items 25.00/25.00% (S%) 49578 338.70

Total Parts (S§)  1,487.32 1,019.10

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https:Hsingapurc.merimen.comf::iaimsﬁndex_cim‘?fuseanMTRadjuster&fuseaction=g,.. 15/3/2019
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Mo Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour Items

1 'FI;D PANEL BEAT AND RENEWAL OF ALL DAMAGED Mew 800.00 300.00
ARTS

2 TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING ON ACCIDENT DAMAGED  Mew 700.00 250.00

PORTION
3 TO REALIGN HEADLAMP Mew 50.00 30.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 1,550.00 580.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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