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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 January 2019 9:09 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC7705T AND SKT189D ON 09/01/2019 ARRANGE 

SURVEY 

Attachments: TP ESTIMATE- MARKED.PDF; Preliminary_Advice.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

We have inspected TP vehicle SHC 7705T at M/s Ding Automotive Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed 

for a direct settlement. 

 

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action. 

 

Enclosed for your perusal is:  

-          Estimated cost of repair 

-          Preliminary advice 

Our case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051. 

Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) [mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 15 January, 2019 8:52 AM 

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC7705T AND SKT189D ON 09/01/2019 ARRANGE SURVEY  

 
Dear Gerald, 

 

Thank you for your assignment. 

 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 15 January 2019 8:34 AM 

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC7705T AND SKT189D ON 09/01/2019 ARRANGE SURVEY  

 
 
 

Our Ref        : 18/19/19/VP05/021315 
 
Dear Catherine/Nivitha 

 
Kindly proceed to survey accordingly.  

 
 
Best Regards 

Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 

From: taxiscs@stengg.com [mailto:taxiscs@stengg.com]  

Sent: Monday, 14 January, 2019 6:21 PM 
To: CHEW BENG KEE; MT_Claim_SG 

Cc: ACCOUNTS@DINGAUTO.SG; ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG; carlor.chan@dingauto.sg; Dd hashim 

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC7705T AND SKT189D ON 09/01/2019 ARRANGE SURVEY  

 
Dear Officer ,  
 
Please arrange surveyor come onto Survey SHC7705T ASAP  
 
The vehicle SHC7705T already in 31 Corporation Road 649825 . 
 
 
 
 
Thanks  
 
Best Regards  
 
Ding Automotive Pte Ltd  
JING FENG 
Hp  : 62657130  
 
NOTE !!! 
All mailed letter & cheque payment is to be mailed to our main office address : 
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BLOCK 10 #01-20 
SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST. SEC C 
SINGAPORE 575645 

 
[This e-mail is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete it and notify us 
immediately; you should not copy or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Thank you] 


