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Consultants

.;u.é’; ;; ?;E\ Pte Ltd Company Registration No. 199607198R

51 UBLAVE 1, #02-23 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 625633561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your ref: D19000383MFSH

Our ref: CS/FCI19000881/Ivd3 Date:16/1/2019

The Motor Claims Department

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SLH 5478M

We thank for your instruction on 14/1/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle

on_15/1/2019 at the premises of M/s

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
"Check" Items Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the

rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ONG HWEE JIE

Automotive Assessor

WORLD AUTO PTE LTD

: 5$13,302.80

: 5$8,103.60

: §$675.20

. S$

: S$

- S§

front




H H MS First Capital Insurance Limited co.Reg No. 195000106C GST Reg No. M2-0001676-9
Ms 6 FI rStca pltal 6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580

Tel: (65) 6222 2311 Fax: (65) 6222 3547

Claims & Motor Underwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877
Tel: (65} 6507 3848 Fax: {65) 6507 3849
www.mstirstcapital.com.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 11-01-2019 Our Ref No. D19000383MFSH

Accident Date 10-01-2019 Claim Type. Third Party

Insured Vehicle SH6187M Third Party Vehicle. SLH5478M

Survey Location NO.1, KRANJI LOOP

Contact Person. AINEE

Contact No. 63621776/ 0 Fax No. 63631250

Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:
inted

ARpainis LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Surveyor

Contact Person NA Fax No. 68416315

Contact Number. NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop WORLD AUTO PTE LTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge JOANNEY

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

\“; i k ‘ \ '\

A Member o EIEGIA (NSURANCE GROUP




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January 2019 3:33 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: SUR; 'Joanne Yong Lai fong'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000383MFSH/1, SLH 5478M
Attachments: SLH 5478M PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLH 5478M
Date of survey: 15/1/2019
Number of days : 7 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January 2019 3:30 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000383MFSH/1

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@mesfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 14 January 2019 5:49 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Joanne Yong Lai fong
<Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19000383MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.



Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

s AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
. © WWWw.avg.com



Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

=
From: Hwee Jie (LKK Auto) <hweejie@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 7 February 2019 8:57 AM
To: tgttan@worldauto.com.sg
Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: SLH 5478 FINALIZATION
Hi Sophia,

Finalized P/P repair $7256.40/- with 7days.

Best Regards,
Hwee Jie| Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 9180 3151 | Email: Hweejie@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: tgttan@worldauto.com.sg [mailto:tgttan@worldauto.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 1 February, 2019 4:51 PM

To: Hwee Jie (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: SLH 5478 FINALIZATION

Hi Hwee lJie
Finalised COR $7256.40 and 7 repair days.

Rdgs
Sophia

From: Hwee Jie (LKK Auto) <hweejie@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 23 January 2019 12:15 PM

To: tgttan@worldauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: SLH 5478 FINALIZATION

Hi Sophia,

Please let me know once i can finalize with you, thank you.

Best Regards,
Hwee Jie| Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 9180 3151 | Email: Hweejie@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: tgttan@worldauto.com.sg [mailto:tgttan@worldauto.com.sqg]
Sent: Wednesday, 23 January, 2019 12:18 PM




To: Hwee Jie (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: SLH 5478 FINALIZATION

Hi Hwee Jie
Cannot finalise at this point of time as the said car is still under repairs.
Kindly hold.

Rdgs
Sophia

From: Hwee Jie (LKK Auto) <hweejie@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 23 January 2019 11:44 AM

To: tgttan@worldauto.com.sg

Subject: SLH 5478 FINALIZATION

Hi Sophia,

Finalized amount is P/P repair $7256.40/- with 7days. Please let me know if you're agree with this amount so | can
proceed with finalize, thank you.
Has spoken to kana about the adjusted price amount.

Best Regards,
Hwee Jie| Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 9180 3151 | Email: Hweejie@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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WORLD AUTO PTE LTD

47 Jalan Pemimpin #01-02/03

Halcyon 2, S'pore 577200

Tel No. : 6451 3933 Fax No. : 6455 7576

E-Mail : worldaut@singnet.com.sg

Website : www.worldauto.com.sg

Tax Reg. No. : 200006765-H Buss. Reg. No. : 200006765H

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSSURANCE LIMITED
6 RAFFLES QUAY,
#21-00 048580

Attention : Motor Claim Department
Contact : 6222 2311 Fax No. : 6222 3547

S/N  Quantity Particular

Estimate :

Date :

Vehicle Num. :
Make/Model :
Chassis/Eng# :
Accident Date :
Claim No. :
Reference :
Policy No. :

Page1/3

ES190016

12/01/2019
SLH 5478M (LCR)
HONDA VEZEL HYBRID

10/01/2019

Unit Price Amount S$

LIST ITEMS :
1. 1 REAR BOOT LID Buc
2. 1 REAR BOOT INNER TRIM BOARD  NW
3.1 REAR BOOT LOCK ASSY NN
4 1 REAR BOOT REFLECTOR LAMP LH &(£
5 1 REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING  NEL
6. 1 REAR BUMPER Buc
7. 1 REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR LENS -LH  5¢R
8. 1 REAR BOOT WEATHER STRIP Der
9. 1 REAR END PANEL 0o
10. 1 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH BT
1. 1 REAR SIDE BUMPER - LH PELF
12. 1 REARTAILLAMP-LH scg B
13. 1 REAR WHEEL ARCH MOULDING -LH D& T
14, 1 REAR BUMPER UNDERDUST COVER  ®UC
15. 1 REAR FENDER UNDERDUST COVER LH NN
16. 1 REAR FENDER INNER TRIM COVER LH NN
17. 1 REAR FLOOR PANEL Bue  Lopeis
18. 1 REAR COMPARTMENT BOX NN
19, 1 REAR ANTENNA SENSOR N
20. 1 SMART BUZZER SENSOR ~ ¢##
21. 2 REAR BUMPER RETAINER NI
22. 1 REAR FENDER AIR GRILLELH  DEF
23. 1 REAR WIPER COVER M ¢
24, 1 REAR BOOT HYBRID EMBLEM (VEZEL)  NEC(
25. 1 REAR BOOT VEZEL EMBLEM (VEZEL) NEC
26. 1 REAR WIPER ARM AL

List TotalS$ :

20.00% Discount S$ :

00 4:360:00 7
280.00
300.00

42 0586.66 7
150 260:00 —
Lo 966.60 7
180.00 /~
s 180:807
550 860.60
155 260.66 7
250.00 ~
580.00 -~
250.00 5
189.00
250.00%
280.00 X
800.00 X
280.00 %
180.00 X
180.00%
89.00 178.00 £ X
56.00¥% ~
85.00 7
89.00 7
89.00 7
90.00 %<
8,916.00
1,783.20

7,132.80

CONTINUE / ...



WORLD

AUTO PTE LTD

47 Jalan Pemimpin #01-02/03
Halcyon 2, S'pore 577200

Tel No. : 6451 39

33 Fax No.: 6455 7576

E-Mail : worldaut@singnet.com.sg
Website : www.worldauto.com.sg
Tax Reg. No. : 200006765-H Buss. Reg. No. : 200006765H

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSSURANCE LIMITED

6 RAFFLES QUAY,
#21-00 048580

Attention : Motor Claim Department

Date :

Vehicle Num.
Make/Model
Chassis/Eng# :

Page 2/3

Estimate : ES190016

12/01/2019
: SLH 5478M (LCR)
: HONDA VEZEL HYBRID

CHASSIS FRAME AND REPLACE RECOMMENDED PARTS.

PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINT REAR AFFECTED AREAS INCLUDING
(INNER/QUTER)

:I'O CHECK REAR WIRES, CONNECTORS, REPLACE DAMAGED LAMPS

Contact : 6222 2311 Fax No. : 6222 3547 Accident Date : 10/01/2019
Claim No. :
Reference :
Policy No. :
SIN Quantity  Particular Unit Price  Amount S$
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS :
1. 1 REAR BOOT INNER TRIM BOARD CLIP Net 30 46:60. 7
2. 1 REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT ME< 6o 10600/
5. REAR BUMPER CLIP MEL 304000 /
4. 1 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS L] 40.00-%
5 1 REAR TAILLAMP CLIPS 3> 4080 /
6. 1 REAR WHEEL ARCH MOULDING CLIPS NEC 3D 40:80 7
Ty 1 REAR BUMPER UNDERDUST COVER CLIP To 40:00 7
‘8. 1 REAR FENDER UNDERDUST COVER CLIPS ) 48-60 4
9. 1 REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS ™M™ 40.00 %
10. 1 REVERSE SENSOR §harte§ 200 28068 /7
Special Nett Total S$ : 700.00
LABOUR :
TRANSFER REAR BOOTLID MECHANISM AND ACCESSORIES ¢o J}B‘Uﬁ
TO APPLY RUSTPROOFING/ TUFFCOATING TREATMENT TO (o 18070
REPLACED PARTS.
REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS (Zo 186700
:I'O DISMANTLE REAR DAMAGE PARTS, CUT AND WELD REAR ( O'Drb L ;,aaﬁﬁo
PANEL, KNOCK, STRAIGHTEN AND RESHAPE O/S REAR s

459 MW

gom

CONTINUE / ...
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WORLD AUTO PTE LTD

47 Jalan Pemimpin #01-02/03

Halcyon 2, S'pore 577200

Tel No. : 6451 3933 Fax No. : 64557576

E-Mail : worldaut@singnet.com.sg

Website : www.worldauto.com.sg

Tax Reg. No. : 200006765-H Buss. Reg. No. : 200006765H

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSSURANCE LIMITED Estimate : ES190016
6 RAFFLES QUAY,
#21-00 048580 Date : 12/01/2019

Vehicle Num. : SLH 5478M (LCR)
Make/Model : HONDA VEZEL HYBRID

Attention : Motor Claim Department Chassis/Eng# :

Contact : 6222 2311 Fax No.: 6222 3547 Accident Date : 10/01/2019
Claim No. :
Reference :
Policy No. :
SIN Quantity  Particular Unit Price  Amount S$

REVERSE SENSORS AND START/STOP UNIT CAPACITORS

DEACTIVATE HV BATTERY SYSTEM IN ORDER TO FACILITATE 00 450@
REPAIRS AND REACTIVATE BACK SAME.
(HV HYBRID SYSTEM SAFETY PROCEDURES)

i’ERFORM WHOLE VEHICLE DIAGNOSTICS INCLUDING CLEARING (20 4}9?07]
FAULT CODES AND REINTIALISING HV HYBRID SYSTEM FOR POST
REPAIRS. (HV HYBRID SYSTEM SAFETY PROCEDURES)

TO REMOVE AND REFIT FUEL TANK TO FACILITATE THE PANEL g9 21‘5»6.(')/0
BEATER TO REPLACE AND CUT OUT DAMAGED PANELS.

Labour Total S$ : 5,470.00

L (-§
E.& QE. Total S$ ; 13,302.80 o'

for WORLDAUTOFTE LB LKK Auo Consultants hence notify ku .
ihe Reparer of the following:

. = resurvey beforelafter spray painting
. = disolay damaged part(s) during resurvey RS I . f 19
« Parts prices are subiecﬂooonﬁma\im

party survey is on a “Without Postidics’ base P { P 1 ’(a'j b}

s modification(s) is aflowed
e pf ntary item(s) must be resurveyed and ‘
< 5.bject to final approval from Insurance Company

ckn-wiedqed by Repairer . py
gig".’r!j:: FL.!‘F“ l}‘l 2 fb‘)h_d“!

Date: e




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
TEL:

Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref :  CS/FCI19000881/Jvd3n2
i?el?&scl:r\lJng ErzllgL?SAEDSINGAPORE 068877 e THReeI ” ”ll””"”"l”l”l “l‘l
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SH 6187M Veh. Inspected SLH 5478M
Policy No. Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. D19000383MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JOANNE YONG Assign Date 14/01/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA VEZEL c.C 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. RU31215848 Colour SILVER
Odometer 115487 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOGD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 GITI 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 GITI 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre [215/60 R16 GITI 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 GITI 6 mm
4, Description of Damages '
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5 General Information
Accident Date  10/01/2019 Inspection Date 15/01/2019
Survey held at WORLD AUTO PTE LTD
47 JALAN PEMIMPIN
#01-02/03 HALCYON 2 BLDG
SINGAPORE 577200
5a, Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

7 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLH 5478M
i cic Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |\ hop (g)) ($J)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BOOT LID BUCKLED 1,300.00 1,100.00
1|REAR BOOT INNER TRIM BOARD NOT NECESSARY 280.00 .
1|REAR BOOT LOCK ASSY NOT NECESSARY 300.00 -
1|REAR BOOT REFLECTOR LAMP LH SCRATCHED 580.00 420.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING NECESSARY 250.00 150.00
1|REAR BUMPER BUCKLED 900.00 760.00
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECOR LENS-LH SCRATCHED 180.00 180.00
1|REAR BOOT WEATHERSTRIP DEFORMED 180.00 150.00
1|REAR END PANEL DENTED 860.00 550.00
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH BENT 260.00 155.00
1|REAR SIDE BUMPER-LH DEFORMED 250.00 250.00
1|REAR TAIL LAMP-LH SCRATCHED 580.00 580.00
1|REAR WHEEL ARCH MOULDING-LH DEFORMED 250.00 250.00
1|REAR BUMPER UNDERDUST COVER BUCKLED 189.00 189.00
1|REAR FENDER UNDERDUST COVER LH NOT NECESSARY 250.00 -
1|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM COVER LH NOT NECESSARY 280.00 -
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 800.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR COMPARTMENT BOX NOT NECESSARY 280.00 -
1|REAR ANTENNA SENSOR NOT NECESSARY 180.00 5
1|SMART BUZZER SENSOR CRACKED 180.00 180.00
2|REAR BUMPER RETAINER @$89.00 NOT NECESSARY 178.00 :
1|REAR FENDER AIR GRILLE LH DEFORMED 56.00 56.00
1|REAR WIPER COVER MISSING 85.00 85.00
1|REAR BOOT HYBRID EMBLEM (VEZEL) NECESSARY 89.00 89.00
1|REAR BOOT VEZEL EMBLEM (VEZEL) NECESSARY 89.00 89.00
1|REAR WIPER ARM NOT NECESSARY 90.00 !
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,783.20 -1,046.60
7,132.80 4.186.40
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BOOT INNER TRIM BOARD CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 40.00 30.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI119000881/Jvd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Al BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 3
g e Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Q Description of Parts Condition
ty P Workshop ($)) (8)
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 60.00
1|REAR BUMPER CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 40.00 30.00
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 40.00
1|REAR TAILLAMP CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 40.00 30.00
1|REAR WHEEL ARCH MOULDING CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 40.00 30.00
1|REAR BUMPER UNDERDUST COVER CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 40.00 30.00
1|REAR FENDER UNDERDUST COVER CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 40.00 30.00
1|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 40.00 -
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SHORTED 280.00 200.00
700.00 440.00
LABOUR
TRANSFER REAR BOOTLID MECHANISM AND 180.00 50.00
ACCESSORIES.
TO APPLY RUSTPROOFING/TUFFCOATING TREATMENT 180.00 60.00
TO REPLACED PARTS.
REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS. 180.00 120.00
TO DISMANTLE REAR DAMAGE PARTS,CUT AND WELD 2,000.00 1,000.00
REAR PANEL,KNOCK,STRAIGHTEN ABD RESHAPE O/S
REAR CHASSIS FRAME AND REPLACE RECOMMENDED
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR FLOOR
PANEL.
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINT REAR AFFECTED AREAS 1,500.00 950.00
INCLUDING (INNER/CUTER).
TO CHECK REAR WIRES ,CONNECTORS,REPLACE 180.00 50.00
DAMAGED LAMPS,REVERSE SENSORS AND
START/STOP UNIT CAPACITORS .
DEACTIVATE HV BATTERY SYSTEM IN ORDER TO 450.00 200.00
FACILITATE REPAIRS AND REACTIVATE BACK SAME.(HV
HYBRID SAFETY PROCEDURES).
PERFORM WHOLE VEHICLE DIAGNOSTICS INCLUDING 450.00 120.00
CLEARING FAULT CODES AND REINTIALISING HV
HYBRID SYSTEM FOR POST REPAIRS (HV HYBRID
SYSTEM SAFETY PROCEDURES).
TO REMOVE AND REFIT FUEL TANK TO FACILITATE THE 250.00 80.00
PANEL BEATER TO REPLACE AND CUT OUT DAMAGED
PANELS.
5,370.00 2,630.00
GRAND TOTAL 13,202.80 7,256.40

Report Ref No. CS/FC119000881/Jvd3n2
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Automotive Assessor

B.Eng,AMSOE, AMIRTE,AMSAE-A,M.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser
DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.
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