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Enguire PARF/COFE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner {0 Type: Singapore NRIC

Owner [D: 4726E

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo.: SLX1324R

“ehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 03 Dec2018

Wehicle Make: MITSUBISHI

Wehicle Madel: ASX 20CVT(G) ABSD/AIRBAG SR
HID 2WD

Primary Colour: White

Manufacturing Year: 2010

Engine No.: 4311GG1477

Chassis Mo.: IMYXTGAZWBZO00138

Maximum Power Output: 110.0 kW {147 bhp)

Open Market Value: $25,104.00

Original Reglstration Date: 31 Mar 2011

First Reglstration Date: 31 Mar 2011

Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid; $25,104.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

FARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eiigibility Expiry Date: 30 Mar 2021

PARF Rebate Amouni: $15,062.00

Intended CQE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 30Mar 2021

COE Categary: B - Car (1601cc & above)

COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $57,002.00

COE Rebate Amount: $13,239.00

Total Rebate Amount: $28,301.00

The information contzined herain is correct as at 03 Dec 2018
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Hesgurces Toyota Corolla Altis 1.6A (COE till 01/2022)
r 4
Car Buying Overview Financial Accessories Similar Research Photos Map
Car Seiling Add Acd 2 Mot Repork Zrror Shara
Car Ownership Car Details
Price 515,800
Car Aftermarket j
Depreciation $6,420 fyr e
0n The Move Reg Date 10-Jan-2007
(3yrs 29days CCE left)
Lifestyle
s Manufactured 2005 2]
: Car TWES" e Mileage 140,000 km (11.7k fyr)
Transmission Auto
Engine Cap 1,598 cc |
Road Tax $BIE fyr @
Power &1.0 kw (108 thp)
View specs of the Tovois Conl
Curb Weight  1115kg D
X Features Toyota 16V DOHC Vil Enging, Smocth Auto ECT

Transmission, Dual SRS Airbags, ABS, Digital Climate

Contral Aircon, Etc.
Selter Information

Accessories Al Criginal, Sperts Rims,Leather Seats, Toyota Audio 4
Systzm Come With Woofer, Retractzhiz Side Mirrgrs, Company
Solzr Film, Reverse Sensor, Steering Contral,
Description Cheapecl In Market, 2 Owners Till Date With High Paper
valve OF £16k, Can Loan Up To $18k Overall Condition | Aedress
Iz Well Maintained, Loan/Trade In Available, Call To
Serutinize. :
COE $25,323 § | Location
oMV $15,333 g  OfficeNo
ARF $12,001 © | | ContactPerson(s) lackson 84799635
b Vincent 97637337
Dereg Value 515,610 as of today (chang (23
No, of Owners 2 & Useful Services
Type of Veh Afraid of lemons? Requast to have
this car evaluated professipnally.
Category et detriiraam Vehicie Evaluation
Availabili Availabl 7
Rty ranabie i Find out the market value for your car,
P ¥ Gzt 2 free Car Valuation.
Adc Azd o Compare Adda 3 Mote -~ %g/ =
| 3 Free Valuation

Upiront Payment

Transfer Fee $25 0
Down Payment 55,940 (changs) Madmiur 7% Loan 0
1st Instalment 5428 @
Total Upfront Payment 6,393 {=xoiuding insurance) 9

Esiw 2, Chack with selier for

Items for Toyota Corolia » igw All

Compare



Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 December 2018 5:52 PM

To: 'KHONG Lynn'

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Check Market Value (MV) - S8M014JT/SLX1324R DOA :27.11.18
Dear Lynn,

The market value for SLX 1324R is $31K - $36K(est) as at Nov 2018

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: KHONG Lynn <lynn.khong@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 7 December 2018 1:37 PM

To: LKK Valuation <valuation@Ikkauto.com>; Account@a-pac.sg; nick@lbs-auto.com; motorsurvey@fta.com.sg;
frankie @fta.com.sg; elson@rta.com.sg; admin (admin@Ibs-auto.com) <admin@Ibs-auto.com>;
bernardong@ajaxinspection.com; patrick.soo®@a-pac.sg; rta@rta.com.sg

Cc: ANG Yvonne <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>; TEO Kitty <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg>

Subject: FW: Check Market Value (MV) - S8M014JT/SLX1324R DOA :27.11.18

Hi All,
Kindly assist on Market Value.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Lynn Khong
Specialist, Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Pie Ltd

8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811
Email: lynn.khong@axa.com.sg

Customer Care No. 1800 8804888

www.axa.com.sg
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