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QUAN DE MOTOR TRADING
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6, #01-67
AUTOBAY, SINGAPORE 417883

HP: 96709191 FAX: 66840767

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

8 Shenton Way

#24-01 AXA Tower

Singapore 068811

Attn: Motor Claims Department

Pate: B January 2019

Accident on 08/01/2019 involving vehicles $)V2984M, GBEB519T, SLW3877D

lin: Me. Morcnso (parveyr)

;}i7_

along PIE towards Tuas
te cost of r to vehicl 984M Proton Persona

1pc. bootlid /e S 580.00 —
1pc bootlld cuter handle £ U 5 116.00
2 pcs. bootlid hinges @5105.00 Py S 210.00 X
1 pe. bootlid inner lock Tl 8 108.00
1pc. bootlid weatherstrip T § 146,00~
1 pc. bootlid inner trim A5 166.00 x
1 set bootlid inner trim clips A S 3500~
1 pe. rear bumper ed S 550.00 .~
2 pcs. rear bumper reflectors @$38.00 e 5 76.00 ~—
1 pc, rear bumper reinforcement M 5 360.00
1 set rear bumper clips U 5 40.007"
2 pes. taillamps @5355.00 A+ g 710.00"
1 pc. rear end panel LodiD> § 480.00
1 pc. rear end panel top garnish cre § 180.00
1 pe. rear floor panel “’-Tﬂ T § 965.00 —
1pe. rear floor panel top board /P 210.00 —
2 pes. rear fender inner trims @$215.00 A4 & 430.00 >
1 pc. bonnet Bac $ $90.00.—
1 pc. bonnet outer chrome Cre g 110.00
1 pe. bonnet lock Tt g 68.00
1 pc. front bumper L% [ 450.00
1 pc, front bumper reinforcement £t 5 290.00 ’fﬁ
2 pes, front bumper side retainers @5$35.00 2ot L 70.00 -~
1 set front bumper clips g 40.00~
1pc. front bumper centre grille Zren s 75.00 -
1 pe. front grille Cha g 105007
1pe. front grille logo AU ¢ 45.00~"
2pes.  headlamps @$510.00 (M4 s 102000~
1pc. front support panel WM -] 588.00

S 8,853.00

less10% S 88530 7Y )
5 7,967.70 7 L{«‘L;
0¥
Co7

— oy 0



IR Eﬂli FRI 20:27 FhRX 3 wguz;qa:

o

Bal c/f 5 7.967.70

Nett Items: )

1 set rear bumper reverse sensor 5 A"M/ 5 280.00 JJJ

1pc rear license plate w/holder ‘ggdf 5 50.00 & -

1 pc. rear exhaust chrome Sue 5 80.00

1pc. front license plate w/holder Led § 50.00 £0)

Labour Charges:

To check wiring 5 BO.00 3 &

To remove & refix reverse sensor s 100.00 £10

To remove & refix interior seat, cushion upholstery 5 120.00 q‘z’a

To remove & refix rear exhaust 3 100.00 ¢

To transter bootlid mechanism S 100006 o

To spray rust proofing b 20000 /2 o

To remove & refix air-con & refill gas S 12000/
Labour for panel beating, welding & renew parts S 1,800.00 T,

) Spray painting S 1,800.00 /60 »
Total: 5 12,847.70s

39%  TlY)
£3771



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page 1 of 1

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Company
5161E

SIV2984M

No

15 Jan 2019

PROTON

PERSONA 1.6L (AT) H-LINE ABS AIRBAG
Black

2010

S4PHPY4088
PL1CM6SRRAG230596
82.0 kW (109 bhp)
$10,975.00

20 Jan 2010

20 Jan 2010

4

$10,975.00

Yes
19 Jan 2020
$6,036.00

19 Jan 2020

A - Car (1600cc & below)
10

$18,502.00

$1,870.00

$7,906.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 14 Jan 2019

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBefore DeregInput 7ZFUNCTION_ID=F030...

14-Jan-19



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 14 January 2019 11:18 AM

To: assignments

Subject: FW: Pre-Repair Inspection

N A3um® 1411 |

Hi Nivitha, v e n _
peavr @ W

TP smuart. Kindly assist. ?J(?-@ Tw

Thank vou,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Jennifer Pang <quanv3@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 11 January, 2019 7:51 PM

To: 5G AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>
Subject: Fw: Pre-Repair Inspection

-—- Forwarded message -—-

From: Jennifer Pang <quanv3@yahoo.com.sq>

To: CST <cst@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 9 January 2018, 7:57:35 PM GMT+8
Subject: Pre-Repair Inspection

Hi All,

Accident on 08/01/2019 involving vehicles SJV2984M, GBES519T, SLW3877D along PIE towards Tuas
Kindly arrange pre-repair inspection for vehicle SJV2984M soonest possible. Thank you.

CQuan De Motor Trading

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

#01-67 Autobay (417883)

Contact: Ms. Jennifer (Hp: 86709191)

Regards,
Quan De Motor Trading
Jennifer



Hsiao TonE (LKKAuto)

From: Coey <admin@windec.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 22 November 2019 10:43 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 8519T(AXA)/ SJV 2984M/ OTHERS ALONG/AT PIE
TWDS TUAS BEFORE ENG NEQ EXIT ON 08/01/2019

Attachments; SKM_C36819112116120.pdf; WP - Han Jun Zhi Jun 2019.pdf; Driving Licence - Han
Junzhi_pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Please find the attached documents as requested,

Thanks & Regards,

Coey « Administration & HR

Your Interior Craftsman . Build with Passion

Blk 3016 Bedok North Ave 4 #04-28/29 Eastech Singapore 489947
Tel: 6246 6266 . Fax: 6245 3685

admin@windec.com.sq « Www.Windec.com.sg

On Thu, 21 Nov 2019 at 12:41, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

REMINDER

M/s WINDEC INTERIOR PTE LTD

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

OUR REF  :CC4/ASM19000804/Upa3// SOMO1AB2

YOUR REF : GBEB519T

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 8519T(AXA)/ 5JV 2984M/ OTHERS ALONG/AT PIE TWDS TUAS BEFORE ENG NEO EXIT
ON 08/01/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your
motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.



As per AXA instruction, we would like to request the following documents for our necessary action,

« Copy of the letter of authorization to confirm that the drive is allow to driver the vehicle.
« Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any).

= Driver's work pass.

+ LUsage of the vehicle at the time of accident.

Thank you,

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Hsiao Tong [LKKAUtD)

Sent: Wednesday, 13 November 2019 2:56 PM

To: admin@windec.com.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 8519T[AXA)/ SIV 2984M/ OTHERS ALONG/AT PIE TWDS TUAS BEFORE ENG

NEO EXIT ON 08/01/2019

M/s WINDEC INTERIOR PTE LTD

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

OUR REF  : CC4/ASM19000804/Upa3// SOM0D1AB2

YOUR REF : GBE8519T



ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 8519T(AXA)/ SIV 2984M/ OTHERS ALONG/AT PIE TWDS TUAS BEEORE ENG NED EXIT
ON 08/01/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your
motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

As per AXA instruction, we would like to request the following documents for our necessary action.

* Copy of the letter of authorization to confirm that the drive is allow to driver the vehicle,
e Driver's driving license or foreign driving license [if any).

= Driver's work pass.

e Usage of the vehicle at the time of accident.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #oz-25 | S{40809737)



[COMPANY LETTER HEAD] .

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION Winde Intesior
To whom it may concern,
We, Windec Interior Pte Ltd (company's name), _199002075Z (Co Reg.
MNo.) are the registered owner of the vehicle GBES8519T (license plate number).
The vehicle is insured by AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (insurance company).
We Windec Interior Pte Ltd (company's name), hereby authorize
our employee @IE";MS. Han Junzhi (employee's name) to drive
our vehicle on 08/01/2019 (date of accident) for Work use

(purpose for vehicle

was being used at time of accident).

@ Ifyou have any questions concerning this matter, please contact me using the information

provided below.

Company Name:; Windec Interior Pte Ltd

Company Reg No.: 1990020752

Contact number: 6246 6266 ,'/ / / : ) ——

Signature (with company stamp):

- S

WINDEC INTERIOR PTE LTL
Bik 3016 Bedok North Ave 4
#oy-28/2g EASTECH Building SigBggs7)
+T +66 6246 6266 «F +65 6245 3bgs
swww. windec.com,sg
senquiry@windec com.sg
Company Reg MNo: 199002075

o« Haspitality

fe/Hestaurant « Home | Living = Office = Betai « Health Care « Project Manangement



1172272019 Claim Portal

éTFE Mandate IA> - S9MO1AB2 [A C%IDENTINVOLVING

4 8519T(Ol) / SJV 2984M HERS ON
08/01/20 é?) Rl

Type
@ Question

Message

Liability: 100%. 4 vehices chain collision whereby our driver was 3rd car. Inform Ol about third party claim.
Agreed to settle at best and aware NCD issue. We have uploaded a copy of Ol LOA, OID DL & 01D Work
Permit in SC. If no issue on policy, we seek your mandate at $8,727 45(all-in). TP-Mandate |A had been
uploaded in Smartclaims. Kindly let us have your approval/instruction. Hsiao Tong - 22-Now-19

hitps:/ivp.smariclaims. axa.com sglclaim-ponalhtml/index-vendor-service-requests himi#/ service-requests/view-message/?serviceRequesiNumbe... 117



54 24

Ao
Consulfants

Company Registration No. 19960T1568R

S p2EadY )5

Jl-ut.-un - . Pie g
SEUEEANYE 6, M0E25 PAY A UBTINDUSTRIAL PFARK, SISO ATCORE 8% TEIL P RISaASH] AN
Immediate Advice
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd
Survey Details:

Date of loss 08.01.2019

Date of appointment 14.01.2019

Date of survey 14.01.2019

Location of survey QUAN DE MOTOR TRADING

Vehicle Details:

DATE: 22/11/2019

Claim Type; Third party

Vehicle number S5JV2984M

Make and Model Proton Persona (1557cc)

Date of registration 20.01.2010

Excess

Market Value/ Book Value 5 18,000.00 |(est)

Parf/COE Rebate 5 7,906.00 |(est)

Nett Value/ ERV S 10,094.00 |{est)

Repair details:

Initial Estimate B 12,847.70
Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts 5 4,303.50 |[Part less 50%)

Check items (estimate) MNIL

Labour S 3,700.00

Supplementary MIL

Total 5 8,003.50

Lump Sum(if applicable) 5 8,000.00

|Numher of days for repair




N a Auto
'.h .!I‘. ;;,-':,_ Consultants
B B = Biw Lid

SLUREAYVE L0225 PAYA TRITSDUSTRIADL PARK, SINGAIKRE J08%33 TE]

Remarks:

4 vehicles chain collision whereby OID was 3rd car.

Company Registration No. 19960T198R

15 2565 FAN © (S n236d0] 3

Mandate:
Liability(TP) 100%
Proposed repair cost 5 8,000.00
Loss of use 5 720.00 (12days x 560.00)
Loss of rental MNIL
Loss of income MIL
LTA/GIA search fees S 7.45
Others MNIL
Proposed Total 5 8,727.45




Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 November 2019 9:08 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Mew message for service request 93112, vehicle number SJV2984M

11/26/19 8:25 AM *** PLS PROCEED - NG Stacey

-----Original Message-—--

From: stacey.ng@axa.com.sg <stacey.ng@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 November, 2019 8:25 AM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 93112, vehicle number 5JV2984M

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number S9MO01AB2.
Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided forina
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.



Hsiao Tona (LKKAuto)

From: Jennifer Pang <quanv3@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 2 December 2012 4:04 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref: S/V2984M *LKK Ref: CC4/ASM19000804/Upa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

GBE 8519T(AXA) / SIV 2984M/ OTHERS ON 08/01/2019]

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Thank you for your email as above.

We confirm acceptance of your offer settlement of $8,600/- (all-in).
Kindly send us the DV or thru email if possible.

Thank you,

Regards,
Quan De Motor Trading
Jennifer

On Friday, 29 November 2019, 02:18:57 pm GMT+8, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @ lkkauto.com> wrote:

Your Ref: 8JV2984M Without Prejudice

LKK Ref: CC4/ASM19000804/Upa3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 8519T(AXA) / SJV 2984M/ OTHERS ON 08/01/2019

We refer to the above matter.

We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $8,600.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.



“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be
construed as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms
of our without prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor
should it be binding in any other related claims."

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue |, #32-25 | 5{408933)



QUAN DE MOTOR TRADING
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6, #01-67

AUTOBAY, SINGAPORE 417883
HP: 96709191 FAX: 66840767

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

8 Shenton Way

#24-01 AXA Tower

Singapore 068811

Attn: Motor Claims Department

Date: 8 March 2019

Accident on 08/01/2019 involving vehicles SJV2984M, GBEB519T, SLW3877D
along PIE towards Tuas

With regards to the above we are writing on behalf of the registered owner of vehicle
SJV2984M which was involved in the abovementioned accident.

We are informed that the accident was caused solely by the negligence of your insured
vehicle GBE8519T As a result of the accident. our client's vehicle was damaged and our
client has been put to great loss and expenses, particulars of which are as follows:

1) Cost of Repairs $8,000.00
2) Loss Of Use ( 12 days x @3%100.00) $1,200.00
3) LTA search fee $7.45
Total: $9,207.45

—_——

We hereby enclosed herewith the following documents for your confirmation of the above
claim

a) Original Invaice b) GIA Accident Report
¢) Certificate of Insurance d) Owner/Driver NRIC & Driving License
e) Letter of Authorisation f) LTA search tax invoice

Kindly acknowledge receipt of the above documents and your favourable reply is much
appreciated

Yours sincerely,
QUAN DE MQTOR TRADING

email: quanv yahoo.com.sg



QUAN DE MOTOR TRADING

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6, #01-67
AUTOBAY, SINGAPORE 417883
HP: 96709191 FAX: 66840767

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

8 Shenton Way

#24-01 AXA Tower

Singapore 068811

Attn: Motor Claims Department

Date: 8 March 2019
Accident on 08/01/2019 involving vehicles SJV2984M, GBES519t. SLW3R77D

along PIE towards Tuas
Invoice for cost of repair to vehicle 5JV2984M Proton Persona

To supply spare parts, labour for panel
beating, welding and renew parts,
including spray painting.

Lump sum; 5 8,000.00

(S.DLS: EIGHT THOUSAND ONLY)



EklﬂnsurunnwrchnnpqnvIjnmﬂnd '
5 Meaowell Aoed #1700 Tower Block MND Compiex Singagone 08810
e e eqnsurance

rog no. 1978-00430-)
Uetee Gt Tiend

CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

ROAD TRANSPORT ACT 1987 (MALAYSIA)
THE MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS) RULES, 1959 (FEDERATION OF MALAYSIA)
THE MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) ACT (CAP. 1B9 OF THE REVISED EDITION)
(REPUBLIC OF SINGAPORE)
THE MOTOR WEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) RULES, 1995 EDITION(REPUBLIC OF SINGAPORE)
OR ANY AMENDMENT, ACT OR ACTS PASSED IN SUBSTITUTION THEREOF,

COMMERCIAL VEHICLE FLEET

Third Party
Certificate No.: DMCFHQ18-888835 Form: LCWH
Excess:
1. Index Mark and Registration Number of Vehicles Saction 2 56D1,808. 08

Outside Singapore 5602, 888,80
YEIDR (All Claims)}  SGD3,86e.80
YIOR (All Claims) 5603, 088,80

S5IV298am

Name of Policyholder
Eazi Car Leasing & Marketing Pte Ltd

I

3. Effective Date of the Commencement of Insurance for the purpose of t

28/83/2818
4. Date of Expiry of Insurance
19/23/2619
5. Persen or Classes of Persons entitlsd to drive*
Any person who is Authorised to drive on the Insu orde with their
permission.
"Provided that the person driving is permitted in rd with the licensing or other laws or
regulations to drive the Motor Vehicle or ha itted and is not disqualified by order of

i ] tion in that behalf from driving the Motor
or W e 1s reglstered under the Road Traffic Act has

or damage.

a Court of Law or by reason of any ena
Vehicle. And provided further that t
not been cancelled at the time of acciden

6. Limitations as to use*
LIMITATIONS AS TO USE

Use for social domestic anf pleasdge plrposes and business purposes of any

person whom the vehicle is™g
THE POLICY DOES MNOT COVER

(1) Use for racing pace-making reliasbility trial or speed-testing
(2) Use whilst drawing a trailer except the towing (other than for reward) of
any one disabled mechanically propellad wehicla

*Limitetians rendered inoperative by Section 8 of the Motor vehiclas (Third-Party Risks and
Compensation) Act (Chapter 189) and Section 95 of the Road Transport Act, 1987
[Malaysia), are not to be included under these headings.

I\WE HEREBY CERTIFY that the Policy to which this Certificate relates is issued in accordance with the

provisions of the Motar Vehicles (Third-Party Risks and Compensation) act (Chapter 185} and Part IV
of the Road Transport Act, 1987 (Malaysia) or and dmendment, Act or Acts passed in substitution thereof.

UNWSR/HC/E083842 /NEWSTATE STENHOUSE | Authorized Sigrataky
EQ Insurance Company Limited

iiﬁh AMemberof C

Pystate



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industnial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. MNo. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ATTN: STACEY NG

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

8 SHENTON WAY #24-01
AXATOWERSINGAPORE 068811

Ref : CC4/ASM19000804/Upads2

Date :

Code : ASM

17-12-2019

LINHRTATAN

13

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh.  GBE 85197 Veh. Inspected SJV 2984M
Policy No. GA1TE5021M Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. SOMO1AB2 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From STACEY NG Assign Date 14/01/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model FPROTON PERSONA (M) c.c 1587
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. PL1CMESRRAG230596 Colour BLACK
Odometer 153735 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3, Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/55 R15 MAXTREK & mm
L/H Front Tyre |[195/55R15 MAXTREK & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/55R15 MAXTREK B mm
L/H Rear Tyre 185/55 R15 MAXTREK 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR AND FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 08/01/2019 Inspection Date 14/01/2019
Survey held at  QUAN DE MOTOR TRADING
BLK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-67 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 12 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Ma: 199507198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607188-R Page No.:10of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJV 2984M
: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop {;_i] {Si]
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS

1|BOOTLID (CONSISTENT) DENTED / 580.00 580.00

BUCKLED
1|BOOTLID OUTER HANDLE (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 116.00 116.00
3|BOOTLID HINGES @ $105.00 (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 210.00

LABOUR
1|BOOTLID INNER LOCK (CONSISTENT) TWISTED 108.00 108.00
1|BOOTLID WEATHERSTRIP (CONSISTENT) TWISTED 146.00 146.00
1|BOOTLID INNER TRIM (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 166.00 -
1|SET BOOTLID INNER TRIM CLIFS (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 35.00 35.00
1|REAR BUMPER (CONSISTENT) DISTORTED 550.00 550.00
2|REAR BUMPER REFLECTORS @ $38.00 (CONSISTENT) |CRACKED 76.00 76.00
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (CONSISTENT) BENT 360.00 360.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 40.00 40.00
2| TAILLAMPS @ $355.00 (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 710.00 710.00
1|REAR END PANEL (CONSISTENT) BADLY DENTED 480.00 480.00
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 180.00 180.00
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL (CONSISTENT) CRUMPLED { 965.00 865.00

BUCKLED
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TOP BOARD (CONSISTENT) TORN 210.00 210.00
2|REAR FENDER INNER TRIMS @ $215.00 (CONSISTENT) |NOT NECESSARY 430.00 .
1|BONNET (CONSISTENT) BUCKLED 590.00 580.00
1|BONNET OUTER CHROME (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 110.00 110.00
1|BONNET LOCK (CONSISTENT) TWISTED 68.00 68.00
1|FRONT BUMPER (CONSISTENT) DENTED 450.00 450.00
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (CONSISTENT) BENT 280.00 200.00
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS @ $35.00 BENT 70.00 70.00

(CONSISTENT)

1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 40.00 40.00
1|FRONT BUMPER CENTRE GRILLE (CONSISTENT) TORN 75.00 75.00
1|FRONT GRILLE (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 105.00 105.00
1|FRONT GRILLE LOGO (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 45.00 45,00
2| HEADLAMPS @ $510.00 (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 1,020.00 1,020.00

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM19000804/Upa3s2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-8607 196-R

Page Mo.:2 of 2

Qty Description of Parts Condition WE:;’:;;;?;'}} Our ‘E‘;{“m"
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL (CONSISTENT) DENTED { BENT 588.00 588.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -885 20 -
LESS 50% DISCOUNT - -4 023.50
7.967.70 4,023.50
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1[SET FRONT BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SHORTED 280.00 200.00
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR LICENCE PLATE W/HOLDER (SN) (CONSISTENT) BENT 50.00 40.00
1|REAR EXHAUST CHROME (SN) (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 80.00 :
1|FRONT LICENSE PLATE W/HOLDER (SN) (CONSISTENT) |BENT 50.00 40.00
480.00 280.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING, 80.00 30.00
TO REMOVE & REFIX REVERSE SENSOR. 100.00 50,00
TO REMOVE & REFIX INTERIOR SEAT, CUSHION 120.00 80.00
UPHOLSTERY.
TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR EXHALUST 100.00 80,00
TO TRANSFER BOOTLID MECHANISM. 100.00 60.00
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING. 200.00 120.00
TO REMOVE & REFIX AIR-COM & REFILL GAS. 120.00 100.00
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING, WELDING & RENEW 1,800.00 1.600.00
PARTS. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR COF BOOTLID
HINGES.
SPRAY PAINTING. 1,600.00 1,600.00
4,420.00 3,700.00
GRAND TOTAL 12,847.70 8,003.50
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 8,000.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM19000804/Upa3s2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Rapedn ks made sclaly for the use and banafit af tha Client namsd on tha frant pags of this Repart.

Ho liability of responsibility whatsoever. in contact of tort, |8 accapbed Lo any third party whio may reply o

Beport, in whobs or In part. does so ot his or her can risk.




