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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#r

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January 2019 2:52 PM
To: ‘Admin @ VAuG'; SUR

Subject: SJW 3918T-DOA: 9/1/2019 (UOI OD)
Dear Raymond,

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SJTW 3918T (Excess 5800/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*QOur client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)



Veron Chen (LKKAuto) )

From: LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January 2019 2:40 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR; LEW JENNY

Subject: RE: PRELIMINARY REVISED FOR VEHICLE SIW 3918T
Dear Veron,

Please proceed to authorise the repair up to $$9,258.01 (before policy excess of S$800).

Regards,

Katie Lee

Claims

United Overseas Insurance Limited

-
3 Anson Road, #28-01 Springleat Tower, Singapore 075803
Main « (A5 B222 7722 | DID = (B58) 6450 9318 | Fax -+ (B5Y 6327 3869 | Email » katielee@uoi cam.sg
UOEB EMAIL DISCLAIMER -
Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts lo a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,
neither UOB nor any entity in the WOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the UCB Group,

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto;veronchen@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 16 January, 2019 11:20 AM

To: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg>
Subject: PRELIMINARY REVISED FOR VEHICLE SIW 3918T

Dear Jenny,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SIW 3918T
Date of survey: 14/1/2019
Number of days : 6 days

We have Not authorise repair.

Kindly let us have your approval please.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear Jenny,

Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Wednesday, 16 January 2019 11:20 AM

LEW JENNY

SUR; LEE KATIE

PRELIMINARY REVISED FOR VEHICLE SJW 3918T
SJW 39718T (PRELI REVISED).pdf

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SIW 3918T

Date of survey: 14/1/2019
Number of days : 6 days

We have Not authorise repair.

Kindly let us have your approval please.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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P71

Company Registration No. 193607198R

51 UBLAYE L, #02-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAMOIRE $08933 TEL : (65) 62563561 FAX @ (165} 62564315

Your ref: DHOM110149331602

Our ref: CS/UOI19000764/Bvd3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s UNITED OVERSEAS INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir'Madam

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SJW 3918T

We thank for vour instruction on 14/1/2019

Date: 16/1/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

14/1/2019 at the premises of M/s
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
"Check" Items Amount
Total

Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear

front portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Repair Cost Economical

Yours faithfully,

LIM TEOW GUAN
Asst, Automotive Assessor

VIN'S MOTOR PTE LTD

: 559,681.88

- §$7,050.53

: $$2.207.48

: §$9,258.01

: 8833,000.00

: §522,801.00

: §510,199.00
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SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE
1 Plaasa report correctly the detalls of the accident to speed up the claims process
2. This Foem must be completed by the Paiicyholder andior the Authorised Driver,

1 Information arovided must be as truthful and accurate as possile. Any wilful misrepcesentation or witholging of material facts may aliow insurance compantes o

repudiate policy liability

A The ssue and acceptancs of this Form by ingurance coempanies i not an admission of policy dasidy on the part of the msuwrance companias.

Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

II| or R

Cchiving and that copies of this repor will

This report will ba fansarded by the insurars of the GIA Racorgs Management Centra octahlished by the Genaral Inaurance Assaciation of Singapore [GIA] for
tora fos, bo made available upon applicaton by inerested padies

7 Lu- the dgement of this 1oport to the INsurars, Yo hereby consent 1o the archiving of this repart al the centre and ta copies of the report Being mace availabla

afmresan

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident
Exact Location OF Accident

Country/State of Loss

10/01/2019 08:39
09/01/2019 17:45
DUNEARN RD
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
SJW3918T

vemcle RE-ngti’E‘lﬂl"l Number

Namu [Jf Reglstered Gwr‘cr
MNRIC Mo

Email Addrass

Mobile Phone No

.&Ilerna five Phone ND

Manufacturer
WModel

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Ara you Claiming under your own insurance
for repair to vour vehicle?

& policy

IF Mo, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Mamae of Insurance Company

Type Of Coverage

Fleat Policy

Policy Mumber

Cover Note Number

Driver...... AT, st

583604142
NOEMAIL

(LOCAL) +85-97315178
OFFICE-97315178

TOYOTA
PREVIA

YES

PRIVATE CAR

Lly

UNITED OVERSEAS INSURANCELTD
COMPREHENSIVE

MO

CHOM110148331602

R P T L ——

e e e

Mame of Driver
MRIC Mo

Date Of Birth
Occupation

Date OFf Driving Pass
Driving Exparience
Gender

Mobile Mumber

Fax Mumber

contact Number

=\ail Adarass

JC’.:C:L#N SH.&YN‘: YEO WEI LING
§7997018B

02/05/1879

INDOCR

03/07/2010

B YEARS AND 6 MONTHS
FEMALE

(LOCAL) +65-87315178

NOEMAIL



Address

~ostoode

Was driver an employse of the Insured's Campany

If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicla

Type Of Accident

Weather Condiions
Road Surface

Eﬂh:ﬁ.‘

i g

BLK 231C BT BATOK ST 24 #13-29

NO
SPOUSE

nformation - o o

CDLLISID'\I H-Aj TCI R—A:'i
CLEAR
DRY

Pl = umﬁ‘ﬁ‘w e -._.._.- e o

r—

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this aceident? NO

Mumber of vehicles (including own vehicle)
involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown personis)
soficiting/offering aceident claims assistance.

MNumber of Passengers (Including Driver)
Passenger 1

alls of Bollég Acton S

Was the accident reported to the police?

If Yas, Please state which Police Stalion
Was notice of intended Prosacution given?
If Yes against whom?

@@%ﬁ?mmm el i

F‘LS REFER ATTACHED ACCIDENT REPORT FROM THE DRIVER.

%@wﬂgﬂ: SET S T -':'.:f-""'_L'i- St

Are accident photos amltable for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?
Was there any audic recorded?

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Caolour
Details Of Properties

2

MO

YES
NO
2

NAME: Do
GENDER: : MALE

R S it
-.. {‘ﬁ,f?‘-_‘_‘.’t

NO
NO
= ks - —:--J'f.'.__' i’
T RERRESE La ]
E:”:é;lﬂ.i Sl i S T '-T:.::n- ST _.-:'-,Tr_'-i.:é-?-__
YES
NO
NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
SGU1365Y
PRIVATE CAR

Vehicle Category

Name of Driver
MNRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Maturz OFf Damage

Mo, Of Passenaaer (Including Orivac)



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correetly the details of the accident to speed wp the claims process.

1. This Farm must e completed by the Palicyholder and/or the Authorised Driver,

3. Information provided must be as truthful and gecurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation ar withholding of materiaf
facts may allow insurance companies to repudiate policy Hability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Farm by lnsurance companies Is not an admission of palicy llability on the part of the Insurance
companies,

= false r ber to the P investigation,

6. The report will be farwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre astablished by the Genersl insurance
Association of Singapore {GIA) for archiving and that cooies of this report will for a fee be made avallable upon application by
interested partios.,

7. By the lodgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this repart at the centre and to copies of
the report being made available aferesald.

B Consent under the Parsonal Data Protection Act (PDPA)
I understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

l#) My insurer, my workshop and the General insurance Assoclation of Singapore ["GIA™ may/are permitted to coilect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal information set out in this [form] and any other personal information
provided by me or passessed by my insurer [collactively the YParsonal Information®] and disclose and transfer such
Personal Infarmation to all insureris) wha have Insured vehicle(s} involved in this accident (all insurar(s) who have insured
wehicle(s} invalved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the “Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Manetary Autharity of Singapors and any relevant government agency/authority {such as the police), for the purposels)
of :

(i} processing, handling and/or deafing with my claims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary
imvestigations relating to the claims;

[} investigating the aceident and/or my claims;
(lil} carrying out andfor dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquirias by me:

(v} administering my claims fincluding the malling of correspondence, statements, invoices, reports or natices to me,
which could involve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well a3 on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/for

[v) complying with applicable law in administe ring, processing, handling and,for dealing with my claims.[collectively the
"Purposes™)
() all Insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) Involved In this accldent and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclose andfor process my Personal information for one or more of tha above Purposes; and

{c}  my Personal Information mayfcan be disclosed by any of the Insurars and/or G1A to thelr third party servics providers or
agents{including their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the above Purposes.

{d) my Personal Information will also be collected and used to compile clsims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
investigation and management in prasent and all future claims.
{e] theinformatian so collected under {d) above may be shared / dischosad:

{i] toallinsurers and/or any other third parties that @ssist in evaluating, investigating. controlfing er managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and gavernmant sgencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

(iil for complying with requirements under any regulations, [3ws or court orders.

AL Se3o -

Falicyholder's Signature Béiver's Signature ~ Reporting Centre Personnei’s Sgnature
Date & Time: (I detver is not ehe paficyholder) Mame:
Date & Time: NRIC/FIN No.:

NAC BLIKIT RATNW niad)




Sketch Plan #2 Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

| wag &{m:kf 2lang Punearvs foaof whetn elude(S&U 1245Y) Wag

(B g in ﬁﬂ‘m ?‘{f\‘.’r ofofe r'aﬁm/raﬂr jfﬂﬂ?ﬂ / ffmr?lrﬁ’d‘ gt him fe #f“f‘

Jum%umu [ wac wmmq mw:—h facte ﬁ-ﬁr] him byt he shi/

decivled to cut o tp lane, Sp J honked af b o secovdd

Hae n&l—%@ Heﬁﬁmaw{ 4o rc-‘!VH i€ bratet, and ewen

ﬂ-hﬁrm\gh [ Wt Yy Fr’f“'l{f‘ﬂfﬂfrjj bﬁﬁk{j 0, et O ot

DECLARATION
IfWe declara the foregeing particulars ara true in every respect.

\%JO DA DT BATOK (VAC)
}‘LUI\—J I =

Paficyholder’s Signatuce rlver's Signature Aeparting Centre Personnel’s Signature

Omte & Tma: [1f driver is not the polcyhaider} Mame:
Date & Time: MRIC/FiM Mo
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> Back to OneMoto ring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Cwener |0

Wehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date;
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis MNo.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount;

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 15 Jan 2019

PARFICOF Rehala Frniny

Singapore NRIC
04147

SIW3918T

Mo

15 Jan 2019
TOYOTA

PREVIA 7 SEATER
White

2010

2AZH465765
JTEGDS4MS0A019324
1250 kW (167 bhp)
$35,783.00

22 Mar 2010

22 Mar 2010

1

$35.783.00

Yes
21 Mar 2020
$19,4680.00

21 Mar 2020

B - Car {14601cc & above)
10

$26.38%.00

$3,121.00

$22,801.00

OK

I'HIIIPS:H'-l'l'l.Ilﬂ.gﬂ\".sg.'IIE.r'U'FI-l'ElElll:!I'Ll'ﬂ'l'll;lu|I'EHBDEWD?PUNICHETDFEUEFEQIH{JUI:’I‘UNI... DI IS U ausuue i

LI
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= Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owiner 1D Type:

Owner 1D:

Vahicla Details

Vehicle Mo.:

Vizhicle ta be Exported:
Imtended Deregistration Date;
Wehicle Maks:

Yehicle Madel:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.

Chassis No.:

taximum Power Output;
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer.C::unt:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Data:

COE Category:

COE Period|Yaars):

QF Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Tl_:_l_t_il Rebate Amount;

The information contained hareinis correct as at 14 Jan 2'01 9.

PARF/MNE Rahata Frmiirg

Singapore MRIC
Q4147

SIW3R1AT

Mo

19 Jan 2019
TOYOTA

PREVIA 7 5EATER
White

2010

2ATHAL5745
JTEGDS4AMS0A017324
125.0 kW (167 bhpl
§35,783.00

22 Mar 2010

22 Mar 2010

1

$35.783.00

Yeg
21 Mar 2020
317,580.00

21 Mar 2020

B- Car (15010 & above)
10

$256,38%7.00

$3.0%2.00



1152019 Used Toyota Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

Toyota Previa 244 £15.800 $13,940 fyr 29-Apr-2010 2362 cx 95,000 km MPY Available
Rare 7 Seaters, Most Popular MPY, Well Taken Care Unit, High PARF Value, No Repairs Needed, Careful Lady Owner, Hagh Loan, High Trade In,
Extremely Wil Kent. We Provide & Manths In House Warranty, 24... L Fravmn o |

Posted: 16-Mav-2018 I:ﬂf:im!':'lﬂ Toyota Frevia, 2010 toyata provia, Torota Previa, toyola previa, Towota, Previa, previa, Used

Toyota Previa 2.4A - A 22-Mar-2010 2,362 e - My SOLD

1 Year Warranty On Engine And Gearbox Provided, Excellent Condition, Guarantee Buyback At End Of COE At $22K. Don't Miss This Excellent Deal,
Excellent Time Frame To Capatalize On Fall OF COE For COE ..

Pesstid: | Nov-2018 Tag'a:ull:l!:l Toynta Priviy, 2010 toyota presaa,, Toyota P, toyota preva, Toyota, Provia, preva, Used

Sawe this search critina, to get emall alerts whenever a match s found,

Prica Deprediation ®  Rog Das Eng Cap Milcage Weh Type Status

For old advertizsaments, view Expired ads 100 ¥ | results/page

Home | New Cars | Used Cars | Sell My Car | Directory = Products | Insurance | Article | Forum | Resources

sglarMart is tha number ane car clossifiods for parabel impart cars, Toyota, Henda, Nissan, Mitsubishi & BMW, There ara plenty of cars for sale, from vans, trucks, sedan cars, luxury Cars; Spos
care o stetiorwagans, SUV, MPY, natchback, to COE cars & OPC cars. You can also buy from a car auctan, ook g car loans, financial services, low mileage cars, Gar brands, carpark rates & car
insurance. Find buy used Toyota, Toyota Singapone, used Toyota Singapare, used Toyom, used vehichs Sngapore or cven buy used Toyota Singapore, We have new car dealers comprisng
paraliel snporters, authorsed car dealers, and used car dealers an our site, Find new car price lists, new car launches and new car promations, Visit our parmer sites for job aperings for
Smgapore jabs, real estate properties for sale, mover, car perfarmance parts, car discussion, forum discussion, commercial vehicle Ieaing & COE resufts.

All prices and cther Information displayed on sgCarMart com sre gathered from sources and based an akeorithems that are believed by seCarMart.com to be sellable, but no assurance can ba glvan
that this informatian is accurate, complete or current, soCarMart.com does not assume any resporsibility for erars or omissions of warrant the accuracy of tls infarmation.

Follow sgCarMart.com

About Us | Careers | Contact Us | Skemap  Terms of Senvice | Privacy Palicy | Personal Data Protection Statement
E2004-2019 sqCarMart. All rights reserved.

Comnpare

https/fwww.sgcarmart. comiused_cars/listing php?MMO=PreviaRPG=1008VEH=04RGD=2010&MOD=Tayota 212



AUTOMOTIVE GROUP
Qur Ref : OD/012019/3739
Accident date: 9/1/2019

Your Ref : DHOM110149331602 Date

Motor Claim Department
United Overseas Insurance

3 Anson Road AnaR by e
#28-01 Springleal’ Tower F\WM:
Singapore 0799049 —
ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIRS TO Toyota Previa S[W3918T
1 pc Front bonnet § 56389 c:;zu v B
2 pes Front bonnet hinge @ $5950 A7 %) $G7 11900 AT
1 pc Front bonnet lock 5 89.90 pT ~.,/
1 pc Front bonnet rubber 5 38:50 4 1| 3.{
2 pes Front headlamp @ $1179.45 $ 235990 pg . H
1 pc Front grille 5 559.08 ER |
1  pc Front bumper $ ~ 515.60 ";7{:;'}' v
1 pc Front bumper reinforcement S 401:20- 7 ¢
1 pc Front bumper sponge 5 /7520 7 |
2 pcs Front bumper side retainer @ 566.78 S /13356 NEL v
1 pc Front bumper LH towing cover 5 s 1479 M5
1 pc Front bumper lower grille S 18319 PR
1 pc Front bumper LH fog lamp $ 24820 7 g
1 pc Frontair condensor 5 7 1,405.00 M vV /DT D
1 pc Frontair cond pipe 5 21270 nec
1 pc Frontradiator $ , 212060 7 7 .
1 pc Front radiator cowling $ S 277.00 = BO7
1 pc Front horn $ 9810 7
1 pc Frontsupport panel 5 $71 1005:10 12, Y
921 1n
§ 1042051 267F64!
Less: 25% $ (2605.13) 24193
$ 781538 325753
3 pcs Front grille top cover clips $3.50 N S 1050 N
8 pecs Front bumper clips @ $4.50 N S 36.00 N NEC
1  pc Front number plate S 254000 N
s
To refill air cond gas $ 'Y 008
To repair front damage g 780.00 5 h(‘ga
To spray painting 5 880.00 ,im >
$ 968188
ﬂ\\“ Tieas
VIN'S MOTOR PTE LTD S QW o w3 8@ c@
f
/] ™ IF3LISTH D -
f oA ] / AN
0 / 19 ips of Nepan
[_) v, Tfn_ Mﬁ_ 'UrL“L . |'_‘:', 'ﬁ O

Tax In
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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) =
Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 10:43 AM

To: Admin @ VAuG

Cc SUR

Subject: RE: 5/W3918T Finalization

Dear Raymond,

Moted with thanks.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin @ VAuUG <admin@vinsautogroup.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 9:50 AM

To: Veron Chen (LEKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: Re: SJW3218T Finalization

Good morning,

Flease proceed @ $8709.03 before excess
Thanks!

Best Regards

Raymond Teo

On Mon, Feb 18, 2019 at 11:16 AM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Raymond,

Offer part by part $8709.03 before excess $800.

Please check and confirm.



Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin @ VAuUG <admin@vinsautogroup.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 18 February 2019 9:52 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com=>
Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SIW3918T Finalization

Hi,

All the photos are taken by the surveyor.
Please check with the surveyor.

Thanks!

Best Regards

Raymond Teo

On Mon, Feb 18, 2019 at 3:48 AM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Raymond,

Please forward us before paint photos.



Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax; 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin @ VAuG <admin@vinsautogroup.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 15 February 2019 11:20 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SIW3918T Finalization

Good morning,

This is a part by part case.
Please confirm

Thanks!

Best Regards

Raymond Teo

On Thu, Feb 14, 2019 at 5:14 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Raymond,

Offer Lump Sum $6950/- before excess 3800 (@ 6 working days

Please check and confirm



Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin @ VAuG <admin@vinsautogroup.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 14 February 2019 11:17 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: 5/W3918T Finalization

Good morning,

Can we finalize?

Please check with your surveyor for the photos.
Thanks!

best regards

Raymond Teo
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607156R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
UNITED OVERSEAS INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/UOI19000764/Bvd3s2
SPRINGLEAF TOWER SINGAPORE 07908 pate - 21022019 ” “II’”"H"“M'" I‘l
Code. UQI2
1 Policy Particulars :- OWN DAMAGE
Insured Veh. Veh. Inspected SJW 3918T
Policy No. DHOM110148331602 Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) $00.00
Assign From FELIS Assign Date 14/01/2019
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA PREVIA c.c 2382
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. JTEGDS54M50A015324 Colour WHITE
Odometer 181354 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60R1G FALKEMN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60R16 FALKEN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60R16 FALKEN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre 215/60R16 FALKEN & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  0%01/2018 Inspection Date 14/01/2019
Survey held at VIN'S MOTOR PTELTD
160 SIN MING DRIVE #03-03
SIN MING AUTO CITY
SINGAPORE 575722
5a. Remarks
AJTHE MARKET VALUE 15 5533,000.00(EST. AVERAGE)
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b, Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: & Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AdE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJW 3918T
Estimate B Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop [;) [il}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BONNET BUCKLED 563 89 563.80
2|FRONT BONNET HINGE @ $59.50 BENT 119.00 97.00
1|FRONT BONNET LOCK BENT 89.90 £9.90
1|FRONT BONNET RUBBER NOT NECESSARY 38.50 -
2|FRONT HEADLAMP @ $1179.45 CRACKED 2,359.80 2,359.90
1|FRONT GRILLE BROKEN 559.08 559.08
1|FRONT BUMPER DENTED 515.60 515.60
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT TO REPAIR SEE 401.20 =
LABOUR
1{FRONT BUMPER SPONGE BROKEN 75.20 75.20
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @ $66.78 NECESSARY 133 56 133.56
1|FRONT BUMPER LH TOWING COVER MISSING 1479 14.79
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE BROKEN 183.19 183.19
1|FRONT BUMPER LH FOG LAMP BROKEN 248 20 248 20
1|FRONT AIR CONDENSOR DENTED 1,405.00 1,405.00
1|FRONT AIR COND PIPE NECESSARY 212.70 212.70
1|FRONT RADIATOR DENTED 2,120,60 2,120.80
1|FRONT RADIATOR COWLING BENT 277.00 277.00
1|FRONT HORN NOT NECESSARY 98.10 4
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL BENT 1,005.10 §21.10
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -2,605.13 -2,419.18
7,815.38 7,257 53
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
3|FRONT GRILLE TOP COVER CLIPS @ $3.50 (SN) NECESSARY 10.50 10.50
8|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS @ $4.50 (SN) NECESSARY 36.00 36.00
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE (SN) MECESSARY 40.00 25.00
86.50 71.50
LABOUR
TO REFILL AIR COND GAS. 120.00 100.00
TO REPAIR FRONT DAMAGE. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR 780.00 580.00
OF FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT.
TO SPRAY PAINTING 880.00 700.00
1,780.00 1,380.00

Report Ref No, CS/UOI19000764/Bvd3s2
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GRAND TOTAL 9.681.88 8,709.03
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS 8,708.03
LESS EXCESS -800.00
NETT LIABILITY 7,909.03

Report Ref No. C5/UOI18000764/Bvd3s2

LIM TEOW GUAN

Automotive Assessor

HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report Is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the frond page of this Report.




