Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 4 October, 2019 9:04 AM

To: Chia Sin Muk

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD - GBJ 341P, your ref. no. SIN216C, DOA : 10.01.2019
Attachments: GBJ341P, LONPAC - LOD-03102019170815.pdf; GBJ341P,

TOW_-03102019171821.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Karen,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.
We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LIRS

w0 Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Chia Sin Muk [mailto:emlautopteltd@gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 3 October, 2019 5:18 PM

To: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: LOD - GBJ 341P, your ref. no. SIN216C, DOA : 10.01.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please find the attached LOD.
COR : $ 5,082.50

TOW:$  60.00



LTA : $ 7.45
GIA :$ 29.00

LOU :$ 800.00

Total : $5,978.95

Kindly arrange for settlement.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Karen, on behalf of,

Chia Sin Muk (Mr)

m: (65) 9666 6556 | o: (65) 6452 3298 | f: (65) 6457 5776

EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 8 #01-68 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C Singapore 575643
Co. / GST Registration Number: 201316380R



