Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 July 2019 11:06 AM

To: shimin poh

Cc: magdelene@jhk.com.sg; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; Kelvin Teo
Subject: RE: SJY6803K / SKN1004D (Axa Insured) on 08/01/2019
Attachments: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT FORM- TPPD AXA.pdf

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for the acceptance.
We attach herewith a copy of the DV for your necessary action.

Thank you.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: shimin poh <shimin@jhk.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 July 2019 10:07 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Cec: magdelene@jhk.com.sg; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; Kelvin Teo <kelvin@jhk.com.sg>

Subject: Re: STY6803K / SKN1004D (Axa Insured) on 08/01/2019

Dear Khanchna:

Thank you or your offer, we accept, please let us have your dv

Thank You !

Bridget Poh (Shimin)

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1



#01-406 Singapore 408701
Office: 67431913

On Tue, Jul 23, 2019 at 10:03 AM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Our Ref: CC4/ASM19000686/Apb3

Your Ref: SJY6803K

Without Prejudice

(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $6,500.00(all-in).
Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: shimin poh <shimin@jhk.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 12:39 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Cc: magdelene@jhk.com.sg; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; Kelvin Teo <kelvin@jhk.com.sg>

Subject: Re: SJY6803K / SKN1004D (Axa Insured) on 08/01/2019

Dear Kelvin:



Please take over

Thank You !

Bridget Poh (Shimin)

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1
#01-406 Singapore 408701

Office: 67431913

On Wed, Jul 3, 2019 at 2:26 PM shimin poh <shimin@jhk.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Khanchna:

Thank you for your offer however, We have finalized $5750.00 with your surveyor adrian on 12/03/2019 and
submitted the necessary claim.

Please reconsider

We quantify our client claim’s as follows:

Cost of Repair inclusive of GST :$6152.50
Purchase of TP Report inclusive of GST :$2.00
Loss of Rental @$100/day X 5 days : $500.00

Total Claim Amount $6,654.50

Thank You !
Bridget Poh (Shimin)

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd



Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1
#01-406 Singapore 408701

Office: 67431913

On Mon, Jun 17,2019 at 11:21 AM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Our Ref: CC4/ASM19000686/Apb3

Your Ref: SJY4803K

Without Prejudice

(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $4,601.00
2. Loss of Use  (5days x $60.00) $ 300.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 2.00

TOTAL | $ 4,903.00

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other
related claims.”



Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



