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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January, 2019 5:29 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Admin A; SUR; assignments

Cc: claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCX 8998 G AND YOUR INSURED WC 4947 D DATED 

ON 07/01/2019

Categories: HMK

Dear Mei Kwan, 

 

My colleague search wrong car plate, third party insurance is insured with Liberty insurance.  

 

Sorry for inconvienence caused to you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Tony Foong 

Claims Advisor 

 
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd  (Reg No 199902271W) 

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699 

p. +65 6388 2323  d. +65 6768 9828  f. +65 6841 1183  

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg   w. www.audi.com.sg 

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre  281 Alexandra Road   Singapore 159938  p. +65 6836 2223 

http://www.audi.com.sg/sea/brand/sg/audi_promotions/promotions/car_promotions/new-audi-q2-
2017.html 
Email Disclaimer 
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged. 
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system. 
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, 14 January, 2019 2:07 PM 

To: Claims Dept <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; 

assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCX 8998 G AND YOUR INSURED WC 4947 D DATED ON 07/01/2019 

 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 
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We refer to the above matter. 

 

Please provide us search result for WC 4947D. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Claims Dept <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 10 January, 2019 9:27 PM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'Claims Dept' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg> 

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCX 8998 G AND YOUR INSURED WC 4947 D DATED ON 07/01/2019 

Importance: High 

 

Dear all, 

 

Please in known my first email.  

Kindly assist in the liability clearance for the above mentioned case. We propose for 100% direct settlement in our 

clients favour. 

We herein attached the GIA report & Estimate for direct settlement for your reference. 

 

Kindly arrange for survey at 15/01/2019 @ 11AM, Owner waiting. 

 

TP insured with AIG 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

Justin Ee 

Claims Advisor 

 
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd  (Reg No 199902271W) 

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699 

p. +65 6388 2323  d. +65 6768 9911  f. +65 6841 1183  

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg   w. www.audi.com.sg 

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre  281 Alexandra Road   Singapore 159938  p. +65 6836 2223 

Email Disclaimer 
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged. 
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system. 
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you 
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