Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Pei Yee <peiyee@primeautoclaims.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January, 2019 10:14 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: '‘May Chua Hui Chin'; admin-d@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D19000280MFSH ; YOUR REF: SHD2498T
Attachments: img-190116115328.pdf

Importance: High

Expires: Monday, 15 July, 2019 12:00 AM

Dear Sir/ Mdm,

With reference to the above matter.

Please withdraw the claims as both parties had done private settlement. Enclosed herewith the private
settlement agreement as evidence for your kind attention.

Aside to Catherine,

Kindly take note to withdraw the survey. Thank you.

Thank you & Best regards,

Pei Yee

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte. Ltd.
6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927
Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer: This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended
solely for the identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us
immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose
its contents to any person.

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@mesfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, January 11, 2019 9:30 AM

To: PEIYEE@PRIMEAUTOCLAIMS.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims; May Chua Hui Chin

Subject: SURVEYOR APPOINTED; OUR REF : D19000280MFSH ; YOUR REF: SHD2498T

Dear Sir/Madam

PRI Request For SHD2498T Accident Involving SHC7060U On 06-01-2019 AT 09:00:00HRS.



Please find below details for your reference

¢ Claim number : D19000280MFSH

¢ Insured vehicle number : SHC7060U

e Accident date : 06-01-2019

¢ Third-party vehicle number : SHD2498T

e Assignment type : WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED
¢ Surveyor : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

e Officer-in-Charge : MAY CHUA

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

[x] = Virus-free. www.avast.com




