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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 11 January 2019 4:29 PM
To: 'Ler, Bernard-JQ'
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: Paper Adjustment for 800625735
Attachments: LKKAdjustment1a (7).pdf; LKKInspection (8).pdf; LKKInvoice1 (3).pdf

Hi Bernard, 
 
Attached our report & invoice for your necessary action. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 
 

From: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 10 January 2019 5:36 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Paper Adjustment for 800625735 
 
Dear Mei Kwan, 
 
I have requested the coloured photos from TP. 
 
Will revert once they have given us the copy. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Bernard Ler 
AIG 
Complex Claims Examiner 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120) 
 
Tel +(65) 6419 1946  
 
Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg 
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: 10 January 2019 5:35 PM 
To: Ler, Bernard-JQ 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A 
Subject: RE: Paper Adjustment for 800625735 
 
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Dear Bernard, 
 
We refer to our tele-conversation a while ago. 
 
Please forward us the LOD with colour copy to enable us to review the matter. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 9 January, 2019 1:16 PM 
To: 'Ler, Bernard-JQ' <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Paper Adjustment for 800625735 
 
Dear Bernard, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
Dear Mei Kwan, 
 
FYNA. Our Ref: CC7/AIG12024896/Kg2t2w2 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Catherine Chong | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Ler, Bernard-JQ [mailto:Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 9 January, 2019 11:54 AM 
To: assignments@lkkauto.com; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Paper Adjustment for 800625735 
 
Hi LKK, 
 
Kindly assist to conduct a paper adjustment urgently as we have received Writ of Summons for this case. 
 
Do let me know if any extra documents is needed. 
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Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Bernard Ler 
AIG 
Complex Claims Examiner 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120) 
 
Tel +(65) 6419 1946  
 
Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg 
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the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International 
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any 
way from its use. 
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