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VS Singapore. M7, 15000 Singaporne

XIE YUFENG

101 BISHAN STREET 23
H#04-290

Singapore, 570101

Singapore
Custamer No. cvod1947
Quote No SER/QUOMNS00063
QuaoteDate Q9119
Salesperson Claire Chong
Page 1
THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE
Make Model Description Mileage Service Advisor
Volkswagen Passeng Touran 7 1.4 TSI CL EQP 15 Cheang Pearlyn
License No. VIN Initial Registration Sales Advisor
SMF1378T WVGZZZ1TZKWO04600 239M10/18 Claire Chong
Engine Code Labor Type Engine No. Model Code
1N CZD 175734 5T13N2Z
No. Description Qty. UoM Unit Price Amounl
P BAP ALEX LABOUR LABOUR 4 Labor ﬂ'f ° 3.360.00
P BAP ALEX LABOUR TRANSFER DOOR PARTS 1 Labor #2¢ Ba0 00
P BA&P ALEX LABOUR RE+REINSTALLED REAR WSCR 1 Labar w2 540,00
P BA&P ALEX PAINT SPRAY PAINT 5 Labor ,.-“:-;, e« 4,000.00
P B&P DIAG PROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION 1 Tima Un w 480,00
COMPULSORY TO DO AFTER AC
P B&P MECH CHECK WIRE HARNESS. ECU, § 1 Tima Un <~ 280.00
Matl
Sum Labor 9,800.00
P BNAS43021 LIC PL LIG 2 Fieces 251,34
P &GTABO7305 BUMPER REINFORCEMENT 1 Pieces e T B47 53
P STABO7393 BUMPER BRACKET LHS 1 Pieces ’:_ 3590~
P STAHO7394 BUMPER BRACKET RHS 1 Pieces + 35.90%
P STABOTA17T GRU REAR BUMPER 1 Pieces “{f 1.8957 05
P 5TAB0O7453 BUMPER GUIDE LHS t Pieces " v{ 4422/
P STABOT7454 BUMPER GUIDE RHS 1 Pieces g 4422
P STABO7568A 980 REAR LOWER SPOILER 1 Pieces ~A - 48083
P S5TABO7863 REAR CENTER STRIP ! Pieces “mb.~" B3 65
P 5TABZ7025P REAR LID 1 Pieces vl - 163857
P 5TAB53630A DPJ VW SIGN 1 Pieces ~ 43856
Use Predecessor 5TABS3630 DPJ
P 5TAB53687 2ZZ NAME PLATE TOURAN 1 Pieces ~A " 80,49
P D 002000A2 CLEANER 1 Pieces b 136 2T
P D O04680M2 2K GLUE 1 Pieces nA- nﬁ"f 167.31 >
P D 00820002 PRIMER 1 Pieces ke 3051
Sum carried forward 15,562.15
Paymenis to: - BBN - Acc.-No

o dit~ ATA51 )
e

|.[r{;1 phiyo

gur (Hipede e
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VGS Singapore
247

Alexandra Road
158934 Singapaore

Phone No +55 6305 7299
Fax No +H5 6474 3643
E-Mail sarvicel@vw. com sg

VAT Reagistration No. M20098505-2

Tax No

1891014842

Service Quote



Volkswagen Centre Singapore

Service Tax Invoice No. SV19P04525
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Volkswagen Centre Singapore

Service Tax Invoice No. SV18P04525
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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Foo, Chityan <Chityan Foo@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, 30 September 2019 5:36 PM

To: Jia Le {LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: 045635528156 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SLM67425 AND
SMF1378T ON 08/01/2019]

Hi lia le,

We refer to your email dated 30.09.19.
Please note that there is no coverage for this vehicle number SLM67425 accident on 08.01.15.

We will forward repudiation letter to insured to and you may also advise third party (Volkswagen Centre) to re-
direct claims to Dandelion ED Pte Ltd.

Kind regards,

Jimmy Foo

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way, #08B-16, Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1945 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

ityan.f aig.com | www.aig.sg
From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JlaLle@Ikkauto.com)
Sent: Monday, September 30, 2019 3:47 PM
To: Foo, Chityan <Chityan.Foo@aig.com=

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Your ref: 04563552815G [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES 5LM67425 AND SMF1378T ON
08/01/2019]

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

AlG Rel. 04563552815G

LKK Ref: CC3/AIG19000562/T1da3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLM 67425(O1) AND SMF 1378T(TP) ON 08/01/2019

We refer to the above matter,

It is a heod-to-rear collision. Liability is not in our driver’s favour,
1



we did clarity with insured the nature of the accident and he is aware that NCD (if any) would be
affected.

We seek your approval to offer to Third Party repairer. *Volkswagen Centre Singapore™ is as follows: -

Claimed Amount | Revised Amount
. Cost of Repair [w/GST) $ 18.723.00 $ 12.595.73
7. Loss of Rental (Bdays x $80.00) (w/GST) | $  684.80 $ 4B4.80 |8days x
$80.00) (w/GST]
3.L1A/ GIA Search Fee § 745 § 745
Total | § 18.415.25 $13.287.98

**Nadays recommendation for repair+ 1 Weekend = 8days

All the relevant documents had been uploaded in Mefimen.

Kindly let us have your mandate in Merimen.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6740 5792 | email: Jiple@lkknuto.com | fax: 6741-3108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the mntended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, 1t 1s the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from i1s use,



Jia Le (LKK Auto)

#

From: Jia L= (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 1 October 2019 8:38 AM

To: Wong Meiy (VGS - 5G/Singapore)

Subject: RE: DV + OFFER REQUEST FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SMF1378T & 5LMB7425 ON

8.1.19 *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG19000562/ea3

withou! Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLM 47425 & SMF 1378T ON 08/011/201%

We refer fo the obove matter,

There is no coverage for this vehicle number SLM6&7425 accident on 08.01.19.

In view of the above. we have our principal instruction to repudiate and unable 1o look into your client’s
claim.

As such, you may forward the claim to our insured "Dandelion ED Pte L1d" directly.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Chan Jin Le | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pre Lud
Phone: 6740 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bk 51. Paya Uhi Industrial Park, U Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Wong Mely (VGS - 5G/Singapore) [mailto:meiy. wong@vw.com sg|

Sent: Tuesday, 3 September 2019 3:57 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: Cheong Pearlyn [VGS - SG/Singapore); Kong Charmaine (VGS - 5G/Singapore); Foo John (VG5 - 56/Singapore)
Subject: RE: DV + OFFER REQUEST FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SMF1378T & S5LM67425 ON B.1.19 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG19000562/ea3

Dear Jia Le,

Could | have an offer or DV for this settlement.
Appreciated your kind action on this matter, Thanks.

Thanks and Best Regards,

Meiy
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd
247 Alexandra Road



Singapore 159534

Direct ine: +65 6305 7216
Main Line: +85 6305 7299
Main Fax: +65 6474 3643
maiy. Wong @ v .com.sg

https/lwww volkswaagen com sg/

Intamal

From: Wong Mely (VGS - SG/Singapore)

Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 7:51 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>; C5 A Team <cs-
a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Cheoang, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore) <Pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg>; ‘Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore)'
ccharmaine. kong@vw.com.sg>; 'Foo, John [VWG Singapore)' <lahn Foo@vw.com.sg>

Subject: RE: DV + OFFER REQUEST FOR ACCDT INVOLVING 5SMF1378T & 5LM674.25 ON 8.1.19 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG19000562/ea3

Dear Asher,

Could | have an offer or DV for this settlement.
Appreciated your kind action on this matter, Thanks

Thanks and Best Regards

Mely
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159934

Direct line: +65 6305 7216
Main Line: +85 6305 7288
Main Fax +B5 6474 3643
mely. wongE@yw, com. sg

hitps://www volkswagen com sg/




It's not e-mail, if you print it. Think Blue

Inteenal

From: Wong Meiy (VGS - 5G/Singapore)

Sent: Friday, 21 June 2019 1:58 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@|kkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@|kkauto.com>; C5 A Team <¢s-
a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore) <Pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg>; 'Kang, Charmaine (VWG Singapore)
<charmaine. kong@vw.com.sg>; Foo, John (VWG Singapore) <John.Foo@vw.com.sg>

Subject: DV + OFFER REQUEST FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SMF1378T & SLM6742S ON 8.1.19 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG12000562/ea3

Dear Asher,

Could | have an offer or DV for this settlement.
Appreciated your kind action on this matter, Thanks.

Thanks and Best Regards

Mery
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Vaolkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 1594934

Direct line: +65 6305 7216
Main Line: +65 6305 7299
Main Fax +65 6474 3643
mely. WongEvw.com.sg
hitps:/lwww volkswagen.com.sa/




More than
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It's not e-mail, if you print it. Think Elue,

Intermal

From: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore)

Sent: Manday, 25 February 2019 5:48 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng(@lkkauto.com=>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Melkwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Wong, Mely (VWG Singapore) <meiy wong@vw.com.sg>; Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore)
<Pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg>; Goh, Edmund (VWG Singapore) <edmund goh@vw.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; C5 A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SMF1378T & SLM67425 ON 8.1.19 *** LKK
REF: CC3/AIG19000562/ea3

Dear Asher,
LOD attached FYA please

Thanks

Best Regards

Charmaineg Kong
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftarsales

Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Lid
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 158834

Diract line: +65 8305 T176
Main Line +65 6305 7299
Main Fax +65 6474 3643
charmaine. kong@vw.com sg
hilp/fWwWwW. vwW.Com.sg




Back witha |
bold new look.

The new Polo.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mallto:AsherSng@ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 10 January, 2019 6:00 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAutn); Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore)

Cc: Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore); Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore); Goh, Edmund (VWG Singapore); Admin A; CS
A Team

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SMF1378T & SLMB6742S ON 8.1.19 ***

LKK REF: CC3/AIG19000562/eal

o SREIUDICE

SAVEAS TO COSTS
Hi Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter
Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under
BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned

Case.

Please note that this e-mail Is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to
yvour client's vehicle

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the
days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051

in order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate
settlement.

Thank You

Bt Resoycnets
Asher Sng | Cose Hanales
LEE Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phona: AB41-4051 | emall gsherng@kkoulo com | fox: 741-4108

Bk 51, Paya Ubl Indusiricl Park, UbE Avanye e02-25 | S[408933)



From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 10 January 2019 5:57 PM

To: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore) <charmaine kong@vw.com.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
<AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore) <mely.wong@vw.com.sg>; Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore)
<Pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg>; Goh, Edmund (VWG 5ingapore) <edmund.goh@vw.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-
a@|kkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SMF1378T & SLMB7425 ON 8.1.19 *** LKK
REF: CC3/AIG19000562/ea3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVEASTO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC3/AIG19000562 /ead Asher - 6841 6051

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | emall: MeiBwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51. Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, roz-25 | Slqo8a33)

Fram: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore] <charmaine kong@vw.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 10 January, 2019 3:02 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com=>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Wong, Mely (VWG Singapore) <meiy. wong@vw.com.sg>; Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore)
<Pearlyn.cheang@®vw.com.sg>; Goh, Edmund (VWG Singapore) <edmund goh®vw.com.sg>

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SMF1378T & 5LME7425 0N 8.1.19

Hi,

May | know wha Is the claim officer for this case?



Thanks

Best Regards

Charmaine Kong
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Graup Singapore Pte Lid
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 158934

Direct line:  +65 83056 7176
Main Line +B85 6305 7299
Main Fax +65 G474 3643
charmaine kong@vw.com.sg
hittp /fwww_ vw.com sq

Back witha
bold new look.

The new Polo.

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mallto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 9 January, 2019 4:23 PM

To: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore); assignments; Admin A

Cc: Wong, Mely (VWG Singapore); Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore); Goh, Edmund (VWG Singapore)
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SMF1378T & SLM67425 ON 8.1.19

Dear Charmaine,
Appointment confirmed.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: gssignmentsi@ kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Pava Ubid Industrial Pack, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{4080933)

From: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore] [mailto:charmaine kong@vw.com.sg|

Sent: Wednesday, 9 lanuary, 2012 4:18 PM

To: assignments (assignments@lkkauto.com) <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>,
Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkaiito.com>

Cc: Wong, Mely (VWG Singapore) <mely.wong@vw.com sg>; Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore)
<Pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg>: Goh, Edmund (VWG Singapore] <edmund.goh@vw.com.sg>

Subject: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SMF1378T & 5LM67425 ON 8 1.19

Dear Claims,

Sl



Please revert on liability & arrange survey tomorrow at 9.30am. Please confirm

Thanks

Bes! Regards

Charmaine Kong
Insurance Service Advisor

Aftersales

Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Lid
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159934

Direct line: +85 6305 71
Main Line +G65 6305 7299
Main Fax +65 6474 3643
charmaine kong@vw.com. sq
htip:/fwaww VW COIM. 50

Backwitha
bold new look. (\1-.

= e

The new Polo. 1-’/;\‘ :
; \'

From: charmaine.kong@vw.com.sq [mailto;charmaine. kong@vw.com.sal
Sent: Wednesday, 9 January, 2019 3:53 PM

To: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore)

Subject: Scan von MyMFP

Scan from MyMFP



‘TP CLAIMANT : VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE
INSURED POLICY HOLDER : DANDELION ED PTE LTD
TP VEHICLE NUMBER: SMF 1378T

Ol VEHICLE NUMBER: SLM 67425

DATE OF ACCIDENT: 08/01/2019

DATE OF INSPECTION: 10/01/2019

10.01.19 — CASE ASSIGN TO ASHER / EMAIL WORKSHOP LIABILITY CLEAR
17.01.19 - ACTIVATE BKW RENTAL

07.06.19 - RECEIVED TP LOD

07.06.19 — CASE TRANFER TO JIA LE

26.07.19— LETTER SEND TO INSURED TO INFORM CLAIM

09.09.19 - FILE PAS5 TO PREPARE REPORT TO SEEK MANDATE

27.09.19 - FILE RETURN TO HANDLER

30.09.19 - SEEK MANDATE APPROVAL

30.09.19 - AIG JIMMY INFORM THAT INSURED POLICY NO COVERAGE / REPUDIATED
01.10.19 - INFORM VW AIG REPUDIATED CLAIM DUE TO NO POLICY COVERAGE
08.10.19 - VW DISPUTE ON THE REPUDIATION

08.10.19 - AlG JIMMY INFORM WILL SPEAK TO THE BOSS AND REVERT
17.10.19 - AIG JIMMY REQUEST FOR CHRONOLOG



' Mer Sna (LKKAuto)

From: Fog, Chityan <Chityan. Foo@aig.com=>
Sent: Wednesday, 18 December 2019 4:51 PM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: 04563552815G003

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Asher,

We refer to your emall dated 20.11.19,

Please proceed to liaise with Volkswagen on direct settlement basis.
Kind regards,

Jimmy Foo

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way, #0B-16, Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1945 |Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Chityan foo@aig.com | www.alg.sg

From: Asher 5ng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com|

Sent: Wednesday, November 20, 2019 12:13 PM

To: Foo, Chityan <Chityan.Foo@aig.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Your Ref: 04563552815G

This message |5 from an external sender: be cautious with links and attachments.

Hi Jimmy,

We refer to the above matter.

Enclosed the Chronological as per you requested.

Thank You,

Bl Beppoy
Ashet Sng | Caza Hoanole
LKK Aute Consultants Ple Lid
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View Received Message

This mall Is assocated with

*SMF1378T (04563552815G)
[SLMET425]
TF

XIE YUFENG
lam 8 2019 7:00PH
[Candehion ED Phe Ltd]
Volkswagen Centre Singapore

Reply | Reoly All | Mark as Unread | Print Message | Dejets Message | Farward |

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd, (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 30/12/2019 15:35 PM,

From
Ta LKK_HOQ
Subject  Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5$13287.98) - SMF1378T - Claim Handler: Foo, Chit Yan

Approved: 13287.98.

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.

hitps:/isingapore. menmen.comiclaims/index ofmHfusebox=5VCmaillluseaction=dsp_viewdmode=1&inboxia=1606933&Domainld=118I0bJId=6... 12
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Exprass
CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
| Case Hotifnd Est Submitted Adj Assigned LAd] Rpt Ad} Subwmitted Ire Auth'ed Sratus
vy |07 200 2019 e |s$11,771.71 Puriing for-Suny
bt Reg eaadinge | | E“""‘“""""rll view Bax | cancel Case |

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]
Ingured: Dandelion ED Pte Lid, Co. Reg. Mo 2001314301

Main ;

Claimant: XIE YUFENG, ID: SE120814F

s 142019 15:00 - :58
:nm SMFL378T Oute of Loas: ?:‘:nrﬂ- and 10 Days Fram LTA Reg Date (Man 1))
ciaim Type: (TP / 04563552815G FOMCYICVE | (Comprehensive)
Wehicie Reg Palicy No
rmmj SLME741S (Caimanty. | A29102680AVW
Excpss: |
Repairer: Volkswagen Centre Singapore (HQ) 247 Alesandra Road, 159934 Alesandra - Tel: 63057288 |

:':m“,' ALG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. (Express) - Tel: 65-6415-3000 .. [Handled by Foo, Chit Yan] Chityan Foo@alg.com

tun'“'“r‘;'f"' M51G Insurance {Singapore) Pre, Ltd. (HQ) - Tel +&5 6827 7988

Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 . [Handled by MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID] ... [Final Rpt due

{ 118/01/2019]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose Case Mai |

« AIG SG_EXPRESS (10/12/2019); Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (S$13287.98) - SMF1378T - Clalm Handler: Foo, Chit ...
» AIG_SG_EXPRESS (19/12/201%): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$8000.00) - SMF1378T - Claim Handler: Foo, Chit ¥...
+ AlG_SG_EXPRESS {10/09/2013); Alert - Ad] Mandata Revoked - SMFLI78T - Claim Handler: Foo, Chit Yan

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= vigw Al | Search Tasks | create wew Tesx | Complete |

Oue Oste  Priority Typs  Task Group  Subject  Handier Assigned By Campleted On Crested On  Done?
No results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ds... 7/1/2020



Merimen e-Claims Page | of 2
Claim Documents
*SMF1378T (04563552815G)
[SLMBT7425)
T
X1E YUFENG
Jan 8 2019 7:00PM
[Dandelion ED Pte Ltd]
Volkswagen Centre Singapore
Lotters /Correspondences 1 ~] M
No | Finaliesd O LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |jonaf Third Party Express Settiement — Payment Breakdown @ e
Piiobsa/Luinges Dpmpee [1 @
Ne |Relabel/Reorder | LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) T [ Thumbnall| Print|
1 |3/09/19 15:37 | Odemeter Reading 0| cadrc | F
I |30/0%/19 15:37 | Chassls Number 0| ot | A
3 |30/08/19 15:37 Ganeral View 0 eawrs | M
& |30/09/19 1537 | General View @ | wurs | #
5 |30/09/19 15:37 | General View 0| weaws | B
B |30/05/19 1537 | Genersl View 0| adic | B
7 |30/05/19 1537 | General View @ | adwc | W
B |30/09/19 15:37 | General View 0| waews |
5 |30/09/18 15:37 | General View 0| waarws | B
10 |30/09/19 15:37 | General View Q| waws | &
11 |30/09/19 15:37 | General View 0| waiwc | A
12 [30/09/1% 15:37 | General View 0| awrs | A
11 |30/09/19 1537 | General View 0| maws | &
14 |30/09/19 1537 | General View 0| waaws | B
15 [30/09/1915:37 | Genersl View @ | waws | B
16 |30/05/19 15:37 General View 0| ladies | A
17 |30/09/19 1537 | General View O | aawc [ 9
I8 | 30/05/19 15:37 General View 0| weaws | A
19 |30/09/19 15:37 | General View @ | tmcwc | A
20 |30/09/19 15:37 | General View 0| weewc | M4
|21 [30/09/19 15:37 | General View O wedws | M
|22 |30/09/19 15137 | General View @ | loadiec | A
|73 |30/09/19 15:37 | Ganeral View 0| toesrc | M
24 |30/09/19 15:37 | General View 0| teans | B
|25 |30/00/19 15:37 | General View Q| waws | A
36 |30/09/1915:37 | General View 0| tcadirc | A
27 |30/09/19 15:37 | General View 0| eairs | @A
6 |30/09/19 15:37 | Genaral View 0| imeawc | A
19 |30/09/19 15:37 | General View 0| wears | M4
30 |30/09/19 15:37 | General View 0| oarve | A
31 |30/09/19 15:37 General View Q| edw | A
T |I0/09/19 1537 | General View 0| aawe | A
33 |30/09/19 15:37 | Ganaral View O eiws | 2
34 |30/09/19 15:37 | General View 0 | wears | B
35 |30/09/19 15:358 | Reinspection Photo 0| odirs | M
36 |30/09/19 15:38 | Reinspection Photo | oo | &
37 |30/09/16 15:38 | Relnspection Photo 0| tesdwe | A
3 |30/09/19 15:38 | Relnspection Photo O eave | @A
39 |30/09/1915:38 | Reinspection Photo Q| loawc | &
40 |30/09/19 15:38 | Reinspection Phota O

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_d...

7/1/2020



Merimen e-Claims

Page 2 0f 2

Letters/ Correspondences 1 per page v! [}
Mo | Finalired On LMK Auto Consultsnis Pte Ltd [HQ) Thumbnall | Print
| (il
&) |Iyos/19 1538 Relnspection Photo 0 | leadies | B
42 |30/059/1915:38 | Relnspection Photo 0 edws | A
41 |30/09/19 15:38 | Reinspection Photo 0 ueaws | B
44 [10/09/19 15:38 | Reinspection Pheto @ | caaws |
45 |30/09/19 15:38 | Reinspection Photo 0| et | A
A4 | 30/0S/19 1538 Reinspection Photo 0 | Load o
47 |30/09719 1538 | Reinspection Photo 0 | Ledws | B
48 |30/09/19 15:28 Reinspection Photo D | wedws | B
ii_ 30/06/19 15:38 Reinspection Photo ! Load G | M
Is0 |30/09/19 1538 | Reinspection Photo 0 | wadec | M
51 | 3y05/19 1538 Reinspection Photo 0 | adirs | A
51 |30/09/19 15:38 | Reinspection Photo 0| wars B
53 | 30/09/19 15:38 Reinspection Photo n Lona G | B
54 | 30/06/19 15:38 Reinspection Photo n Loag WG E
55 |a0/08/19 15:38 Reinspection Photo g wad G | &
55 | 30/09/19 15:38 Reinspection Photo 0| aaws | BA
Documentation 1 per page «]| &
Mo | Relabal/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |eapon/ae 19z NOTIFICATION FROM WORKSHOP + TP ESTIMATE Load POF

2 |09/01/1915:12 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF

3 1401719 19:32 TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load POF
Li- 18/02/19 0856 RENTAL RECEIPT Load PDF

5 |27/08/19 13:44 LETTER TD O1 Load POF
(6 |37/09/19 13:43 LoD Load POF
|7 |mene 13 LTA SEARCH Load POF
|8  |o7/01/20 13:58 WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF

9 |07/01/20 13:58 AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load PDF

10 |07/01720 13:58 Release Voucher Load POF
| N | Finalized On AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (5G) Thumbnail | Print
1 |10/01/19 11:3% | O GIA REPORT D | Load ror

Documents Checklist

' DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Save | Print |

There are no document checklists configured.

Cur Checkiist Remarks - LKK Aute Consultants Pie Lid

Show Remarks To: L] Handiing Insurer
Fimim | Remarsy ore provade uniess pou dlow 8 1 oflies parfies

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_d... 7/1/2020
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
]'Fthidﬂ No: SLMET425 (Insd veh) Model: VOLKSWAGEN TOURAN 1.4
SMF1378T (TP veh) TSI {A)

| Date of Accident: |08/01/2019

Global Sum Settiement | | [ ] Yes | 1X1 No

Repair Estimate 5| 18,723.00|

Final Repair Cost s 12.585.73

Loss of Use - days ai $0.00 per day

Rental (if any) 5 GB480( 8 days

LTA / GIA Search Fee ' § T.45

Others: $ 0.00

-

Final Satflement Sum $ 13,287.98

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1] YES [X ] NOD (Kindly indicate
lbelow]

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liahility 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:
B} For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (") {%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Volkswagen Centre Singapore il 12,603.18)
2) |BKW Rent-A-Car Pte Ltd E 684,80
3 7 $|
4) |

07 Jan
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2020
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Litd Datea

Plaase attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher: Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;
Medical Report/ Bill {if any)

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc&fuseaction=dsp_do... 7/1/2020
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (cs regne 10as071sar,
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@ikkauto.com:assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC3/AIG18000562/T1DA3Q2

Date: 07/01/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Policy No
Claimant .
Vehicle No : SMF1378T Insured Vehicle No: SLMB742S
Date of Loss: 08/01/2019 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: 04563552815G
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SMF1378T
Make & Modal: VOLKSWAGEN TOURAN, 1.4 TSI (A) Engine No: CZD175734
Reg. Date: 20110/2018 (Man. Year 2018) Chassis No: WVGZZZ1TZKWO04600
Colour Grey Odometer: 4993 km
Engine Capacity: 1385 ¢cc
Market Value/New Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable). Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 215/65 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 215/55 R17
Front Left Side:; Pirelli & mm Rear Left Side: Pirelli 6 mm
Front Right Side: Pirelli 6 mm Rear Right Side: Pirelli & mm
The above values represant the remaring fyre mads deph
'COST OF CLAIMS - Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  DIff %
Parts 7.688.13 6,471.71 1.226.42 15.93
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 9.800.00 5.300.00 450000 4592
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (55} 17,498.13 1. 771.M 572642 3273
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5§) 1,224 87 824 02 40085 3273
Nett Amount (5§) 18,723.00 12,595.73 612727 3273
+ Car Rental (8.0 x $§80.00/day + 7.00% GST) (5§) 684 .80
+ DociSearch Fee (5§) 745

Nett Liability (S%) 13,287.98

INSPECTION

Date of Assignment: 10/01/2019

Date Inspected: 10/01/2019 Inspected Al Veolkswagen Cenire Singapore (HQ)
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 158934

Estimated Peariod of Repair; 6.0 days

Adjuster: MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID Manager: CHAN JIA LE

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ge... 7/1/2020
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NOTE: This report represents our findings af the time and place of inspection stated hersin. Such inspection haa been carried oul fo the best of our
knowiedge and ability but &y ofher fabdity under any other circurmsiances iy heraby axpressly sxciuded

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=ge... 7/1/2020
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *LIC PL LIG Mot Necessary 251.34FS *.FS
2 1 *BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Nol Necessary B847.53F5 *F8
i 1 *BUMPER BRACKET LHS Not Necessary 3580F5 *-F5
4 1 *BUMPER BRACKET RHS Mot Necessary 35.80FS “F5
5 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformed 1,857.05F5 *1,857.05FS
6 1 *BUMPER GUIDE LHS Not Necessary 44.22F5 *-FS
7 1 *BUMPER GUIDE RHS Not Necessary 44 22F5 *-FS
8 1 *REAR LOWER SPOILER Cut 460.83F5 *460.83F35
| 1 *REAR CENTER STRIP Necessary B3.65FS *B3B5FS
10 1 *REAR LID Bent 1,638.5TF5 *1B3B5TFS
11 *VW SIGN Necessary 138.58FS  *13858FS
12 1 *NAME PLATE TOURAN Necessary B0.49FS *80 48FS
13 1 *CLEAMNER Necessary 136.27F5 *136.27FS
14 1 *2K GLUE Nol Necessary 167.31FS *-FS
15 1 *PRIMER Mecessary 3051F5 *30.51FS
1w 2 *APPLICATOR MNecessary 22 24F5 *22 24FS
7 1 *ACTIVATOR Necessary 27 BAFS *27 BAFS
1B 1 *PUSHBUTTON Distoried 1.142.14FS  *1,142.14F5
19 1 *‘REAR W/SCREEN TRIM LH Necessary 296.59FS *2086.58FS
20 1 ‘REAR W/SCREEN TRIM RH Necessary 206.59FS 206 50FS
21 1 *REAR NUMBER PLATE PACKING Dented 26.09F5 *26.08FS
2 1 *1K ADHES Necessary 39.73F8 *39.73FS
23 2 NUT Necessary 456FS *4 5BFS
24 1 ‘B&P NUMBER PLATE Dentad 80.00F5 *B0.0OFS
F=Franchisa parl S=Spcheit

Total Parts (S§) 7.698.13 647171

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=ge... 7/1/2020
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Recommended Miscellaneous Iltems

There are no new miscellancous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No  Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 LABOUR New 3,360.00 1.680.00

2 TRANSFER DOOR PARTS MNew £840.00 420.00

b, RE+REINSTALLED REAR WSCR New B40.00 840.00

4 SPRAY PAINT New 4 000.00 1,600.00

5 PROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION COMPULSORY TO DO New 480.00 480.00

AFTER AC

(1 CHECK WIRE HARNESS ,ECU.S New 2B80.00 280.00

Gross Labour Cost (S§) 9,800.00 5,300.00

Report was unsubmitied during this prinl-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.comy/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=ge... 7/1/2020



