Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

ONG U LI <llsng@lonpac.com>
Wednesday, 15 January 2020 12:42 PM
Jia Le (LKK Auto)
MT_Claim_SG
RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving YN5773A (Ol : LPC -
18/19/19/VC00/021306) AND GBD4579B (TP : LKK REF - CC6/LPC19000545/Kdb3)
on 05.01.2019 [External General]

Lonpac External - General

Dear Jia Le
Pls proceed.

Regards,
Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse

Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax:

The all

NEW

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [maiito:Jiale @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 7 Jlanuary 2020 3:43 PM

To: ONG LI LI

65) 6296 2706

lonpac.com.sg

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN5773A (O : LPC - 18/19/19/VC00/021306) AND GBD45798 (TP
LKK REF - CC6/LPC19000545/Kdb3) on 05.01.2019

Lonpoc Ref: 18/19/19/VC00/021306
LEK Ref: CCA/LPC)9000545/Kdb3

Diear Sirs/Madam.

we refer to the above malter.

we have highlighted to your good office on 22/01/201% of Third-Party's request o do Direct Settlement with

our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

Insured reversed and collided onto third party vehicle. Liability is not in our driver's favour.

summary to offer to third party repairer. “CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD" is as follows: -

Claimed Amount

Revised Amount

1. Cost of Repair (w/G5T] $6.395.22 $ 2,338.45
2. Loss of Use |1day x $80.00) $ B0.00 $ 80.00 [1day x $80.00)
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 800 $ 800

Total | § 648322 $2426.45




**0ldays recommendation for repair.
kelevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval,

“Wishing you ¢ Happiness and Prosperity New Year”

Best Regards,

Chan Jin Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5702 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | §{408031)

From: ONG LI Ll <llong@lonpac.cam:>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2019 12:38 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@|kkauto.com>

Ce: MT_Claim_5G <mt claim{@lonpac com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Poh Kin |[LKKAuto)
<pohkin@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YNS773A (01 ; LPC - 18/19/19/VC00/021306) AND GBD4579B (TP
: LKK REF - CC6/LPC19000545/Kfb3) on 05.01.2019

Dear Shu Pei
Please see our Insured’s GIA report attached.

Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

-

| =

The all ©%% lonpac.com.sg

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2019 9:59 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; ericwoo; ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_5SG; Admin A; Poh Kin {LKKAuto)

Subject: Direct Settiement - Accident Involving YN5773A (OI : LPC - TBA) AND GBD4579B (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/LPC19000545/Kfb3) on 05.01.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle GBD 45798 at M/s Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer
proposed for a direct settlement.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Enclosed for your perusal is:



TP's GIA report
Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.

Our case handler in-charge is Poh Kin and he can be contacted at DID: 6841-2132.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupe|@®|kkauto.cam | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



e L

/

-
Fl

CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD

DI Blk 1019, Yishun Industrial Park A, #01-374/382, Singapore 768761
Tel : 67556142 Fax : 67557719

Ermmil: chmotorf@singnet.com.sg

Your Ref :

THE MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT
LONPAC INSURANCE BERHAD

Singapore

Dear Sir / Madam

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

T/ACCIDENT INVOLVING M/V GBD4579B & YNST73A ON 05/01/2019
ALONG SERVICE RD BESIDE BLK 158D RIVERVALE CRESCENT.

We are authorized by the owner of GBD45798 for his/hertheir above claims.

As you are the insurer of YN5773A, we therefore wish to seek your compensation.

Quantum of the claims as follow -

COST OF REPAIR . 8§
LossOFUSE  (Ix#80[)y) . sg
HIRE OF VEHICLE . 5§
SURVEY FEE . 5§
LTA SEARCH . 8
GIA SEARCH . 5§
OTHERS . S8

ss

233B.45 (As recommended by your appointed surveyor)
80.00
0.00
0.00
8.00
0.00
0.00

2426.45

Copies of all the relevant documents are enclosed.

Please advise settlement within ten (10) days.

Thank you.

Yours Faithfully,
L ON




Re:

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION
(FOR PROPERTY DAMAGE CLAIM ONLY)

Motor Insurance Claim GBD45798

in respect of the traffic accidenton  5/1/2019
at/along Services Road Beside Blk 158B Rivervale Crescent

I'We 800 Super Waste Management Pte Ltd
NRIC 198601155H of 17A Senoko Way  Singapore 758056

owWTer nrm“tur vehicle GﬂD‘ﬁ?gB : mmd b}, m m i.nsurm
Co-operative Ltd under policy no. 5073860219-03

hereby authorise M/s CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD on Blk 1019 Yishun
Industrial Park A #01-374 Singapore 768761, to act as my/our representative in

my/our claim against the owner /driver of motor vehicle TNS773A in respect
of the above-mentioned accident.

I/We further authorise that any payment due to me/us from the aforesaid claim is to be
directed to my/our abovenamed representative.

And I/'We hereby indgmnify my/our abovenamed representative against any claim

and/or damage which may arise from any action taken on my/our behalf

I/We affirm all the above by my/our signature below.

Signed :
Date




LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO : 18/1919/VC00/021306
DATE : IS JANUARY 2020

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We, 800 SUPER WASTE MANAGEMENT PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from
M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of YN 5773A the sum of
Singapore Dollar Two Thousand Four Hundred Twenty-Six and Cents Forty-Five
Only ($2,426.45) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all
property losses competent 1o me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
in respect of all property losses sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to
become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident involving GBD
4579B and YN 5773A on 05 January 2019 along SERVICE RD BESIDE BLK 158B
RIVERVALE CRESCENT.

| /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/ NG NAM BEE MARKETING PTE LTD AND/OR PNG AIK HONG)
against all claims and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our
behalf in respect of the said accident.

I'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to CHENG HOE
MOTOR PTE LTD.

I'We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of

liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured's recovery action.

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

800 Super Waste Management Pte Ltd

Name of vehicle owner Date



Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Bk 1019, Yishun Industral Park A #111-374/382, Smgapore ThETo |
TEL 67556142 (YI5) FAX: 67S577190Y15) Email: chmoton@singnecom.sg
GST201001158F ROA NO-20100] J38E

TAX INVOICE
M/S: LONPAC INSURANCE BERHAD
300 BEACH ROAD NO: CLRI9I234
#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSE Date: 24 Oct 2019
SINGAPORE 199555 Policy No: 5073860219-03
TEL: 62507388 FAX: 62963767 Veh Reg No: GBD45TYB
ATTN: Motor Claim Department Make/Model: MITSUBISHI CANTER
FEAOIBRISDEB
WS Ref: TP/LONPAC/YS Job No: JC1600779
Claim Type: Third Party
Accident Date:  05/01/2019
TP Veh Reg No: YN5ST73A
_ PAGE:!
Description | Quantity |  List Price Amount
5§ 53
To Supply all replaced parts, all necessary and agreed labour & I PC 55§2,185.47 5% 2,185.47
miscellaneous charges.
{As recommended by your appointed survevor)
Total 558 2.185.47
Add GST @ T 152.98
Total Amount pavable S8 2.338.45

oe Motor Pie Lud

E&OE AUTHORISED SIGNATURE



A.C. SYED & PARTNERS

ADVOCATES & BOLICITORS
COMMISBIONER FOR OATHS

101A UPPER CROSE STREET, #13-23 PEOPLE'S PARK CENTRE, SINGAPORE D58358
TEL : 8838 7411 & FAX : 0534 1014

TO ! CHENG HOE MOTOR PTELTD

laws no: oYY 2018

YOUR REF:;

OUR REF : AGS.CH.LTA2018 (JAN 2019)

DATE : 18219

W“M“hﬂ.hnhh“_“ﬁ-m“
firnoEncs prepemion memnadion of documaenta reisng fheres: CoTEspondance. aiendance, pertsl, eenons
cals, searches ol all other incidentsl works not apecially marBianed hersin © ersble us fo ooty oul the work

strusisd o us Inchusive of &l acvios,
END TP NO. CHM DOA
1 3172019  SKO6789B SKB2413Z  29/122018
2 57172019 YNS9OSJ SKW3T0SD /172019
3 712019  BLLISSOC GBHEM4C  S/1/2019
4 M2019  YNSTISA GBDMSTSB  s12019 ~
5 8172019  SKN2243B SBGAZT 2172019
6 V172019  SKA3SSIT GBH794SL 6172019
7 #1/2019  EDIGOBOD SKRS939)  &/12019
8 10172019  SGY7794G GBFIMSU  9/172019
9 10172019  YM6240U OBPSES4A  31/1272018
10 6112019  SLC3765Z SLWORGSZ  &/172019
1 6172019  SIGTT98E  GZAOTTH /172019
12 10172019  SKR48318 SLLS4SIG  9/1/72019
13 10172019  SLZSEITK BGSYTSIT  10/1/2019
14 11172019  GY4960M SIQBISOZ  9/1/2019
15 11172019  SIQ8I90Z GY4960M  $/1/2019
16 /12018  GBFB238Z GBBAT96K 14/172019
17 137172019  GBAR20X SIY2IBSL 12172019
18 167172019  BKS4033Z SKAZ485E  16/1/2019
19 16/12019  SKT9SIP GBGG4SSG 15172019
20 16/1/2019  SMFBS32T SFU2122L 12/1/72019
21 1612019  SKN6M7Y SOC2833B 1812019
22 17/1/2019  SGM94278 BITS644K  5/1/2019
23 2112019  SFES8068 SKJES19Z  19/172019
24 21172019  BIAMG29L SKS6656M  20/1/2019
25 2112019  8IPBOITP  SLP626BG  21/172019
Sub-total o/f 320000
Mh. A & PARTNERS
IADVOCATES & SOLICITORS
SINGAPORE
Wa“hdﬁhhﬂummhm
disharsements comittad berein.
E&OE
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