Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 12 November, 2019 1:43 PM

To: Chich KweeKeong

Cc: Admin A; May Liew; Johnson Poon; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: GBH 2545R_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBH 2545R AND SHC
4372P ON 05.01.19 LKK REF CC3/AIG19000530/Jha3

Attachments: WhatsApp Video 2019-01-07 at 18.47.24.mp4

Without Prejudice

Dear Mr Chich,

We refer further to the below email.

We noted that you help our Insured filed a TP claim.
Kindly advise update of the claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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" Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Johnson Poon [mailto:johnson.poon@fulcoleasing.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July, 2019 11:18 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Chich KweeKeong; May Liew

Subject: RE: Your Ref: GBH 2545R_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBH 2545R AND SHC 4372P ON 05.01.19 LKK REF
CC3/AIG19000530/Jha3

Hi Vic,
Attached herewith the video footage from our vehicle GBH2545R front camera.

Please note that we’re lodging a 3" party claim for this case.



Kindly liaise with our Mr Chich , workshop manager of Fulco Autocare Pte Ltd at Mobile 93299930 should you
require any clarification on this matter.

Thank you.

Kind regards,

Johnson Poon | Manager

HP: 9838 7928

Email: johnson.poon@fulcoleasing.com.sg

—'\? Add: 22 Ubi Road 4, Fulco Building, Singapore 408617

‘\\@ m:ﬂ Tel: 6743 6266 | Fax: 6420 6328

LEASING PTE LTD Website: www.fulcoleasing.com.sg
DISCLAIMER -This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the addressed
individual or entity. If you are not the intended recipient you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this email or files
If you have recelved this email by mistake, please notify us immediately by return email and deleting the original message

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 5 July, 2019 9:47 AM

To: Johnson Poon <johnson.poon@fulcoleasing.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Chich KweeKeong <kweekeong.chich@fulcoautocare.com.sg>; May Liew
<mayliew78@gmail.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: GBH 2545R_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBH 2545R AND SHC 4372P ON 05.01.19 LKK REF
CC3/AIG19000530/Jha3

Hi Johnson,
We would like to request for a copy of the video footage.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Johnson Poon [mailto:johnson.poon@fulcoleasing.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 4 July, 2019 5:32 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Chich KweeKeong; May Liew

Subject: RE: Your Ref: GBH 2545R_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBH 2545R AND SHC 4372P ON 05.01.19 LKK REF
CC3/AIG19000530/Jha3




Dear Vic,
We are the Owner of GBH2545R.

Please advise what copy of document you want from us?

Kind regards,

Johnson Poon | Manager

HP: 9838 7928

Email: johnson.poon@fulcoleasing.com.sg

Add: 22 Ubi Road 4, Fulco Building, Singapore 408617

@Fﬂ:ﬂ Tel: 6743 6266 | Fax: 6420 6328

LEASING PTE LTD Website: www.fulcoleasing.com.sg

DISCLAIMER -This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the addressed
individual or entity. If you are not the intended recipient you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this email or files
If vou have recelved this emall by mistake, please notify us immediately by return email and deleting the original message

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 4 July, 2019 1:52 PM

To: Johnson Poon <johnson.poon@fulcoleasing.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Your Ref: GBH 2545R_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBH 2545R AND SHC 4372P ON 05.01.19 LKK REF
CC3/AIG19000530/Jha3

Without Prejudice
Dear Johnson,
We refer to the subject matter.

Please be informed that we are acting on behalf of our mutual client, the owner of vehicle GBH 2545R and his insurer
M/s AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.

We received a claim against his policy and we would like to request for a copy for our further action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not



read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



