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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Wednesday, 9 January 2019 9:20 AM
Jocelyn Ng; SUR

RE: MV - SGVB828C; DOA: 08/01/2019

Dear Jocelyn,

The market value of SGV 8828C is $78K-$82K (Estimated) as at Jan20l9

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, UbiAvenue 7,#02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Jocelyn Ng <jocelyn_ng@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 January 2Ot9 6:01 PM

Subject: MV - SGV8828C; DOA: O8/OL/2O1,9

Dear att,

Ptease hetp to advise on the market value of the above mentioned vehicte.

Thank you

F+ave a gYeatweed aheadl

Jocelyn Ng

Executive, Ctaims Services
D: +65 65942539 | F: +65 62257402 I iocelvn_nq@sq.msiq-asia.com
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ALPHARD MOONROOF CVT

White

2072

Engine No.: 242H948321

Chassis No.: JTESD21H2O8255O4O

Maximum Power Output: 125.0 kW (167 bhp) 
:

Open Market Value:

Original Re_qistration Date: I2Dec2O72
First Registration Date: t2Dec2072
Transfer Count: 0

: ActualARF Paid: 
r Deraits 

$47'8o7'oo 
49c)lntended PARF Rebate Details / t - /

: PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

7tDec2022

$31,074.00
lntended COE Rebate Details

r COE Expiry Date: I1,Dec2O22

10

:$:;:i"q(Years! :
, COE f,ebate Amount: $35,401.00

.lotal Bebatel\m.gynt $66,475.00
The information contained herein is correct as at 08 Jan 2019
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> Back to OneMotoring

Chassis No, :

frgpeflglt:
Engine No.:

; Vehicle Make: TOYOTA

Vehicle Model: __ALPHAT_D 
Mo-,o*ry-$_o_9f._9[

lTEG?21H2082s:s,O4o
Petrol

2A2H948321

Engine Capacity: 2362cc

Maximum Power Output: 125.0 kW ( 167 bht)
Maximum Laden Weight: 2505 kg

: Road tax, including Over Payment (if any), of a vehicle will follow the vehicle to the new registered owner when its ownership is being transferred.
Amount Payable

AmountBeforecsT GSTAmount AmountAftercsT

Total Amount Payable: 25.00

You may print this page for reference.
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