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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 17 December 2019 4:42 PM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Re: Accident between EJ 8686G [TP] & SKJ 9933R [ AIG]  on 03/01/2019

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Khanchna 
 
Based on Merimen records, the case has reverted from Third-party to Reporting Only. 
 
Hence, we have proceeded to close the file at our end. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
Caroline 

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, 17 December 2019 4:38 PM 
To: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg> 
Cc: 甯珺 © <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Accident between EJ 8686G [TP] & SKJ 9933R [ AIG] on 03/01/2019  
  
[External Mail] This email originated from outside of the organisation; be careful with requests, attachments and links.  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
We would like to know whether your client is still pursuing the claim or not. 
  
Please confirm. 
  
Thank you. 
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from 
this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
  
“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020" 
  
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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