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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 7 January 2019 3:14 PM

To: ‘assignments’; Chunni Motor

Subject: FW: Accident involving veh no: SHC 324E & GU 4145X on 01.01.13
Attachments: TP REPAIR ESTIMATE & SAS REPORT- SHC324E.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir,
We refer to your email of 04.01.19.

We will be assigning M/s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to survey your client’s vehicle and propose direct settlement
with quantum to be agreed.

Aside to LKK,
Please refer to the email below with attachment and proceed to survey the third party vehicle.

Kindly acknowledge receipt. Thank you.

Regards,

Elaine Cheong
Executive {Motor Claims)
Claims Departrment

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tawer

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID 6385 6530

Fax: 6224 7478 /6224 7175

Email. elaine cheong@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www sg.cntaiping.com

AN SARY
fu Simpapere cinee 1938

From: Chunni Motor [mailto:chunnimotor @gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 4 lanuary, 2015 5:11 PM

To: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: Re: Accident involving veh no: SHC 324E & GU 4145X on 01.01.19

Dear Sir,

We appoint Henry Ng



Thank you

Regards,
Chunni Motor Work P/L

On Fri, Jan 4, 2019 at 5:03 PM Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong(@sg cntaiping.com=> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear All,

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's vehicle jointly with your client/your
motor workshop, We propose to use one of the following motor surveyors to conduct the joint pre-repair survey
as a single joint expert.

TAY BENG HEE

DERECK OH SIONG WEE

SEE CHEW SENG

MOHD FADHILAH BIN OSMAN
XING QUO QIANG

KENMNETH KONG

SIMON HO

CHUA WELIIE

MARCUS CHUA

HEMNRY NG

Please let us know within two(2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert.

You may select one of the listed motor surveyors and we will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out
by the single joint expert.

Regards,

Elaine Cheong
Executive (Motar Claims)

Claims Departrment

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079904

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6385 6530

Fax: 6224 747816224 7175



Email: elaine.cheong@sg cntaiping.com

Website: www sqg cntaiping.com

I'.I.\ I':\Illl"l:"l
lu Sispapare simee [ 938

From: Chunni Motor [mailto:chunnimotor@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 4 January, 2019 4:25 PM

To: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: Fwd: Accident involving veh no: SHC 324E & GU 4145X on 01.01.19

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Chunni Motor <chunnimotor(@gmail.com>
Date: Fri, Jan 4. 2019 at 11:14 AM

Subject: Fwd: Accident involving veh no: SHC 324E & GU 4145X on 01.01.19
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept(@sg.cntaiping.com>

From: Chunni Motor <chunnimotor@gmail.com=>
Date: Thu, Jan 3, 2019 at 9:09 AM
Subject: Accident involving veh no: SHC 324E & GU 4145X on 01.01.19

To: Claims Dept of CT] <claimsdept(@sg.cntaiping.com>

Dear Sir/Mdm,
We refer the above mentioned matter.
We enclosed herewith the relevant documents for your necessary action.

In line with the new protocol, kindly provide us with the list of surveyors on your panel for assessment of the damaged accident taxi
involved.

Kindly arrange to survey in AMK Autopoint, Soon Hock Motor#01-05/06,

Should vou have any queries, please do not hesitate to contact Ms Lynn or Ms Irene at 65425119 or 6542 7162

Thank you for your Kind assistance.
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SUBTTED BY, Cathering Por Moy Jaan

Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting
Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 03/01/2019 07:37

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE
1. Fleasa raport correctly tho delalla of the accidont o speod up thoe Elaims procoss.

2 This Form must ba camgietod by the Pelicyheidor andior the Autharised Diriver,
1. |nfsrmalion provided must ba 85 Wnuthiul and sccurale as posalbla, Any wilful misrepresenintion o withalding of mialaral facts may aliow insurance companies o

repudiate policy llablliry.

4, Tha laaus and sceeptance of this Form by [nsurance comparniss

5. Any falso ro

s et an admisslan af pelicy labllity &n o pad of the insurance COMpanias

ring may bo reforrod to the Polleo for Inveatigotlon,

G. This rapart will ba lorwardad by ke insurars of the GIA Records Managamant Cantra sstabiished by (e Gengral insurancs Assoekation of Singapere (GLA| fer

archiving ard thal coples of this regart will, fara

foo, bo mada availablo upon application by intaresiad parties.

7, By the lodgemant of this reapa to the Insurems, you heteby congent 1o the archiving of this repan ol the canire and te coples & the ropen boing mado avalable

alaresakd,

Data Of Raport
Date Of Accidant
Exact Location Of Accidant

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

03/01/2018 0731

01/01/2018 10:50

JOO CHIAT RD TWDS KOON SENG RD .

CountryfSiate of Loss SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
Vehlcle Raglstration Number SHC324E
Insured/Policyhalder
Marme Of Hegistered Owner CITYCAR PTE LTD
Co Reg No 1895028396
Email Address FLEETSAFETY@CDGTAXL.COM.SG

Mobile Phone No
Altarnative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufaciurer

hpdel

Exact Purpose for which vehlcle was being used al
{ime of accldent

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicla?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken
Vahicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Coempany
Type O Coverage

Fleet Policy

Palicy Number

Cover Mole Number

Driver

Wamea of Drivar

NRIC Mo

Cate OF Birth

Qcoupatien

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gendar

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number
EMail Address

CFFICE-65508768

HYLIMNDAI
SONATA

MO

THIRD PARTY
TAXI

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD
THIRD PARTY FIRE AND/OR THEFT
YES

D-1808BB33TMFSH

CHONG MAM

52598074C

02/10/1961

CUTDOOR

13/01/1983

35 YEARS AND 11 MCNTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-90308074

ZHENGBOTANAMEYAHDO.COM

Page 1al17



-1=19114:3C nunrii Motor Works Pte Lt

(Wl
(]

1 AQCK g & i

Address 108 #07-26 ALJUNIED CRESCENT
Posleade 380108

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If No. Relatianship of the Driver with the Insured ~ OTHER - TAXI DRIVER

Yehlele Regisiratien Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle = .

Ingurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident SIDE SWIPE
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accldent? NO
Mumber of vehicles (Inchuding gwn vehicle)

involved In the accident 1
Wae any body Injured in the Accldent? NO
Was any Injured conveyed o hospital by NO
ambulance?

Was any other matarial or proporty damaged? YES
| have been approached by unknown person(s) NO
galicltinglelfering accident clalms asslstance.

Number of Passengers {Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action

Was the accldent reported to the police? NO
If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notica of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes,against whom?

Clreumstances of Accldent

SEE ATTACH.

Attachment(s)

Ara accident photos available for allachment? YES

Was there any video caplured by Car Camera? YES
Remarks/ Reasons: -

Was there any audio recarded? NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROFERTY 1
Vehicle Registration Number G4 145X

\ahicle Make/ModeliColour
Datailz Of Properties

Vehicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Name of Driver GOVINDARAJAN VIMAL RAJU
MRIC/Passport Number GERR4TE10R

Contact Number 94479837

Address

Pastcada

Insurance Company Name
Wature Of Damage FRT RHT
N, Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 2 ol 17



‘14130 Chunri Motor Works Fte LTO Scon Hook i s

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1.
2.
i

Pleaze report correctly the detalls of the accident to speed up the claims process.

This Form must be completed by the Palicyholder and/or the Authorised Driver,

Infarmation provided must be as truthful nd accurate ible. Ary wilful misrepresentation ¢r withholding of material
facts may allow insurance companies o repudiate palicy liabllity.

. The Issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance cam panies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance

companies.

Any false reporting may be referrgd to the Police for investigation,

. The report will be forwarded by the Insurers of the GlA Recards Management Centre gstabllshed by the General Insurance

association of Singapore (G1A] for archiving and that coples of this report will far a fee be made available upon application by
Interested parties,

8y the lodgment of this report te the Insurers, you heraby consent to the archiving of this repert at the centre and 1o coples of
the report being made available aforesaid.

_ Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act {POPA)

| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

{a) My Insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Assoclation of Singapore (“GLA") may/are permitted to collect, use,
discloze and/eor process my personal data/personal information set out In this [form] and any other personal information
provided by me or possessed by my insurer {collectively the “Persenal Info rmatlon”) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Infermation to all insurer(s) who have Insured vehlcle(s) involved in this accident (2!l insurer(s) who have Insured
vehicle(s) involved In this accldent shall be collectively referred to as the "Insurers”), the nsu rers’ lawyers/law firms, the

Monetary Authority of Singapere and any relevant government agency/autherity [such as the police), for the purpose(s)
of «

[I) processing, handling and/or dealing with my clalms including the settlgment of the claims and any necessary
investigatlons relating te the clalms;

(i) Investigating the accident and/or my clalms;
(iii) carrying out and/or dealing with my Instructions or resp onding to any enquirles by me;

{iv) administering my claims (Including the mailing of correspondence, statements, Invaices, repors or notices 1o me,
which could Involve disclosure of certaln personal data 2bout me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of envelapes/mall packages); and/or

{v] complying with applicable law in administering, processing, handling andfer dealing with my claims.{collectively the
"Purpases’)

(b) all Insurer|s) who have intured vehlciels) invohved in this ascident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitied
10 collect, use, disclose and/or process my Persenal Information for ene or more of the above Purposes; and

{c) my Personal Information may/ean be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to thelr third party service providers or

agents(including thelr lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapare, for one or more of the above Purposes.

(d] my Personal Information will also be collected and uead 1o compile clalms history for the purpose of fraud detection,
investigation and management In present and all future clalms.

{e) the Informatlon so collected under {d) above may be shared [ disclosed:

(i} to allinsurers and/or any other third parties that assistin evaluating, investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencles as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

[il) forcomplying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

CITYCAB PTE LTD

0, REG. NO, 1885028386 =

» A

Policyholder's Signature
Date & Time:

(If driver is not the policyholder) Name: ‘Ljeﬂ‘-

pare&Time: g 2 JAN 2089 NRIC/FIN No.:
@ 1510 h& /

Drlver's Signature Reporting Centre Peg‘;gm el's Tgnature
g
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
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CITYCAB PTE LTD
CO. REG. NO. 199502838G

1/We declare the foregoing particulars are true in every respect,

Polieyholder's Signature

DECLARATION
Date & Time:

sonnel
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Reperting

Name:

Driver's Signature

{If driver is nat the pelicyhalder)

1

MRIC/FIN No,:
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CHUNNI MOTOR WORK PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE*
VEHICLE MO @ SHC 324E

MAKE

MODEL

: HYUNDAIL SONATA

DATE : 2.01.2019
TEL : 65425119

FAX = 6542 6039 ChinaTaiping

Parts Description/ Labour
Bonnet e
Bonnet Hinge (LH/RH) i+

Front Bumper Cover oAtstovdd

Front Bumper Sponge ™!

Front Bumper Reinforcement ®lw

Front Bumper Bracket Top (LH) =

Front Bumper Protector (LH) ¢4

Front Bumper Bracket (LH) =

Headlamp Suppent Panel AsSY Dats &

Headlamp (LH) ‘'l

Front Fender (LH) B,

Front Fender Shield (LH)} sy ™

Battery Tray "

Front Door (LH) Bwc

Front Door Gear / Regulator (LH) # ¥*F

Front Door Key Lock Set (LH) -

Front Door Quter Handle (LH) ¢4

Front Door Mirror (LH) Ve —

Front Door Power Motor =«

Front Door Protector (LH) bl

Door Centre Pillar Outer (LH) D »vate r

Rear Door (LH) Dhite &

Rear Door Protector (LH) w1

Front Wheel Rim (LH) =i «Ac At A

Front Wheel Hub Cap (LH) v € ot

Front Wheel Bearing & Devna

Front Shock Absorber (Assy) (LH) 2 Auvhodvdl
Front Shock Absorber Mounting (LH) b

Front Shock Absorber Fork (LHLZR AusvhuArA
Front Suspension Upper Arm (LH) Z Aistedr &
Front Drive Shaft (LH) s iy SAiatovith
Rack & Pinion Assy bt 1D e~

STG Tie End 22 &l stk

Stabilizer Bar & SuanArh

Stabilizer Bar Bush (LH)

Stabilizer Bar Link # Aoy A

Stabilizer Bracket % iy

Front Suspension Lower Arm (LH) Z &l istedrd
Knuckle Arm (LH) & Aurodr b

Engine Under Cover i

Engine Crossmember = what oy sladeek

ABS Sensor =

Wiring-Engine ¢ N9 A b
Wi_ring-F'mnl-i? Iowsir hyd e

Ameunt
2,265.90
175.00
544.50
136.30
504.10
22.40
29.20
24.60
1,023.00
1,388.00
593.00
174.90
52.00
2,256.40
625.00
186.50
37.00
670.00 | %
42500 | X
7825 |v—
252780 | «—
220110 | —
56.90 | ¥
325.30 | —
145.00 | —o
540.50
14220 | €
108.80 | X
20330 | & —
240.00
1,030.80 |3% —
2,003.00 | & —
66.50
252.30 | & —
16.40 | X
78.30 | X «—
24.00 | X
685.20 | L~
558.60
334.60 | X
2,143.70 A —
250.50 | ¢
3,326.00 [96 —
1.960.80 [ L—
3,243.00 | —

c Unit Price

g 87.50

CF O T Ty

WMMMU‘rmiﬂMMEﬂMi.r')l'.ﬂéﬂ"u"iM'Lv"lHMMV‘IHMWMMMMMWWMMWHMHM?}HMMMMM
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SHC 324E
‘ gw Parts Description/ Labour Type + Unit lﬂn Amount
SUB TOTAL § 33,965.65
LESS 1&‘1‘0 o 5 61-?93- ] 3
2,04% 9.5
DISCOUNTED TOTAL $ 27,172.52
DU 1-8%
Front Door City Cab Logo (LH) o 3 75.00 |Nett L~
Rear Door Tel No. Sticker (LH) He S 10.00 [Nett =
Front Tyre (LH) Sc $  216.00 |[Nert *
New Battery i Q5-oY $  207.00 |Nett X
§  508.00
Labour Charge
Panel Beating $ 180000 q::rb[ -
Spray Painting Charge $ 1,600700 Sfau\r
Wiring Charge S 10660 | 30|~
Tuff Kote 3 150:60 | 4o~
Towing Charge 5 50.00 |~
Transfer of Door b 12000 | §  2406:60 'lﬂ} -
Remove/Refix Undercarriage (FRT) 5 20000 [ 1,5331._.
FRT Wheel Alignment 3 12660 | Lo l-—
Remove/Refix Aircon & Refill Gas ?%uﬁ 50 § 150,00 | =
Remove/Refix Dashboard §  456:00 M 15y -
Remove/Refix Fuse Box S 1B6-60 53} e
TOTAL LABOUR $  5,040.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL

25 1Hooo| 1

5 317052 |

Jeki A

LKK Auto Consultants hence rfoti
the Repairer of the fl_ lowing:
& Tore
= To digel
» Parta
® Third

Ll

urvey beforefafie
play damaged part(s) durin
Ces are subiact to o

ACi Py edped by Repairer

Spray .;a:r'.'.m
rgsurvey
onfirmation

*-’E-Uf--r* on & “Without Py

Mo il 4 miodific i afl
o Suppiprantary i st |
% subject to final approval f

Bjudice” bass

resufveyed pnd
ufnce

ompany

This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The Tinal repairquanturmwith

be prepared afier the vehicle is surveyed by a molor Surveyor appointed by the insurance company.
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NAME
ADDRESS

Home Tel.:

VIN:

Registration: SHC 324 E
Technician:

Mileage: 375641

Time Printed 7.1.19 2:02 PM

Hyundai 05- Sonata (NF)

Front : Left Front : Right
Actual BEFORE Specified Range Actual | BEFORE Specified Range
1°58' -0°30' 0°30' Camber —0°59" -0°30° 0°30'
3r 1’ 3°60' 5°50° Caster 401" @ 3°50" 5°50°
5°01" -0°05’ 0°05° Toe 008" | = | 008005
20°56' SAl 18°37 p—
22°54° Included Angle  19°368' |
Turning Angle Diff.
Front
“Actual BEFORE Specified Range
Cross Camber 059"
Cross Caster -0°51'
Cross SaAl 2719 | -
Total Toe 5°04' | -0°09' 009"
Cross Turn Diff. i
Rear : Left Rear : Right
Actual BEFORE  Specified Range Actual | BEFORE  Specified Range
-0°47" | -1°00' 0°00" Camber 0°06’ | -1°00" 0°00"
0°03' 0°00' 0°08" Toe 0°04' 0°00' 0°09'
Rear
 Actual | BEFORE  Specified Range
Cross Camber -0°53" S s
Total Toe -0°02' 0°00' 0°19°

Thrust Angle 003’



Adjuster Report

Page 1 of 5

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreqno1sssoriser)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@Ikkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur File No:  CS/CTIN8000363/D0OD3NZ

Date: 18/04/2019
REFERENCE
Handling China Talping Insurance . :
gl (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Policy No: DMCWYSN3I0E2301801
Claimant Insured
VohicleNg:  STGI#E Vahicie Nz  2Ha146%
- Nature of Claim
Date of Loss:  01/01/2018 Claim: T No: SNM18D200053C02
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SHC324E
Make & Model: HYUNDAI SONATA, 2.0 (A) Engine No: D4EACDBE292
Reg. Date: 30/04/2012 (Man. Year: 2012) Chassis No: KMHET41VMCAB24558
Colour: Yellow Odometer: 3756841 km
Engine Capacity: 1991 cc
Mgrket Value/New Car NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (S§). Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
COMNDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 215/60R16 Rear Tyre Size: 215/60R16
Front Left Side: West Lake 5 mm Rear Left Side: West Lake 5 mm
Front Right Side: Wesl Lake 5 mm Rear Right Side: West Lake 5 mm
The above values represant the remaining fyre freads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 27 680.52 24 867 .84 2.812.68 10.16
Mizcellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 5,040.00 2,300.00 2,740.00 54.37
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 32,720.52 27,167.84 5,552.68 16.97
Approved Total (Overridden) (S%) 14,000.00
(S$) 32,720.52 14,000.00 1872052  57.21
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 2,290.44 980.00 1,310.44 57.21
Nett Amount (S§) 35,010.96 14,980.00 20,030.96 57.21

INSPECTION

Date of Assignment: 11/04/2018

Date Inspected: 07/01/2019 Inspected At:
Estimated Period of Repair: 13.0 days

Chunni Motor Pte Lid (HQ)

10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 24, #03-

19 AMK Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Adjuster: BRYAN TANI

Manager: SHIALI CHAM
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WOTE: This report represents our findings at the time and place of inspechion staled herein. Such ingpection has been camed out o the best of our
knewiedge and ability but any other lability under any pther circumstances is nereby expressly excluded.
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Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-3G

Page 3 of 5

Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 17 Apr 2018)

HYUNDAI SONATA 2.0 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.00

Parts: 143

Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)
Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no prini-code for SHC324E)

Validity:

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Oty
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Part No.

These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

“BONNET Dented 2265.90FL “2,265.80FL
*BONNET HINGE (LH/RH) Mot Mecessary 175.00FL *FL
*FRONT BEUMPER COVER Distorted 544 50FL *544 50FL
*FRONT BUMPER SPONGE MNot Necessary 136.30FL *FL
*FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Mot Necessary 504 10FL *FL
*FRONT BUMPER BRACKET TOP (LH) Not Necessary 2240FL *-FL
*FRONT BUMPER PROTECTOR (LH) Cut 28 20FL *29.20FL
*FRONT BUMPER BRACKET (LH) Not Necessary 24 6OFL *.FL
*HEADLAMP SUPPORT PANEL ASSY Dented 1,02300FL *1,023.00FL
*HEADLAMP (LH) Eroken 1,388.00FL *1,388.00FL
*FRONT FENDER (LH) Buckled 59300FL *593.00FL
*FRONT FENDER SHIELD (LH} Deformed 17490FL *174.90FL
*BATTERY TRAY Mot Necessary 52.00FL *-FL
*FRONT DOOR (LH) Buckled 2.25640FL *2,256.40FL
*FRONT DOOR GEAR/REGULATOR (LH) Bent 62500FL *625.00FL
*FRONT DOOR KEY LOCK SET (LH) Mot Necessary 186.50 FL *-FL
*FRONT DOOR OUTER HANDLE (LH) Cut 37.00FL *37.00FL
*FRONT DOOR MIRROR (LH) Repair B70.00FL *.FL
*FRONT DOOR POWER MOTOR Mot Necessary 42500FL *FL
*FRONT DOOR PROTECTOR (LH) Broken 78.25FL *78.25FL
*DOOR CENTRE PILLAR OUTER (LH) Dented 2,527.80FL *2,527 B0FL
*REAR DOOR (LH) Dented 2201.10FL *2,201.10FL
*REAR DOOR PROTECTOR (LH) Mot Necessary 56.90 FL *-FL
*FRONT WHEEL RIM (LH) Distorted 32530FL *325.30FL
*FRONT WHEEL HUB CAP (LH) Cut 14500FL *145.00FL
*FRONT WHEEL BEARING Damaged 54050FL  *540.50FL
*FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER (ASSY)(LH) Distorted 342 20FL  *342 20FL
*FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER MOUNTING (LH) Mot Necessary 108.80FL *-FL
*FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER FORK (LH) Distorted 20330FL *203.30FL
*FRONT SUSPENSION UPPER ARM (LH) Distorted 24000FL  *240.00FL
*FRONT DRIVE SHAFT (LH) Distorted 1,030.80FL *1,030.80FL
‘RACK & PINION ASSY Damaged 2,093.00FL *2,093.00FL
*STG TIE END Distorted B6.50 FL *66.50 FL
“STABILIZER BAR Distorted 252 30FL "252.30FL
*STABILIZER BAR BUSH (LH) Mot Necessary 16.40FL *-FL
*STABILIZER BAR LINK Distorted 78.30FL *78.30FL
*STAEBILIZER BRACKET Mot Necessary 24 D0OFL *FL
*FRONT SUSPENSION LOWER ARM (LH) Distorted B85.20FL *B85.20FL
*KNUCKLE ARM (LH) Distorted 558 B0FL *558.60FL
*ENGINE UNDER COVER Mot Necessary 334.60FL *-FL
*ENGINE CROSSMEMEBER Distorted 2,143.70FL "2,143.70FL
“*ABS SENSOR Mot Mecessary 250.50FL *FL
“WIRING-ENGINE Housing Broken 3,326.00FL *3,326.00FL
“WIRING-FRONT Broken 1,960.80FL *1,960.80FL

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Adjuster Report

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars

45 1 “WIRING-ECM

4 1 “FRONT DOOR CITY CAB LOGO (LH)
47 A *REAR DOOR TEL NO STICKER (LH)
48 1 *FRONT TYRE (LH)

49 1 *NEW BATTERY

F=Franchise part. S=Spchett. L=ListitemDisc

Page 4 of 5

Condition Repairer's Amount

Housing Broken 3.243.00FL *3,243.00FL

Mecessary 7500FS  *75.00FS
Necessary 10.00FS  *10.00FS
Serviceable 216.00FS “FS
Mot Necessary 207.00FS *-FS

Sub Total (S$) 234,473.65  31,063.55

_ List Item Discount on L ltems 20.00/20.00% (S§) 679313 6,195.71

Total Parts (S5) 27,680.52  24,867.84

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Adjuster Report Page 5 of 5
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 PANEL BEATING Mew 1,800.00 800.00
2 SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE Mew 1,600.00 800.00
3 WIRING CHARGE Mew 100.00 30.00
4 TUFF KOTE Mew 150.00 40.00
5 TOWING CHARGE MNew 50.00 0.00
& TRANSFER OF DOOR MNew 240.00 120.00
T REMOVE/REFIX UNDERCARRIAGE (FRT) Mew 200.00 150.00
a FRT WHEEL ALIGNMENT MNew 120.00 60.00
] REMOVE/REFIX AIRCON & REFILL GAS MNew 150.00 0.00
10 REMOVE/REFIX DASHBOARD New 450.00 150.00
1 REMOVE/REFIX FUSE BOX Mew 180.00 50.00
2,300.00

Gross Labour Cost (S5) 5,040.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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