Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Attachments:

Dear Hsiao Tong,

erik@jcngrp.com

Thursday, 4 June 2020 3:35 PM

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Re: Your Ref: SGY 3268K Our Ref:SLZ 3665H ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 3665H &
SGY 3268K ALONG JUNCTION OF ELITE PARK AVE (SIGLAP ROAD) ON 02/01/2019
AT ABOUT 1945 HOURS
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As per my client information, After the collision , both your insured and my client did step off their vehicles to access
the damage which i have attached the scene photo for your reference. Base on the photo given, we could conclude

the damages inc cured is there

We would appreciate if you could re-look into the case and keep us updated on the status

Thanks
Erik

On 2020-04-23 13:56, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote:

> Without Prejudice
>

> Dear Sirs/Mdm,
>

> We refer to our below email.

>

> Kindly advise if there is any PIR or independent witness statement
> for us to consider your client's claim.

>

> Thank you.
>

> “KINDLY NOTE THAT THIS NEGOTIATION BETWEEN PARTIES ON THIS MATTER IS

> PURELY ON A WITHOUT PREJUDICE BASIS WITH THE SOLE INTENTION OF

> RESOLVING THE MATTER AMICABLY WITHOUT PARTIES RESORTING TO LEGAL

> PROCEEDINGS. NO ADMISSION OF LIABILITY, WHATSOEVER, SHOULD BE DEEMED /
> INFERRED FROM THIS NEGOTIATION OF TERMS/SETTLEMENT.

>

> IN THE EVENT OF NEW EVIDENCE BEING DISCOVERED OR SUBSEQUENTLY

> PRODUCED BY EITHER PARTY THAT WILL MATERIALLY AFFECT/INFLUENCE ON THE
> ISSUES OF LIABILITY/DAMAGES, EITHER PARTY IS NOT BOUND, THEREAFTER, BY

> THE NEGOTIATION TERMS/SETTLEMENT.”

>

>_NOTE: WE ARE ON WORK FROM HOME ARRANGEMENT. ALL CORRESPONDENCE SHOULD
> BE MADE VIA EMAIL. SUBMISSION OF CLAIM RELATED DOCUMENTS WILL BE IN
> SOFTCOPY. ANY INCONVENIENCE CAUSED IS MUCH REGRETTED._

>
> Best Regards,

> HSIAO TONG, CHEW | Case Handler
> LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD



> Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 Blk 51,
> Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

>
>
>
> FROM: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

> SENT: Friday, 22 November 2019 10:36 AM

> TO: erik@jcngrp.com <erik@jcngrp.com>

> SUBJECT: RE: Your Ref: SGY 3268K Our Ref:SLZ 3665H ACCIDENT INVOLVING
> SLZ 3665H & SGY 3268K ALONG JUNCTION OF ELITE PARK AVE (SIGLAP ROAD)
>ON 02/01/2019 AT ABOUT 1945 HOURS

>

> Without Prejudice

>

> Dear Sirs/Mdm,

>

> We refer to the above matter.

>

> Please be informed that our insured reported that there is no

> collision.

>

> As per FWD instruction, kindly provide us with PIR or independent

> witness statement for us to consider the losses incurred by your

> client.

>

> Thank you.

>

> “Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is

> purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

> resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal

> proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /

> inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

>

> In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced

> by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of

> liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the

> negotiation terms/settlement.”

>

> Best Regards,

> Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

> Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51,

> Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

>

> From: erik@jcngrp.com <erik@jcngrp.com>

> Sent: Tuesday, 19 November 2019 12:18 PM

> To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

> Subject: Re: Your Ref: SGY 3268K Our Ref:SLZ 3665H ACCIDENT INVOLVING
> SLZ 3665H & SGY 3268K ALONG JUNCTION OF ELITE PARK AVE (SIGLAP ROAD)
>ON 02/01/2019 AT ABOUT 1945 HOURS

>

> Dear Hsiao Tong,

>

> Would appreciate if you could update us on the status of the claim, so

> we could proceed to finalaize



>
> Thanks

> Mike

>

> 0n 2019-11-05 12:21, erik@jcngrp.com wrote:
>> Dear Hsiao Tong,

>>

>> We refer to our last email send,

>>

>> Would appreciate if you could update us on status for above accident
>

>> claim

>>

>> Thanks

>> Mike

>>

>>

>>

>>0n 2019-10-14 13:16, erik@jcngrp.com wrote:
>>> Dear Hsiao Tong,

>>>

>>> Any updates with regards to the above claim?
>>>

>>> Thanks

>>> Mike

>>>

>>>

>>>

>>>

>>>

>>>0n 2019-10-07 17:35, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote:
>>>> Hi,

>>>>

>>>> Thank you for your email.

>>>>

>>>> | am on leave and will be back on 08 Oct 2019.
>>>>

>>>> | will look into your email when | am back.
>>>>

>>>> Regards,

>>>>

>>>> Hsiao Tong

>>>>

>>>> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



