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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 5 July, 2019 2:34 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SJE4431T & GBB8578M on 

02/01/2019

Attachments: TI199168 for SJE4431T (SMG198071).pdf

Your Ref: GBB8578M 

Our Ref: SJE4431T 

  

Dear Cecilia, 

  

We refer to below, we are pleased to accept the offer. 

Please find attached TAX INVOICE for your kind onward action. 

  

Tax Invoice No. TI199168 @ S$4,815.00 (Inclusive of 7% GST) -Agreed 

Loss of Use @ S$350.00 (7 Days x S$50) -Agreed 

LTA Search @ S$7.45 -Agreed 

  

Please look into the above claim and let us have your payment of S$5,172.45 soonest. 
 

Provided always that this discharge of my claim for damages relating to the damage to my vehicle 

SJE4431T shall not prejudice or affect my further claim for general and special damages for my personal 

injuries sustained in the same accident on 02/01/2019.  

  

Best Regards, 

  

Su Wong 

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD 

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre 

#02-03B Singapore 415933 

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376 

 

 

 

On Fri, Jul 5, 2019 at 1:53 PM Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <JoyIrene@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

  

Dear Su, 
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On without prejudice basis and without admission of liability, we offer settlement as follows: 

  

  

  

Cost of Repairs  $ 4,815.00 GST included 

Loss of Use $     350.00 ($50 x 7 days ) year 2008 vehicle 

LTA SF $         7.45 

TOTAL $ 5,172.45 

  

Kindly confirm acceptance. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Joy Irene | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged 

information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender 

immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this 

email is strictly forbidden. 

  

From: MG Solution [mailto:mg3solution@gmail.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 14 May 2019 5:07 PM 

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <JoyIrene@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SJE4431T & GBB8578M on 02/01/2019 

  

Your Ref: GBB8578M 
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Our Ref: SJE4431T 

  

Dear Joy, 

  

Please refer to below mentioned email, as we have sent out our LOD previously to your side on 

20/03/2019. 

We have not receive any offer from your side.  

Resend LOD for your reference and hope to receive an offer from your side soon. 

  

Best Regards, 

  

Su Wong 

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD 

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre 

#02-03B Singapore 415933 

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376 

  

  

  

On Wed, Mar 20, 2019 at 10:46 AM MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com> wrote: 

Your Ref: GBB8578M 

Our Ref: SJE4431T 

  

Dear Joy, 
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Please find attached our LOD for your onward action. Original Copy will send to you by POST.    

Please feel free to contact the under mentioned should you require any further information.  

Your prompt action will be greatly appreciated.  

Best Regards, 

  

Su Wong 

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD 

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre 

#02-03B Singapore 415933 

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376 


