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e, . R P Lo Campany Registration Ha. 199607198R
ElUBIAVE L #0225 PAYA UBN INDUSTRIAL PAREK, SINGAPODRE J08933 TEL : (105) 62563501 FAX @ (65) 62564315
Your Ref: TBA Date: 08 January 2019

Our Ref: CS/EGIT19000234/Ksb

The Motor Claims Department
ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SE]J 8875R .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 07/01/2019 at the premises of M/s Loh Heng and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8% 6,184.00
Revised Estimate Amount 188 4.032.20
“Check” Items Amount : 5§ 1,951.80
Market Value k] -
LTA Reimbursement Value h -
Nett Value : 8% -

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the n/s front portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 5 Days

Yours faithfully,
Kenneth Kong
Automotive Assessor
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Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto) :

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com=
Sent: Tuesday, 8 January 2019 5:29 PM

To: ‘Steve Lim’

Ce: 'Siti Rahman'; assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: 3rd party claim attachment (Qur insured: GZ68518)
Attachments: SF) BB75R - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Steve,
Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SFJ 8875R.

Kindly provide us claim no.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 5256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com
Sent: Friday, 4 lanuary, 2019 3:47 PM

To: 'Steve Lim' <steve.lim@ergo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Siti Rahman' <5iti.Rahman@ergo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.comz
Subject: RE: 3rd party claim attachment (Our insured: GZ68518)

Dear Steve,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer arrange survey on 07.01.2019.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants 'te Ltd

Phone: 6741-84:44 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Steve Lim [mailto:steve. lim@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 4 lanuary, 2019 3:23 PM
To: SUR (sur@lkkauto.com) <sur@lkkauto.com=; Admin-D (LKKAuto) (admin-d@lkkauto.com) <admin-

d@lkkauto.com>




Catherine Chnng (LKK Auto)

From: Steve Lim <steve.lim@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 4 January, 2019 3:23 PM

To: SUR (sur@lkkauto.com); Admin-D (LKKAuto) (admin-d@Iikkauto.com)
Cc: Siti Rahman

Subject: FW: 3rd party claim attachment (Our insured: GZ6851B)
Attachments: CCI01032019.pdf; Ol report. pdf

Dear LKK,

Please assist to conduct TP survey,

nage LAaims

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.
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From: Danny Loh [mailto:lohheng0308@yahoo.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 4 January, 2019 3:19 FM

To: Steve Lim

Subject: Re: 3rd party claim attachment

Hi Steve,

thanks for the reply. We prefer LKK
to survey at our workshop.

Thank you
Danny

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Fri, 4 Jan 2019 at 9:55, Steve Lim

<steve.lim@ergo.com.sg> wrote:
Hi Danny.
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EMAIL DISCLAIMER =

The information contained in this email communication is confidential. You should only read, disclose, re-transmit, copy, distribute, act in reliance on or
commercialize the information if you are authorized to do so. If you are not the intendad recipient of this email communication, please notify the sender by
replying to the email and destroy any electronic or paper copy of this message.

Any views expressed in this email communication are those of the individual sender, ERGO Insurance Pte, Lid, does not reprasant.
that the integrity of this communication has been maintained or that the communication is free of errors, virus or interference.

ERGOQ Insurance Pte. Lid. asserts copyright in respect la this email including any attachment. No part may be reproduced by any process or for any
purposa without prior written permission,

warrani or guarantee

inll £



From: ERGO Insurance Pre. Lid.

Sent: Thursday, 3 January, 2019 4:03 PM
To: Steve Lim

Ce: Charlie Neo

Subject: FW: 3rd party claim attachment

Dear Steve.

Please assist. Thanks.

Wiarmesl Regurds,

Eileen

From: Danny Loh [mailto:lohheng0308(@yahoo.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 3 January, 2019 10:09 AM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

Subject: 3rd party claim attachment

we are submitting a 3rd party claim attachment for vour perusal.

Kind regards,
Loh Heng

Danny
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AUDMative Repair Services
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ERGO Insurance Co.

Singapare Tt
i

Attn. : Motor Claim Department

Re : Estimated Quotation

Vehicle No. SFJBBYER VW Jetia

SIN Amount (S5)
A |PART REPLACEMENT e
Front bumper 'ﬁ"f/ 3.7 79000 | —
Front left mudguard $ A, 49700 “—
Retainer bumper - $2:7 11700 —
Front right shock Absorber YH-Z¢ 4 5 570.00 | P
Front wheel cowling $ Ju. 198.00 ?\
Road rim F¢5. 0 , § P’ 879.00 | —
Front left headlamp 00, ¢ a7l s 793.00 | —
Fromt knuckle Y2351/ Ayl 5 74900 2—
Front bearing A | § 327.00 | T—m
Sub-total § 492000
Less: 5%
Total $ 4.674.00
B |LABOUR CHARGES

To repair damaged on front left accident area Knocking panel beating, ?
and readjustment. s s0000| 2
Remove front suspension and replace new parts. 5 200.00 | 74}(
Readjust front wheel alingment g 60.00 | —
Respraying front accdent area ] ¥50.00 d/;‘;?
GRAND TOTALOF A& B $ 6,184.00

Block 176 #03-08 Sin Ming Autoeare—
Sin Ming Drve
Singapore 575721
Tel 84532237 /654530787
Fax @ 64556384



¥y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

kil B B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
TEL: G256 3561 FAX: G256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607108R GST Reg. Mo, 19-0607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD Ref : CS/EGI19000234/Ksbn2
for! SONTEL TOWER [T
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date : 01-03-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Coda: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh, GZ 68518 Veh. Inspected SFJ 8B75R
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. GZBBS1B Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From STEVE LIM Assign Date 04/01/2019
& Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model VOLKSWAGEN JETTATSI(A) |e.c 1390
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. WWVWEZZZ16ZEMO11629 Colour METALLIC GREY
Odometer 87365 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/55R16 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 PIRELLI 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55R16 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 PIRELLI & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE NfS FRONT PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  29/12/2018 lInspection Date 07/01/2019
Survey held at LOH HENG
BLK 176 #03-08
SIN MING DRIVE
SINGAPORE 575721
5a, Remarks .
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A™WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Feg. Mo 1006807198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607 196-R Pape No.:1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SFJ 8875R
S Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER BUCKLED f CUT 790.00 790.00
1|FRONT LEFT MUDGUARD BENT 497 00 497.00
1|RETAINER BUMPER DISTORTED 117.00 117.00
1|FRONT RIGHT SHOCK ABSORBER BENT 570.00 48820
1|FRONT WHEEL COWLING SERVICEABLE 198.00 .
1|ROAD RIM DENTED 879.00 705.00
1|FRONT LEFT HEADLAMP cuT 793.00 684.00
1|FRONT KNUCKLE BENT 749,00 42511
1|FRONT BEARING NECESSARY 327.00 327.00
LESS 5% DISCOUNT -246.00 -201 67
4,674.00 3,831.64
LABOUR
TO REPAIR DAMAGED ON FRONT LEFT ACCIDENT AREA 500.00 450.00
KNOCKING PANEL BEATING AND READJUSTMENT.
REMOVE FRONT SUSPENSION AND REPLACE NEW 200.00 160.00
PARTS
READJUST FRONT WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 60.00 60.00
RESPRAYING FRONT ACCIDENT AREA, 750.00 600.00
1,510.00 1,270.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,184.00 5,101.64
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS - 4,000.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/EGI19000234/Ksbn2

y/svs

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appralser

Ly il f 1 (. 16 A4 Rsed L0 ANy Lhrd Dary wiie m

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report s made solely for the use and benefi of the Client named on the front page of this Report.

reply on the Report wholly orin p
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