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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 4 January 2019 10:45 AM

To: ‘Elaine Ngu'; SUR

Subject: RE: Check MV - SIJM 7269) (DOA: 10.03.2018)

Dear Elaine,

The market value of STM 72697 is $10K-$11K (Estimated) as at March 18.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 3 January 2019 4:19 PM

To: 'Elaine Ngu' <elaine_ngu@sg.msig-asia.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Check MV - SJM 7269) (DOA: 10.03.2018)

Dear Elaine,
Thank you for the email.
Dear Veron,

Kindly assist

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Elaine Ngu [mailto:elaine _ngu@sg.msig-asia.com]
Sent: Thursday, 3 January 2019 4:18 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Check MV - SJM 7269) (DOA: 10.03.2018)

Dear Catherine



Please assist to check the market value at the time of loss.

Thank you.

Have a great week aheaol!

Elaine Ngu
Senior Executive, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2540 | Dirqct fax +65 6225 7402 | elaine_ngu®sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG Fi¢
2016 Insurer Claims Team of the Year

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | Tel +65
6220 9644 | Fax +65 6225 6371 1 Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | http://www.msig.com.sg/ | Follow us

81800

amember of |[URTAAY INSURANCE GROUP
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vebhicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registfation Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 03 Jan 2019
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No

03Jan 2019
SUZUKI

SX4 1.6HB AT
White

2008
M16A1444421
JSAGYA21500203781
75.0 KW (100 bhp)
$16,309.00

15 Jan 2009

15 Jan 2009

1

$16,309.00

Yes
14 Jan 2019
$8,154.00

14 Jan 2019

A - Car (1600cc & below)
10

$5,001.00

$14.00

$8,168.00
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https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDeregInput?ZFUNCTION_ID=F03... 03/01/2019
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1/3/2019 Used Suzuki Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart
SGEARMART.COM Login  Sign up

New Cars

Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources

+ dealers , * Sell ur Car for More Cash
competed to . . » Highest Price or Get $100 Free . - : A
buy my car! - + Get Paid Now, Handover Later i @uoTz

B 3 Lake View
W % Credit Pte Ltd
> Low prices guaranteed
| » Specialist in Japanese cars
> Easy loan approval
» All terms are negotable

Post an Advertisement
Sell it yourself! Advertise it at just

$58 until it's SOLD!

Post an Ad Advertiser Login Ways of Selling

Browse by Category [Sort by Date Posted
16 vehicles saasa S | st earch g
Price Depreciation <oy Dat Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type Status
Search Selection Suzuki SX4 Any Any 2009 Any Any Any Al
Suzuki $X4 1.6A (New 5-yr $25,800 $5,160 /yr 12-Jan-2009 1,586 cc 140,152 km Sedan Available

COE)

Spacious And Fuel Efficient Sedan! Well Maintained! Good To Go For Another 5 Years! Affordable Monthly Installment. From $380! High/Full Loan
Options Available! Call For A Viewing Appointment Today!

Mayfair Motoring
Pasted: 02-Jan-2019  Tags: 2009 Suzuki SX4, 2009 suzuki sx4, Suzuki SX4, suzuki sx4, Suzuki, SX4, sx4, Used Suzuki

Suzuki SX4 HB 1.6A (New 5-yr $26,800 $5,360 /yr 19-Jun-2009 1,586 cc - Hatchback Available
COE)

In House Finance Available! Low Installment At $586! Low Depreciation At $5,000 Plus For A Japanese Car! Please Call For Appointment To View The
Car!

Speedo Motoring
Posted: 27-Dec-2018  Tags: 2009 Suzuki SX4, 2009 suzuki sx4, Suzuki $X4, suzuki sx4, Suzuki, SX4, sx4, Used Suzuki

Suzuki $X4 HB 1.6A (New 5-yr  $26,800 $5,360 /yr 19-Jan-2009 1,586 cc - Hatchback Available
COE)

High Loan Available! STA And VICOM Evaluation Welcome. Elegant Blue With Black Interior. Lowest Interest Rate. Lowest Monthly Instaliment.
Highest Trade In Value For Used Car. Fast And Hassle Free Tra...

Shuang Hup Credit
Posted: 21-Dec-2018  Tags: 2009 Suzuki SX4, 2009 suzuki sx4, Suzuki SX4, suzuki sx4, Suzuki, SX4, sx4, Used Suzuki

Suzuki $X4 HE 1.6A (New 5-yr  $25,800 $5,160 /yr 09-Feb-2009 1,586 cc 109,000 km Hatchback Available
COE)

3K Deposit. High Loan Available, Good Condition Inside Out. Well-maintained SX4 That Requires No Further Repairs, Test-drive Personally To Believe,
In-house/Banks Loans Provided, Act Fast By Calling O...

Creative Auto
Posted: 20-Dec-2018  Tags: 2009 Suzuki $X4, 2009 suzuki sx4, Suzuki $X4, suzuki sx4, Suzuki, Sx4, sx4, Used Suzuki

Is your COE expiring? Let us help you renew it!

COE Getting your COE renewed s easy, fast and affordable, We'll help you renew your COE and get a loan for it. Get the cheapest loan in town and an
'RENEWAL  approval in 2 days without effort! Enquire today.
LOAN

Suzuki $X4 1.6A $13,000 $9,100 /yr 27-Aug-2009 1,586 cc 99,000 km Sedan Available

New Year Promo! High Loan At Low Interest Rate! Fully Agent ( Borneo Motor ) Unit. Free Warranty + Servicing For An Added Peace Of Mind! Low
Maintain & Depreciation! High Trade-In Are Welcome! No Repa...

Posted: 12-Dec-2018  Taas: 2009 Suzuki $X4, 2009 suzuki sx4, Suzuki SX4, suzuki sx4, Suzuki, SX4, sx4, Used Suzuki

. om Suzuki $X4 1.6 (New 5-yr $25,800 $5,160 /yr 22-Apr-2009 1,586 cc 130,000 ke Sedan Roaiiatle
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Select used cars to Compare or Add to Alert Shortlist [ 1 ] |
]

Suzuki SX4 1.6A z To compare cars, ; To compare cars, To compare cars, {

select from the select from the select from the :

27-Aug-2009 search results. search results. search resuits. |
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