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¥ L7 2w
=== == Consultants
P Y Pie Lid Company Registration Mo. 19060T19ER

SLUBLAVE 1, F02-25 PAYA UL INDUSTHRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 08933 TEL 1 (065) 62563561 FANX : (065) 62564315

Your Rel: TBA Date: 08 January 2019

Our Ref: CS/ECI19000212/Ksd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Lid

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SHD 5125A .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 07/01/2019 at the premises of M/s Trans-Cab Auto Services Pte Ltd and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount ;88 12,882.53
Revised Estimate Amount 5% 2,130.06
“Check” Items Amount : 8%
Market Value : 8%
LTA Reimbursement Value : 8%
Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the ofs front body.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 2 Days

Yours faithfully,
Kenneth Kong
Automotive Assessor



Ms‘ thtcapital ?:ﬁft:rm:'rguu;ﬁ:pl;‘mw Cofleg, Mo, [S000NNE. GAT fieg. Mo, MO-O01ETEY
Tek (655222 2311 Fax: (63) 6222 3547

Clibsms B blster Undaruritmg Depe: 35 Roobinson Foad #16-01 Ciey House Singapoes 068377
Tel: (65 6507 3848 Fax: (65) 6507 3645

v, malimacapical com ag

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 3/;/!0] Our Ref No. S‘I’flﬁg[g@ﬁ\

Accident Date 7, /r / I' (T Claim Type. ..Tp
Insured Vehicle SH C g l 80 fﬂ[ Third Party Vehicle. SHn ‘51 1,_‘;/3[

Survey Locatlon — M \-—~
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Survey Type ‘.;_\‘p - e ocdmit oles l?-\-li\' Auantimn 4 e coarecc)
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Esf:;yor L M LK

Contact Person . Fax No. 6" g'

Contact Number. éz gg B—é ,|’ 4L/ g\g IIS

oo, (18T 1Y

Contact No.

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax invoice ingether with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report,

Cc : Workshop fMS (L AJ S?ﬁhr’@s ‘w Gi Attention. CM‘JT )(_Ghj

Ce : TP Solicitor — ]| — TP Solicitor Fax No. - \J'|_

Officer Incharge [\[\ B\l. 'J A ne (uf i_f i)

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.
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Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Mg Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 11 January 2019 11:46 AM

To: 'Shirley Hiew [LKK Auto)’

Cc ‘Candy Kong'; 'SUR’

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1901-015--Accident involving SHD 5125A & SHC 8180A on
02.01.2019

Attachments: ESTIMATE plt

Hi Shirley

We confirmed COR amount $2,130.06 (before GST).

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

##* please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

‘fg TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
RAN lg No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

..-‘C“ Main Line: (65) 6287 4646 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

website: www . transcab.com.sg
This message is confidential, It may alsg be privifeged or OIN2rwise protected by work p ct immunity or other jal rulas, if
you have received It by mistake, please let us kKnow by e-mail repl ate It From ol ; YOouU may n Nessa
or disclose its contents to anyone, Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming g-ima r Creent
for response deadlines. The integrity and se urity of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Interpet

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 11 January, 2019 10:06 AM

To: 'Ng Wai Yin' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Ce: 'Candy Kong' <candy.kong@transcab.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: TCS REF: AAD1901-015--Accident involving SHD 5125A & SHC 8180A on 02.01.2019

Dear Wai Yin.

Please confirm final fig $2,130.06 (part by part) @ 2 days of repairs before GST.

Thank you.

fest Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Libi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)



This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
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shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto) :

From: May Chua Hui Chin <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 January 2019 5:33 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT - SHD5125A OUR REF: SHC8180A DOA
02-1-19

Dear Sir / Madam,

Our claim ref: D19000254MFSH
Thank you

May Chua
Motor Claim Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID :
6507 3859| Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000106C A
Member of Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in
error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-
mail.

----- Original Message-———

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, January 8, 2019 5:29 PM

To: May Chua Hui Chin <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>; Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>;
assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT - SHD5125A OUR REF: SHC8180A DOA 02-1-19

Dear May,
Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SHD 5125A.

Kindly provide us claim no.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25
| 5(408933)



Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) e U ..

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com=>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 January 2019 5:29 PM

To: 'May Chua Hui Chin’

Ce: Admin-D (LKKAuto); ‘Teo Swee Keong'; assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT - SHD5125A OUR REF: SHCB180A DOA
02-1-19

Attachments: SHD 5125A - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear May,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SHD 5125A,

Kindly provide us claim no.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25
| 5(408933)

-----0riginal Message----

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Friday, 4 January 2015 12:03 PM

To: 'Teo Swee Keong' <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Ce: 'May Chua Hui Chin' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT - SHD5125A OUR REF: SHC8180A DOA 02-1-19

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

----- Original Message--—-

From: Teo Swee Keong [mailto:TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 4 January 2019 11:52 AM

To: 'assignments@lkkauto.com' <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: May Chua Hui Chin =maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT - SHD5125A OUR REF: SHCB8180A DOA 02-1-19

i



Dear Sirs

New survey request for your handling.

Thanks and Regards,

SK Teo
Motor Claims Dept

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3848 | Fax No.
: 6507 3849 |

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data,
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the
sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Teo Swee Keong

Sent: Friday, January 04, 2019 11:51 AM

To: Candy Kong (candy.kong@transcab.com.sg) <candy.kong@transcab.com.sg>

Cec: May Chua Hui Chin <maychua@msfirstcapital. com.sg=>; ‘assignments@Ilkkauto.com’
<assignments@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: YR REF: SHD5125A OUR REF: SHC8180A DOA 02-1-19

Dear Sir

Thank you for informing us of your choice, the surveyor will be appointed
within 2 working days of your email.

Thank you.

Thanks and Regards,

SK Teo
Motor Claims Dept

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House
Singapore 068877 | DID : 6507 3848 | Fax No.: 6507 3845 |

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing

2



of your personal data.
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data
Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally
privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy,
forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and
all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return
e-mail.

-----0riginal Message-----

From: Rosliza Bte AB Rahman

Sent: Thursday, lanuary 03, 2019 11:01 AM

To: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: FW: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY SHD5125A

PRI SHCB180A REPORTED

————— Original Message--—-

From: Candy Kong [mailto:candy.kong@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, January 3, 2019 9:26 AM

To: Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Aini Binte Md Min <Aini@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 'Amanda Tay'
<amanda.tay@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: ARRANGE FOR SURVEY 5HD5125A

DEAR ALL,

PLS ARRANGE LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD TO SURVEY
Please arrange for survey as below :

SHC8180A - 02.01.2019 at 1100Hrs - SHD5125A

Lunch time : 12pm - 1pm.

Kindly pls dun arrange survey during lunch time.

"We Agree to let your In-house surveyor assess/ survey our vehicle with
estimate

Thks & Rdgs



Candy Kong
Claims Service Assistant

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise
protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If you have
received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it

from your system; you may not copy this message or disclose its contents to
anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming
e-mails are not screened for response deadlines. The integrity and security
of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG.
https://www.avg.com



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Crwner 1D Type:

Crwmer (D¢

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No-

Yehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model;

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

raximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
FARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

POP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Tatal Rebate Amount:
Message

Page 1 of |

Comparny
3878K

SHDS51254

Yes

02 Jan 201%

REMAULT

LATITUDE 2.0L DCI AUTO D/AB 4DR
Red

2015
MIRBEIFCO0II0S
VF1ABL15AUCZ2832356
127.0kW (170 bhp)
$19,998.00

15 Dec 2017

15 Dec 2017

]

£19.998.00

Yes
14 Dec 2025
§14,996.00

14 Dec 2025

A - Car up to 1600ce & 97kW {130bhp]
a

£34,159.00

2732700

$42,325.00

Please note that the B-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed, The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle

reaches its statutory lifespan [if applicable). whichever is earlier.
The information contained herein is correct as at 02 Jan 2019

OK

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBe foreDeregInput?FUNCTION_ID=F03040... 02/01/2019
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Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd ' AAD1901-015

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111 /2/5,7 /W'fﬁf?,%_/
Tel No. - 6287 6666 Fax No.: 6257 1330
CO./GST Reg. No. 201019626G /{5 e % K?ﬁﬁ:hf
SHD 5125A
B2/30-0f
Vehicle No.. SHD 5125A
Chassis No.: VF1ABL15AUC283236
Vehicle Make: RENAULT
Vehicle Model: LATITUDE
Date of Accident : 2.1.2019
Third Party Insurer : FCIL
Date of Registration : 15/12/2017
PART LIST
1 DOOR PANEL FRT RH § /T 284466 X
1 DOOR HINGE UPPER RH ¢ AT 26128 ¥
1 DOOR HINGE LOWER RH $ A 30055 Y
1 DOOR MIRROR ASSY RH $ €/ 1,48340
$ 4,889.89
10% $ 488.99
$ ~ 4,400.90
Specical Nett
1 FRONT DOOR STICKER 'TRANS-CAB' $ . 80,00 Cosa-
1 FRONT DOOR STICKER * CHASSIS' $ e, 5000 T
1 DOOR CHECK BOLT g S 2269
1 DOOR GUIDE SCREW $ Ju, 1085
1 DOOR HINGE BOLT $ Je, 10.85
1 DOOR HINGE NUT RH g Ju 1460
1 DOOR CHECK BOLT $ Jo 2269 X
1 DOOR CHECK NUT $ Jo 375
1 DOOR LOCK SCREW L70Y § Iy 612
1 DOOR CATCH SCREW L70Y $ e 1006
TOTAL $ 231.63

TOTAL PARTS $ 4,632.53

_—



‘Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel No.: 6287 6666  Fax No.: 6257 1330
CO./GST Reg. No. 2010196266

SHD 5125A

LABOUR

Panel beating, knocking and straightening the
necessary portion, remove and renewal of parts, adjust

and realign the same %
Putty and spray painting of the affected portion. $
To rust-proofing of the affected areas. $

To remove and refit interior fittings, trimings, garnish,
fittings and other, to enable repair. g

To check steering geometry and computer wheel|

alignment $
To transfer of tire, rim and on wheel balancing. g
To Check Electrical Lighting Concerned. 4

To transfer of front fender fittings, attachment and
perform water seepage test. g

To transfer of front door fittings, attachment and

AAD1901-015

3,00000 Zoz/
3,00000 Jeg/

A 17000 X

4 38000 X

VA 22000 X
A1 170,00 A

170.00 2=y

VA 38000 X

perform water seepage test. g v 38000 X
To transfer of Rear door fittings, attachment and
perform water seepage test. $ Phv 280100 X
TOTAL $ 8,250.00
Over All Total $ 12,882.53
PART-BY-PART (REPAIR DAY) _1oDAYS

Zots,



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: G256 4315
Reg. Mo 109807188R GST Reg. No. 19-8807198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI19000212/Ksd3n2
sroasonsonn o e[|
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHC B180A Veh. Inspected SHD 5125A
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19000254MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  MAY CHUA Assign Date 04/01/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model RENAULT LATITUDE (A) c.c 1995
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. VF1ABL1SALUCZ83236 Colour METALLIC WHITE / RED
Odometer 137383 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN CRDER Meodification NIL
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60R18 GIT 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60R16 GIT 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre [215/60 R16 GITI B mm
LH Rear Tyre [215/60 R16 GITI 8 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S FRONT BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  02/01/2019 |inspection Date 07/01/2019
Survey held at TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
NO.2 ANG MO KIO ST B3
SINGAPORE 569111
5a. Remarks
2IDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REFORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




' 74 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
g aE 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
/’A—! TEL: 6256 3561 FAX; 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page Mo.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 5125A
aty Description of Parts Condition ,‘E:gm"‘::ﬁg“ Our "{iil‘“t"d
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|DOOR PANEL FRT RH TO REPAIR SEE 2.844.66
LABOUR
1|DOOR HINGE UPPER RH TO REPAIR SEE 261.28 i
LABOUR
1|DOOR HINGE LOWER RH TO REPAIR SEE 300.55
LABOUR
1|DOOR MIRROR ASSY RH CRACKED 1,483.40 1,483.40
LESS 10% DISCOUNT .488 99 -148.34
4,400.90 1,335 06
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT DOOR STICKER "TRANS-CAB" (SN) NECESSARY 80.00 60.00
1|FRONT DOOR STICKER "CHASSIS" (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 15.00
1|DOOR CHECK BOLT (SN) SERVICEABLE 22 69 ‘
1|DOOR GUIDE SCREW (SN) SERVICEABLE 10.85 5
1|DOOR HINGE BOLT (SN} SERVICEABLE 1085 J
1|DOOR HINGE NUT RH (SN) SERVICEABLE 1460 .
1|DOOR CHECK BOLT (SN) SERVICEABLE 2269 -
1|DOOR CHECK NUT (SN) SERVICEABLE 375 %
1|DOOR LOCK SCREW L70Y (SN) SERVICEABLE 6.12 .
1|DOOR CATCH SCREW LTOY (SN) SERVICEABLE 10.06 3
23161 75.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING, KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTENING THE 3,000.00 200.00
NECESSARY PORTION,REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF
PARTS ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME.INCLUSIVE OF
THE REPAIR OF DOOR PANEL FRT RH,DOOR HINGE
UPPER RH AND DOOR HINGE LOWER RH.
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED 3,000.00 500.00
PORTION.
TO RUST-PROOFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS NOT NECESSARY 170.00 :
TO REMOVE AND REFIT INTERIOR NOT NECESSARY 380.00 .

FITTINGS. TRIMINGS, GARNISH,

FITTINGS AND OTHER, TO ENAELE REPAIR.

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19000212/Ksd3n2




y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Uibi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408913

L
:—;(l!_!
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reqg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 16-06071598-R Pape No. 2 of 2
Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition Estimate By | Our
it sciiE tion  |\workshop ($))|  (S)
TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY AND COMPUTER NOT MECESSARY 220.00 -
WHEEL ALIGNMENT
TO TRANSFER OF TIRE,RIM AND ON WHEEL NOT MECESSARY 170.00 -
BALANCING
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL LIGHTING COMCERMNED. 170.00 20.00
Ty TRANSFER OF FRONT FENDER NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
FITTINGS. ATTACHMENT AND PERFORM WATER
SEEPAGE TEST
TO TRANSFER OF FRONT DDOR NOT NECESSARY 380.00 .
EITTINGS ATTACHMENT AND PERFORM WATER
SEEPAGE TEST
TO TRANSFER OF REAR DOOR EITTINGS ATTACHMENT |NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
AND PERFORM WATER SEEPAGE TEST
8.250.00 T20.00
GRAND TOTAL 12,882.51 2,130.06
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 2,130.06|

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19000212/Ksd3n2
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KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser
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