SG 98 VIOTORPTELTD

4001, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1 #01-21 SINGAPORE 568622
Tal: 6452 4098 Fax: 6452 4868
Emall: sg_motor_enterprisediiyaboo.com.sg

DATE: 2 May 2019 Invoice No: SGES8-PD-19-035
Lonpac Insurance Bhd (S'pore Branch) PD - Direct Settlemant

100 Beach Road

#18-00 Shaw Tower

SINGAPORE 188702

Attn: Motor Claim Dept
Claim No.: 18/M18M19NVCOE21275
Your Insured; YN 6794H

Date of Accident:  28-Dec-18

Location: Inside 127 Pasir Ris Grove

FINAL REPAIR COSTS
VEHICLE NO. FBK 7212C (H/Revo S4)

Cost of Repair for Vehicle No.: FBK 7212C (lump sum) $1,050.00
Loss of Use: 2 days x $30 $60.00
Total: $1,110.00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS: ONE THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED TEN ONLY
Notes:

1. All chegue paymeni shauld be “Crossed” and made paysble io 5G 98 MOTOR PTELTD
2 All chagua should heve our “invoica Ma® witon on the reverse side of the cheque
3 For further enquiries on this involice, pleases fesl free lo contact us

'.fjr Q/x/
\ /

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd
1G




AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

[, MUHAMMAD HATKEL BIN JUREMI (the third party claimant™) of BLOCK
519 BEDOK NORTH AVENUE 1 #07-384 SINGAPORE 460519 (address), owner
ol FBK 7212C /{vchir:lc no.) hereby authorize SG 98 MOTOR PTE LTD (“the
waorkshop™) to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or
lass of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no FBK 7212C that was damaged pursuant to the
accident which occurred on 28/12/2018 (date) along 127 PASIR RIS GROVE
(locanon) involving vehicle no/s YN 6794H f"lhc accident’).

I further suthorize the waorkshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that
they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to
settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop,

SG 9 MOTOR PTE LTD,
I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on

a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the

driver/fowner/insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this_ S| day) of DGRy tmonth) 20/4 (year)

N

Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop”
(with chop if applicable) (with chop)




—

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO  : 18/18/19/VCO5/021275
DATE : 31 JULY 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We, MUHAMMAD HAIKEL BIN JUREMI confirmed acceptance from Ms
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of YN 6794H the sum of
Singapore Dollars One Thousand One Hundred Ten Only ($1.110.00) in full and
final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of property claim competent to me/us
upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim
sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accidemt to my vehicle, FBK 7212C on 28
DECEMBER 2018 along 127 PASIR RIS GROVE.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (STAR FURNITURE PTE
LTD / LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever
made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/S SG 98
MOTOR PTE LTD.

[/'We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our

insured’s récovery action.
II
'F\V.'"ﬂl'v' ';*,Fcl?("l DI

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

Mdammad Neikel BinTuvern

Name of vehicle owner/Date

Provided always thar this discharge of my

cliim for damages relating to the damage 1o
my vehicle shall not prejudice or affect or
preciude me from making a further claim for
general and special damages for my personal
injurics sustamed in the same accident



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 July, 2019 9:47 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Ce: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: FOR YOUR MANDATEA PPROVAL : 18/18/19/VCD5/021275 / YN 6794H ON
28/12/2018 | SG 98 FBK 7212C) /LKK REF: CC4/LPC19000187/Dha3q2 [External
Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vic,

Kindly proceed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

f__

The all {¥w ) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential dala is for use by authorised extemnal parties only

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 31 July, 2019 9:29 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FOR YOUR MANDATEA PPROVAL : 18/18/19/VC05/021275 / YN 6794H ON 28/12/2018 ( SG 98 FBK
7212C) [External Confidential]/LKK REF: CC4/LPC19000187/Dha3qg2

Dear Gerald,

We refer further to your below emall

Please be informed that we had spoken to the TP witness Mr Chua and he confirmed to us his the entire incident as
per his statement. He confirmed he didn't know both drivers and he told us that he saw the Insured Lorry reversed

and collided to the parked TP motorcycle then drove off.

We asked if he is willing to do an affidavit if required for his statement but we were informed that he doesn’t want to
go to the hassle of doing it.

Kindly advise if we can proceed settlement and/or for your instructions.,

Thank you.



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 24 July, 2019 10:58 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Ce: MT_Claim_SG; Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: FOR YOUR MANDATEA PPROVAL : 18/18/19/VC05/021275 / YN 6794H ON
28/12/2018 ( SG 98 FBK 7212C) [External Confidential]/LKK REF:
CC4/1PC19000187/Dhaig2

Hi Gerald,

Thank yvou for your email,

Please be informed that this matter is now handled by my colleague. Mr Vic.
Thank you,

Hi Vic

FYNA, CC4/LPC]9000187/Dha3a2

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhi@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 7:45 AM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <loylrene@lkkauto.com>

Ce: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: FOR YOUR MANDATEA PPROVAL : 18/18/19/VC0D5/021275 / YN 6794H ON 28/12/2018 ( 5G 98 FBK
7212C) |External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential

Dear Irene,

Kindly proceed as proposed subject to verification from the witness.
Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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Lonpac External - Confidential data Is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:Joylrene®@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 17 July, 2019 1:44 FM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cec: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: FOR YOUR MANDATEA PPROVAL : 18/18/19/VC05/021275 / YN 6794H ON 28/12/2018 ( SG 98 FBK 7212C)

Ref: 18/18/19/VC05/021275
Dear Gerald,
We refer to the subject.

This is a head-to-rear collision where a witness (condo security officer) confirmed our insured driver reversed.
Witness statement attached.

We called the witness several times however, his number is always in busy tone or unavailable. We will continue to
contact the latter for verification/confirmation of his statement.

Summary to offer to repairer M/s SG 98 MOTOR PTE LTD is as follows:

AT =y

Cost of Repa!rs- 5 2,480.00 | per estimate) .G.DD
Loss of Use 5 £0.00 (530 x 2 days) 5 60.00 [31‘.] x 2 days)
TOTAL _ [s2sa000 T Sl

For your approval.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

oy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@|kkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this emall Is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have recelved this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
Is strictly forbidden.

From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto) <sMeikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 January, 2019 6:29 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <loylrene@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-
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Joy Irene (LI{I(Autu!

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 17 July 2019 1:44 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: FOR YOUR MANDATEA PPROVAL : 18/18/19/VC05/021275 / YN 6794H ON
28/12/2018 ( SG 98 FBK 72120)

Attachments: SURVEY REPORT.pdf; LOD.pdf; SURVEY PHOTOS.pdf; TP WITNESS STATEMENT pdf

Ref: 18/18/18/vC05/021275
Dear Gerald,
We refer to the subject.

This is a head-to-rear collision where a witness (condo security officer) confirmed our insured driver reversed.
Witness statement attached.

We called the witness several times however, his number is always in busy tone or unavailable. We will continue to
contact the latter for verification/confirmation of his statement,

Summary to offer to repairer M/s $G 98 MOTOR PTE LTD is as follows:
TP CLAIMED OUR REVISED
TO OFFER

Cost of Repairs $ 2,480.00 ( per estimate) $ 1,050.00

Loss of Use S  60.00(S30 x 2 days) S 60.00 (530 x 2 days)

TOTAL $ 2,540.00 $1,110.00
For your approval,
Thank you.

Best Regards,

loy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@|kkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addresses(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient {or have received this emall in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.coms
Sent: Tuesday, 15 January, 2019 6:29 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <m!_claim@lonpac.com>; Joy Irene [LKKAuto) <loylrene @lkkauto.com>; C5 A Team <cs-




STATEMENT OF A WITNESS TO AN ACCIDENT

IAME OF WITNESS : Chua \(Em Crnan

IRIC/PASSPORT NO : ¢ 2370ct | o

DDRESS ; et 287 Ghopinie tinitd 37 o 1~ 294
ELEPHONENO AL S2 Sokae.

MAIL :

UEF FACTS : A motor accident has taken place on %|0|!5 atabout 1eooris
ang/at junction/location of 127 PASw 248 (reue dWtst Gnde
tween vehicle fiok 32N.C and vehicle INEF9YH | am an eye-witness to the

id accident and wish to state my recount of it as follows:-
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