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B P V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Aver 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi industrial Park, Singapore 408933

-
g SN YW
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX; 6256 4115

Reg. No. 189607198R GST Reg Mo 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PL Ret . CC4/1119000162/R1pb3
et rrencsnosroreosern oo osorzoe | [N
Code: 2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHEB102H Veh. Inspected SHD 27038
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date oa/o1/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Qdomater . Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mim
RIH Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  02/01/2019 |Inspection Date 04/01/2019
Survey held at PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE LTD
& BENOI PLACE
SINGAPORE 629927
5a, Remarks
AJTHE INSFECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
GST Reg. No : 201606560M

6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927
Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948 LK Ao Cansltants henca nobly

PRIME GROUP

Date: 03.01.2019 o Pty prices e sutyect ko cor

India International Insurance Pte Ltd " Samameriy bands) mott be leurvey

64 Cecil Street #04/#05 Bt Rl MR e |
OB Building achnowledyed by Regai |
Singapore 049711 Sqnanre:

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

RE: ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR TO VEHICLE SHD2703B HONDA FREED 1.5G (2010)

To Supply
1) 1pc Right side mirror assy. el »~~ 5 564.20 7
2] 1pc Frontright door glass fuft-s'\f S 455.11]!]7(
Sub total Parts S 1,019.20
Less: 20% discount S (203.84)
5 815.36
To Supply S.Nett Parts
1] 1pc Right front door advertisement sticker & ' 5 180.00 /
Sub total 5.Nett Parts S 180.00
L/charges
1) Toremove right side mirror. Knock & repair front right door. Replace S A}Ddﬁﬂ 250
the above parts.
2 ) To putty, respray painting right front door & right side mirror outer S 39063 e
cover. To polish. Qﬂ!w‘...
HP Govioobl Sub total L/charges S 800.00
2 W Estimated Grand Total §  1,795.36
Hs
u‘;{ml (1 oV

M abber rrpd



Hsiao Tuna !LI{I{Autu!

From: Alice Leong <aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com>

Sent: Tuesday, B January 2019 12:18 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAUto)

Cc Rasul (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: FINALIZE TO SHD27038B **LKK REF: CC4/11119000162/R1pb3
Attachments: img-190108140913.pdf

Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Enclosed our LOD with supporting documents for your retention.

For swift & amicable settlement, please let us have your offer.

Thank you

Alice Leong
Manager, Motor Claims

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Lid

6 Benol Place Singapore 629927

T (65): 6861 0908 | F (65) 6515 2948
HP (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Group

Discluimer

This e-mail (including all sttachment) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. IT vou are not an intend reciplent, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system.
You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its conlents to any person.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: 08 January, 2019 10:44 AM

To: Alice Leong <aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com=

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: FINALIZE TO SHD2703B **LKK REF: CC4/11119000162/R1pb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Alice,
wWe refer to the above matter.

Flease be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties. the liability is clear
and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.

Flease note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an autherisalion of
repair 1o your client’s vehicle,

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the
accident.

And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.
1



) Please note that all finalisation subject insurer's approval.
By copy to Rasul,
Kindly assist to finalise COR & Repair days. Tq.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, 8 January 2019 10:24 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewh kauto.com>

Cc: 'Alice Leong' <aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: FINALIZE TO SHD2703B

Importance: High
Hi Hsiao Tong,

CCa/I19000162/R 1pb3

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirtey Hiew | Case Handles

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall: Sur@®lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Bik 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Alice Leong [mallto:aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com]
Sent: Tuesday, B January 2019 9:55 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@|kkauto.com>

Cc: sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: FINALIZE TO SHD27038

Importance: High

Hi Rasul,

Enclosed our after repair photos & our calculation sheet for your retention. Shall we finalize at LS $900/-
and 3 days

Please let us have your confirmation within three days from our e-mail.



_ Thank you

Alice Leong
Manager, Motor Claims

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927
T(65). 6861 0908 | F(65) 6515 2948
HF (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Group
Diselai
This e-mail {including all sttachment) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified

recipient(s) o whom it is addressed. If you are not an intend recipient, please reply to us immedistely and delete this message from your system,
You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its conlents to any person.
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Meariman e-Claims

Claim Audit

E AUDITTRAIL = =
N, on Aufit Remarks By
1 932802019 cim veh Modal Changed (202345) HONDA FREED 1.5 G (A). Ehu i
03 Jan 2019 Reg No: SHD27038, Acct Date: 2019/01/02. Claim Type: TR, Insurer: India Internation ., .
2 747 Cim Created al Insurance Pte Lid (HQ), TP Insurer; NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ). ) pai
’ Workshop: Prime Auto Claims Service Puo Ltd (HQ)
3 1209 adj co Assigned LKK Auts Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): E:.',L'ﬂ
4 03302019 pg) Next Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Rot.Due Date:2019/01/14 ol
5 033802015 4y mandate Set Approved:0,00,Reinsp:Adj decides. e e
6 53220299 Label Added {30653):Direct Settiement. W frer
[A]
8 1133 2" AdjMandate Request  CurReq:0.00:PODS Liability: 100% Remarks: Insured passenger opened door. s
TONG
[t
o (o0 209 agj Next Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Rot.Dus Date:2019/01/14 Lalitha
: Krishnan|
(1]
10 05 20309 ag) Mandate Set Approved:0,00, Lalitha
B Kr‘iﬂ'll'lln1
11 ég:?; 2019 Cim OH Modified Insured Name: -> COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD. E:LI:;
12 050309 cim ot Modified Claimant's Name: -> COMFORT TRANSPORTATION FTE LTD. e e
Date From 4ITH > pateTo 4| »| Audit Type  None |
ACTIVITY |
No recard - S =
Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History N —
Bl e b il Duste Are Type | e tiarms o hame Qf | Pl P
| (Branet

No billing ftems

hitps:/isingapore.meriman.com/claims/index cfm Musebox=MTRadjuster&luseaction=dsp_viewhistoryScaseid=7785508exlid=2916828CFID=468...
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Merimen e-Claims

Claim Audit

= AUDIT TRAIL

Mo, on Ausdit Remarks By
1 'i';i‘.‘:" 2019 cym veh Model Changed (202345) HONDA FREED 1.5 G (A). ;T‘L'ﬁ
03 Jan 2019 Reg No: SHD2703B. Acct Date: 2019/01/02, Claim Type: TP, Insurer: India Internation [A] Lau
| 2 17:47 Cim Created &l Insurance Pte Ltd {HQ). TP Insurer: NTUC [ncome [nsurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ), Shu Pl
; Workshap: Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd (HQ)
1 ?3;?; 2019 adj co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ): Esﬂ L:.:
03 Jan 2019 : 3 [A] Lay
e+ Adj Next Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2015/01/14 Ul tay
03 Jan 2019 o z [A] Lau
| 5 1747 Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00,Reinsp: Ad) decides, Shu Pel
03 Jan 2019 s [A] Lau
I 6 17:47 Label Added (3I0653): Direct Settlement. Shy Pel
03 Jan 2019 ) [A] Lau
7 1347 Adj Adjuster Assigned  [None] -> MOHD RASUL Shu Pt
(&)
8 ﬁ_.?; 1% Ad] Mandate Request  CurReq:0.00:PODS Liability: 100% Remarks: Insured passanger opened door, m
TONG
(1]
9 Toos -U'7  AdjNext Rpt Changed  Next Rot:Final Rpt.Due Date:2019/01/14 Lalitha
} Krishnan
[1]
10 (500 279 ady Mandate Set Approved:0.00, Lalitha
’ Krishnan
11 102201 cim Dt Modified Insured Name: -> COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD. $Al au
10 Jan 2019 i [A] Lau
12 0 Cim Dt Modified Claimant's Name: -> COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD. LA La
JOANNE
4
13 (3202019 ag) mpt Initiated LEE
KHANG
MIN
JOANNE
14 135002 cim pu Moditied Claimaint's 1D: -> -. LEE
KHANG
MIN
JOANNE
15 1340 % cim ot Modified JP) Reg. Date: -> 2011/07/13. LEE
KHANG
MIN
JOMMNE
16 1300 2717 cim Datails Notified LEE
KHANG
MIN
Cur,Req:1492,50:PODS Liability: 100% Quantum: (a)CORw/GST: $963.00 + (BJLOR(S  [A]
17 330N 2019 L e ate Request  00YS X $65.90): $329.50 + (c)LOI(5days x $40.00):$200.00 = Tutal: $1,492.50 Vehicl CHEW
17:10 & Model: Honda Freed (1496cc) 3 recommendation repair days + 1PRS + 15unday = 5 HSIAD
days Fo TONG
Date From 4|7 »] pateTo 4|F»] Audit Type None v Ga|
m — =
[Wo record
|Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History = =
B Rl No Bill Date Ace Type Acc Name _ fE:::{T.T-T Ret 1 Rusf 3 l An
LKK Auto LKK Auto
2027969 b Motor | Consultants Pte | Consultants Pte |  SHD27038 SHE102M 10,70
L : — Lid Led (HQ) = = .

hitps./isingapore. mermen.com/claims/index.cfm fusebox=MTRad|uster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=7T785508exiid=201682ACFID=478. .

112



2018 Mermen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associaled with :

*SHD2703B (MCT19010025)
[SHE102H]
TP
PRIME CAR RENTAL & TAXI SERVICES PTELTD
Jan 2 2019 2:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTDO]
Prime Auto Claims Service Pta Lid

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (I1I_SG), sent on 01/02/2019 14:09 PM.

To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$1492.50) - SHD2703B - Claim Handler: Sherini Pillal

Approved: 1492.50.

hitps:/isingapare. merimen. com/claims/index cfm?fusebox=5VCmalldfuseaction=dsp_PrintaCFID=481666984CFTOKEN=3/d0021a0404b75¢-81...  1/1



Hsiao Tona SLKKAutoE

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Monday, 11 February 2019 2:47 PM

To: ‘Alice Leong'

Cc Rasul (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: FINALIZE TO SHD2703B **LKK REF; CC4/11119000162/R1pb3

Without! Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm.,
We refer o the above matter.

We propose setllement as follows :-

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 943.00
2. Loss of Rental [Sdays x $65.90) $ 32950
3. Loss of Income (Sdays x $40.00) $ 200.00

Total $1.492.50

Please confirm acceplance.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings, No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / Inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hslao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultanis Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhi@lkkauto.com | fax; 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Alice Leong <aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com>

Sent: Tuesday, B January 2019 12:18 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: FINALIZE TO SHD2703B **LKK REF: CC4/11119000162/R1pb3
Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Enclosed our LOD with supporting documents for your retention.



Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd(__\-' "‘“‘)
GST Reg. No : 201606560M \@L 4
6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927 ~——

Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

J
T

PRIME GROUP

Date: 08.01.2019

Our Ref: SHD27038
Your Ref: SH6102H

India International Insurance Pte Lid Without prejudice

64 Cecil Street s04/#05

IOB Building

Singapore 049711

Aun: Ms. Hsiao Tong (Motor Claims Dept)

Dear Madam.

ACCIDENT ON 02012019 INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SHD27038 & SHo10211
We are on behalf of M/s Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Pte Ltd the owner of vehicle
SHD27038 in their third party claim against your insured / driver of SH6102H negligence

caused the accident.

Appended below our client’s claim:

I. Cost of repair $  963.00
2. Loss of rental (pre-inspection arrangement) @ $65.90 x 2 days § 13180
3. Loss of rental @$65.90 x 4 days (Incl. T Sun] $  263.60
4. Loss of income @$40.00 x 6 days $ 24000

Total $ 1.598.40

We enclose herewith copy of our invoice no 3046, Letter of authority & Letter of
Certification for vour retention. Please acknowledge receipt.

For an amicable settlement, please let us have your offer.

Yours faithfully.

....... [ | A
Alice Leohg
e-mail: aliceleong primeautoclaims com

Enel.



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

To: PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE. LTD.

Re: ACCIDENT ON 02.01.2019 INVOLVING SHD27038 & SH6102H
ALONG MANDARIN ORCHARD HOTEL TAXI STAND

I/ We. M/S Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Pte Ltd hereby authorized vou to carry out repairs

of the damage caused to my / our vehicle no. SHD2703B in the above accident.

I’ We further also confirm and agree that all sums of money to be recovered by you on my/ our
behalf shall be paid to you. I/ We hereby also authorise the third party insurer to release to you

such sums of money recovered on my / our behalf.

Nignature (Company s stanp (T applicabler
Mamy
NRIC:
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EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

RISCHARGE VOUCHER
Iil-Direct Settlement (PODS)

india Raf: MCT18010025
Claimant Ref : SHDZTO38

wei,  Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Lid ("Ihe worksnop”) heraty confim that weil have reached an agreement
with the appoirted Surveyar of India Intemational Insurance Pia Lid LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid iname
of wilh respect 1o the amount claimed for S§ _ 963.00 (repair cost) S§__ 52850  (loss of

rartnl), S5 _—  (search fea) wehicle no SHD 27038 that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occumed
on 02001/2018  (4ateyar  Mandarin Orchard Hotel Taxi Stand llocation) involving vehicle io.SH 6102H _(inaiired

vehicig) This s pursuant 1o ihe inspection conducted on _ D4H01/2010  jaaie) a1 “the workshop

Weil confirm thal we/l sreism sulhorized b’u e FRIME CAR BEMTAL & TAN SEAVCES PTE LTD {“the third paity
claimant) of veticle noSHD 27038 1o make the claim as sel sul inthe above paragraph and wed| have full authonty 1o seMlie
the matter on hisher behall n & manner thal wel desm fit We'l enclose haran the jefier of authomy given by The fhurg
party claimant®,

Vel further confirm that wafl will indemnily India Intemational Insurance Ple Lid for all dsmages. loss and/of expense (hal
trey will or have already ncumed in the event fhat “the thind party claimant® after the above sakd agreement lodges a
furfer claim againet the formar for any loss and espenses suffered pertaining to cos! of repairs andiot rental andior less
of Use pursuant to the damage jo SHD 27038 (yahicie no ) as & result of the accident.

Vel confirm fhat the agreemen! reached above 5 in full ang final semement of ail cimms of “the third pamy claimant”
pursuani lo the accident and thal further this seltiemant is mached on o withoul prejudice and without sdmission of ability
Dass

This agreemenl is subject 1o the application of Singapore law and Ihe Singapore Courte have exclusive |unisdiction over any
dispute anging oul of the same

15 Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Lid

Wefl authorize tw to pay the total amount of §§ _1.492.50

Dated this ! day of F‘LN‘*“\

CLAIMANT: || :
Signanure:;

WITNESS: M W |

Signatura
Signed by appointed Survayor
Name l— ‘:5\ Name LKK Auta Consunams Ple Lid
NRIC \f}'. ”‘“L“L\ NRIC: 199607108R
Address LIID g, 8 Address: 51 Uibi Avenue 1
Ry L,‘sﬁ‘ﬂl #01:25 Paya Ub Ind. Park 5(406933)

Matlonalily lr.j [g‘ : Ll Mationality
Cecupation; L —Il“T”‘ Cecupation:




TAX INVOICE
Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd

& Benaol Place Singapore 629927
Tel; GBG1 0908 Fax: 6515 2048

GET Reg Mo 2016806580M
FRIMEGROUF  Rag No. 201606560M

MESSRS INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD

&4 Cettl Streat
A0S 108 Bulding
SINGAPORE 040711

NO.: 3046

DATE 080172019
WORKS ORDER NO . 3057
VEHICLE NO SHD2T03B

MTEM

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
Mulke/ Model HONDA FREED
- Repair Date 12019
Terms of Paymem LOD
THIRD PARTY CLAIMS
BEING LUMP SUM REPAIR TO THE ABOVE £ 00,00
VEHICLE
-
‘ompound interests at the rate of 1% per month SUB TOTAL $ 200 ﬂ_ﬂ
will be chiarged on hite payment GST T g 63.00
, ROUNDING ADJ & 0.00
TOTAL 5 963.00

FREMARED BY

PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE
Manager




Prime Tax Office

PRIME CAR RENTAL oo
& TAXI SERVICES PTE LTD [EieEe
- pnmetao@mingnet.com.sg
warw, primeta com.sq

Wabsile |

Co. Cert. No: 1996062932
Gst Reg. No: 19-9606293-Z

Your Ref : Please advise Our Refl: SHD2703B

Date :07.01.2019

To : Whom It May Concern
From - Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Pie Lid
. RE: LETTER OF CERTIFICATION FOR MR. OUEK POH TONG

This letter serves to confirm that Mr. Quek Poh Tong. Nric Number S7413169G is a
Taxi Master for Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Ple Lid hiring the Vehicle
Registration Number SHD2703B for Singapore Dollar Sixty Five and Cents Ninety
($65.90) Only.

Should clarification require | can be contacted at 94524182,

Thank you with Best Regards

Yours Sincerely

C—“Vir Chan knn; me;
~Workshop Manager
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co meg e 1sssor1esr)

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel 6258-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email surf@lkkaulo com assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/111189000162/R1PB302
Date: 28/02/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India Intermnational Insurance Ple Ltd ~ Policy No: MCOMO0015
Fiaimant Vehicle s1ip2708 Insured Vehicle No: SHB102H
Date of Loss: 02/01/2019 MNalure of Claim. TP Claim No: MCT18010025
DESCRIPTION & 1D IFICATION I
Reg No: SHD2703B
Make & Model HOMDA FREED, 150G (A) Engine No: L15A3445571
Reg, Date 13/07/2011 (Man. Year: 2010) Chassis No GB31185718
Colour: Brown Cdomeler 580875 km
Engine Capacily: 1406 cc
Marketl Value/New Car Price:  N/A
Sum Insured (5%) Market Value/New Car Price

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY

General Condition: Steering (Serviceable) Yes Footbrake (Serviceable), Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/65 R15 Rear Tyre Size; 185/65 R15
Front Left Side; Goodnde 5 mm Rear Left Side: Goodride 5 mm
Front Right Side; Goodnde 5 mm Rear Right Side: Goodride 5 mm
The above values represent the emaning tyre reads depih
COST OF CLAIMS - Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 985,36 631.38 354 00 3B8.57
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 800.00 §50.00 250.00 a1.25
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing D.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Tolal (S$) 1,795.36 1,181.36 614.00 3420
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 800.00
(s$) 1,785.36 900.00 BO5.36 49.87
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (55) 125.688 63.00 62 68 49.87
Nett Amount (S§) 1,021.04 963.00 958.04  49.87
+ Car Rental |[5.0 x 5565.90/day) (S5) 329.50
+ Loss of Earnings (5.0 x S$40.00/day) (S$) 200.00
Nett Liability (S%) 1,4982.50
INSPECTION
Data of Assignment: 03/012018
Date Inspected: 04/01/2018 Inspected At Prnme Auto Claims Service Pte Lid (HQ)

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_...

& Benoi Placa
Singapore 629927

26/2/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Estimated Period of Repair: 30days

Adjuster: MOHD RASUL Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

NOTE: This repart represents our Rodings of ihe e and place of inspection stated heremn. Such mapecton nes been camed ouf o (e best of our
kenowiedge and abiify but any other kabiity under amy other circumaiances i hereby sxpressly sxciuded

https://singapore.merimen.conv/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 26/2/2019
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REPAIR DETAILS i B B
Reference
Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 14 Jan 2019)
Paris: M1-MPV HONDA FREED 1.5 G (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
| Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominaled Standard List)

Print Code: {Unsubmitted, no pnnt-code for SHD27038)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: tems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

T *‘RIGHT SIDE MIRROR ASSY Scraiched 564 20FL 584 20FL
2 1 “*FRONT RIGHT DOOR GLASS Repair 45500 FL *-FL
a 1 *RIGHT FRONT DOOR ADVERTISEMENT STICKER Necessary 1BO.00FS *1BD.00FS

F=Franctuse pan. S=Spcan L=ListitemDisc
Sub Total (38) 1,199.20 T44.20
- List Item Discount on L Items 20.00/20.00% (S5%) 203.84 112.84

Total Parts (S§) 995.36 631.36

[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 26/2/ 2019



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO REMOVE RIGHT SIDE MIRROR KNOCK & REPAIR FRONT New 400.00 250.00
RIGHT DOOR .REPLACE THE ABOVE PARTS
2 TO PUTTY RESPRAY PAINTING RIGHT FRONT DOOR & New 400.00 300.00
RIGHT SIDE MIRROR OUTER COVER .TO POLISH
Gross Labour Cost (55) 800.00 550.00
Repont was unsubmitted during this print-oul.
< END OF ESTIMATES >
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.ctm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 26/2/2019



