
LOT:_____ piiority : i,jGRf,JlAl- / |..!RGEiJT

::'l::::--. rvr\vnrrq*o rgqlts:craimNo ir*r,rir'
l,:#",jJ'"-' fr"t j-6
TYPE; M.Cai I lrl
Vehicte No :

I'/alle & Model:

Registraiion Daie: 
r

c,vcle / Bus r Van r Larry lra.x.i/ piime Mover i riuck / Trailer oi.

1 guotD D.O.A/AsAt :rlp,lE
l.lEW CAR Pp,tCE:$

coE Expiry Daie: rflil;o> 
--

_
L lA. lctal Re'Jaie Amount: (PARF) + iCO=)

M\r:$lQE:_63.L. euore l:* : lytf [i nt
p=g*rklrt

I'l OPS :Yes / l.to DL-IA:

ilru,s 
I

q\/.a



From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Thursday, 3 January 2019 3:39 PM

Kitty Teo Poh Guek

ANG Yvonne; HO Winnie; birdie.ong@axa'com.sg; Jas Tan Siok Thiew;

lynn.khong @axa.com.sg; peter.wang@axa'com'sg; LKK Valuation

RE: tMVl Check Market Value (MV) - S8Mo',l87W / DOA: 27.12.2018 - SJT 8409D

$iffi
* E{tr c

Dear Kitty,

The market value of SJT 8409D is $62K-63K (Estimated) as at Dec 18.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone:6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, UbiAvenue I,#02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Lavender Pa ng <surveyad m in2 @fta'com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 3 January 2019 11:06 AM

To: claims@ajaxinspection.com; admin@autoprobe.com.sg; chowauto@singnet.com.sg; bokhari@jpknights.com;

admin@lbs-auto.com; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg; rta@rta.com.sg;

collin.wong@a-pac.sg
Cc: ANG yvonne <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>; HO Winnie <winnie.ho@axa.com.sg>; Kitty Teo Poh Guek

<Kitty.Teo@axa.com.sg>; birdie.ong@axa.com.sg; Jas Tan Siok Thiew <jas.tan@axa.com.sg>; Wendy Tan

<motorsurvey@fta,com.sg>; Bridget Poh <Claims5@fta.com.sg>; lynn.khong@axa.com.sg; peter.wang@axa'com.sg

subject: [MV] check Market value (MV) - s8M0187W / DOA: 27.12.2018 - SJT 8409D

Dear Sir/Mdm,

please check Market Value and email back to Kittv,Teo(daxa.com.ss and cc to all OD case handler within 48 hours.

Thank you & warm regards

flma=se€gn&:rg

FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd
No. 33 Ubi Ave 3, #02-15 Vertex, Singapore 408868

Tel : {65) 6509 1788. Fax: (65) 6509 6221

Email: surveyadmin2@fta.com.sg
Website: www.fta.com.sg
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03 Jan 2019

VOLKSWAGEN

cc 1.8 TSt AT 3584H7
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Open lr4arket Value:

O1qiryl Registration Date:

First Registralion Date:.

V\[\ANZZZ3CZCE7O2754

rie.o tw iisa uhp)

$33,979.00

is i"trorz
1! Sep 2012

7

$33,979.00ActualARF Paid:

I nletqgd PA$F Repate_ Qgtalls
PARF Elieibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF RebateAmount:

l3_t g$"9!_ co r--Be!!!j o 9l-qt!'
COE Expiry Date:

L7 Sep2O22

$22,086.00

t7 Sep2O22

- c-.o.-E'9lFe:ojv'

: COE Period(Years):

QF paia:

COE Bebate Amount:

, 'Total RebateAmount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 03 Jan 2019

B - Car (1601cc & above)
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Used Volkswagen Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart
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Post an Advertiseftent
Sell it yourself! Advertise it at just

$58 until it's SOLD!

Al")rctt"i5et l-aefi Ways of Sellinq
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Search Sele€tion Volkswagen CC

Price

A.1y

Depreciation

Any

Eng Cap

Any

Mileage

AnY

i4

Veh Type Status

Ail

&,uailable

2012

Volkswagen Pas$at CC 1.8A $5r,800 912,020 lyt !7ian-2012 1,798 cc
TSI

Elegant White, Low Mileage Done, Powerful Drlve, Serviced By Agent, With Navigation System, Very Well Maintained,
Payment, Flexible In House Loan Packages Available.

Prime Motor & Leasing

o^Lrsn. 1!-na._)n1a Tags: 2012 Volkslvagen Passat, 2012 volkswagen passat, Volkswagen Passal, volkwagen passat,
"'" '''"' volrsvr:qc1, ['as.dl. pJ.s;r. rJsc(i volks$agcn

53,000 km Luxury

Drive Away With Minimum Down

Volkswagen CC 1,8A TSI S59,800 913,130 /yr 09-Apr-2012 !,798 cc 89,560 km Luxury Avrilablc

Only R-Line In Market! High Loan Original Paint, Elegant White, Low Mileage Done, Powerful Drive, Extended 2yrs Warranty! Wth Navigation System,
Very Well Maintained, Flexible In House Loan Packages ...

posredi 09-Nov-201{i ;:i_:;il:3 
*,"*cen cc,2012 volkswagen cc, volkswagen cc. volkswagen cc, volksw?gen, cc, cc, tjsed

Volkswagen Parsat CC 1,8A
TSt

16-Jan-2012 L,798 cc LUXUry

Cheapest In The Market With The Best Condition. High De-registration Value, High Loan And Can Be Arranged, Superbly, well Maintained By Ex
Owner. Always Park Under Shelter. 100o/o Accident Free. Transmi.,.

D r.ro^ )(--.|-)n1 a Tnqs: 2012 VolkswsQen Passat, 2012 volkswagen passat, Volkswagen passat, volkswagen passit,
Voi(s!!aqf n, Picsit, passdl, Uscd Vollswtg€11

Save this search criteria, to get email alerts whenever a match is found.

For old advertisements, view fxpired ads
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