: Priority CORMAL /URGENT
E0) g
Reference Mo - " VHL\QOQ)\DL\- (v Claim No. DO\ 8002330 IN OPS: Yes/No DOA:
From (Person) : G of (Tx Ref:
Date/Time )[! l(f( ' MV 5

TYPE: M.Car / M. Cycle / Bus / Van / Larry / Taxi/ Prime Movar / Truck / Trailer or
Venicle No gﬁg SU3IER D.C.A/As At “I"hg
Make & Mogel; - ¢ s ‘ NEW CAR PRICE:$
Eegistraf_ion Dais: f‘él')l Jotl MV: 353\~ Cok. Q,J otz by I Qumont
COE Expiry Date: . |gl\>[ >3 FS:$ Date SM\EI
LTA Total Rebate Amount: (PARF) - + {COE) = SV
Caiculation for LTA Rebata: - Caiculation for Valuation
{a} COE Period: X112 = Mths Average MV %
As At '
Seda N
- = Mihs  iCalculation for Repossessed vehlale:
- ’ = Mths High demand ve hlclﬁ.u, . Yes /No -3
{b) B:l:no:e,f\/‘ontha =] yehiol 1- 5
: ' More tHan 10yrs_ olg -3
g L MV for Repossesse B
e Engine Capacity: .. - &
(b)- =__ /2= <__ s Europe / Asia- Car £ : - % A
oo mierSelore/After MAY 2002 < 4Car Condition: Goad/Faxr/Pb‘o;/Bunt - 8 :
(e) PARF, = (OMV) X X .= . INd.oftransfer:.. . - %
LT:-\ Total Rebate Amount: (d)+(2) ; Other deduction o _ . - %
Salvage Value(LTA Rebate - 5%):. Forced-Sales Valiis derived - = §
Date/Time | i Action/ Instruction .__ .- Additional Information:




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 3 January 2019 10:25 AM

To: Elaine Cheong; SUR

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI

Subject: RE; REQUEST FOR MARKET VALUE & LTA REBATE - SGP8438B - CLAIM REF:
' 20180002320

Dear Elaine,

The market value of SGP 8438B is $57K-60K (Estimated) as at Dec 18.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 January 2019 3:06 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; admin@lbs-auto.com; fchong@stengg.com

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: REQUEST FOR MARKET VALUE & LTA REBATE - SGP8438B - CLAIM REF: 20180002320

Dear All,
Please assist to check the market value of the abovementioned vehicle as at 11.12.2018 (DOA).

Thank you.

Regards,

Elaine Cheong
Executive (Motor Claims)
Claims Departrment

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6530

Fax: 6224 7478 / 6224 7175

Email: elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com




PARE/COE Rebate Enquiry
> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner|D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

OPC Cash Rebate Details
OPC Cash Rebate Eligibility:

OPC Cash Rebate Eligibility Expiry Date:

OPC Cash Rebate Amount:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained hereinis correct as at 26 Dec 2018

, 01800023
C A=4u) Q |
(y W\.’“\SE—J“«QQ’Q ,D}Q :

Singapore NRIC
7888Z

SGP84388B

Yes

26 Dec 2018
MERCEDES BENZ
E 200

Silver

2011
27186030330810
WDD2120482A511376
135.0kW (181 bhp)
$53,452.00

19 Dec 2011

19 Dec 2011

0

$53,452.00

Yes (w.e.f 14 Dec 2016)
18 Dec 2021
$76.00

Yes
18 Dec 2021 /
$32,071.00

18 Dec 2021

E - Open Category
10

$62,502.00
$18,601.00
$50,672.00

DOA; 1 [,»hg
CIT

%A:’ZWTS O~1N>R§‘

2L 26

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNC... 26/12/2018
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