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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Zawaye, Norsazani <MNorsazani.Zawaye@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 January 2019 11:51 AM

To: Mastura; claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Cc: Veran Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: OD / 88560539285G / SLC3139G - Activation courtesy car
Hi Mastura,

0| called in and ask on the activation courtesy car.
Please be inform that AIG already confirm coverage this case yesterday around 11lam.
Kindly assist to do activation courtesy car and advise Ol accordingly.

LEE MING SHU, ID:58821485D, Tel: +6590238134, Email: GLENNLEEMS@GMAIL.COM

Thanks & Regards,

MNorsazani Zawaye

AlG

Claims Adjuster | Express Auto Claims
Singapore Claims | AIG Shared Services

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use,



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

f

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 15 January 2019 3:59 PM

To: ‘NORA : 'Claims Dept’; Admin A; Poh Kin (LKKAuto)
Cc: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: RE:OD CLAIMSLC 3139 G

Dear Mora,

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SLC 3139G (Excess $1600/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 15 January 2019 7:46 AM

To: 'NORA ' <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg>; 'Claims Dept' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@l|kkauto.com>

Cc: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM SLC 3139 G

Dear Nora,

Pending approval from AIG.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: NORA <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg=
Sent: Monday, 14 January 2019 7:41 PM




To: 'Claims Dept' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@|kkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
<veronchen@l|kkauto.com>

Ce: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM SLC 3139 G

Importance: High

Urgent
Dear Poh Kin and Veron,

Please update what's happening to the approval ? This case is revert fram TP claim to Own damage (AIG insured) .
Previously under TP claim the vehicle has been surveyed by Guo Xiang dated 7/1/19. Therefore we assume there is
no need to do another round of OD survey right ? Attached is a copy of the marked estimate previously surveyed by
Guo Kiang.

In any case, please give us instructions should you require a resurvey. Otherwise please help to chase for approval as
owner is rushing for repairs before CNY.

Thanking you all for your kind understanding.

Many Thanks.

Kind Regards,
Morah Khai
Claims Manager

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (reg ua tsaonzzmiw)

55 UUbi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9827 f. +65 6541 1183

e, claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audl Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 683

= - W i
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The all-new Audi Q2 ____:
#untaggable
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http://www.audi.com.sg/sea/brand/sg/audi promotions/promotions/car promotions/new-audi-g2-

2017.html

Emall Disclaimer

This emall, Including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged

If wou have recened it in arror, please notify us immediately by reply @mail and then dalete this message from your system
Please do not copy It or use it for any purpase, or disclose its contents or any attachment 1o any other person. Thank you
From: Claims Dept [mailto:claims@premium .com.sq]

Sent: Monday, 14 January 2019 5:57 PM

To: 'Admin A'; 'assignments’; 'Poh Kin (LKKAuto)'
Cc: 'Claims Dept’; 'Adrian Ling (LKKAuto)'; 'SUR'
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM SLC 3139 G



Dear Poh Kin,
Please kindly assist.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Justin Ee
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd reg no 1sssnzimivn

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 4. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumaute.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 G236 21‘2

The all-new Audi Q2

1§
#tuntaggable

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment; is confidential and m

If you have re 2 it in error, please notify us lmmedi delete this message from your system

Piease do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disciose its contents or amy attachment 1o any other person. Thanik you

From: Claims Dept [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 14 January 2019 2:55 PM

To: 'Admin A'; 'assignments’; "SUR'; 'Adrian Ling (LKKAuto)'
Cc: 'Claims Dept’

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM SLC 3139 G

Importance: High

Dear All,

Any update of approval repair? Owner is chasing us as vehicle is in our workshop.
Please kindly assist ASAP.

Thank you,

Best Regards,
Justin Ee
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (eeg ne 10s0271w)

55 Libi Read 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e, claims@ premiumauto,Ccom.sg W. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223
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Emall Disclaimer

This ematl, including any attachment, is.confidential and may alse be privileged

i you have reca error, please notify us immediat

Plaase do nat copy it or use it for any purpese, or disclose its contents or arvy attachment to any other person. Thank you

¢ rephy email and then delate this message from your system

From: Claims Dept [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sq]
Sent: Thursday, 10 January 2019 6:59 PM

To: 'Admin A'; 'assignments'; 'SUR"; 'Adrian Ling (LKKAuto)'
Cc: 'Claims Dept’

Subject: OD CLAIM 5LC 3139 G

Importance: High

Dear All,

Please to inform that this car number SLC 3139 G TP claims had convert OD claims, kindly refer to our attach file of
GIA Report Addendum.

Kindly assist.
Thank you,

Best Regards,
Justin Ee
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd jreg wo tsssnzzraw

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p.+55 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 0911 f. +65 6841 1183

e, claims@premiumauto.com,sg  w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159338 p. 465 633:6 2!12_23
= g o e 3

The all-new Audi Q2

#untaggable

| Discover offers J

Emall Disclaimer

s emall, including amy &

phy ermail and then delete this message from your Syster

its contents or any attachmeant to any other person. Thank you



1152019 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

Thia mail is associated with :

*SLC3I1396G (BES60539285G)
oD
Jan 2 2019 8:40AM
[LEE MING SHU]
Premium Automaoblies Pte Ltd

Reply | Reply All | Mark as Unread I “Print Message 1 Delete Message | Forward |

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 15/01/2019 15:46 FM.

To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved {5%11328.00) - SLC3139G - Claim Handler: Mohd Zawaye, Norsazani

!Appmued: llszé,onzﬂe-inspeﬂian to be done for damage check and supplementary items / labour,

'DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.

https:/isingapore menmen. comiclaims/index.cim?fusebox=8VCmail&fuseaction=dsp_viewamode=1&iinboxid=14180B0&IDomainid=1 1&i0bjld=12... 12



114/2019

hitps:/isingapore merimen.com/claimsfindex cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_rpts&rpimode=28&caseid=77 8026&extid=2924%2&adjcur...

Rich Text Editor, SYCDOCItrcontent

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregne1sssortasr)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: G256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@kkauto comiassignments@lkkauto.com

To; AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
AlG Building
78 Shenton Way #08-16
Singapore 079120

Attn:

Vehicle No

Make

Assignment Date
Date of Inspection
Inspection At

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages

Preliminary Advice

: SLC3139G
D AUDI A4

:14/01/2019
;07012019

55 UBI ROAD 1
SINGAPORE 408899

From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapare 408933

Date:

14 Jan 2019

Accident Date 02012019
Policy MNo. :
Excass : 550.00

Est. Duration of Repair : 8.00
: PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)

The vehicle sustained impact / damages o/s body and parts claimed are consistent to the accident,

Remarks

(X))

Repairer's Estimate (Gross)
Revised Amount

Check Items (Estimated)
Total

Lump Sum Repair

Total Loss Consideration

Mew for Old Value
Pre-Accident Value
COE /| PARF Rebate
Salvage Value
Margin for Repair

5%
5%
5%
55

5%

5%
55
5%
5%
5%

21,895.00
11,328.00

3,755.00
15,083.00

130,000.00
64,709.00

65,291.00

The wehicle is repairable al our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy

coverage. Kindly let us have your authorisation.

The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

Other comments ;

M



MPAT1S000ES1T / Prermeum Autamobiles Pie Lid - LB

EMTRY DATE & TIME: 02/01:2015 16:58
SUBMITTED BY: Mastura Bire Osman Basash

IMPORTANT NOTICE

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

1. Please report Gorrecily the detalls of the accsdent o spied up he claims process.
2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder andfor the Autharised Driver

3. Infarrmation provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible, Any wilful misrepresentation or wiholding of matadial facte may allow msurance companias to

repudiate palicy Bability.

4 Tha meue and acceplance of (his Fonm by insurance companies is nol an adnission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred 1o the Police for investigation.

& This repor will b forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centra established by the General Ingurance Association of Singapore (GlA] for

archiving and that copies of this report will, lor a lee. be made available upon application by interested parties

7. By lhe lacgement of this repart ta the insurers, you hereby consent o the archiving of ihis report at the centre and 1 copies of the report baing made avallabte

aforesad.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Repaort

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registered Owner
NRIC No

Email Address

Mabile Phone Na

Altermative Phone Mo
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Mode

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken

Yehicle Category
Insurance Company
Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage
Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Mote Number
Driver

Mame of Driver

NRIC Mo

Date Of Birth
Occupation

Date OFf Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Mumber

Contact Mumber
EMail Addrass

02/01/2019 16:58
02/01/201% 08:40

JUNCTION OF FINLAYSON GREEM & RAFFLE QUAY

SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
SLC3139G

LEE MING SHU
588214850

GLENNLEEMS@GMAIL.COM

(LOCAL) +65-80238134
HOME-67 325486

ALUDI
A4 SEDAN 2.0 TFSI 8w

PRIVATE USE

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD

COMPREHENSIVE
MO

LEE MING SHU
588214850

29/06/1988

INDOOR

18/09/20086

12 YEARS AND 3 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-90238134

HOME-67325486

GLENNLEEMS@mGMAIL.COM

Page 10l 25



A 5 FERNVALE CLOSE
Hareys #19-10

Postcode 797487
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured  OWNER

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle -

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Acciden! COLLISION - MAJOR/MINOR RD
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface ORY

Other Information
Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)

involved in the accident <

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| have been appruached by unknown _person[s] MO

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Mumber of Passengers {Including Driver) 2

Pagasngac NAME: - LEE JIA HUI

GENDER: : FEMALE

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? NO
If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prasecution given? NOD
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

| WAS DRIVING ALONG FINLAYSON GREEN WITH THE INTENTION TO TURN RIGHT INTO RAFFLES QUAY. | WAS ON
THE LEFT MOST LANE THAT COULD TURN RIGHT (FOR CLARIFY PURPOSES: THIS WAS THE LANE THAT COULD GO
STRAIGHT AND TURN RIGHT). | HAD MY RIGHT TURN SIGNAL SWITCHED ON. | WAS TURNING LEFT MOST LANE ON
RAFFLES QUAY THAT IS NEXT TO THE BUS LANE (FOR BEMEFIT OF CLARIFY), THIS WAS THE LANE 5 AS THE BUS
LAMNE WAS IN , EFFECT AT THAT TIME). AS | WAS MAKING THE TURN, | HEARD A CRASH ON MY RIGHT. THE OTHER
VEHICLE HAD CRASHED INTO RIGHT SIDE OF THE VEHICLE. FOR BENEFIT OF CLARITY, | WAS UNABLE TO GET OUT
OF THE VEHICLE AS THE CAR WAS BLOCKING MY DOOR, WHEN WE GOT DOWN TO THE CAR, BOTH PARTIES (THE
DRIVER OF THE OTHER CAR AND |) TOOK PHOTOS OF MY CAR AND WE EXCHANGED PARTICULARS. THE OTHER
DRIVER VERBALLY ADMITTED THAT HE THOUGHT THE LANE THAT HE WAS ON (ON FINLAYSON GREEN), WAS THE
LAST LANE THAT COULD TURN RIGHT AND THAT HE THOUGHT THE LANE THAT | WAS ON, WAS ONLY FOR PURPOSES
OF GOING STRAIGHT TO MARINA BOULEVARD AND NOT FOR PURPOSES OF GOING STRAIGHT AND TURNING RIGHT
TO RAFFLES QUAY, SUBSEQUENTLY, WE BOTH DROVE TO THE RIGHT SIDE OF MARINA BOULEVARD TO AVOID
IMPENDING THE FLOW WHERE | WAITED FOR THE TOW TRUCK TO COME. | CALLED FOR A TOW TRUCK BECAUSE MY
RIGHT MIRROR WAS FACING ME WRONG WAY AND THEREFORE WAS NOT SAFE TO OPERATE.

Attachment(s)
Are accident photos available for attachment? YES
Was there any video caplured by Car Camera? NO
Was there any audio recorded? NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
Vehicle Registration Number SLO23ZR
Wehicle Make/Model/Colour MERCEDES 5320 / BLACK

Details Of Properties
Page 2 of 25



Vehicle Category

Name of Driver
MRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address
Postcode
Insurance Company Name

Mature Of Damage
Ma. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

PRIVATE CAR

MOHAMAD ASHIK BIN AMAL
S7917186G

2298590

BLK 427 WOODLANDS STREET 41
#11-220

730427

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.

Page 3 of 25



Sketch Plan

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1 Piease report cormectly the detalh of the accedent to speed up the clasms process.
3 Thn borm must be gompleted by the Policyholder snd/or the Authgriged Driver

3 rformation provided miust be as truthfyl ang accurate 85 possitie Any wifful messepresentation or withholding of material
facts may afiow msurance companies 1o repudiaty policy Nability.

4. The iasue and acceptance of this Form by msurance companiss is not a0 admitvon of poloy habHiry an the part of the insurance
COMmpanses,

& The report witl be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the Genersl Insurance
Aisociation of Singapore (G1A] for archiving and that copies of this repart will for 2 lee be made available upon apphcatian by
interested parties

1. By the iodgment cf this report 1o the insurers, you hereby consent 1o the archring of this report 81 the centre and to copies of

the report being made available atoresaid 2

B Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA}
| understand, acknowiedge, agree and consent that

{8} My insurer, my workshop and the General insurance Assotlation of Singapore ["GIA") may/are permitted to coflact, ute,
disclose andfor process my personal data/personat sormation set sut in thas [form| and ey ther personal informaton
provided by me or possessed by my insures [collectively the “Personal Information”) and sisciose 2nd transfer such
Personal information 1o all insures(s) who have insured wehicke(s] invobved in this accident (all insures(s) who have insured
vehicle(s] involved in this accident shall be collectively referred to 25 the “Insurers”|, the Insurers’ Lewyers/law firms, the
Monetary Autharity of Singapore and any relevant government agency/authority (kuch a5 the posee|, for the purpose(s)
af

(il processing handling ardfor dealing with my caims including the settioment of the claima and any necessary
investigations relating to the clalms;

{il} investigating the accident and/or my ciaims;

{1k} earrying out andfor dealing with my instrucbons or resgonding i amy enguirses by me;

() administering my clalms (including the mailing of correspondence, statements. invoices, réparts or notices 1o me,
which could involve disclosure of certain personal data about me 10 bring abaut delivery of the same a5 well as on the
external cover of envelopsy/mail packages); and/or

{v) comphying with appiicabla law in administering. processing, handiing and/or dealing with my dalms {collectively the
“Purpotes”)

{b]  all insurer(s) wha have insured vehiciels) invohved in this accident and the insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collert, use, disciose and/or process my Personal information for one of mare of the above Purposes; and

{e}  my Parsanal information may/can be disclosed by any of the insurers andfor GUA to thesr third party service providers o
agentsfinchuding thelr lwyers/iow firms], which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or mare of the sbove Purposes

{d] rmy Personal information will alio be coliected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
imvestigation and management in present and ail future claims.

(e} the information s collected under (d] above may be shared [ disciosed

lil to ai msurers and,/or @ny other third parties that assist in maluating, investigating, controliing or managing fraud,
regulatons, law enforcoment and government agencies a reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

[} : complying with requirements under sy regulations, laws or count orders
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle i N ¥\3 Qims::.

Owner ID Type:
Owner |D;

Vehicle No.:
Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended Deregistration Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Maodel:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount;
Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
1485D

SLC3139G

No

08 Jan 2019

AUDI

A4 SEDAN 2.0 TFSI S TRONIC (NAV)
Blue

2018

CVK057897
WAUZZZF43JA138605
140.0 kW (187 bhp)
$33,419.00

25 May 2018

25 May 2018

0

$38,787.00

Yes
24 May 2028 ~

$29,090.00 \4 233

24 May 2028
B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

$37,989.00
$35,619.00
$64,709.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 08 Jan 2019

OK

nupsLivnLE.gov.saitanriiacticn/enquireHebated yHublcBetorelereginpulyFUNL 110 N_IU=FU3UE0ud 11 11



REPUBLIC OF SINGAFORE
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REFUBLIC OF SINGAPORE
\nenTiTY cARD NO, S8821485D

Feam

LEE MING SHU

¥ 8 &
S

CHINESE

Dt of By 5o
28-06-1988 M
Courtry o Beth
SINGAPORE

ARG

ok SBA21485D

B Boocd Group  Dwie of e

; R 27-06-2003
5 FEANVALE CLOSE #18-10 §
SINGAPORE 77487

NRIC Mg SBAZ14850  pg,  OBMDE[201E R)

teannriw SBB21485D

LEE MiNG SHU

Bt Do 29 Jun 1988
s Cte 18 Sep 2006 g

b

SRS N

' YOU ARE LICENSED TO DRIVE VEHICLES IN THE FOLLOWING CLASSIES|

PASS DATE
Class 1A Molor cars withoul cluteh (Ao} =< 18 Sep 2006
wilh =< 7 passangers, ax of th drivet; &

‘Il.pc-m Ho: 588714850 II
NP 2288 I..ll ' l.




Lraren Fie

NKG Asis Pacile Ins

2018

i &

o, Reg. Mo

Name of Policyhelder @ LEE MING SHU Vehicle No. : SLC31386
Period of Insurance « 25 May 2018 To 24 May 2018 Palicy No. : 180

Engine No. ¢ CVKD57E97 Endorsement No,

Chassis No. s WALUZZZF43JA138605 lssued Date : 28 May 2018

ABOUT THE COVER

Make/Model AUDI A4 Sedan 2.0 TFSI S tronic
Engine Capacity/Tonnage & 1,984 00 CC Sum Insurad | Market Value First Year of Registration : 2018 |
Driver Restnction A Off Peak Car . No Insuring with COE/PARF | Yes

Persan or Classes of Persons Entitled to Drive”

| = i s

Age Condition All Age Condition

Lirmitation as 10 use
] ¥ For sols 4T & Dusineas.
racing, paca-making relabilty nal of Epead-testr e carnages of goads otner thah sam plas in cemnaction with any rede or

Lass of Use 1800cc - 2000cc Optional

+ Lymitabara randered mepanative by Section 8 af the Motor Vet as (Thiro-Parly Risks and Compensaton) Acl (Cap 180} amd Sachan 85 of e Road Transpon Acl, 1887 (Malaysal, &r@ not to be
| rduded undss hase headngs

Section 1
Fire - 30 Crwn Damage - $1600 Theft - 30 Fiood Cover - 30

Section 2
Property Damage - 50

Windscrean - 5100

Named Driver and EXCesS (where appicable]

LEE MING SHU - $1600 {Owin Damage

APPROVED REPORTING CENTRE

1 Al Cuslomer Service Centes Add 55 Ubi Road 1 Singanore #0BESS EXBEZI2I

Far otner Approved Repoming CentneslAlG Authoried R r accidenl emergency hathne at +55 G338 8500, Alernatively. you may redar 1o SIS welEla wWihaLag . oom. 85

Mobila App, Simply search and downalaad Al

IMPORTANT NOTES

| Hire Purchase Company/Employer's Lean: MAL AYAN BANKING BERHAD

ardancs with tha provisiong of tha Motor Vehides{Third Party Risks ard Campansation) Act (Cap. 188), Fan IV of
[Malayaia)

|Aivia harebry sadify at the palicy 10 which fis Certthcate of Insurance relalas & S5ued in B
Ihe: Riaad Trangpart Act, 1987 (Malaysa) and Motar Vahicks {Third Party Risks) Rules, 1533

0504125258
-+
PREMILM LEASING -PSHE :‘\ﬁ/

381 ALEXAMDRA ROAD AUDI CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE — -
SIMGAPDRE 150038 AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
Underwritten by AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Ltd. AUTHORISED REPRESENTATIVE
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Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1. Singapore 408699
Tal : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Email; Mora.khai@premiumaute.com.sg { claims@premiumauto.com.sg
Telefax

Estimate : Accident Repairs

Workshop :  UbiRoad 1

Contact No : 63662323

Fax No : 68411183

Reference : PATPIOD092019/JE

Date : 3-Jan-18

Vehicle IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name

Mr Lee Ming Shu

Address 5 Fernvale Close
#18-10
Singapore 797487
Telephone : HP+659023 8134
Type of Claim :  Third Party Claims
Policy No.
Vehicle No : SLC3139G
Model Code : Audi A4 2.0 SEDAN TFSI
Model [ Year ;. 25/5/2018
Engine No : CVK 057897
Chassis No T WAUZZZF43.4138605
Mileage ;G144 KM
Date In ;. 2-Jan-19
Liability =
Excess Cost i
Estimated By Johnny Boo ( Allan Wu

Accident Date
Place of Accident

2-Jan-19

Junction of Finlayson Green & raffle Quay



Premium Automobiles '

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SLC 3139 G.

Estimated
SIN Nature of Jobs Charges
To remove and transfer front wire harness for St
1 headlights, horns, outside temperature sensor, SIN $ 480.00 X A
headlight washer assy and front parking aid. \

To remove and transfer RHS front door's multi-lock
- system and power window devices. S 280.00 .~

To dismantle front bumper, RHS front fender, RHS
front door. Cut out and reweld RHS sill panel and

RHS lower A Pillar. To Renew RHS front fender, RHS

4 wing mirror assy and RHS front door. Re-orgnise $ 2:100.00 (gﬂ'_ =
crash management components. Reinstall all parts gﬁv
removed.

< o> 2% [Se
To respray front bumper, RHS front fenc}sr, RHS wing I g3
4 mirror cover, RHS front door, RHS sill panel and RHS $ 3,800.00 !:%5

lower A Fyar. €50 §€o HE

To renew RHS front rims and carry out wheel
alignment.

SIN $ 28000 ML AN

6 To carry out diagnostic check. SIN § 19200

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES :  $ 10,132.00



Premium Automobiles
55 Ubki Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax . 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SLC 3139 G.

Damage Parts & Prices

S/IN  Parts Description SINETT REMARKS
1 Front fender - RH m.ﬂ:\,\-f %, $ 700.00
2 Front fender attachment parts X ] 48.00
3 Front fender end plate - RH o 3 45,00
4  Frontfender bracket - RH X $ 32.00
5 Front fender retaining bracket - RH X 5 45.00
] Front fender center bracket - RH X W $ 29.00
7 Frontfender end support-RH $ 107.00
8 Front wheel housing liner - RH s 1 220.00
9  Front wheel housing liner attachment parts X 5 B2.00

10 Front wheel arc spoiler trim-RH X I ] 66.00
1 Front fender end plate-RH X 5 33.00
12 Front stone chip guard-RH i M ] 46.00
13 Front fender ledge cover-RH A H f‘l ﬂ./ 3 28.00
14 Front fender ledge top cover-RH X 5 21.00
15  FrontdoorRH .~ (el S 2,152.00
16  Front outer door seal-RH .~ A ¢ 5 185.00
17 Bonding agent X WA § 43.00
18 Cleaning solution .~ MEC $ 64.00
19 Applicator  x° INFN 3 7.00
20 Front door attachment parts-RH )% fJN $ 488.00

SUB - TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 4,441.00

All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend - Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X} = Not approved
Spare parls are Special Mett.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel . 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SLC 3139 G

Damage Parts & Prices

SIN Parts Description SINETT REMARKS
21 Front door catch-RH /I | 3 96.00
2 Fiontdosr cakchicoverRl L "”J $ 13.00
23 Front window regulator without motor-RH /? $ 250.00
24  Front exterior mirror mounting-RH =~ -~ 15f 5 824.00
25  Front mirror cap-RH - 'S 3 220.00
26 Front mirror glass-RH ] 7 ‘ﬂ'/ }V( 3 1,553.00
27 Data plate for tyre pressure . a"’ ‘@ L 5 35.00
28 Datatag 7 7 ﬁ N N $ 423.00
29 Sticker with pictogram for air bag ’? i 5 23.00
30  Frontdoor tim-RH ¥ ANV $ 41.00
31 Front window Slot seal with trim strip chrome-RH i Cc-:{' 8 280.00
32 Frontwindow trim strip guideRH X MV $ 235.00
33 Front sectional part -side member-RH .~ fGir€ - $ 1,907.00
34 Front sill trim strip-RH '7 P‘J 5 109.00
35  Rubbervalve #@ St 4% 13.00
36 Acrylic sealant ”t!.: z SN § 180.00
a7 Cavity wax - SN & 140.00
38 Stone chip -~ SIN 5 180.00
3  FrontimRH ~ (A TBC
40 Sundries O W C. $ 800.00

TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 11,763.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 10,132.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 21,895.00
All charges are not inclusive of GST.

Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X} = Not approved

Spare pars are Special Nett.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax

Name : 6M° &‘CVP

Surveyed Date

Authorised Date lc? g@ﬂw]‘j i

Excess Cost :
iy ef gt S,
o7 / / / *2,@{“7

N§

Please Note . This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment,

5 notify
Yours faithfully, X
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd
= 54 ; 5 51 be resuiveyed and
% subsect Io final approval from Insurance Ce mpany
Acknowledged by Repairgr
-:'-:;":'sf'_lle.
Johnny Boo Allan Wu

Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



